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Bidder   Total  Total Bonus + 
Number  Lessee  Acres  Total Rental 
 

 101 Western Land Services, Inc. 1,660.00 $144,260.00 
 1100 Conrad Industrial Drive 
 Ludington, MI 49431 

 102 Kosco Energy Group, LLC 1,323.93 $26,509.30 
 P.O. Box 2104 
 Traverse City, MI 49685 

 103 Quantum Energy, Inc. 327.62 $2,633.24 
 2400 Northern Visions Drive 
 Traverse City, MI 49684 

 104 CORE Energy, LLC 738.15 $14,796.50 
 1011 Noteware Drive 
 Traverse City, MI 49686 

 105 Jordan Development Company, L.L.C. 1,333.14 $201,566.28 
 1503 Garfield Road N 
 Traverse City, MI 49686 

 106 Jordan Development Company, L.L.C. 793.21 $12,129.58 
 1503 Garfield Road N 
 Traverse City, MI 49686 

 107 Maritz Land Company LLC 40.00 $2,800.00 
 P.O.Box 4126 
 Traverse City, MI 49685 

 108 West Bay Exploration Company 1,302.38 $79,322.80 
 13685 South West Bay Shore, Suite 200 
 Traverse City, MI 49684 

 109 Western Land Services, Inc. 3,557.91 $310,234.82 
 1100 Conrad Industrial Drive 
 Ludington, MI 49431 

 110 Steve Rapanos No Bid  No Bid 
 P.O. Box 560 
 Rockford, MI 49341 

 111 Maness Petroleum Corporation 160.56 $3,215.60 
 1425 S. Mission Road 
 Mt. Pleasant, MI 48804 

 112 Rich Patterson No Bid  No Bid 
 P.O. Box 610 
 Haslett, MI 48840 



Bidder  Bidder  Total  Total Bonus + 
Number  Name  Acres  Total Rental 
 

 113 Rich Patterson No Bid  No Bid 
 P.O. Box 610 
 Haslett, MI 48840 

 114 Tom Coughlin No Bid  No Bid 
 711 Bayliss Street 
 Midland, MI 48640 

 Totals: 11,236.90 $797,468.12 
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State Of Michigan Mineral Auction

Stipulation Report
 Stipulation ID  Stipulation Name   Description

6 Portions of the leased area may lie within essential Kirtland's
Warbler habitat or within ¼ mile of essential Kirtland’s Warbler
habitat.   No drilling, development, construction, or non-routine
maintenance activities shall take place within ¼ mile of essential
habitat from May 1 to August 15 without prior written
authorization from the lessor.   In addition, no surface
development of any kind will be allowed within essential habitat
or within 300 feet of essential habitat.

Kirtland's Warbler Habitat Management

15 To limit surface disturbance, any wells to be drilled on the leased
premises shall be drilled from a single surface area that is
acceptable to and approved by the Lessor.  The Lessee shall
submit a proposed development plan for the leased premises
including a proposed surface area, access routes and pipeline
corridors, with due regard to surface features, the relative location
of other operations in the area, and applicable regulatory
requirements.  The Lessee may not drill any well on the leased
premises without first obtaining an approval from the Lessor.
Approval shall not be unreasonably withheld.  If Lessor
reasonably determines that production on adjacent land creates the
probability of drainage of oil and/or gas from State mineral land,
additional surface locations may be considered.

Limited Surface Disturbance-OG FEE

16 All other provisions of this lease not withstanding, it is understood
that no exploration or development work shall be conducted on
this parcel without specific authorization from the Department of
Natural Resources, Wildlife Division.  No operations shall be
conducted until written instructions for the proper protection of
any threatened or endangered species or their habitat are issued.

Threatened or Endangered Species Habitat

19 All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, it is understood
that no well site shall be located closer than 660 feet to any
recreational trail without obtaining the written consent of the
Lessor and contacting the local Department trails coordinator.

Recreational Trails

20 All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, it is further
understood that existing well pads shall be used for drilling unless
otherwise authorized by the Department of Natural Resources'
Land Manager.

Use Existing Well Pad

23 All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, this parcel is
subject to an existing State of Michigan Underground Gas Storage
Lease.  Contact Underground Gas Storage field operator prior to
any surface use.

Subject to Existing Underground Gas
Storage Leas

33 All other provisions on this lease notwithstanding, it is understood
that this parcel was determined to be, at time of leasing, near to a
known raptor nesting site.  No drilling or development shall take
place, and no activity is allowed within ¼ mile of known (or
possible) protected raptor nests, during the nesting season.  All
exploration and development activities must be approved, in
writing, by the Lessor's Wildlife Management Unit Supervisor.

Raptor Nesting Area

44 All other conditions of the Lease notwithstanding, it is expressly
understood and agreed that the above-described land is leased
solely for communitization purposes and that no drilling or other
development work will be conducted on the leased premises
without the express written permission of the Michigan
Department of Transportation (MDOT) and Lessor.

MDOT #1 - Conditions

49 Best Management Practices along wetlands, waterways, or steep
slopes as per Sustainable Soil and Water Practices on Forest Land
IC 4011 (Rev. 02/24/2009 and as amended) and approved in
writing by the Local Management Supervisor.

Best Management Practices
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Stipulation Report
 Stipulation ID  Stipulation Name   Description

63 The Lessee for itself, its personal representatives, contractors,
subcontractors, employees, applicants for employment, successors
in interest and assigns, as a part of the consideration hereof, does
hereby covenant and agree as a covenant running with the land,
that (1) No person on the ground of race, color, religion, national
origin, age, sex, height, weight, or marital status shall be excluded
from participation in, be denied the benefits of, or be otherwise
subjected to discrimination with respect to hire, tenure, terms,
conditions, or privileges of employment, or a matter directly or
indirectly related to employment, in the use of said land, and (2) In
the event of breach of any of the aforementioned
nondiscrimination covenants, the Lessor shall have the right to
terminate the Lease and to re-enter and repossess said land and the
facilities thereon, if any, and hold the same as if said Lease had
never been made or issued.

MDOT Nondiscrimination Clause

68 An environmental review has indicated the potential for restricted
activity on this parcel. All other provisions of this lease not
withstanding, it is understood that no exploration or development
work shall be conducted on this parcel without first contacting the
local Michigan Department of Environmental Quality District
Office to obtain specific special instructions regarding use of the
surface.

Potential for Restricted Activity

69 To limit surface disturbance, any wells to be drilled on the leased
premises shall be drilled from a single surface area.  Upon the
request of the Department’s Land Administering Division (LAD),
the Lessee shall submit a proposed development plan to the LAD
for the leased premises including a proposed surface area, access
routes and pipeline corridors, with due regard to surface features,
the relative location of other operations in the area, and applicable
regulatory requirements.  If Lessor reasonably determines that
production on adjacent land creates the probability of drainage of
oil and/or gas from State mineral land, additional surface locations
may be considered.

Limited Surface Disturbance-OG MIN
ONLY

70 Best Management Practices along wetlands, waterways, or steep
slopes as per Sustainable Soil and Water Practices on Forest Land
IC 4011 (Rev. 02/24/2009 and as amended) and approved in
writing by the Surface Owner and the Local Management
Supervisor.

Best Management Practices-OG MIN
ONLY

71 To limit surface disturbance, any borings and/or wells to be drilled
on the leased premises shall be drilled from surface locations that
are acceptable to and approved by the Lessor’s Land
Administering Division (LAD).  The Lessee may not drill any
borings and/or wells on the leased premises without first obtaining
approval from the Lessor’s LAD.  Approval shall not be
unreasonably withheld by Lessor’s LAD.

Limited Surface Disturbance-MM/NM FEE

March 14, 2016 Page 2 of 2
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Alpena County
T29N R09E

64N- 1 $0.00 No Bid
0.70

100%Sur
Min100%Part of Govt Lot 1 in NW1/4 NW1/4 27

31.50
100%Sur

Min100%Part of Govt Lot 1 in SE1/4 NW1/4 27

31.50
100%Sur

Min100%Part of Govt Lot 1 in SW1/4 NW1/4 27

160N- 2 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 27

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Arenac County
T19N R03E

40N- 3 101 $10.00 $400.00 N-58941
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 21

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Bay County
T16N R03E

714 106 $10.00 $710.00 58942
30.93

0%Sur
Min100%69 NW1/4 NW1/4 4

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%69 SW1/4 NW1/4 4

72N- 5 106 $10.00 $720.00 N-58943
31.36

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 4

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 4

Bay County
T17N R03E

406 101 $15.00 $600.00 58944
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%69 NE1/4 NE1/4 17

40N- 7 101 $13.00 $520.00 N-58945
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 17

40N- 8 101 $19.00 $760.00 N-58946
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 17

80N- 9 101 $16.00 $1,280.00 N-58947
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 17

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%SE1\4 SW1\4 17

110 106 $10.00 $10.00 58948
0.92

0%Sur
Min100%69

70
*Com 1138 feet N of SE corner of NE 1/4, th W 268
feet, th N 150 feet, th E 268 feet, th S 150 feet to beg

25

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Bay County
T17N R03E

4011 106 $10.00 $400.00 58949
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%69 SW1/4 NW1/4 28

40N- 12 106 $10.00 $400.00 N-58950
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 28

4013 106 $10.00 $400.00 58951
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%69 W1/2 W1/2 SW1/4 28

8014 106 $10.00 $800.00 58952
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 29

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 29

4015 106 $40.00 $1,600.00 58953
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 29

40N- 16 106 $30.00 $1,200.00 N-58954
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 29

4017 109 $45.00 $1,800.00 58955
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 29

4018 106 $10.00 $400.00 58956
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 29

5019 106 $10.00 $500.00 58957
10.00

0%Sur
Min100%69

70
E 1/2 of W 1/2 of SW 1/4 of SW 1/4 32

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%69 SE1/4 SW1/4 32

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Bay County
T17N R03E

40N- 20 106 $10.00 $400.00 N-58958
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 32

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Clare County
T17N R04W

3N- 22 108 $10.00 $30.00 N-58959
2.64

100%Sur
Min100%That part of S1/2 desc as comm at the SE cor of said Sec,

th  along the Sec line S 89d42'07" W 2149.70 ft to pt of
beg, th N 0d01'01" E 33 ft, th N 69d10'47" W 588.46 ft,
th N 89d42'59' W 111.75 ft, th N 89d42'59" W 15 ft, m/l,
to lake shore, th SE'ly along the lake shore 310 ft, m/l to
a pt which is S 89d42'07" W from the pt of beg, th N
89d42'07" E 8 ft m/l to a pt which is S 37d35'59" E
309.45 ft from the E'ly end of the preceeding 15-foot
course, th N 89d42'07" E 472.98 ft along sec line to pt of
beg, together with the riparian rights thereinSubject to
existing easements.

9

4N- 23 108 $10.00 $40.00 N-58960
0.45

0%Sur
Min100%Beg N 0d 13' W, alg th E line, 657.15 ft fr th SE cor, th

N 0d 13' W alg E line, 165.52 ft to a point on th S bank
of th S br of th Tobacco River, th S 36d 04' 03" W alg  th
S bank, 208.12 ft,th N 88d 44' 21" E,  123.19 ft back to
POB, cont 0.45 A and extending N to th C/L of th S br of
Tobacco River

30

3.24
100%Sur

Min100%Railroad R/w running across SEl/4 SEl/4 30

7N- 24 108 $10.00 $70.00 N-58961
1.08

100%Sur
Min100%Railroad R/w running across NWl/4 SWl/4 30

3.28
100%Sur

Min100%Railroad R/w running across SEl/4 SWl/4 30

2.18
100%Sur

Min100%Railroad R/w running across SWl/4 SWl/4 30

Clare County
T18N R06W

4025 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%49 SE1/4 NW1/4 5

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Clare County
T18N R06W

85N- 26 $0.00 No Bid
43.92

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 5

40.68
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 5

161N- 27 111 $10.00 $1,610.00 N-58962
40.33

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 6

40.23
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 6

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 6

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 6

Clare County
T19N R06W

120N- 28 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 14

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 14

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 14

12029 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

16
49

NE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

15

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
49

SE1/4 NW1/4 15

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
49

SW1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

15

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Clare County
T19N R06W

4030 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

16
49

NW1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

15

14231 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
71

NE1/4 SW1/4 18

30.78
100%Sur

Min100%15
49
71

NW1/4 SW1/4 18

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 SW1/4 18

30.77
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SW1/4 18

14332 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 NW1/4 19

31.08
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 NW1/4 19

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 NW1/4 19

31.71
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NW1/4 19

13733 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 SW1/4 19

32.34
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 SW1/4 19

33.56
100%Sur

Min100%15
49
71

SE1/4 SW1/4 19

30.51
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SW1/4 19

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Clare County
T19N R06W

12034 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
71

NE1/4 NE1/4 20

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NE1/4 20

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 NE1/4 20

40N- 35 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 20

4036 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 20

3737 $0.00 No Bid
36.62

100%Sur
Min100%15 SW1/4 SE1/4 21

40N- 38 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 21

120N- 40 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 22

120N- 41 $0.00 No Bid
4.00

100%Sur
Min100%Beginning at NW corner of NE1/4 SE1/4, thence 5 chs S,

thence 8 chs E, thence 5 chs N, thence 8 chs W to point
of beginning

22

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Clare County
T19N R06W

(Continued) 120N- 41 $0.00 No Bid
36.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 except beginning at the NW corner of

NE1/4 SE1/4, thence 5 chains South, th. 8 chains E, th. 5
chains N, th. 8 chains W to point of beg.Subject to
existing easements.

22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

22

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Crawford County
T25N R04W

40N- 42 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 5

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

4043 109 $13.00 $520.00 58963
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 SW1/4 NE1/4 3

97N- 44 109 $15.00 $1,455.00 N-58964
28.55

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 3

28.43
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 3

137N- 45 109 $164.00 $22,468.00 N-58965
28.29

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 3

28.17
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 3

8046 109 $30.00 $2,400.00 58966
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 SE1/4 3

80N- 47 109 $15.00 $1,200.00 N-58967
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 3

160N- 48 109 $164.00 $26,240.00 N-58968
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 3

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

(Continued) 160N- 48 109 $164.00 $26,240.00 N-58968
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 3

136N- 49 109 $161.00 $21,896.00 N-58969
28.01

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 4

27.60
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 4

4050 109 $164.00 $6,560.00 58970
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SW1/4 NW1/4 4

95N- 51 109 $165.00 $15,675.00 N-58971
27.43

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 4

27.47
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 4

120N- 52 105 $500.00 $60,000.00 N-58972
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 4

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

12053 105 $375.00 $45,000.00 58973
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NW1/4 SW1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 SW1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SW1/4 4

40N- 54 109 $161.00 $6,440.00 N-58974
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 4

8055 105 $50.00 $4,000.00 58975
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SE1/4 NE1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NE1/4 5

55N- 56 109 $175.00 $9,625.00 N-58976
27.22

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 5

27.17
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 5

134N- 57 105 $50.00 $6,700.00 N-58977
26.69

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 5

26.45
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 5

16058 109 $162.00 $25,920.00 58978
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 SE1/4 5

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

(Continued) 16058 109 $162.00 $25,920.00 58978
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NW1/4 SE1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 SE1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SE1/4 5

8059 109 $164.00 $13,120.00 58979
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SE1/4 SW1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SW1/4 5

80N- 60 105 $50.00 $4,000.00 N-58980
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 5

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 5

16061 109 $175.00 $28,000.00 58981
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 NE1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 NE1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 NE1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NE1/4 8

8062 105 $150.00 $12,000.00 58982
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NW1/4 NW1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NW1/4 8

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

80N- 63 105 $65.00 $5,200.00 N-58983
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 8

12064 109 $175.00 $21,000.00 58984
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 SE1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 SE1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 SE1/4 8

40N- 65 105 $65.00 $2,600.00 N-58985
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 8

4066 105 $65.00 $2,600.00 58986
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 SW1/4 8

120N- 67 105 $65.00 $7,800.00 N-58987
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 8

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 8

8068 101 $164.00 $13,120.00 58988
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 NE1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 NE1/4 9

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

80N- 69 105 $265.00 $21,200.00 N-58989
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 9

4070 105 $275.00 $11,000.00 58990
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 NW1/4 9

40N- 71 101 $164.00 $6,560.00 N-58991
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 9

4072 101 $162.00 $6,480.00 58992
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SE1/4 SE1/4 9

120N- 73 101 $160.00 $19,200.00 N-58993
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 9

4074 101 $160.00 $6,400.00 58994
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SW1/4 SW1/4 9

120N- 75 101 $160.00 $19,200.00 N-58995
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 9

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T17N R02E

8076 101 $160.00 $12,800.00 58996
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NW1/4 NW1/4 10

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

10

2077 101 $161.00 $3,220.00 58997
20.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
W1/2 NW1/4 SW1/4 10

Gladwin County
T17N R02W

4078 108 $10.00 $400.00 58998
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%70 SE1/4 SE1/4 16

40N- 79 108 $10.00 $400.00 N-58999
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 16

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

8080 109 $30.00 $2,400.00 59000
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4 20

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 NW1/4 20

40N- 81 109 $30.00 $1,200.00 N-59001
39.57

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 except S 125 feet of the N 225 feet of W

150 feet thereof
20

4082 109 $35.00 $1,400.00 59002
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 20

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

4083 109 $35.00 $1,400.00 59003
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 SW1/4 SW1/4 20

120N- 84 109 $35.00 $4,200.00 N-59004
38.98

100%Sur
Min100%N1/2 N1/2 SW1/4 except the W 13 rods of the N 121/2

rods thereof
20

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%S1/2 N1/2 SW1/4 20

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 20

1.02
100%Sur

Min100%West 13 rods of North 121/2 rods of NW1/4 of SW1/4. 20

8085 109 $35.00 $2,800.00 59005
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

19
49

SE1/4 NE1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19
49

SW1/4 NE1/4 21

80N- 86 109 $35.00 $2,800.00 N-59006
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 21

12087 109 $35.00 $4,200.00 59007
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19
49

SE1/4 NW1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 NW1/4 21

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

40N- 88 109 $35.00 $1,400.00 N-59008
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 21

16089 109 $35.00 $5,600.00 59009
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

19
NE1/4 SE1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19

NW1/4 SE1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19
49

SE1/4 SE1/4 21

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19

SW1/4 SE1/4 21

4090 109 $35.00 $1,400.00 59010
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

19
NE1/4 SW1/4 21

40N- 91 109 $35.00 $1,400.00 N-59011
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 21

8092 109 $60.00 $4,800.00 59012
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NE1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NE1/4 28

80N- 93 109 $60.00 $4,800.00 N-59013
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 28

160N- 94 109 $60.00 $9,600.00 N-59014
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 28

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

(Continued) 160N- 94 109 $60.00 $9,600.00 N-59014
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 28

16095 109 $60.00 $9,600.00 59015
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SE1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 SE1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SE1/4 28

16096 109 $60.00 $9,600.00 59016
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SW1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 SW1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 SW1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SW1/4 28

160N- 97 109 $60.00 $9,600.00 N-59017
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 29

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

(Continued) 160N- 97 109 $60.00 $9,600.00 N-59017
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 29

8098 109 $60.00 $4,800.00 59018
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4 29

80N- 99 109 $60.00 $4,800.00 N-59019
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 29

160100 101 $60.00 $9,600.00 59020
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SE1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 SE1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SE1/4 29

120101 101 $65.00 $7,800.00 59021
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SW1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 SW1/4 29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SW1/4 29

40N- 102 101 $55.00 $2,200.00 N-59022
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 29

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

80103 105 $60.00 $4,800.00 59023
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 NW1/4 32

80N- 104 101 $55.00 $4,400.00 N-59024
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 32

40105 107 $60.00 $2,400.00 59025
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SE1/4 32

120N- 106 101 $55.00 $6,600.00 N-59026
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 32

40107 105 $50.00 $2,000.00 59027
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 SW1/4 32

120N- 108 101 $55.00 $6,600.00 N-59028
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 32

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

40109 105 $50.00 $2,000.00 59029
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NE1/4 33

120N- 110 105 $50.00 $6,000.00 N-59030
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 33

120111 109 $55.00 $6,600.00 59031
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 NW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 NW1/4 33

40N- 112 105 $50.00 $2,000.00 N-59032
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 33

80113 109 $55.00 $4,400.00 59033
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SE1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 33

80N- 114 101 $55.00 $4,400.00 N-59034
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 33

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T18N R02E

120115 101 $55.00 $6,600.00 59035
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 SW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SW1/4 33

40N- 116 101 $55.00 $2,200.00 N-59036
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 33

Gladwin County
T20N R01E

40117 108 $100.00 $4,000.00 59037
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4 21

40118 108 $109.00 $4,360.00 59038
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 SE1/4 SW1/4 21

120119 108 $20.00 $2,400.00 59039
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NE1/4 22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NE1/4 22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 NE1/4 22

40N- 120 108 $30.00 $1,200.00 N-59040
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 22

160121 108 $20.00 $3,200.00 59041
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SE1/4 22

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T20N R01E

(Continued) 160121 108 $20.00 $3,200.00 59041
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 SE1/4 22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 SE1/4 22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SE1/4 22

80122 108 $80.00 $6,400.00 59042
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
22

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

22

80123 108 $20.00 $1,600.00 59043
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NE1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 NE1/4 27

80N- 124 108 $20.00 $1,600.00 N-59044
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 27

40125 108 $80.00 $3,200.00 59045
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4 27

40N- 126 108 $80.00 $3,200.00 N-59046
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
27

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Gladwin County
T20N R01E

40127 108 $16.00 $640.00 59047
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 SW1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
27

120N- 128 108 $16.00 $1,920.00 N-59048
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 27

80N- 129 108 $105.00 $8,400.00 N-59049
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 28

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 28

139130 108 $101.00 $14,039.00 59050
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4 28

29.50
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SE1/4 NW1/4 28

28.87
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 NW1/4 28

40131 108 $111.00 $4,440.00 59051
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 SE1/4 SE1/4 28

40N- 132 108 $111.00 $4,440.00 N-59052
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 28

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Gladwin County
T20N R01W

32N- 133 108 $10.00 $320.00 N-59053
31.14

0%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 18

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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 Bid
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Number

Grand Traverse County
T25N R11W

40134 104 $10.00 $400.00 59054
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SW1/4 NE1/4 33

40N- 135 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 33

80136 104 $10.00 $800.00 59055
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
20

SE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

33

80137 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

33
NE1/4 SW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 SW1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

33

Grand Traverse County
T25N R12W

48138 $0.00 No Bid
47.79

100%Sur
Min100%15 NW1/4 NE1/4 6

40N- 139 104 $10.00 $400.00 N-59056
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
10

Grand Traverse County
T26N R09W

40140 104 $10.00 $400.00 59057
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

19
SW1/4 NE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

10

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Grand Traverse County
T26N R11W

120141 106 $15.00 $1,800.00 59058
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

20
NE1/4 NW1/4 15

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19

SE1/4 NW1/4 15

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
19

SW1/4 NW1/4 15

40N- 142 106 $10.00 $400.00 N-59059
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 15

Grand Traverse County
T27N R09W

160143 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 NE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 27

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 27

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Ingham County
T01N R01E

182N- 144 102 $10.00 $1,820.00 N-59060
49.63

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 4

51.83
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 4

186N- 145 102 $10.00 $1,860.00 N-59061
16.50

100%Sur
Min100%N 33 rds of NE1/4 of NW1/4 4

16.50
100%Sur

Min100%N 33 rds of NW1/4 NW1/4 4

36.10
100%Sur

Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 exc N 16.50 acres 4

36.10
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 exc N 16.50 acres 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 4

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 4

80N- 146 102 $10.00 $800.00 N-59062
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
4

38.62
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 except beginning at the SW corner of
NW1/4 of SE1/4 of said Sec. 4, thence North 5 chains,
thence East 2.75 chains, thence South 5 chains, thence
West 2.75 chains to point of beginning.Subject to
existing easements.

4

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Ingham County
T01N R01E

(Continued) 80N- 146 102 $10.00 $800.00 N-59062
1.38

0%Sur
Min100%Part of NW1/4 of SE1/4 beginning at the SW corner of

NW1/4 of SE1/4 of said Sec. 4, thence North 5 chains,
thence East 2.75 chains, thence South 5 chains, thence
West 2.75 chains to point of beginning

4

15N- 147 $0.00 No Bid
14.43

100%Sur
Min100%N1/2 SE1/4 E of Potter Road and N of Extension of

Batesse Drain
5

Ingham County
T02N R01E

73N- 148 102 $10.00 $730.00 N-59063
33.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 of SW1/4 S of Highway 28

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 of SW1/4 28

60N- 149 102 $10.00 $600.00 N-59064
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%E 40 acres of S 60 acres of N fractional half of Section 30 30

20.00
100%Sur

Min100%S 60 acres of N fractional half of Section 30, except the
E 40 acres thereof

30

86N- 150 102 $10.00 $860.00 N-59065
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%East 40 acres of the N1/2 of the S fractional half of

Section 30
30

20.30
100%Sur

Min 50%The South 1/4 of the East 80 acres of the South 1/2 of
Fractional Section 30 (per deed); also described as the
South ½ of the South Fractional ½ of Section 30, T02N,
R01E EXCEPT the West 25 acres thereof (based on
P-937 dated 03/16/1942 from Thomas H. Hanna).

30

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Ingham County
T02N R01E

(Continued) 86N- 150 102 $10.00 $860.00 N-59065
25.00

100%Sur
Min100%West 25 acres of the S half of S fractional half of Section

30
30

100N- 151 102 $10.00 $1,000.00 N-59066
29.75

100%Sur
Min100%N1/2 EXC part of E 80 acres N of Hwy within NW1/4

NE1/4
31

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%N1/2 EXC part of E 80 acres N of Hwy within SE1/4
NE1/4

31

29.75
100%Sur

Min100%N1/2 EXC part of E 80 acres N of Hwy within SW1/4
NE1/4

31

80N- 152 102 $10.00 $800.00 N-59067
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 32

16.04
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 ex. South 1300 ft of that part of SE1/4
NW1/4 lying West of public road right of way and
reservation of the right to flood water over, through,
under and upon said land, to a height not toexceed 951 ft
sea level datum.

32

23.96
0%Sur

Min100%South 1300 ft of that part of SE1/4 NW1/4 lying West of
public road right of way and reservation of the right to
flood water over, through, under and upon said land, to a
height not to exceed 951 ft sea level datum.

32

160N- 153 102 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59068
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4  SE1/4 32

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 32

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Ingham County
T02N R01E

(Continued) 160N- 153 102 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59068
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 32

160N- 154 102 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59069
39.47

100%Sur
Min100%Lot 2 (SE1/4 SE1/4 ) 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NE1/4  SE1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 33

160N- 155 102 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59070
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 33

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 33

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Kalkaska County
T27N R08W

28156 104 $10.00 $280.00 59071
27.50

100%Sur
Min100%15

19
49
68

SE1/4 SE1/4 except that portion which lies W'ly of
Valley Road and N'ly of the S'ly 330 feet thereofSubject
to existing easements.

1

3N- 157 $0.00 No Bid
2.50

100%Sur
Min100%S'ly 330 feet of E'ly 330 feet of SW1/4 SE1/4   Subject to

existing easements.
1

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Manistee County
T22N R16W

1N- 161 104 $10.00 $10.00 N-59072
1.00

0%Sur
Min100%Pt SW 1/4 com 450 ft W & 33 ft N of S 1/4 Cor, N 170

ft, W 256.2 ft, S 170 ft, E 256.2 ft to POB
1

1N- 162 $0.00 No Bid
0.60

0%Sur
Min100%44

63
Parcel 53Hwy US-31 r/w lying within the SE1/4 SW1/4
Sec. 14, T22N-R16W.

14

40N- 163 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 25

40N- 164 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4  NW1/4                                    Subject to existing

easements.
25

Manistee County
T24N R13W

80165 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%69 SE1/4 NE1/4 15

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%69 SW1/4 NE1/4 15

3N- 166 $0.00 No Bid
1.34

100%Sur
Min100%A 100 ft. wide former RR ROW traversing over and

across the NE 1/4 of SE 1/4.
15

1.34
100%Sur

Min100%A 100 ft. wide former RR ROW traversing over and
across the NW 1/4 of SE 1/4.

15

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Manistee County
T24N R14W

80N- 167 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
14

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 14

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

May 18, 2016  10:42 am Printed By: vennek Page 37 of 49



d_aucrprts_auc_rslts

 Description
 Offering
 Number

 
Section

 Lease
 Acres  Equity

 Bid
 Acres

 Bidder
 Number

 Per Acre
 Bid

Department of Natural Resources
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Midland County
T13N R01W

55168 $0.00 No Bid
34.55

0%Sur
Min100%16

70
NW1/4 NE1/4 4

20.00
0%Sur

Min100%16
70

W1/2 SW1/4 NE1/4 4

35N- 169 $0.00 No Bid
5.62

0%Sur
Min100%A parcel desc as commencing 400 ft S of NE Sec corner,

th W 700 ft, S 350 ft, E 700 ft, N 350 ft
4

28.60
0%Sur

Min100%Frac'l NE1/4 of Frac'l NE1/4 except commencing 400
feet South of Northeast section corner, thence West 700
feet, South 350 feet East 700 feet, North 350 feet

4

151170 $0.00 No Bid
34.89

0%Sur
Min100%16

70
NE1/4 NW1/4 4

35.23
0%Sur

Min100%16
70

NW1/4 NW1/4 4

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%16
70

SE1/4 NW1/4 4

40.00
0%Sur

Min100%16
70

SW1/4 NW1/4 4

1N- 171 $0.00 No Bid
0.80

0%Sur
Min100%*Com 247.5 ft W of SE Sec cor, th N 181.5 ft, SW alg

Rd to Sec ln, E to pob.
4

Midland County
T16N R01W

80172 106 $10.00 $800.00 59073
80.00

100%Sur
Min100%15 The North 1/2 of the Southeast 1/4 29

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
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 Bid

Lease
Number

Montmorency County
T32N R02E

144N- 173 $0.00 No Bid
31.69

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 2

32.23
100%Sur

Min100%NW 1/4 NW1/4 2

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 2

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 2

160N- 174 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 2

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 2

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 2

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 2

145N- 175 104 $10.00 $1,450.00 N-59074
32.37

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 3

32.11
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 3

144N- 176 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 NW1/4 ` 3

31.85
100%Sur

Min100%NE1/4 NW1/4 3

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
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Lease
Number

Montmorency County
T32N R02E

(Continued) 144N- 176 $0.00 No Bid
31.51

100%Sur
Min100%NW1/4 NW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 NW1/4 3

160N- 177 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 3

160N- 178 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 3

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 3

160N- 179 104 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59075
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 NE1/4 9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 NE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 NE1/4 9

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Montmorency County
T32N R02E

(Continued) 160N- 179 104 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59075
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
9

160N- 180 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

9

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

9

Montmorency County
T32N R03E

160181 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 NE1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 NE1/4 30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 NE1/4 30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NE1/4 30

162182 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 NW1/4 30

40.84
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 NW1/4 30

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Number

Montmorency County
T32N R03E

(Continued) 162182 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
SE1/4 NW1/4 30

40.79
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NW1/4 30

160183 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 SE1/4 30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 SE1/4 30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 SE1/4 30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SE1/4 30

121184 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NE1/4 SW1/4 30

40.73
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 SW1/4 30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 SW1/4 30

41N- 185 $0.00 No Bid
40.67

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4 30

40N- 186 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 NE1/4 31

41187 $0.00 No Bid
40.48

100%Sur
Min100%15

49
NW1/4 NW1/4 31

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
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 Bid

Lease
Number

Montmorency County
T32N R03E

37N- 188 $0.00 No Bid
37.00

100%Sur
Min100%LOT 1 31

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Number

Ogemaw County
T24N R01E

164189 103 $2.00 $328.00 59076
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%6

15
16
19

NE1/4 SW1/4 19

41.50
100%Sur

Min100%6
15
16

NW1/4 SW1/4 19

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%6
15
16
19

SE1/4 SW1/4 19

41.83
100%Sur

Min100%6
15
19

SW1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

19

165190 103 $10.00 $1,650.00 59077
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%6

15
16

NE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

30

42.07
100%Sur

Min100%15 NW1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

30

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SE1/4 NW1/4 30

42.22
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 NW1/4 30

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Otsego County
T31N R01W

6191 104 $10.00 $60.00 59078
5.17

0%Sur
Min 50%70 *Beg 2200.5 ft E of W 1/4 cor th E 220.05 ft S 2049.88

ft W 220 ft N 2047.03 ft to pob Parcel C1
7

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Presque Isle County
T33N R02E

40N- 192 104 $10.00 $400.00 N-59079
40.00

0%Sur
Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 2

Presque Isle County
T34N R04E

160N- 193 104 $10.00 $1,600.00 N-59080
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%NE1/4 SE1/4 13

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%NW1/4 SE1/4 13

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SE1/4 13

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SW1/4 SE1/4 13

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Roscommon County
T21N R04W

160194 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

16
19
20

NE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
19

NW1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
19
20
49

SE1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
19
49

SW1/4 NW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

29

120195 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%15

16
19
20
49

NE1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
19

NW1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing
easements.

29

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
16
19
20
49

SE1/4 SW1/4 29

40N- 196 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%SW1/4 SW1/4                                     Subject to existing

easements.
29

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
 Bid

Lease
Number

Roscommon County
T24N R01W

160197 $0.00 No Bid
40.00

100%Sur
Min100%49 NE1/4 SW1/4 13

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

NW1/4 SW1/4 13

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%SE1/4 SW1/4 13

40.00
100%Sur

Min100%15
49

SW1/4 SW1/4 13

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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Department of Natural Resources
State Of Michigan Land Ownership Tracking SystemMineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Wednesday May 4, 2016
 Total
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Lease
Number

Saginaw County
T12N R02E

3N- 198 $0.00 No Bid
2.90

0%Sur
Min100%*Ely 250 ft of Wly 594 ft of Sly 506 ft of E1/2 of SW1/4 33

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.
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MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES MISSION STATEMENT 

"The Michigan Department of Natural Resources is committed to the conservation, protection, management, 
use and enjoyment of the State’s natural and cultural resources for current and future generations." 

 

NATURAL RESOURCES COMMISSION STATEMENT 

The Natural Resources Commission, as the governing body for the Michigan Department of Natural Resources, 
provides a strategic framework for the DNR to effectively manage your resources. The NRC holds monthly, 
public meetings throughout Michigan, working closely with its constituencies in establishing and improving 

natural resources management policy. 

 

The Michigan Department of Natural Resources provides equal opportunities for employment and access to 
Michigan's natural resources. Both State and Federal laws prohibit discrimination on the basis of race, color, 
national origin, religion, disability, age, sex, height, weight or marital status under the U.S. Civil Rights Acts of 
1964 as amended, 1976 MI PA 453, 1976 MI PA 220, Title V of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 as amended, and 
the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act, as amended. 

If you believe that you have been discriminated against in any program, activity, or facility, or if you desire 
additional information, please write:  Human Resources, Michigan Department of Natural Resources, PO Box 
30028, Lansing MI 48909-7528, or Michigan Department of Civil Rights, Cadillac Place, 3054 West Grand Blvd, 
Suite 3-600, Detroit, MI 48202, or Division of Federal Assistance, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, 4401 North 
Fairfax Drive, Mail Stop MBSP-4020, Arlington, VA 22203 

For information or assistance on this publication, contact Kimberly Venne, Office of Minerals Management, 
Michigan Department of Natural Resources, P.O. Box 30452, Lansing, MI 48909. 

This publication is available in alternative formats upon request. 

Printed by Authority of: The Michigan Department of Natural Resources 
 


