

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
17-Dec-13	17-Dec-13	DTMB/MDOC GLOBAL POSITIONING SYSTEM (GPS)	3M ELECTRONIC MONITORING, INC	Bid	071B2200036	\$5,000,000.00	\$15,134,280.79	Extension and Dollar Authorization	5
30-Sep-14	30-Sep-14	RESTART - DTMB/MDE Project Manager for MEGS/CMS	A J BOGGS & COMPANY	Bid	071B2200226	\$188,480.00	\$565,440.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
06-May-14	06-May-14	HRMN Staff Augmentation	A R M CONSULTING CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300033	\$1,300,000.00	\$5,301,750.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
10-Jun-14	10-Jun-14	LARA - Construction Codes Software	ACCELA COM	Bid	071B3200042	\$5,819,700.00	\$10,216,815.00	Option and dollar Authorization	24
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	LARA - Construction Codes Software	ACCELA COM	Bid	071B3200042	\$395,840.00	\$4,442,115.00	Dollar Authorization	
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	LARA Construction Code Software	ACCELA COM	Bid	071B3200042	\$1,355,995.74	\$11,572,810.74	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
03-Apr-12	08-May-14	Contact Center Support	ACCENTURE	Bid	071B2200168	\$6,482,560.00	\$20,731,375.40	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
5/20/2014	5/6/2014	084 DTMB-CIP C20130618-102437	ACCENTURE	Bid	071B4300078		\$998,750.00	Follow-On	
26-Aug-14	26-Aug-14	MICSES Application MAINT & Support	ACCENTURE	Bid	071B9200166	\$723,737.00	\$124,028,765.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
15-Jul-14	13-Aug-14	RESTART Project Manager for BAM	ADVANTAGE TEK	Bid	071B2200294	\$176,576.00	\$529,728.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
14-Jan-14	14-Jan-14	Vendor Managed Services	ACRO SERVICE CORP	Bid	071B2200246	\$20,000,000.00	\$43,012,290.80	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
	05-Feb-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$287,680.00	\$1,599,100.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	08-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$321,000.00	\$2,683,940.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	27-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$267,840.00	\$2,683,940.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	13-Jun-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$74,940.00	\$3,026,720.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	09-Apr-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$238,080.00	\$1,837,180.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	09-Sep-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$277,760.00	\$6,522,505.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	01-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$238,080.00	\$2,362,940.00	Dollar Authorization	
	01-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$287,680.00	\$2,124,860.00	Dollar Authorization	
17-Dec-13	17-Dec-13	Electronic Alcohol Monitoring Device	ALCOHOL MONITORING SYSTEMS	Bid	071B2200120	\$840,000.00	\$4,480,920.80	Option and dollar Authorization	5

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	Restart 2nd WDA MTB/OsMIS Sr. Programmer Analyst	AMBERIAN CORPORATION	Bid	071B2200308	\$156,736.00	\$313,472.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
	03-Oct-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	Advocate Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B3200059	\$212,284.00	\$1,311,420.00	Dollar Authorization	
15-Jul-14	15-Jul-14	AASHTO Transportation System	AMERICAN ASSOC OF STATE HIGHWAY & TRANS OFFICIALS	Bid	071B0200182	\$680,000.00	\$5,683,675.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
22-Apr-14	23-Apr-14	RESTART Senior PA Powerbuilder Resource	AMERICAN IT SOLUTIONS, INC	Bid	071B2200163	\$164,672.00	\$494,016.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
22-Apr-14	22-Apr-14	RESTART - DTMB/LARA Senior Programmer Analyst for MBOS	AMERICAN IT SOLUTIONS, INC	Bid	071B2200231	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
17-Dec-13	19-Nov-13	Bureau of Strategic Policy (BSP) Facilitated Sessions for DTMB	ANALYSTS INTERNATIONAL SEQUOIA SERVICES GROUP	Bid	071B8200236	\$1,500,000.00	\$6,824,000.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
14-Jan-14	14-Jan-14	AAMVA	AMERICAN ASSOC OF MOTOR VEHICLE ADM	Bid	071B0200187	\$634,626.36	\$2,903,426.36	Dollar Authorization	
06-May-14	03-Jun-14	Electronic Monitoring (Tether) System - Department of Corrections	B I INCORPORATED	Bid	071B9200118	\$150,000.00	\$4,732,000.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	4
26-Nov-13	03-Dec-13	Electronic Monitoring System (Tether)	B I INCORPORATED	Bid	071B9200118	\$120,000.00	\$4,432,000.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	6
14-Jan-14	14-Jan-14	RESTART - MSP CJIC New Records Management System	Blue Leaf Management	Bid	071B3200027	\$391,920.00	\$1,076,400.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
24-Jun-14	24-Jun-14	Bureau of Strategic Policy for MDIT	ANALYSTS INTERNATIONAL SEQUOIA SERVICES GROUP	Bid	071B8200236	\$1,000,000.00	\$7,826,000.00	Dollar Authorization	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
6/24/2014	6/24/2014	071H-DTMB/SBO, MAIN Replacement ERP IMPL	CGI TECHNOLOGIES AND SOLUTIONS INC	Bid	071B4300137		\$50,627,395.00	Follow-On	
6/24/2014	6/24/2014	ERP Implementation Services Agreement	CGI TECHNOLOGIES AND SOLUTIONS INC	Bid	071B4300138		\$38,833,928.00	Follow-On	
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	Modified Adjusted Gross Income (MAGI) Eligibility Determination Service	CGI Technologies and Solutions Inc	Bid	071B3200100	\$2,435,187.59	\$14,912,117.59	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	17-May-14	MAGI Eligibility Determination Service	CGI Technologies and Solutions Inc	Bid	071B3200100	\$1,761,009.00	\$12,476,930.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	07-Jan-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B3200056	\$287,680.00	\$1,287,680.00	Dollar Authorization	
	13-Jun-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B3200056	\$137,600.00	\$1,518,080.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	08-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B3200056	\$92,800.00	\$1,380,480.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
14-Jan-14	24-Jan-14	DIT/DELEG-UIA PROJECT MANAGEMENT OFFICE FOR SYSTEM INTEGRATION PROJECT	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B0200123	\$4,359,468.00	\$18,435,423.95	Option and dollar Authorization	12
04-Feb-14	04-Feb-14	RESTART-DTMB TELECOMMUNICATIONS WEB DEVELOPER SR.	Complete Corporate Solutions, Inc.	Bid	071B2200062	\$148,800.00	\$446,400.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
	15-Sep-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B3200056	\$216,000.00	\$1,934,080.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
06-May-14	06-May-14	Compuware Vantage Product and Service	COMPUWARE CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300069	\$350,000.00	\$7,350,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	30-Jun-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B3200056	\$200,000.00	\$1,718,080.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	03-Oct-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	CHICAGO SYSTEMS GROUP INCORPORATED	Bid	071B3200056	\$404,800.00	\$1,000,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
11-Mar-14	11-Mar-14	RESTART-DTMB/LARA SR. PROGRAMMER FOR FRONT END MITALENT	COMPUWARE CORPORATION	Bid	071B2200195	\$213,840.00	\$551,120.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	511 MSP FY2010 Establish Maintenance Contract	DATAWORKS PLUS, LLC	Bid	071B0200097	\$182,992.00	\$2,164,803.22	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	09-Sep-14	MDOT Statewide Advanced Traffic Management System	DELSCAN CORPORATION	Bid	071B9200040	\$86,800.00	\$3,865,624.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
17-Dec-13	17-Dec-13	EPMO SaaS Solution and Supporting Services PPM Tool	COMPUWARE CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300038	\$1,500,000.00	\$4,181,342.00	Dollar Authorization	
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	Compuware Vantage Product and Services	COMPUWARE CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300069	\$500,000.00	\$7,885,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
	06-Mar-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	COMPUWARE CORPORATION	Bid	071B3200054	\$257,920.00	\$257,920.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
08-Apr-14	01-Mar-14	MBT/MIITAS	DELOITTE & TOUCHE LLP	Bid	071B8200018	\$10,000,000.00	\$61,890,010.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
22-Apr-14	22-Apr-14	Maintenance and Support of DHS Bridges	Deloitte Consulting LLP	Bid	071B1300256	\$2,106,000.00	\$73,234,047.00	Dollar Authorization	
24-Jun-14	25-Jun-14	Michigan Statewide Longitudinal Data System (MSLDS)	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B1300105	\$1,600,000.00	\$8,327,374.83	Option and dollar Authorization	12
26-Aug-14	26-Aug-14	Add funding to support Medicaid Compliance Program	Deloitte Consulting LLP	Bid	071B1300256	\$2,786,000.00	\$76,020,047.00	Dollar Authorization	
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	State of Michigan HUB Solution	Deloitte Consulting LLP	Bid	071B3200103	\$3,762,240.00	\$13,482,679.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	01-Aug-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$277,760.00	\$19,745,300.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	10-Dec-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$208,320.00	\$16,353,720.00	Dollar Authorization	
24-Jun-14	25-Jun-14	DIT/DCH MIHIN TECHNICAL DESIGN/PCO	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B9200296	\$7,438,016.00	\$18,278,037.63	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	02-Oct-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$136,896.00	\$15,554,250.00	Dollar Authorization	
	27-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$81,750.00	\$18,803,499.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	10-Dec-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$365,550.00	\$16,145,400.00	Dollar Authorization	
	02-Oct-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$225,600.00	\$15,779,850.00	Dollar Authorization	
	14-Jul-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$105,800.00	\$19,467,540.00	Dollar Authorization	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
	07-Jan-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$228,160.00	\$16,826,005.00	Dollar Authorization	
	09-Apr-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$1,172,544.00	\$18,503,509.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	ReStart - One Stop Programmer Analysts	Digital Technology Solutions LLC	Bid	071B2200033	\$86,773.76	\$327,360.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	2-way Radios	E F JOHNSON COMPANY	Bid	071B0200124	\$500,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	RESTART - DTMB/MDOC OMINI	E-Com Inc.	Bid	071B2200109	\$139,400.00	\$421,600.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	15-Sep-14	MDIT/Technical Services - Storage Infrastructure Solutions (SIS)	EMC CORPORATION	Bid	071B8200079	\$1,000,000.00	\$47,174,216.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
	16-Apr-14	Michigan State Housing Development Authority Elite System	EMPHASYS COMPUTER SOLUTIONS INC	Bid	071B9200171	\$1,251,218.28	\$4,251,033.59	Option and dollar Authorization	24
30-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	National Pollutant Elimination Discharge Maintenance System (NMS) Software Support	ENFOTECH & CONSULTING INC	Bid	071B0200094	\$200,492.00	\$1,402,952.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Mar-14	11-Mar-14	ReSTART - DTMB/MDE Sr. Programmer Analyst for BAA	ENGAGE INFORMATION	Bid	071B2200117	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Mar-14	25-Mar-14	DTMB TELECOM PROJECT COORDINATOR - DESIGN	ENGAGE INFORMATION	Bid	071B2200176	\$128,960.00	\$386,880.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	15-Sep-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$80,500.00	\$25,852,600.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	07-Jan-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$244,125.00	\$16,597,845.00	Dollar Authorization	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
	02-Oct-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	DEWPOINT, INC.	Bid	071B3200057	\$220,224.00	\$15,417,354.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
12-Aug-14	13-Aug-14	Exercising option and adding funds	FORRESTER RESEARCH, INC.	Bid	071B1300096	\$163,000.00	\$342,240.92	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	12-Sep-14	Information Tech Research & Advisory Services (IT-RAS) for DTMB	GARTNER GROUP INC	Bid	071B1300098	\$200,000.00	\$1,774,390.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
10/29/2013	10/31/2013	071-DTMB/FBSA/BOD, Asset Management Software	EMAINT ENTERPRISES, LLC	Bid	071B4300014		\$716,000.00	Follow-On	
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	RESTART SR. DATBASE ADMIN FOR MDOS	GDI INFOTECH INC	Bid	071B2200037	\$160,800.00	\$503,040.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
12-Nov-13	12-Nov-13	RESTART-DTMB/MDOT SENIOR SYSTEMS ANALYST FOR TEA/TEDS	GDI INFOTECH INC	Bid	071B2200104	\$137,760.00	\$415,520.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	RESTART SR Systems Analyst for MDOT	GDI INFOTECH INC	Bid	071B2200175	\$138,880.00	\$416,640.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
15-Jul-14	15-Jul-14	Computer Software Consultant to Supply Facade - Family Independence Agency	Global Vision Technologies Inc.	Bid	071B9200015	\$1,377,316.00	\$8,886,132.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	30-Jul-14	Restart - DTMB/MDE BAA - Senior Programmer Analyst	Gnosis Technologies	Bid	071B2200260	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	RESTART Testing Technicians SACWIS	Gnosis Technologies	Bid	071B2200056	\$540,640.00	\$1,676,420.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	SENIOR PROJECT MANAGER - DTMB - ORS	HG DETROIT CONSULTING, LLC (dba, HALO GROUP)	Bid	071B2200045	\$218,240.00	\$654,720.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	30-Jul-14	RESTART Sr. Programmer Analyst for MDOT PMO	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B2200274	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
30-Sep-13	26-Nov-13	Enhanced Document Management	Evans CaseLoad, Inc.	Bid	071B0200162	\$238,241.00	\$3,400,568.55	Dollar Authorization	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
26-Nov-13	26-Nov-13	Enhanced Document Management	Evans CaseLoad, Inc.	Bid	071B0200162	\$7,707,828.70	\$11,396,049.00	Dollar Authorization	
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	Second Generation Retail Sales System	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B1300157	\$16,126,203.00	\$36,825,993.00	Option and dollar Authorization	60
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	Second Generation Retail Sales System	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B1300157	\$16,126,203.00	\$36,825,993.00	Option and dollar Authorization	60
11-Sep-14	15-Sep-14	Restart Senior Project Manager for MDOT	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B2200275	\$218,240.00	\$654,720.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	15-Sep-14	Restart Sr. Data Architect for MDOT LAMP	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B2200273	\$218,240.00	\$654,720.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	Information Technology Research and Advisory Services (IT-RAS) for DTMB	FORRESTER RESEARCH, INC.	Bid	071B1300096	\$55,272.58	\$730,513.50	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	18-Apr-14	Information Tech Research & Advisory Services	GARTNER GROUP INC	Bid	071B1300098	\$59,120.00	\$1,574,390.00	Dollar Authorization	
10-Jun-14	10-Jun-14	DCH Medicaid Cost Settlement	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B0200024	\$2,097,870.70	\$12,648,212.48	Option and dollar Authorization	12
20-May-14	30-May-14	GRANT ELECTRONIC MONITORING SYSTEM(GEMS) FOR MDE	HTC GLOBAL SERVICES INC	Bid	071B1300375	\$141,000.00	\$1,074,800.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	19-Nov-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B3200053	\$257,920.00	\$775,744.00	Dollar Authorization	
	19-Nov-13	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B3200053	\$323,392.00	\$517,824.00	Dollar Authorization	
22-Apr-14	22-Apr-14	RESTART - DTMB/MSP SR. PROGRAMMER FOR SEX OFFENDER	HTC GLOBAL SERVICES INC	Bid	071B2200203	\$148,800.00	\$446,400.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	30-Sep-14	Second Generation Retail Sales System	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B1300157	\$149,875.00	\$36,975,868.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
10-Jun-14	10-Jun-14	HOSTING/INFRAS SERV, CMS SOLUTION AND ADM SERVICES	IBM CORPORATION	Bid	071B9200124	\$10,300,000.00	\$47,594,217.00	Option and dollar Authorization	24
	01-May-14	Pre-Qualified IT Services Contract Programmer	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B3200053	\$194,432.00	\$970,176.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
04-Feb-14	04-Feb-14	Add funding to customize web-based COTS software Egramsto automate Title IV-E process...	HTC GLOBAL SERVICES INC	Bid	071B1300146	\$126,600.00	\$1,827,424.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
26-Aug-14	26-Aug-14	RESTART Sr. Programmer Analyst for MGCB	INFINITE COMPUTING SYSTEMS	Bid	071B2200269	\$128,960.00	\$386,880.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	01-Sep-14	Field Manager Disadvantaged Business Enterprise (DBE) Services	INFO TECH INC	Bid	071B1300288	\$58,300.00	\$227,800.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
30-Sep-14	30-Sep-14	Lawson Software Maintenance and Support	INFOR (US), INC	Bid	071B3200041	\$811,685.25	\$2,880,072.22	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	05-Mar-14	431/391 -RFP Electronic Doc Mgmt - C2011062	HTC GLOBAL SERVICES INC	Bid	071B2200068	\$220,000.00	\$1,748,320.00	Dollar Authorization	
15-Sep-14	15-Sep-14	431/931 - RFP Electronic DOC MGMT - C2011062	IBM CORPORATION	Bid	071B2200099	\$80,734.00	\$1,590,719.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	25-Mar-14	431/931 - RFP Electronic DOC MGMT - C2011062	IBM CORPORATION	Bid	071B2200099	\$876,658.00	\$1,509,985.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
3/25/2014	4/1/2014	391 DCH Emergency Med Service C20131007-	IMAGETREND, INC.	Bid	071B4300073		\$721,120.00	Follow-On	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	Michigan Emergency Medical Services Information System (MEMSIS)	IMAGETREND, INC.	Bid	071B4300073	\$225,300.00	\$946,420.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
30-Sep-14	30-Sep-14	Oracle Migration Project	INTERGRAPH CORPORATION	Bid	071B2200240	\$420,444.00	\$1,509,950.58	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Jul-14	29-Jul-14	ERP Consulting Services	INTERNATIONAL CONSULTING ACQUISITION CORPORATION	Bid	071B3200088	\$4,356,720.00	\$6,856,720.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	6
	30-May-14	IPSwitch Messageway Product and Services	IPSWITCH INC	Bid	071B1300134	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	14-Mar-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	Bid	071B1300137	\$283,712.00	\$3,862,152.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	TWO-WAY RADIOS	KENWOOD USA CORPORATION	Bid	071B0200128	\$500,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	31-Jul-14	Restart - DTMB/MDE BAA - Senior Business Analyst	KEY BUSINESS SOLUTIONS	Bid	071B2200261	\$146,816.00	\$440,448.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
26-Nov-13	03-Dec-13	RESTART SR DBASE Admin for MDOT	KUTIR CORPORATION	Bid	071B2200072	\$158,720.00	\$476,160.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
12-Nov-13	12-Nov-13	RESTART one sr. pm and 3 sr pa for MDOC	LAZER TECHNOLOGIES INC	Bid	071B2200098	\$218,240.00	\$590,480.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Mar-14	25-Mar-14	RESTART Telecom Technology Consultant	LAZER TECHNOLOGIES INC	Bid	071B2200123	\$176,576.00	\$529,728.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
10-Jun-14	11-Jun-14	RESTART - DTMB/LARA ARCHITECT FOR MITALENT	LEARNGAUGE, LLC	Bid	071B2200213	\$228,160.00	\$684,480.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
11-Mar-14	11-Mar-14	RESTART-DTMB/LARA SR. PROGRAMMER FOR FRONT END ITALENT	MAGNA SYSTEMS INTERNATIONAL	Bid	071B2200192	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	16-Jul-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	Bid	071B1300137	\$145,824.00	\$4,424,656.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
20-May-14	20-May-14	RESTART -DTMB/DCH Senior Programmer Analyst for Vital Records	Mejenta Systems Inc.	Bid	071B2200239	\$158,720.00	\$476,160.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	05-Nov-13	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence	INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	Bid	071B1300137	\$274,000.00	\$3,578,440.00	Dollar Authorization	
	09-Jun-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	Bid	071B1300137	\$99,240.00	\$4,278,832.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	08-May-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	Bid	071B1300137	\$317,440.00	\$4,179,592.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
13-Sep-13	01-Oct-13	CAMPAIGN FINANCE REPORTING-DOS, BUREAU OF ELECTION	NATIONAL INFORMATION CONSORTIUM TECHNOLOGIES INC	Bid	071B2001188	\$311,220.00	\$12,174,931.31	Extension and Dollar Authorization	3
10-Jun-14	11-Jun-14	Statewide Social Networking Services	Neighborhood America Inc.	Bid	071B0200221	\$455,000.00	\$2,638,600.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
11-Sep-14	11-Sep-14	E-Recruiting	NEOGOV/Governmentjobs.com, Inc.	Bid	071B8200298	\$290,000.00	\$1,755,300.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
24-Jun-14	24-Jun-14	Ecrash & Ecitation for MSP	IYETEK LLC	Bid	071B0200339	\$899,392.00	\$3,155,967.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	12-Nov-13	Telecom Billing System Main & Support	MATSCH FINANCIAL SYSTEMS LTD	Bid	071B2200137	\$56,800.00	\$1,831,045.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
26-Nov-13	09-Dec-13	Correctional Offender Management and Profiling for Alternative Solutions	Northpointe, Inc.	Bid	071B3200096	\$874,300.00	\$1,404,665.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
30-Sep-14	30-Sep-14	Correctional Offender Management and Profiling for Alternative Solutions	Northpointe, Inc.	Bid	071B3200096	\$700,000.00	\$2,104,665.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	03-Apr-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	MIPRO Consulting	Bid	071B1300140	\$248,000.00	\$2,713,960.00	Dollar Authorization	
17-Dec-13	17-Dec-13	RESTART One Sr. PM and 3 SR PA for MDOC	Omniscient Systems, Inc.	Bid	071B2200097	\$166,656.00	\$499,176.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	RESTART ONE STOP PROGRAMMER ANALYSTS	OPTECH, LLC	Bid	071B2200034	\$109,120.00	\$327,360.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12
20-May-14	20-May-14	RESTART 1 PROGRAMMER ANALYST FOR LARA	OPTECH, LLC	Bid	071B2200229	\$107,136.00	\$321,408.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	03-Dec-13	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	MIPRO Consulting	Bid	071B1300140	\$150,800.00	\$2,215,960.00	Dollar Authorization	
	24-Jan-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	MIPRO Consulting	Bid	071B1300140	\$250,000.00	\$2,465,960.00	Dollar Authorization	
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	Electronic Medical Business Record System	NETSMART TECHNOLOGIES, INC	Bid	071B3200052	\$1,462,330.00	\$16,462,330.00	Dollar Authorization	
17-Dec-13	17-Dec-13	Electronic Medical Business Records (EMBR)	NETSMART TECHNOLOGIES, INC	Bid	071B3200052	\$1,664,496.00	\$19,068,643.00	Dollar Authorization	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
8/26/2014	8/26/2014	REAL TIME MONITORING AND LOG ANALYSIS SYSTEM	NOVACOAST, INC	Bid	071B4300140		\$562,296.65	Follow-On	
10-Jun-14	19-Jun-14	APC Outpatient Claim Methodology - DCH	OptumInsight, Inc.	Bid	071B9200312	\$2,672,434.00	\$5,026,166.00	Option and dollar Authorization	60
	05-Sep-14	APC Outpatient Claim Methodology - DCH	OptumInsight, Inc.	Bid	071B9200312	\$70,362.00	\$5,096,528.00	Option and dollar Authorization	60
30-Sep-14	15-Sep-14	Real Time Monitoring and Log Analysis System	Novacoast, Inc.	Bid	071B4300140	\$149,856.44	\$712,153.09	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
15-Oct-13	15-Nov-13	Eskort Compliance Solution - Add funds and change buyer name.	OPTUM GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC.	Bid	071B1300034	\$500,000.00	\$4,366,824.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
26-Nov-13	26-Nov-13	ReSTART - TMSH - Add Dollars and Exercise Option Year	PEER Solutions Group, Inc.	Bid	071B2200042	\$134,160.00	\$443,664.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	03-Oct-13	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	OPTUM GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC.	Bid	071B1300138	\$165,000.00	\$24,410,398.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
	13-Jul-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	OPTUM GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC.	Bid	071B1300138	\$248,000.00	\$49,538,350.00	Dollar Authorization	
12-Nov-13	12-Nov-13	RESTART-DTMB/MDOT SENIOR TECHNICAL WRITER	PTD TECHNOLOGY	Bid	071B2200103	\$97,171.25	\$315,411.25	Option and dollar Authorization	12
10-Jun-14	11-Jun-14	Q2 INVESTMENT ACCOUNTING & PORTFOLIO MGT	QED INFORMATION SYSTEMS INC	Bid	071B1300386	\$343,721.50	\$1,630,872.10	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	RESTART One Sr. Pm and 3 SR PA for MDOC	QUESTA TECHNOLOGY, INC.	Bid	071B2200096	\$162,520.00	\$456,960.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	Restart - Sr. Application/Sys Engineer	RAMSOFT SYSTEMS INC	Bid	071B3200015	\$166,656.00	\$333,312.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	12

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
11-Mar-14	11-Mar-14	RESTART Back End Programmers	RAMSOFT SYSTEMS INC	Bid	071B2200187	\$152,768.00	\$458,304.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	RESTART - DTMB/MDOT Senior Application Software Engineer	ROBBINS - GIOIA INC	Bid	071B2200162	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	RESTART - DTMB/MDOT Senior Application/Software Engineer	ROBBINS - GIOIA INC	Bid	071B2200167	\$168,640.00	\$505,920.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	07-Jan-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	OPTUM GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC.	Bid	071B1300138	\$145,600.00	\$49,290,350.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
06-May-14	05-Jun-14	RFP Security Awareness	SECURITY MENTOR, INC	Bid	071B2200258	\$180,180.00	\$395,580.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
29-Oct-13	29-Oct-13	RESTART-DTMB/MDOC PROGRAMMER ANALYST SR.	SMART SOURCE TECHNOLOGIES	Bid	071B2200110	\$167,620.00	\$500,140.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
22-Apr-14	22-Apr-14	RESTART-DTMB/MSP SR. PROGRAMMER FOR SEX OFFENDER REGISTRY DEVELOPMENT	SYSTEMS TECHNOLOGY GROUP INC	Bid	071B2200202	\$148,800.00	\$446,400.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
12-Nov-13	12-Nov-13	RESTART - DPE ESS Developer	SYSTEMS TECHNOLOGY GROUP INC	Bid	071B3200033	\$168,640.00	\$337,280.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
	08-Jul-14	DTMB Data Warehouse Business Intelligence (BI)	OPTUM GOVERNMENT SOLUTIONS, INC.	Bid	071B1300138	\$1,663,325.00	\$51,201,678.00	Dollar Authorization	
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	TWO-WAY RADIOS	T & W ELECTRONICS INC	Bid	071B0200127	\$500,000.00	\$2,450,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	TWO-WAY RADIOS	TAIT NORTH AMERICA, INC.	Bid	071B0200126	\$500,000.00	\$1,500,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
12-Nov-13	01-Nov-13	Oracle Software and Support - DTMB	ORACLE AMERICA, INC.	Bid	071B0200245	\$2,000,000.00	\$62,236,979.05	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	
11-Mar-14	11-Mar-14	Oracle America, Inc. - Funding Increase	ORACLE AMERICA, INC.	Bid	071B0200245	\$15,000,000.00	\$77,236,979.05	Dollar Authorization	

Michigan Department of Technology, Management Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2014

As Required by Section 830 of PA 252 of 2014

Ad Board Date	Effective Date of Change	Description	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period - In Months
30-Sep-14	30-Sep-14	Statewide Automated Child Welfare Information System (SACWIS) Design, Development and Implementation (DDI).	UNISYS CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300247	\$1,988,000.00	\$61,167,880.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
06-May-14	06-May-14	SACWIS Project	UNISYS CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300247	\$7,648,680.00	\$59,179,880.00	Option and dollar Authorization	10
04-Feb-14	04-Feb-14	SACWIS Project	UNISYS CORPORATION	Bid	071B1300247	\$4,227,640.00	\$51,531,200.00	Option and dollar Authorization	2
22-Apr-14	22-Apr-14	4 SENIOR PROGRAMMER ANALYSTS - MSP	VED SOFTWARE SERVICES INC	Bid	071B2200201	\$148,800.00	\$297,600.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
28-Aug-14	28-Aug-14	DLEG/OFIS Web-Based Database System to Track Deferred Presentment Transactions	VERITEC SOLUTIONS, LLC	Bid	071B6200311	\$650,000.00	\$11,450,000.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	6
25-Feb-14	25-Feb-14	2-way Radios	VERTEX STANDARD	Bid	071B0200125	\$500,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	Option and dollar Authorization	12
12-Nov-13	15-May-14	Enterprise SW License for Fully Integrated eProcurement System...	PERISCOPE HOLDINGS INC	Bid	071B3200023	\$765,640.00	\$12,882,502.00	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Scope and \$ Auth	