Michigan
Register

Issue No. 2— 2016 (Published February 15, 2016)




GRAPHIC IMAGES IN THE

MICHIGAN REGISTER

COVER DRAWING

Michigan State Capitol:
This image, with flags flying to indicate that both chambers of the legislature are in session, may have originated
as an etching based on a drawing or a photograph. The artist is unknown. The drawing predates the placement of

the statue of Austin T. Blair on the capitol grounds in 1898.

(Michigan State Archives)

PAGE GRAPHICS

Capitol Dome:
The architectural rendering of the Michigan State Capitol’s dome is the work of Elijah E. Myers, the building’s
renowned architect. Myers inked the rendering on linen in late 1871 or early 1872. Myers’ fine draftsmanship,
the hallmark of his work, is clearly evident.
Because of their size, few architectural renderings of the 19™ century have survived. Michigan is fortunate that
many of Myers’ designs for the Capitol were found in the building’s attic in the 1950’s. As part of the state’s

1987 sesquicentennial celebration, they were conserved and deposited in the Michigan State Archives.

(Michigan State Archives)

East Elevation of the Michigan State Capitol:
When Myers’ drawings were discovered in the 1950’s, this view of the Capitol — the one most familiar to
Michigan citizens — was missing. During the building’s recent restoration (1989-1992), this drawing was

commissioned to recreate the architect’s original rendering of the east (front) elevation.

(Michigan Capitol Committee)



Michigan
Register

Published pursuant to § 24.208 of
The Michigan Compiled Laws

Issue No. 2— 2016

(This issue, published February 15, 2016, contains
documents filed from January 15, 2016 to February 1, 2016)

Compiled and Published by the

Office of Regulatory Reinvention




© 2016 by Office of Regulatory Reinvention, State of Michigan
All rights reserved.
Printed in the United States of America

Michigan Register (ISSN 0892-3124). Published twice per month, with a cumulative index, by the Office of
Regulatory Reinvention, pursuant to §24.208 of the Michigan Compiled Laws. Subscription $400.00 per year,
postpaid to points in the U.S. First class postage paid at Lansing, Michigan. Direct all mail concerning
subscriptions to Office of Regulatory Reinvention, Ottawa Building — Second Floor, 611 W. Ottawa, Lansing, MI
48909

Mike Zimmer, Director, Licensing and Regulatory Affairs; Deidre O’Berry, Administrative Rules Specialist for
Operations and Publications.



Rick Snyder, Governor

Brian Calley, Lieutenant Governor



PREFACE

PUBLICATION AND CONTENTS OF THE MICHIGAN REGISTER
The Office of Regulatory Reform publishes the Michigan Register.

While several statutory provisions address the publication and contents of the Michigan Register, two are of
particular importance.

24.208 Michigan register; publication; cumulative index; contents; public subscription; fee; synopsis of
proposed rule or guideline; transmitting copies to office of regulatory reform.

Sec. 8.

(1) The office of regulatory reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once each month. The Michigan
register shall contain all of the following:

(a) Executive orders and executive reorganization orders.

(b) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills signed into law
by the governor during the calendar year and the corresponding public act numbers.

(c) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills vetoed by the
governor during the calendar year.

(d) Proposed administrative rules.

(e) Notices of public hearings on proposed administrative rules.

(f) Administrative rules filed with the secretary of state.

(g) Emergency rules filed with the secretary of state.

(h) Notice of proposed and adopted agency guidelines.

(1) Other official information considered necessary or appropriate by the office of regulatory reform.
(j) Attorney general opinions.

(k) All of the items listed in section 7(m) after final approval by the certificate of need commission under section
22215 of the public health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.22215.

(2) The office of regulatory reform shall publish a cumulative index for the Michigan register.

(3) The Michigan register shall be available for public subscription at a fee reasonably calculated to cover
publication and distribution costs.

(4) If publication of an agency's proposed rule or guideline or an item described in subsection (1)(k) would be
unreasonably expensive or lengthy, the office of regulatory reform may publish a brief synopsis of the proposed
rule or guideline or item described in subsection (1)(k), including information on how to obtain a complete copy
of the proposed rule or guideline or item described in subsection (1)(k) from the agency at no cost.

(5) An agency shall electronically transmit a copy of the proposed rules and notice of public hearing to the office
of regulatory reform for publication in the Michigan register.



4.1203 Michigan register fund; creation; administration; expenditures; disposition of money received from
sale of Michigan register and amounts paid by state agencies; use of fund; price of Michigan register;
availability of text on internet; copyright or other proprietary interest; fee prohibited; definition.

Sec. 203.

(1) The Michigan register fund is created in the state treasury and shall be administered by the office of regulatory
reform. The fund shall be expended only as provided in this section.

(2) The money received from the sale of the Michigan register, along with those amounts paid by state agencies
pursuant to section 57 of the administrative procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.257, shall be
deposited with the state treasurer and credited to the Michigan register fund.

(3) The Michigan register fund shall be used to pay the costs of preparing, printing, and distributing the Michigan
register.

(4) The department of management and budget shall sell copies of the Michigan register at a price determined by
the office of regulatory reform not to exceed the cost of preparation, printing, and distribution.

(5) Notwithstanding section 204, beginning January 1, 2001, the office of regulatory reform shall make the text of
the Michigan register available to the public on the internet.

(6) The information described in subsection (5) that is maintained by the office of regulatory reform shall be made
available in the shortest feasible time after the information is available. The information described in subsection
(5) that is not maintained by the office of regulatory reform shall be made available in the shortest feasible time
after it is made available to the office of regulatory reform.

(7) Subsection (5) does not alter or relinquish any copyright or other proprietary interest or entitlement of this
state relating to any of the information made available under subsection (5).

(8) The office of regulatory reform shall not charge a fee for providing the Michigan register on the internet as
provided in subsection (5).

(9) As used in this section, “Michigan register” means that term as defined in section 5 of the administrative
procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.205.

CITATION TO THE MICHIGAN REGISTER
The Michigan Register is cited by year and issue number. For example, 2001 MR 1 refers to the year of issue
(2001) and the issue number (1).

CLOSING DATES AND PUBLICATION SCHEDULE
The deadlines for submitting documents to the Office of Regulatory Reinvention for publication in the Michigan
Register are the first and fifteenth days of each calendar month, unless the submission day falls on a Saturday,
Sunday, or legal holiday, in which event the deadline is extended to include the next day which is not a Saturday,
Sunday, or legal holiday. Documents filed or received after 5:00 p.m. on the closing date of a filing period will
appear in the succeeding issue of the Michigan Register.

The Office of Regulatory Reinvention is not responsible for the editing and proofreading of documents submitted
for publication.

Documents submitted for publication should be delivered or mailed in an electronic format to the following
address: MICHIGAN REGISTER, Office of Regulatory Reinvention, Ottawa Building — Second Floor, 611 W.
Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48909.



RELATIONSHIP TO THE MICHIGAN ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
The Michigan Administrative Code (1979 edition), which contains all permanent administrative rules in effect as
of December 1979, was, during the period 1980-83, updated each calendar quarter with the publication of a
paperback supplement. An annual supplement contained those permanent rules, which had appeared in the 4
quarterly supplements covering that year.

Quarterly supplements to the Code were discontinued in January 1984, and replaced by the monthly publication
of permanent rules and emergency rules in the Michigan Register. Annual supplements have included the full text
of those permanent rules that appear in the twelve monthly issues of the Register during a given calendar year.
Emergency rules published in an issue of the Register are noted in the annual supplement to the Code.

SUBSCRIPTIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
The Michigan Register, a publication of the State of Michigan, is available for public subscription at a cost of
$400.00 per year. Submit subscription requests to: Office of Regulatory Reinvention, Ottawa Building — Second
Floor, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48909. Checks Payable: State of Michigan. Any questions should be
directed to the Office of Regulatory Reinvention (517) 335-8658.

INTERNET ACCESS
The Michigan Register can be viewed free of charge on the Internet web site of the Office of Regulatory
Reinvention: www.michigan.gov/orr.

Issue 2000-3 and all subsequent editions of the Michigan Register can be viewed on the Office of Regulatory
Reinvention Internet web site. The electronic version of the Register can be navigated using the blue highlighted
links found in the Contents section. Clicking on a highlighted title will take the reader to related text, clicking on
a highlighted header above the text will return the reader to the Contents section.

Mike Zimmer, Director
Licensing and Regulatory Affairs



2016 PUBLICATION SCHEDULE

Closing Date for
Issue Filing or Submission Publication
No. Of Documents (5 p.m.) Date
1 January 15, 2016 February 1, 2016
2 February 1, 2016 February 15, 2016
3 February 15, 2016 March 1, 2016
4 March 1, 2016 March 15, 2016
5 March 15, 2016 April 1, 2016
6 April 1, 2016 April 15,2016
7 April 15,2016 May 1, 2016
8 May 1, 2016 May 15, 2016
9 May 15, 2016 June 1, 2016
10 June 1, 2016 June 15, 2016
11 June 15, 2016 July 1, 2016
12 July 1, 2016 July 15, 2016
13 July 15, 2016 August 1, 2016
14 August 1, 2016 August 15, 2016
15 August 15, 2016 September 1, 2016
16 September 1, 2016 September 15, 2016
17 September 15, 2016 October 1, 2016
18 October 1, 2016 October 15, 2016
19 October 15, 2016 November 1, 2016
20 November 1, 2016 November 15, 2016
21 November 15, 2016 December 1, 2016
22 December 1, 2016 December 15, 2016
23 December 15, 2016 January 1, 2017
24 January 1, 2017 January 15, 2017




CONTENTS

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES FILED
WITH SECRETARY OF STATE

Department of Health and Human Services
Bureau of Disease Control, Prevention and Epidemiology (2015-093)
Transportation and Disposition of Dead Bodies..........cccceeveerieniiiiniininiiiienceiceie 2-3

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES,
NOTICES OF PUBLIC HEARINGS

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Director’s Office (2015-025)
Part 9a. Mechanical Code ...........coiiiiiiiiiiiiiee e e 5-10
Public HEaring NOTICE. .......eeiuiieiieiiie ettt ettt et siee et e s ens 11-12

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Director’s Office (2015-026)
Part 7. PIUMDBING COA@ ......veiiiiieiiiiiieiiecitee ettt ettt et enseens 13-22
PUDIic HEaring NOTICE.....c.vieuiieiieiiieeieeeiie ettt ettt et ettt teeebeesaaeenseessneensaesnseens 23-24

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Director’s Office (2015-032)
Part 4. BUuilding Code.......ccuviiiiiieiiieieeeces ettt et e eaae e e es 25-45
Public HEaring NOTICE . .......eeiuiieiieiie ettt ettt ettt et e s ens 46-47

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Director’s Office (2015-036)
Rehabilitation Code .........c.ooiiiiiiiiiiii e 48-53
Public HEaring INOTICE......ccvieeiieeiiie ettt ettt et e e e et e e eaaeessaaeeenseeeesaaeeenseeeensees 54-55

MICHIGAN ADMINISTRATIVE CODE TABLE

TabIe (2016 SESSION) ...eecvviiiiieiieiieeiteete ettt et e st e eteesteeebeessaeessaessseesseessseensaessseesseessseeseessseans 57-57

Cumulative INAEX (2016) ....eecriiiieieeiie ettt e e et e et e e et e e e taeeesbaeeesaeessaaeessseeenseeens 58-59

BILLS SIGNED INTO LAW OR VETOED

Appendix Table 1 (2016 Session) (Legislative Service Bureau Pages (1-1) .....cccccoeviiiienienen. 60-60



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES
FILED WITH THE SECRETARY OF STATE

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reinvention shall publish the Michigan register at least
once each month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

() Administrative rules filed with the secretary of state.”



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES
BUREAU OF DISEASE CONTROL, PREVENTION AND EPIDEMIOLOGY
TRANSPORTATION AND DISPOSITION OF DEAD BODIES
Filed with the Secretary of State on January 28, 2016
These rules become effective 7 days after filing with the Secretary of State.

(By authority conferred on the department of health and human services by section 2226 of 1978
PA 368, MCL 333.2226, section 2233 of 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.2233; by section 2678 of 1978
PA 368, MCL 333.2678; and by Executive Reorganization Orders No. 2015-1 and No. 2015-4.)

R 325.1, R 325.2, R 325.3, and R 325.4 are added to the Michigan Administrative Code as
follows:

R 325.1 Preparation and transportation of bodies dead from certain causes; permission for public
funeral.

Rule 1. (1) The bodies of those who have died of diphtheria, meningococcic infections, plague,
poliomyelitis, scarlet fever, or smallpox shall not be transported or accepted for transportation
unless they have been prepared for shipment by being thoroughly embalmed and disinfected by
arterial and cavity injection with an accepted embalming fluid. This preparation must be
effected by an embalmer licensed with the state of Michigan.

(2) When bodies are transported under this rule, notice must be sent by the shipping embalmer
to the health officer of the jurisdiction where the body is to be received, advising the date and
time of arrival.

(3) Public funerals may be conducted, provided that prior permission is obtained from the local
health officer. When permission is granted, persons in isolated areas may be released for the
purpose of accompanying the body to a funeral home, church, or cemetery, provided that they do
all of the following:

(a) Use a separate car or means of conveyance.

(b) Remain in a separate room or separate from the public and avoid proximity to others in
attendance.

(c) Return to the area or isolation and remain there until premises are released from isolation
and quarantine.

R 325.2 Transportation of certain bodies in sound shipping cases; preparation for shipment;
burial-transit or disinterment permit.

Rule 2. Bodies dead from a cause not named in R 325.1 that will reach their destination within
48 hours from the time of death, or are addressed to the demonstrator of anatomy of a medical
college or for other demonstration purposes, may be received for transportation when encased in
a sound shipping case. If the body is not so addressed or cannot reach its destination within 48
hours it must be prepared for shipment as described in R 325.1. When dead bodies are shipped



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

by common carrier, a burial-transit or disinterment permit shall be securely fastened upon the
outside box, and a duplicate of the permit shall be supplied by the funeral director to the person
escorting the body, or, if there is no escort, a duplicate of the permit shall be mailed to the
receiving funeral director.

R 325.3 Burial-transit permit.

Rule 3. The Michigan department of health and human services may authorize a registrars,
mortuary science, and funeral director licensees to have full authority to make out and sign a
new burial-transit permit where a dead human body is transferred beyond the destination point as
given on the burial-transit permit which accompanies the body. The same applies to cases where
bodies are placed in a cemetery vault and transferred at some later date. The original burial-
transit permit which accompanies the body must be given to the registrar, mortuary science, or
funeral director licensee before a new burial-transit permit is made by the person authorizing the
transfer. The person issuing the new permit must indicate the point of destination on the original
burial-transit permit. When a mortuary science or funeral director licensee issues a new burial-
transit permit, the original burial-transit permit must be filed within 72 hours with the registrar in
whose jurisdiction the transfer was made.

R 325.4 Removal of body from incorporated or unincorporated area; death or stillbirth
certificate; burial-transit permit; duty of county clerk.

Rule 4. (1) When a mortuary science or funeral director licensee is called upon to remove a
body from an incorporated or unincorporated area, the mortuary science or funeral director
licensee may remove the body for the purpose of caring for it but must file a completed death or
stillbirth certificate and secure a burial-transit permit within 72 hours from the local registrar of
the incorporated or unincorporated area in which the death occurred.

(2) If a death occurs in an unincorporated area, when a Sunday or a holiday or both, or when an
immediate internment, cremation, or shipment makes it impossible to obtain a burial-transit
permit by mail, a mortuary science or funeral director licensee may issue a burial-transit permit
to him or herself, provided that the envelope in which the completed death or stillbirth certificate
is mailed to the county clerk in whose jurisdiction the death occurred is postmarked within the
72 hours after the death occurred.

(3) If for any other reason a burial-transit permit has not been received by mail in time for the
interment, cremation, or shipment, the mortuary science or funeral director licensee may issue a
burial-transit permit to him or herself, provided that the envelope in which the completed death
or stillbirth certificate was mailed to the county clerk in whose jurisdiction the death occurred is
postmarked within the 72 hours after the death occurred.

(4) When a county clerk receives a death or stillbirth certificate from his or her primary
registration district by mail, he or she shall enter on the certificate, as the date of filing, the date
on which the certificate or certificates were received and shall also enter beneath the date of
filing the postdate appearing on the envelope in which the certificate or certificates arrived.



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES,
NOTICES OF PUBLIC HEARINGS

MCL 24.242(3) states in part:

*“... the agency shall submit a copy of the notice of public hearing to the Office of Regulatory
Reform for publication in the Michigan register. An agency's notice shall be published in the
Michigan register before the public hearing and the agency shall file a copy of the notice of
public hearing with the Office of Regulatory Reform.”

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once
each month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

(d) Proposed administrative rules.

(e) Notices of public hearings on proposed administrative rules.”



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR'’S OFFICE
CONSTRUCTION CODE

Draft November 11, 2015
Filed with the Secretary of State on
These rules take effect 120 days after filing with Secretary of State

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by
section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-4 and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030)

R 408.30901a, R 408.30912a, R 408.30923a, R 408.30928a, R 408.30935a, R 408.30936a, R
408.30945a, R 408.30946, and R 408.30948, of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended
and R 408.30915a, R 408.30916, R 408.30018a, R 408.30947, and R 408.30948a are rescinded
as follows:

PART 9A. MECHANICAL CODE
AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS TO BASIC MECHANICAL CODE

R 408.30901a International mechanical code; adoption by reference.

Rule 901a. The provisions of the international mechanical code, 26422015 edition, except for
sections 102.10, 102.11, 103.2, 103.4, 106.1.1, 106.1.2, 106.5.1 to 106.5.3, 107.2.5 to 107.2.5.3,
109.2 to 109.7, +6H+te1+04+2; 1101.10, and appendix B govern the construction, alteration,
relocation, demolition, use, and occupancy of buildings and structures. With the exceptions
noted, the code is adopted in these rules by reference. All references to the International
Building Code, International Residential Code, International Energy Conservation Code,
National Electrical Code, International Mechanical Code, and International Plumbing Code
mean the Michigan Building Code, Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Bniferm Energy
Code, Michigan Electrical Code, Michigan Mechanical Code, and Michigan Plumbing Code
respectlvely The code is avallable for 1nspect10n at the lemes eﬁieeef—the Michigan
es Department of
Llcensmg and Regulatory Affalrs, Bureau of Constructlon Codes, 611 W. Ottawa St., 1%
Floor Ottawa Building, Lansing, MI 48933. The code may be purchased from the
International Code Council, through eur the bureau s website at www. mlchlgan gov/bcc,

Gmel%@kemes—M&eh&-gaﬂ— at a cost as of the tlme of adoptlon of these rules of $—7—1—99 $76 00

each.

R 408.30912a Enclosed parking garages.



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Rule 912a. Section 404.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

404.1. Enclosed parking garages. Mechanical ventilation systems for enclosed parking garages
are not required to operate continuously where the system is arranged to operate automatically
upon detection of carbon monoxide (CO) not to exceed 25 parts per million (ppm) and nitrogen
dioxide (NO2) not to exceed 3 ppm by approved automatic detection devices. Upen-aetivation

stichsstersshab-operatefor 30-nutes:

404.1.1 Testing. Testing of detection devices shall be per manufacturer’s installation
instructions. All detectors shall be calibrated per the manufacturer’s instructions at an interval
not to exceed 1 year.

R 408.30915a Seope-ofarticleradoptionbyreference-Rescinded.
Rule g ection-60 0fthe code ic amandad o rand 1l ovrzas

R 408.30923a Equipment installation.
Rule 923a. Sections 301.10.1 is added to the code and section 309.1 of the code is amended to
read as follows:



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

301.10.1. Electrical disconnect. The mechanical contractor shall ensure that all equipment
have an electrical disconnect switch on, or immediately adjacent to, the equipment.

309.1. Occupiable space heating system. Interior spaces intended for human occupancy shall
be provided with heating facilities capable of maintaining a minimum room temperature of 68
degrees Fahrenheit at a point 3 feet above the floor and 2 feet from exterior walls at the design
temperature. The installation of portable space heaters shall not be used to achieve compliance
with this section.

Exception:

1. Interior spaces where the primary purpose is not associated with human comfort.

2. Group F, H, S, and U occupancies.

R 408.30928a Solid fuel burning equipment.

Rule 928a. Sections 901.5, 929.0, and 929.1 are added to the code to read as follows:

901.5 Solid fuel burning equipment. Solid fuel burning equipment shall be listed and labeled
in accordance with section 301.4; of the code and installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s #stalation-instructions;-and NFPA 211-26462013 requirements.

929.0 Solid fuel hydronic heaters.

929.1 Solid fuel hydronic heaters must shall be listed and labeled, or approved by the code
official in accordance with the Michigan mechanical code section 105, or have certificate of
acceptability issued by the Michigan construction code commission.

R 408.30935a Commercial kitchens; ventilation.

Rule 935a Sections 506.1, 506.3.6, 507.1, and 567-9507.2.6, of the code are amended and
sections 507.16.1.1 is added to the code to read as follows:

506.1. Ventilation requirements for commercial kitchens. Commercial kitchen hood ventilation
ducts and exhaust equipment shall be in compliance with NFPA-96-2644+2014, which is the
standard of the national fire protection association listed in chapter 15 of the code.

506.3.6 Grease duct clearances. Grease duct systems and exhaust equipment serving a type I
hood shall have clearances to combustibles as required by NFPA-96-26442014, as listed in
chapter 15 of the code.

Exception: Listed and labeled factory-built commercial kitchen grease ducts and exhaust
equipment installed in accordance with section 304.1 of the code.

507.1 General. Commercialkitchen-exhaust-hoods-shall-comphywith




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

apphaneces-that-are-operatingina-standby-mede: Commercial kitchen exhaust hoods shall
comply with the requirements of this subrule and NFPA 96-2014. Hoods shall be type I or
type II and shall be designed to capture and confine cooking vapors and residues. A type I
or type II hood shall be installed at or above all commercial cooking appliances in
accordance with sections 507.2 and 507.3 of the code. When a cooking appliance under a
single hood requires a type I hood, a type I hood shall be installed. When a type II hood is
required, a type I or type II hood shall be installed. When a type I hood is installed, the
installation of the entire system, including the hood, ducts, exhaust equipment, and makeup
air system, shall comply with the requirements of sections 506, 507, 508, and 509 of the
code.

Exceptions:

1. Factory-built commercial exhaust hoods that are listed and labeled in accordance with
UL 710, and installed in accordance with section 304.1 of the code, shall not be required to
comply with sections 507.1.5, 507.2.3, 507.2.5, 507.2.8, 507.3.1, 507.3.3, 507.4, and 507.5 of
the code.

2. Factory-built commercial cooking recirculating systems that are listed and labeled in
accordance with UL 710B and installed in accordance with section 304.1 of the code, shall
not be required to comply with sections 507.1.5, 507.2.3, 507.2.5, 507.2.8, 507.3.1, 507.3.3,
507.4, and 507.5 of the code. Spaces in which these systems are located shall be considered
kitchens and shall be ventilated in accordance with table 403.3.1.1. For the purpose of
determining the floor area required to be ventilated, each appliance shall be considered as
occupying not less than 100 square feet (9.3 m?2).

3. When cooking appliances are equipped with integral down-draft exhaust systems and
such these appliances and exhaust systems are listed and labeled for the application in
accordance with NFPA 96-2014, a hood shall not be required at or above these appliances.
—507:9507.2.6. Clearances for type I hood. A type I hood shall be installed with clearances
from combustibles as required by NFPA-96-26112014 as listed in chapter 15 of the code.

507.16.1.1 Smoke test. The field test identified in section 507.16.1 of the code shall be
conducted in accordance with the smoke testing procedures established by the bureau of
construction codes, which are available at no cost from the bureau's web-site website at
www.michigan.gov/bcce, or; from the Michigan Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs,

Bureau of Construction Codes, 250+ Weedlake-Cirele, Okemes; Michigan; 48864 611 W.
Ottawa St., 15t Floor Ottawa Building, Lansing, MI 48933.

R 408.30936a Scope of article.

Rule 936a. Sections 1001.2 is added to the code and section 1004.3 of the code is amended to
read as follows:

1001.2. Boilers. In addition to the other provisions of the code, this article governs the
installation, alteration, and repair of water heaters and boilers. The installation of boilers shall
be in comphance w1th the pr0V1510ns of th1s code and the Mlchlgan boﬂer code.




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30945a Ventilation; exhaust.
Rule 945a. Sections 501.3, 504.4, and-504-8 504.8.2, 504.10, and 505.3 of the code are
amended to read as follows:

56+21414501.3 Exhaust discharge. Exhaust-airshallnotbe-directed-onto-walleways—Exhaust
opetttesshatnotterninatewithin-3Hect ot aventibtedsectoniasotie The air removed by

every mechanical exhaust system shall be discharged outdoors at a point where it will not
cause a public nuisance and not less than the distances specified in section 501.3.1 of the
code. The air shall be discharged to a location from which it cannot again be readily
drawn in by a ventilating system. Air shall not be exhausted into an attic or a crawl space,
be directed onto walkways, or terminate within 3 feet of a ventilated section in a soffit.

Exceptions:

1. Whole-house ventilation-type attic fans shall be permitted to discharge into the attic
space of dwelling units that have private attics.

2. Commercial cooking recirculating systems.

3. When installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s instructions and when
mechanical or natural ventilation is otherwise provided in accordance with chapter 4 of the
code, listed and labeled domestic ductless range hoods shall not be required to discharge to
the outdoors.

504.4 Exhaust installation. Dryer exhaust ducts for clothes dryers shall terminate on the
outside of the building, shall not terminate within 3 feet of a ventilated section in a soffit, and
shall be equipped with a back draft damper. Screens shall not be installed at the duct
termination. Ducts shall not be connected or installed with sheet metal screws or other fasteners
that will obstruct the exhaust flow. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not be connected to a vent
connector, vent, or chimney. Clothes dryer exhaust ducts shall not extend into or pass through
ducts or plenums.

504.8.2 Duct installation. Dryer exhaust ducts shall be supported at 4 foot (1,219 mm)
intervals and secured in place. The insert end of the duct shall extend into the adjoining
duct or fitting in the direction of airflow. Ducts shall not be joined with screws or similar
fasteners that protrude into the inside of the duct.

5048 504.10 Common exhaust systems for clothes dryers located in multistory structures.
When a common multistory duct system is designed and installed to convey exhaust from
multiple clothes dryers, the system shall be engineered by a registered design professional and
installed in accordance with the Michigan building construction codes.

505.3 Common exhaust systems for domestic kitchens located in multistory structures.
When a common multistory duct system is designed and installed to convey exhaust from
multiple domestic kitchens, the system shall be engineered by a registered design
professional and installed in accordance with the Michigan building construction codes.

R 408.30946 Alterations and repairs.
Rule 946. Section 1001.3 is added to the code to read as follows:

1001.3. Alterations and repairs. Alterations and repairs to boilers shall be in accordance with
the Michigan boiler act, 1965 PA 290, MCL 408.751 to MEE-408.776.



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30948 Boiler safety devices.

Rule 948. Section 1806-6-1 1006.1.1 is added to the code and 1006.7 of the code is amended
to read as follows:

1006-611006.1.1 Safety and safety relief inlets. The opening or connection between the boiler
and any safety or safety relief valve shall have at least the area of the valve inlet.

1006.7. Boiler safety devices. Boilers shall be equipped with controls and limit devices as
required by ASME, CSD-1-20092012, and the manufacturer’s installation instructions, and the
conditions of the listing. All controls and safety devices shall be tested and maintained in
accordance with ASME code CSD-1-20092012.

048 100
— S

R 408.30948a Gauges Rescinded.

10



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Construction Code — Part 9A — Mechanical Code (ORR# 2015-025 LR)
Construction Code — Part 7 — Plumbing Code (ORR# 2015-026 LR)
Construction Code — Part 4 — Building Code (ORR# 2015-032 LR)

Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings (ORR# 2015-036 LR)

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, will hold a
public hearing on Tuesday, March 15, 2016, at 9:00 a.m. in Ottawa Building, Upper Level,
Conference Room 3, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48933. Please come early and bring
your driver’s license, as you will need to check in with the security desk and be escorted to the
conference room. The Part 9A Mechanical, Part 7 Plumbing, Part 4 Building and Michigan
Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules are proposed to be effective 120 days after
filing with the Secretary of State.

The public hearing is being held to receive public comments on the proposed amendments to the
administrative rules noted above. Testimony will be taken for each rule set in the order the rules
are listed above. Individuals who are not present during testimony for a particular rule set will
be provided an opportunity to testify after final testimony on the Michigan Rehabilitation Code
for Existing Building Rules.

The proposed revisions to Part 9A Mechanical Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Mechanical Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under the authority of
Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504 and Executive Reorganization order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-20 and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 7 Plumbing Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Plumbing Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA
230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4,
MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 4 Building Code rules adopt the 2015 edition of the International
Building Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for use in
Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230,
MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4, MCL
445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building rules adopt

the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code with amendments, deletions, and
additions deemed necessary for use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the

11



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization
Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030. The proposed
rules will be published in the February 15, 2016, Michigan Register. Copies of the proposed
amendments to the Michigan Part 9A Mechanical, Michigan Part 7 Plumbing, Michigan Part 4,
and the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules may be obtained for a fee of
$3.00 each by submitting a check or money order made payable to the State of Michigan, to the
Bureau at the address below. You may download a free copy of the proposed amendments by
visiting the Bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc. The amendments are located under
“What’s New” on the front page of the website.

Oral or written comments may be presented in person at the hearing on March 15, 2016, or
submitted in writing by mail, email, or facsimile no later than 5:00 p.m., March 15, 2016, to the
address stated below. If your presentation at the public hearing is in written form, please provide
a copy to the Rules Specialist, at the conclusion of your testimony at the hearing.

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Office of Management & Administrative Services
P.O. Box 30254
Lansing, MI 48909
Telephone (517) 241-6312
Facsimile (517) 241-9570
matsumotos@michigan.gov

The meeting site and parking are accessible. Individuals attending the meeting are requested to
refrain from using heavily scented personal care products, in order to enhance accessibility for
everyone. People with disabilities requiring additional services (such as materials in alternative
format) in order to participate in the meeting should call Hillary Cushman at (517) 335-2972
(voice) at least 14 days prior to the hearing. LARA is an equal opportunity employer/program.

12



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR'’S OFFICE
CONSTRUCTION CODE

Draft December 21, 2015
Filed with the Secretary of State on
These rules take effect 120 after filed with the Secretary of State

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by
section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-4 and 2011-4 MCL 445.2011, 445.2025, and 445.2030)

R 408.30701, R 408.30715, R 408.30721, R 408.30730, R 408.30731, R 408.30735, R
408.30758, R 408.30791, and R 408.30792 of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended,
R 408.30713, R 408.30724, R 408.30763a, and R 408.30786 are rescinded to the Code as
follows:

PART 7. PLUMBING CODE
AMENDMENTS AND ADDITIONS TO BASIC PLUMBING CODE

R 408.30701 Applicable code.

Rule 701. Rules governing the installation, replacement, alteration, relocation, and use of
plumbing systems or plumbing materials shall be those contained in the international plumbing
code, 20422015 edition, including appendices A, B, C, D, E, F, G, and HE, except for sections
102.10, 102.11, 103.4, 103.4.1, 106.1.1, 106.1.2, 106.6.1, 106.6.2, 106.6.3, 107.2.5, 107.2.5.1,
107.2.5.2,107.2.5.3, 109.2 to 109.7, 312.1.1, 404.2, 404.3, 602.3 to 602.3.5.1, 608.17 to
608.17.8, 708-3-2,708-3-6; 712.3.3.1, 712.3.3.2, 716.1 to 716.4, 717.1 to 717.8, 1106.3, 1106.6,
1301 to 1304.4.2, 1401 to 1403.2.1 and tables H06-2(2); 1106.3, and 1106.6. With the
exceptions noted, the code is adopted in these rules by reference. All references to the
International Building Code, International Residential Code, International Energy Conservation
Code, International Electrical Code, International Mechanical Code, and International Plumbing
Code mean the Michigan Building Code, Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Yaiferm-Energy
Code, Michigan Electrical Code, Michigan Mechanical Code, and Michigan Plumbing Code
respectively. The code is available for inspection at the OkemesLansing office of the Michigan
department of licensing and regulatory affairs, bureau of construction codes. The code may be
purchased from the International Code Council, through the bureau’s website at

WWW. mlchlgan gov/bcc M%Wm%é*ﬂe@r—\%shmgﬁm%@@@i—ef

Gedes—%@-l—WeedJ—ak%@&el%@kemes—M}emg&n ata cost as of the tlme of adoptlon of these
rules of $74:60 $76.00 cach.

13



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30715 Permits.

Rule 715. Sections 106.4, 106.5.3, and 106.5.4 of the code are amended to read as follows:

106.4. By whom application is made.

(1) Application for a permit shall be made by a plumbing contractor licensed in accordance
with pursuant-te 2002 PA 733, MCL 338.3511 to 338.3569.

Exceptions:

1. Water service permits.

2. Building sewer and private sewer permits.

3. Minor repair.

(2) A plumbing contractor shall do both of the following:

(a) Be active in the business of serving the public as a plumbing contractor in a county, city,
village, or township in this state.

(b) Operate 1 or more branches in this state bearing the same firm name, where a licensed
master plumber is in charge and has the responsibility of supervision at each branch. The names
of the authorized master plumbers representing a firm shall be on record with the state plumbing
board.

(3) To become a plumbing contractor, an applicant shall file an application on a form furnished
by the state plumbing board and file with the board at OkemesLansing, Michigan. An
incomplete application will be returned to the applicant.

106.5.3. Expiration. Each permit issued by the code official under the provisions of the code
shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the work authorized by suehthis permit is
not commenced within 180 days from the date of such permit, or if the work authorized by
stehthis permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work is commenced for a period
of 180 days. Before suehthis work may be recommenced, the permit shall be reinstated if the
code has not changed. If the code has changed and the work was not started, a new permit shall
be first obtained for such work, provided no changes have been made or will be made in the
original construction document for suehthis work and provided further that suehthe suspension
or abandonment has not exceeded 1 year.

106.5.4. Extensions. Any permittee holding an unexpired permit shall have the right to apply
for an extension of the time within which the permittee will commence work under that permit
when work is unable to be commenced within the time required by this section for good and
satisfactory reasons. The code official shall extend the time for action by the permittee for a
period not exceeding 180 days if there is reasonable cause. No permit shall be extended more
than once.

LSS

14




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30721 Required tests.
Rule 721. SeetionSections 309.3 and 312.1 of the code isare amended and section 312.3 is

added to read as follows:

309.3. Flood hazard areas subject to high-velocity wave action. Structures located in flood
hazard areas subject to high-velocity wave action shall meet the requirements of section 309.2.
The plumbing systems, pipes, and fixtures shall not be mounted on or penetrate through walls
intended to break away under flood loads.

312.1. Required tests. The permit holder shall make the applicable tests prescribed in
sections 312.2 to 312.10.2 to determine compliance with the code. The permit holder shall
give reasonable advance notice to the code official when the plumbing work is ready for
testing. The equipment, material, power, and labor necessary for the inspection and test
shall be furnished by the permit holder and the permit holder shall be responsible for
determining that the work will withstand the test pressure prescribed in this rule. All
plumbing system piping shall be tested with either water or, for piping systems other than
plastic, by air. After the plumbing fixtures have been set and their traps filled with water,
the entire drainage system shall be submitted to final tests. The code official shall require
the removal of any cleanouts if necessary to ascertain if the pressure has reached all parts
of the system.

Exception: Drainage and vent low pressure air tests for plastic piping systems shall be
acceptable as prescribed in section 312.3 of the code.

312.3 Drainage and vent air test. An air test shall be made by forcing air into the system until
there is a uniform gauge pressure of 5 psi (34.5 kPa) or sufficient to balance a 10-inch (254 mm)
column of mercury. This pressure shall be held for a test period of not less than 15 minutes.
Any adjustments to the test pressure required because of changes in ambient temperatures or the
seating of gaskets shall be made before to the beginning of the test period.

R 408.30724 PipingRescinded.

R 408.30730 Sewer required.
Rule 730. Section 701.2 of the code is amended and section 701.9 is added to read as follows:
701.2. Sewer required. Every building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and all
premises having drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, or an
approved private sewage disposal system.

15




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

701.9. Connections. Direct connection of a steam exhaust, blowoff, or drip pipe shall not
be made with the building drainage system. Waste water where discharged into the
building drainage system shall be at a temperature not greater than 140°F (60°C). Where
higher temperatures exist, approved cooling methods shall be provided.

R 408.30731. Laundries.

Rule 731. SeetionSections 1002.6 and 1003.6 of the code isare amended to read as follows:

1002.6. Building traps. Building (house) traps shall be prohibited, except where local
conditions necessitate these traps. Building traps shall be provided with a cleanout and a
relief vent or fresh air intake on the inlet side of the trap. The size of the relief vent or
fresh air intake shall not be less than 2 the diameter of the drain to which the relief vent or
air intake connects. The relief vent or fresh air intake shall be carried above grade and
shall be terminated in a screened outlet located outside the building.

1003.6. Laundries. Commercial laundries shall be equipped with an interceptor with a wire
basket or similar device, removable for cleaning, that prevents passage into the drainage system
of solids 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) or larger in size, string, rags, buttons, or other materials detrimental
to the public sewage system.

R 408.30735 Hot water supply required.

Rule 735. Section 607.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

607.1. Where required. (1) In residential occupancies, hot water shall be supplied to all
plumbing fixtures and equipment utilized for bathing, washing, culinary purposes, cleansing,
laundry, or building maintenance. In nonresidential occupancies, hot water shall be supplied for
culinary purposes, cleansing, laundry, or building maintenance purposes. In nonresidential
occupancies, hot water or tempered water shall be supplied for bathing and washing purposes.
Tempered water shall be supplied through a water temperature limiting device that conforms to
ASSE 1070, asreferenced-inchapter13-of the-code; and shall limit the tempered water to a
maximum of 110 degrees Fahrenheit (43 degrees Celsius). This provision shalldoes not
supersede the requirement for protective shower valves in accordance with section 424.3 of the
code.

(2) Tempered water shall be supplied to bathing and hand washing facilities in the occupancies
identified in subdivistens{a)rto-(h)ofthissubrulethe following by individual water temperature
limiting devices to individual fixtures::

(a) Elementary schools.

(b) Child care centers.

(c) Day care centers.

(d) Nurseries.

(e) Adult group homes.

(f) Adult congregate homes.

(g) Children’s camps.

(h) At accessible plumbing fixtures.

R 408.30758 Minimum number of fixtures.
Rule 758. Sections 403.1 and 403.3.1 and Table 403.1 of the code are amended to read as
follows:

16



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

403.1. Minimum number of fixtures. Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of
occupancy and in the minimum number shown in Table 403.1. Types of occupancies not shown
in Table 403.1 shall be considered individually by the code official. The number of occupants
shall be determined in accordance with the Michigan building code. Occupancy classification
shall be determined in accordance with the Michigan building code.

Exceptions:

1. The actual number of occupants determined by a supporting affidavit from the owner or
agency.

2. Hand washing sinks in food service establishments shall be provided in accordance with
regulation no. 553, food establishments, R 285.553.1 to R 285.553.26 of the Michigan
department of agriculture and rural development.

3. Toilet facilities for public swimming pools shall be provided in accordance with public
swimming pools, R 325.2111 to R 325.2199 of the Michigan department of environmental
quality.

4. Toilet facilities for child care center, day care center, and nursery school facilities shall be
provided in accordance with child day care licensing — child care centers, R400-510+to-R
400-5940R400.8101 to R 400.8840 of the Michigan department of licensing and regulatory
affairshuman-serviees.

5. Toilet facilities for children’s camps shall be provided in accordance with children’s and
adult foster care camps, R 400.11101 to R 400-34319400.11413 of the Michigan department of
human serviees licensing and regulatory affairs.

403.3.1. Access. The route to the public toilet facilities required by section 403.3 shall not
pass through kitchens, storage rooms, or closets. Access to the required facilities shall be from
within the building. All routes shall comply with the accessibilities requirements of the
Michigan building code. The public shall have access to the required toilet facilities at all times
that the building is occupied.

17



(See Sections 403.1.1 and 403.2)

2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

TABLE 403.1
MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURES*?

WATER CLOSETS
(URINALS SEE SECTION
419.2) LAVATORIES FOUEI)\IF}I'IA,\IIKII ’;'fG(SEE
NO. | CLASSIFICATION | OCCUPANCY DESCRIPTION MALE FEMALE MALE FEMALE BATHTUBS/ SESTON OTHER
SHOWERS 1
1 Theaters and other
A-1¢ bu11dlqgs for the 1 per 125 1 per 65 1 per 200 1 per 500 1 service sink
performing arts and
motion pictures
Nightclubs, bars, tav-
erns, dance halls, and 1 per 40 1 per 40 1 per 75 1 per 500 1 service sink
A buildings for similar
purposes
Restaurants, banquet 1 per 75 1 per 75 1 per 200 1 per 500 o
halls and food courts 1 service sink
Auditoriums without
permanent seating, art
galleries, exhibition
halls, museums, lecture 1 per 125 1 per 65 1 per 200 1 per 500 1 service sink
halls, libraries,
Assembly arcades, and
A3 gymnasiums
Passenger terminals
and transportation 1 per 500 1 per 500 1 per 750 1 per 1,000 1 service sink
facilities
Places of worship and
other religious 1 per 150 1 per 75 1 per 200 1 per 1,000 1 service sink
services.
1 per 75 for 1 per 40 for
Coliseums, arenas the first the first
. L i 1,500 and 1 1,520 and 1
skating rinks, pools, o 120 for o1 60 for
A-4 and tennis courts for | P e 1per200 | 1 per 150 1 per 1,000 1 service sink
indoor sporting events . .
Lo remainder remainder
and activities . .
exceeding exceeding
1,500 1,520

18




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

A-5!

Stadiums, amusement
parks, bleachers, and
grandstands for
outdoor sporting
events and activities

1 per 75 for
the first
1,500 and 1
per 120 for
the
remainder
exceeding
1,500

1 per 40 for
the first
1,520 and 1
per 120 for
the
remainder
exceeding
1,520

1 per 200 1 per 150

1 per 1,000

1 service sink

A-5

Outdoor educational
and municipal venues
not larger than 3,000
spectators

1 per 125

1 per 65

1 per 200 1 per 150

1 per 1,000

1 service sink

Business

Buildings for the
transaction of
business, professional
services, other services
involving
merchandise, office
buildings, banks, light
industrial, and similar
uses

1 per 25 for the first 50 and
1 per 50 for the remainder
exceeding 50

1 per 40 for the first 80
and 1 per 80 for the
remainder exceeding 80

1 per 100

1 service sink®

Educational

Educational facilities

1 per 50

1 per 50

1 per 100

1 service sink

Factory and
industrial

F-1 and F-2

Structures in which
occupants are engaged
in work fabricating,
assemblyassembling,
or processing of
products or materials

1 per 100

1 per 100

(see Section 411)

1 per 400

1 service sink

Institutional

I-1

Residential care

1 per 10

1 per 10

1per8

1 per 100

1 service sink

I-2

Hospitals, ambulatory
nursing home patients,
care recipient

1 per room ¢

1 per room ¢

1 per 15

1 per 100

1 service sink per
floor

Employees, other than
residential care®

1 per 25

1 per 35

1 per 100

Visitors, other than
residential care

1 per 75

1 per 100

1 per 500

19




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Prisons® 1 per cell 1 per cell 1 per 15 1 per 100 o
1 service sink
-3 Reformitories, S
: detention centers, and 1 per 15 1 per 15 1 per 15 1 per 100 1 service sink
correctional centers®
Employees® 1 per 25 1 per 35 - 1 per 100 -
14 Adult day care and 1 per 15 I per 15 1 1 per 100 o
child care 1 service sink
WATER CLOSETS
(URINALS SEE SECTION 419.2)
LAVATORIES DRINKING
FOUNTAIN *' (SEE
BATHTUBS/ SECTION
NO. CLASSIFICATION OCCUPANCY DESCRIPTION MALE FEMALE MALE FEMALE SHOWERS 410.1) OTHER
Retail stores, service
6 Mercantile M stations, shops, 1 per 500 1 per 750 - 1 per 1000 1 service sinke
salesrooms, markets,
and shopping centers
R-1 Hotels, motels,
boarding houses 1 per sleeping unit 1 per sleeping unit 1 per sleeping unit 1 service sink
(transient)
Dormitories,
fraternities, sororities,
and boarding houses 1 10
R-2 (not transient) per 1 per 10 1per8 1 per 100 1 service sink
7 Residential
1 kitchen sink per
dwelling unit; 1
. . . . . . automatic clothes
R-2 Apartment house 1 per dwelling unit 1 per dwelling unit 1 per dwelling unit - washer connection
per 20 dwelling
units
Congregate living
R-3 facilities with 16 or 1 per 10 1 per 10 1 per 8 1 per 100

fewer persons

1 service sink

20




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

One-and two-family 1 kitchen sink per
dwellings-1 - and -2 dwelling unit; 1
R-3 family dwellings and 1 per dwelling unit 1 per dwelling unit 1 per dwelling unit - automatic clothes
lodging houses with 5 washer connection
or fewer guestrooms per dwelling unit

Congregate living
R-4 facilities with 16 or 1 per 10 1 per 10 1 per 8 1 per 100 1 service sink
fewer persons

Structures for the
storage of goods,
S-1 warehouses, 1 per 100 1 per 100 . 1 service sink
S-2 storehouse, and freight See Section 411 1 per 1,000
depots. Low and
Moderate Hazard.

Storage”

a. The fixtures shown are based on 1 fixture being the minimum required for the number of persons indicated or any fraction of the number of persons indicated. The number of
occupants shall be determined by the International Building Code.

b. Toilet facilities for employees shall be separate from facilities for inmates or patients.

c. A single-occupant toilet room with 1 water closet and one lavatory serving not more than 2 adjacent patient sleeping units shall be permitted where such room is provided with
direct access from each patient room and with provisions for privacy.

d. The occupant load for seasonal outdoor seating and entertainment areas shall be included when determining the minimum number of facilities required.

e. The minimum number of required drinking fountains shall comply with Table 403.1 and Chapter 11 of the International Building Code.

f. Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of 15 or fewer.

g.. For business and mercantile occupancies with an occupant load of 15 or fewer, service sinks shall not be required.

h. Structures not designed for occupants or as an employee’s regular working area, are not required to have toilet facilities.

i. Water closets and lavatories in adjacent school buildings may be included in the required minimum fixture count, if they are located within a 500-foot walking
distance to the stadium. Signage for the location of these rest rooms is required.

21




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30763a Fempered-waterforpublichand-washingfaetlities: Rescinded.

R 408.30791 Definitions.

Rule 791. (1) Section 202 of the code is amended to amend the definition of code official and
add the definitions of the act and plumbing contractor.

(2) “Act” means 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1501 and known as the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single
state construction code act.

(3) “Code official” means the person appointed and employed by a governmental subdivision
charged with the administration and enforcement of the state code or codes and registered in
accordance with the requirements of 1986 PA 54, MCL 338.2301 to 338.2313.

(4) "Plumbing contractor" means a person who is licensed in accordance with 2002 PA 733,
MCL 338.3511 to 338.3569.

R 408.30792 Food utensils, dishes, pots and pans sinks.

Rule 792. Section 802.1.8 of the code is amended to read as follows:

802.1.8. Food utensils, dishes, pots and pans sinks. Sinks used for the washing, rinsing, or
sanitizing of utensils, dishes, pots, pans, or service ware where used in the preparation, serving,
or eating of food shall discharge indirectly through an air gap or an air break to the drainage

system.
Exception:

/8 : : : atnage-systemr When required, a
washing sink or wash compartment shall be directly connected to a hydromechanical
grease interceptor. The outlet of a hydromechanical grease interceptor shall directly
connect to the sanitary drainage system.

5 O v H oPp CH H D€ S OHRC ca1to0tcCd

22



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Construction Code — Part 9A — Mechanical Code (ORR# 2015-025 LR)
Construction Code — Part 7 — Plumbing Code (ORR# 2015-026 LR)
Construction Code — Part 4 — Building Code (ORR# 2015-032 LR)

Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings (ORR# 2015-036 LR)

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, will hold a
public hearing on Tuesday, March 15, 2016, at 9:00 a.m. in Ottawa Building, Upper Level,
Conference Room 3, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48933. Please come early and bring
your driver’s license, as you will need to check in with the security desk and be escorted to the
conference room. The Part 9A Mechanical, Part 7 Plumbing, Part 4 Building and Michigan
Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules are proposed to be effective 120 days after
filing with the Secretary of State.

The public hearing is being held to receive public comments on the proposed amendments to the
administrative rules noted above. Testimony will be taken for each rule set in the order the rules
are listed above. Individuals who are not present during testimony for a particular rule set will
be provided an opportunity to testify after final testimony on the Michigan Rehabilitation Code
for Existing Building Rules.

The proposed revisions to Part 9A Mechanical Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Mechanical Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under the authority of
Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504 and Executive Reorganization order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-20 and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 7 Plumbing Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Plumbing Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA
230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4,
MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 4 Building Code rules adopt the 2015 edition of the International
Building Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for use in
Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230,
MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4, MCL
445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building rules adopt

the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code with amendments, deletions, and
additions deemed necessary for use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the

23



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization
Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030. The proposed
rules will be published in the February 15, 2016, Michigan Register. Copies of the proposed
amendments to the Michigan Part 9A Mechanical, Michigan Part 7 Plumbing, Michigan Part 4,
and the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules may be obtained for a fee of
$3.00 each by submitting a check or money order made payable to the State of Michigan, to the
Bureau at the address below. You may download a free copy of the proposed amendments by
visiting the Bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc. The amendments are located under
“What’s New” on the front page of the website.

Oral or written comments may be presented in person at the hearing on March 15, 2016, or
submitted in writing by mail, email, or facsimile no later than 5:00 p.m., March 15, 2016, to the
address stated below. If your presentation at the public hearing is in written form, please provide
a copy to the Rules Specialist, at the conclusion of your testimony at the hearing.

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Office of Management & Administrative Services
P.O. Box 30254
Lansing, MI 48909
Telephone (517) 241-6312
Facsimile (517) 241-9570
matsumotos@michigan.gov

The meeting site and parking are accessible. Individuals attending the meeting are requested to
refrain from using heavily scented personal care products, in order to enhance accessibility for
everyone. People with disabilities requiring additional services (such as materials in alternative
format) in order to participate in the meeting should call Hillary Cushman at (517) 335-2972
(voice) at least 14 days prior to the hearing. LARA is an equal opportunity employer/program.

24



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS

DIRECTOR’S OFFICE CONSTRUCTION CODE
Draft January 12, 2016

Filed with the Secretary of State on
These rules take effect 120 days after filing with the Secretary of State

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by
section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-4 and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025, and 445.2030)

R 408.30401, R 408.30403, R 408.30415a, R 408.30418, R 408.30419, R 408.30421, R
408.30427, R 408.30428, R 408.30429, R 408.30430, R 408.30441, R 408.30445, R 408.30446,
R 408.30447, R 408.30451c¢, R 408.30452, R 408.30459, and R 408.30497 of the Michigan
Administrative Code are amended and R 408.30413, R 408.30416, R 408.30420, R 408.30429a,
R 408.30432, R 408.30437, R 408.30448, and R 408.30475 are rescinded as follows:

PART 4. BUILDING CODE

R 408.30401 Applicable code.

Rule 401. The provisions of the international building code, 20422015 edition, including
appendices F, G, and H, except for sections 104.8, 109.2 to 109.6, 114.3,415.8.2.2 t0 415.8.2.9,
415.8.3,903.2.8.3.1, 903.2.8.3.2, 903.2.8.4, table 16082; 2902 to 2902.5, Table 2902.1, 3006.5,
the definition of “agricultural building” in section 202, the definition of "recreational vehicle" in
Appendix G, and, [ECC-26422015, [IEBC-26422015, IMC-26422015, IPC-26422015, IPSDC-
20422015, NFPA 70-2641+2014, listed in chapter 35, govern the construction, alteration,
relocation, demolition, use, and occupancy of buildings and structures, and, with exceptions
noted, the international building code is adopted by reference in these rules. All references to
the International Building Code, International Residential Code, International Energy
Conservation Code, National Electrical Code, International Existing Building Code,
International Mechanical Code, and International Plumbing Code mean the Michigan Building
Code, Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Bniferm-Energy Code, Michigan Electrical Code,
Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings, Michigan Mechanical Code, and Michigan
Plumbing Code respectively. The code is available for inspection at the Okemes-eoffice-ofthe
Michigan Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, 611
W. Ottawa St., 1%t Floor Ottawa Building Lansing, MI 48933. The code may be purchased
from the International Code Council, through the bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc,

é;; I E JE{SE§ 1k Ei}HE’¥ * *o é 2 5 * N 5

Gmel%@kemes—%eh&-g%% at a cost as of the tlme of adoptlon of these amendatory rules
of $126-00$128.00.

25



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30403 Residential group R-3.
Rule 403. Sections 310.5 and-310.5.1, 903.3.8.1, and 903.3.8.5 are amended and 903.2.8.3 is
added to the code to read as follows:

310.5. Residential group R-3. Residential occupancies where the occupants are primarily
permanent in nature and not classified as group R-1, R-2, R-4, or [, including any of the
following:

(a) Adult foster care family homes or adult foster care small group homes licensed per the adult
foster care facility licensing act, 1979 PA 218, MCL 400.701 to 400.737, that provide
accommodations for 6 or fewer persons receiving care.

(b) Buildings that do not contain more than 2 dwelling units.

(c) Boarding houses (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants.

(d) Boarding houses (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants.

(e) Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with 16 or fewer occupants.

(f) Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants.

(g) Foster family homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116, MCL
221H2722.111 to 722.127a, that provide care for not more than 4 minor children.

(h) Foster care family group homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA
116, MCL 722-H2722.111 to 722.127a, that provide care for more than 4 but fewer than 7 minor
children.

310.5.1. Care facilities within a dwelling. Care facilities that are located within a single- family
dwelling may comply with the Michigan residential code if 1 of the following conditions is met:

(a) Adult foster care family homes or adult foster care small group homes for 6 or fewer
persons receiving care that are within a single-family dwelling and licensed in accordance with
the adult foster care facility licensing act, 1979 PA 218, MCL 400.701 to 400.737.

(b) Family child care homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116,
MCL 72232722111 to 722.127a, that provide care for fewer than 7 minor children.

(c) Group child care homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116, MCL
72212722111 to 722.127a, that provide care for more than 6 but not more than 12 minor
children.

(d) Foster family homes licensed per the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116, MCL
7221H2722.111 to 722.127a, that provide care for not more than 4 minor children.

(e) Foster care family group homes licensed per the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116,
MCL 72232722111 to 722.127a, that provide care for more than 4 but fewer than 7 minor
children.
903.2.8.3. Child care organizations. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
section 903.3.1.3 shall be permitted in child care organizations that are within a single-family
dwelling and licensed in accordance with the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116, MCL
72212722111 to 722.127a, as follows:

(a) Foster family homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116, MCL
F221H2722.111 to 722.127a, that provide care for more than 4 but fewer than 7 minor children.

(b) Foster care family group homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA
116, MCL 722-H2722.111 to 722.127a, that provide care for more than 4 but fewer than 7 minor
children.

(c) Family child care homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116,
MCL 72232722111 to 722.127a, that provide care for fewer than 7 minor children.

26



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

(d) Group child care homes licensed under the child care organizations act, 1973 PA 116, MCL
72212722111 to 722.127a, that provide care for more than 6 but not more than 12 minor
children.

903.3.8.1. Number of sprinklers. Limited area sprinkler systems shall not exceed 20
sprinklers.

903.3.8.5. Calculations. Hydraulic calculations in accordance with NFPA 13 shall be
provided to demonstrate that the available water flow and pressure are adequate to supply
all sprinklers installed with discharge densities corresponding to the hazard classification.

R 408.30413 Vaperretarders-:Rescinded.

R 408.30415a Definitions.
Rule 415a. The definitions of act, agricultural or agricultural purposes, and source point are
added and the definitions of building, building inspector, building official, high-rise building,
registered design professional, and structure in section 202 of the code are amended to read as
follows:

202. Definitions.

“Act” means 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1501 to 125.1531 and known as the Stille-DeRossett-
Hale single state construction code act.

“Agricultural or agricultural purposes” means of, or pertaining to, or connected with, or
engaged in agriculture or tillage which is characterized by the act or business of cultivating or
using land and soil for the production of crops for the use of animals or humans, and includes,
but is not limited to, purposes related to agriculture, farming, dairying, pasturage, horticulture,
floriculture, viticulture, and animal and poultry husbandry.

“Attic, uninhabitable with limited storage” means uninhabitable attics with limited storage are
those where the minimum clear height between joists and rafters is 42 inches or greater, 42
inches high by 24 inches in width, or greater, within the plane of the trusses, or where there are
not two or more adjacent trusses with web configurations capable of accommodating an assumed
rectangle.

“Attic, uninhabitable without storage” means uninhabitable attics without storage are those
where the maximum clear height between joists and rafters is less than 42 inches, or where there
are not twe2 or more adjacent trusses with web configurations capable of accommodating an
assumed rectangle 42 inches high by 24 inches in width or greater, within the plane of the
trusses.

27



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

"Building" means a combination of materials, whether portable or fixed, forming a structure
affording a facility or shelter for use or occupancy by persons, animals, or property. The term
does not include a building incidental to the use for agricultural purposes of the land on which
the building is located if it is not used in the business of retail trade. The term shall be construed
as though followed by the words "or part or parts of the building and all equipment in the
building" unless the context clearly requires a different meaning.

"

3382343
"Building official"

vavie OTT;

L 1 Ao orad 1n o 1th tho ran amen a QR
3382301+t0-338-2313as found in 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1501 to 125.1531 and known as the
Stille-DeRossett- Hale single state construction code act, means an individual who is
employed by a governmental subdivision and is charged with the administration and
enforcement of the code and who is registered in compliance with the building officials and
inspectors registration act, 1986 PA 54, MCL 338.2301 to 338.2313. a building official may
also be an employee of a private organization.

“High-rise building” means a building with an occupied floor located more than 55 feet (1 6764
mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

"Registered design professional" means an individual who is licensed under; 1980 PA 299,
MCL 339.101 to 339.2919.

"Structure" means that which is built or constructed, an edifice or building of any kind, or a
piece of work artificially built up or composed of parts joined together in some definite manner.
Structure does not include a structure incident to the use for agricultural purposes of the land on
which the structure is located and does not include works of heavy civil construction, including
without limitation, any of the following:

(a) A highway.

(b) A bridge.

(c) A dam.

(d) A reservoir.

(e) A lock.

(f) A mine.

(g) A harbor.

(h) A dockside port facility.

(1) An airport landing facility.

(j) A facility for the generation, or transmission, or distribution of electricity.

Structure shall be construed as though followed by the words "or part or parts of the structure
and all equipment in the structure," unless the context clearly indicates otherwise.

“Source point” is defined in section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504d.

R 408.30416 Area-andheightinereasesRescinded.
e 416 ection-406 6-of the code mended

28



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30418 Maximum floor area allowances per occupant.
Rule 418. Table 1004.1.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:

Table 1004.1.2
MAXIMUM FLOOR AREA ALLOWANCES PER OCCUPANT

FUNCTION OF SPACE

FLOOR AREA IN SO. FT. PER

Agricultural building 300 gross
Aircraft hangars 500 gross
Airport terminal

Baggage claim 20 gross
Baggage handling 300 gross
Concourse 100 gross
Waiting areas 15 gross
Assembly

Gaming floors (keno, slots, etc.) 11 gross
Exhibit Gallery and Museum 30 net

Assembly with fixed seats

See section 1004-71004.4

Assembly without fixed seats

Concentrated (chairs only-not fixed) 7 net
Standing space ' 5 net
Unconcentrated (tables and chairs) 15 net
Bowling centers, allow 5 persons for each

lane including 15 feet of runway, and for 7 net
additional areas

Business areas 100 gross

29




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Courtrooms-other than fixed seating areas 40 net
Day care 35 net
Dormitories 50 gross
Educational

Classroom area 20 net
Shops and other vocational room areas 50 net
Locker rooms 15 gross
Exercise rooms 50 gross
H-5 Fabrication and manufacturing areas 200 gross
Industrial areas 100 gross
Institutional areas

Inpatient treatment areas 240 gross
Outpatient areas 100 gross
Sleeping areas 120 gross
Kitchens, commercial 200 gross
Library

Reading rooms 50 net
Stack area 100 gross
Mall buildings-covered and open See Section 402.8.2
Locker rooms 50 gross
Mercantile 60 gross
Areas-on-otherfloors 30-gross
Storage, stock, shipping areas 300 gross
Parking garages 200 gross
Residential 200 gross
Skating rinks, swimming pools

Rink and pool 50 gross
Decks 15 gross
Stages and platforms 15 net
/Accessory storage areas, mechanical

equipment room 300 gross
Warehouses 500 gross

For SI: 1 square foot = 0.0929 m?

R 408.30419 Toilet room requirements.

Rule 419. Sections 1210.1, is amended and 1210.5, 1210.4, and 1210.6 are amendedadded to
the code to read as follows:

1210.1. Required fixtures. The number and type of plumbing fixtures provided in any
occupancy shall comply with the Michigan plumbing code.

1210.4. Toilet room location. Toilet rooms shall not open directly into a room used for
the preparation of food for service to the public.

30



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

1210.5. Baby changing stations. A building or structure that has baby changing stations in the
women's restrooms shall have baby changing stations in the men's restrooms.

1210.6. Directional signage. Directional signage indicating the route to the public facilities
shall be posted in accordance with section 3107 of the international building code. Signage shall
be located in a corridor or aisle at the entrance to the facilities for customers and visitors.

R 408.30420 WVentilationRescinded.

31



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

32



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

i

33




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

605

55’93%% £ & BERE

34




2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

35



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30421 Emergency escape and rescue.
Rule 421. Sections 1024-11025.1 and 1029-11030.1 of the code are amended and
10142.21016.2.2 is added to read as follows:

+044-2.21016.2.2. Group E. Egress from classrooms in group E occupancies shall be limited to
pass through 1 intervening space before reaching an exit access door leading directly to a
corridor or an exit.

1024-11025.1. General. Approved luminous egress path markings delineating the exit path
shall be provided in buildings with an occupied floor located more than 75 feet (16 764 mm)
above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access of groups A, B, E, I, M, and R-I
occupancies in accordance with sections 1024.1 to 1024.5.

4029-11030.1. General. In addition to the means of egress required by this chapter, provisions
shall be made for emergency escape and rescue in group R as applicable in section 101.2,
classrooms greater than 250 feet? (23.2 m?) in group E, and group I-1 occupancies. Basements
and sleeping rooms below the fourth story above grade plane shall have at least 1 exterior
emergency escape and rescue opening in accordance with this section. Where basements contain
1 or more sleeping rooms, emergency egress and rescue openings shall be required in each
sleeping room, but shall not be required in adjoining areas of the basement. The opening shall
open directly into a public street, public alley, yard, or court.

Exceptions:

1. In other than group R-3 occupancies as applicable in section 101.2, buildings equipped
throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system in accordance with section 903.3.1.1 or
903.3.1.2.

2. In other than group R-3 occupancies as applicable in section 101.2, sleeping rooms provided
with a door to a fire-resistance-rated corridor having access to 2 remote exits in opposite
directions.

3. The emergency escape and rescue opening may open onto a balcony within an atrium in
accordance with the requirements of section 404, provided the balcony provides access to an exit
and the dwelling unit or sleeping unit has a means of egress that is not open to the atrium.

4. Basements with a ceiling height of less than 80 inches (2 032 mm) shall not be required to
have emergency escape and rescue openings.

5. High-rise buildings in accordance with section 403.

6. Emergency escape and rescue openings are not required from basements, classrooms, or
sleeping rooms which have an exit door or exit access door that opens directly into a public
street, public alley, yard, egress court, or to an exterior exit balcony that opens to a public street,
public alley, yard, or egress court.

7. Basements without habitable spaces and having not more than 200 square feet (18.6 square
meters) in floor area shall not be required to have emergency escape and rescue openings.

36



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30427 Barrier free design for buildings, structures, and improved areas.
Rule 427. Sections 1101.2 and 1109.8 of the code are amended and section +-03-246 1103.2.15
is added to the code to read as follows:

1101.2. Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be accessible in
accordance with 1966 PA 1, MCL 125.1351 to 125.1356, this code, and ICC/ANSI A 117.1,
except sections 611 and 707.

H0O32-161103.2.15. Military, fire service, and police facilities. Housing, bathing, toilet,
training, and storage areas intended for use and occupancy exclusively by military, fire service,
police, or security personnel required to be physically agile are not required to be accessible.

1109.8. Lifts. Platform (wheelchair) lifts may be a part of a required accessible route in new
construction where indicated in items 1 to 10. Platform (wheelchair) lifts shall be installed in
accordance with the Michigan elevator code, R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.

—BH1. An accessible route to a performing area and speakers' platforms. i#+-eeceupaneies-ingroup
A

2)2. An accessible route to wheelchair spaces required to comply with the wheelchair space
dispersion requirements of sections 1108.2.2 to +-08-2-51108.2.6.

3)3. An accessible route to spaces that are not open to the general public with an occupant
load of not more than 5.

4. An access1b1e route within a dwelhng or sleepmg unit.

eutdeers—.An accessible route to jury boxes and witness stands; raised courtroom stations
including judges’ benches, clerks’ stations, bailiffs’ stations, deputy clerks’ stations and
court reporters’ statlons, and to depressed areas such as the well of the court

(656.

statrens—and—te%epressed—areas—sueh—as—th&weﬂ—eﬁth&eeuﬁAn accessrble route to load and

unload areas serv1ng amusement rides.

@7.

route to play components or soft contalned play structures

(8)8.

9. g Ay : :
accessible route lnstead of gangways serving recreatlonal boatlng fac111t1es and ﬁshlng piers
and platforms.

H0310.  An accessible route where existing exterior site constraints make use of a ramp or
elevator infeasible.

R 408.30428 Structural integrity.
Rule 428. Section +644-+1615.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

1614-11615.1 . General. Buildings with an occupied floor 75 feet (22 860 mm) or more in
height above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access and assigned to risk category III
or IV shall comply with the requirements of this section. Frame structures shall comply with the
requirements of section 1615.3. Bearing wall structures shall comply with the requirements of
section 1615.4.

R 408.30429 High-rise buildings.

37



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Rule 429. Sections 403.1; and 403.5.4, 907.2.1.3, and 967-6-3-2-907.6.4.2 of the code are
amended to read as follows:

403.1. Applicability. The provisions of this section shall apply to buildings having the
occupied floors located more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department
vehicle access.

Exception: The provisions of this section shall not apply to the following buildings and
structures:

1. Airport traffic control towers in accordance with section 412 of the code.

2. Open parking garages in accordance with section 4663 406.50f the code.

3. Buildings with an occupancy in group A-5 in accordance with section 363-3303.6 of the
code.

4. Bew-hazard-speetal Special industrial occupancies in accordance with section 503.1.1 of the
code.

%h%eed%Bulldlngs w1th any of the followmg
5.1. A group H-1 occupancy
5.2. A group H-2 occupancy in accordance with section 415.8, 415.9.2, 415.9.3, or
426.1
5.3. A group H-3 occupancy in accordance with section 415.8.

6. Existing buildings having occupied floor levels not more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above
the lowest level of fire department vehicle access where the local unit of government complies
with both of the following:

6.1. The local unit of government has a municipal fire department with an ISO rating of 3 or
lower, employing a full-time career firefighting staff.

6.2. The governing body of the local unit of government has passed a resolution affirming the
use of this exception and filed that resolution with the department of energy;tabeor,-and
economie-growthlicensing and regulatory affairs, bureau of construction codes.

403.5.4. Smokeproof exit enclosures. Every required stairway serving floors more than 55 feet
(16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall comply with sections
909.20 and 4—92—2—91023 10 of the code

38



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30430 Liquefied petroleum gas distribution facilities.

Rule 430. SeetienSections 415.7.2 and 41-5-6:3415.7.3 of the code isare amended to read as
follows:

415.7.2. Flammable and combustible liquids. The storage, handling, processing, and
transporting of flammable and combustible liquids shall be in accordance with the
Michigan mechanical code, R 408.30901 to R 408.30998, and the international fire code
listed in chapter 35, and the requirements of the Michigan rules for the storage and
handling of flammable and combustible liquids, R 29.4101 to R 29.5516.

415-6:3415.7.3. Liquefied petroleum gas distribution facilities. The design and construction of
propane, butane, propylene, butylene, and other liquefied petroleum gas distribution facilities
shall conform to the applicable provisions of the Michigan liquified petroleum gas code, R
29.3801 to R 29.4035. The storage and handling of liquefied petroleum gas systems shall
conform to the international fire code listed in chapter 35. The design and installation of piping,
equipment, and systems that utilize liquefied petroleum gas shall be in accordance with the
international fuel gas code listed in chapter 35. Liquefied petroleum gas distribution facilities
shall be ventilated in accordance with the Michigan mechanical code, R 408.30901 to R
408.30998, and the requirements of the Michigan rules for the storage and handling of
flammable and combustible liquids, R 29.4101 to R 29.5516.

R 408.30432 HFammable-and-combustible liguidsRescinded.

39



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30437 Masenry-heaterclearanceRescinded.

R 408.30441 Consumer fireworks facilities.

Rule 441. Sections 307.5.1, 415.1.1, 4254427.1, 509.4.2.2, 907.2.5.1, 910.2.3, and
1036-11031.1 of the code are added to read as follows:

307.5.1. High-hazard group H-3. Consumer fireworks 1.4G (class C common) Consumer
fireworks 1.4G facilities shall meet the requirements of this code and those requirements of this
code and those requirements referenced in section 425-4427.1.

415.1.1. Consumer fireworks facilities 1.4 G (class C common) consumer fireworks 1.4 G
facilities shall be designed and constructed in accordance with NFPA 1124 as referenced by the
Michigan fireworks safety act, 2011 PA 256, MCL 28.451 to 28.471.

4251427.1. Consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities. The items in buildings used for the retail
sale of consumer fireworks shall be designed and constructed in accordance with NFPA 1124, as
referenced by the Michigan fireworks safety act, 2011 PA 256, MCL 28.451 to 28.471 as
follows:

(a) Means of egress.

(b) Storage rooms.

(c) Fire alarms.

(d) Smoke control.

(e) Automatic sprinkler systems.

509.4.2.2. Consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities storage rooms. Storage rooms in consumer
fireworks (1.4G) facilities used for the retail sale of consumer fireworks shall be designed and
constructed in accordance with the code for the manufacture, transportation, storage, and retail
sales of fireworks and pyrotechnic articles, NFPA 1124, as referenced by the Michigan fireworks
safety act, 2011 PA 256, MCL 28.451 to 28.471.

907.2.5.1. Consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities fire alarms. Fire alarm systems in consumer
fireworks (1.4G) facilities used for the retail sale of consumer fireworks storage shall be
designed and constructed in accordance with the code for the manufacture, transportation,

40



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

storage, and retail sales of fireworks and pyrotechnic articles, NFPA 1124, as referenced by the
Michigan fireworks safety act, 2011 PA 256, MCL 28.451 to 28.471.

910.2.3. Consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities smoke and heat vents. Smoke and heat vents in
consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities used for the retail sale of consumer fireworks storage shall
be designed and constructed in accordance with the code for the manufacture, transportation,
storage, and retail sales of fireworks and pyrotechnic articles, NFPA 1124, as referenced by the
Michigan fireworks safety act, 2011 PA 256, MCL 28.451 to 28.471.

40306-+1031.1. Consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities means of egress. The means of egress in
consumer fireworks (1.4G) facilities used for the retail sale of consumer fireworks means of
egress shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the code for the manufacture,
transportation, storage, and retail sales of fireworks and pyrotechnic articles, NFPA 1124, as
referenced by the Michigan fireworks safety act, 2011 PA 256, MCL 28.451 to 28.471.

R 408.30445 Automatic sprinkler systems.

Rule 445. Section 903.2.11.3 of the code is amended to read as follows:

903.2.11.3. Buildings more than 30 feet (9144 mm) in height. An automatic sprinkler system
shall be installed throughout a building that has a floor level which has an occupant load of 30 or
more occupants and which is located 30 feet (9144 mm) or more above the lowest level of fire
department vehicle access.

Exceptions:

21. Open parking structures.

32. Occupancies in group F-2.

-4-3. Existing buildings having occupied floor levels not more than 55 feet (16764 mm) in
height above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, where the local unit of
government complies with the following parameters:

443.1. The local unit of government having a municipal fire department with an ISO rating of
3 or lower, employing a full-time career fire fighting staff.

423.2. The governing body of the local unit of government has passed a resolution affirming
the use of this exception and filed that resolution with the department of energy;laber-and
economicgrowthlicensing and regulatory affairs, bureau of construction codes .

R 408.30446 Smoke alarm locations.
Rule 446. Sections 997-2-+-5907.2.11.8 and 96742-+H-5-1907.2.11.8.1 are added to the code as
follows:

907211-5907.2.11.8. Smoke alarm locations in existing buildings constructed before
November 6, 1974. Within each dwelling unit or sleeping unit, a single-station smoke alarm shall
be installed in all of the following locations:

(1) In each sleeping room or each area directly outside the sleeping room.

(2) On each floor level including the basement level.
For sleeping units with split levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels,
a smoke alarm installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that
the lower level is less than 1 full story below the upper level.

907-21H-51907.2.11.8.1. Equipment requirements. The required equipment for smoke alarms
shall consist of the following:

(1) Installation. Smoke alarm devices shall be listed and installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s installation requirements, the provisions of the code, and the provisions of NFPA

41



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

72 as listed in chapter 35.

(2) Power Source. The equipment shall be operable by power from 1 of the following primary
sources:

(a) The building wiring provided the wiring is served from a commercial source and is
equipped with a battery backup. Wiring shall be permanent and without a disconnecting switch
other than as required for overcurrent protection.

(b) A non-rechargeable battery able to power the smoke alarm in the normal condition for a life
of 5 years.

(c) A rechargeable battery, with proper charging, able to power the alarm for a life of 5 years.

(d) A commercial use alarm system with battery backup listed and approved in accordance
with the commercial fire warning equipment provisions of NFPA 72, as adopted by reference in
this rule.

(3) Audible Alarm Notification. The activation of the alarm signal shall produce a sound that
is audible in all occupiable dwelling areas.

(4) Testing and Maintenance. The owner of a dwelling unit, in which required or optional fire
detection or fire protection systems equipment is installed, shall be responsible for the proper
operation, testing, and maintenance of the equipment in accordance with the manufacturer’s
instructions included with the equipment. The occupant of rental dwelling units shall be
responsible for the periodic operational testing and periodic cleaning of the installed equipment
within the rental unit in accordance with the testing instructions provided in the manufacturer’s
instructions for the equipment. If the system fails, breaks, or is out of service, it shall be repaired
and functional within 30 days.

Exception: Smoke alarms and devices installed in buildings constructed before November 6,
1974 where an installation was approved by the appropriate enforcing agency under regulations
in effect at the time of the installation shall be considered to comply with the provisions of the
code.

R 408.30447 Smokeproof enclosures.
Rule 447. Section +622-4061023.11 of the code is amended to read as follows:

1022-161023.11. Smokeproof enclosures. In buildings required to comply with section 403 or
405 of the code, each of the exits of a building that serves stories where the floor surface is
located more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access
or more than 30 feet (9 144 mm) below the level of exit discharge serving such floor levels shall
be a smokeproof enclosure or pressurized stairway in accordance with section 909.20 of the
code.

42



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30451c. Flood loads.

Rule 451c. SeetionsSection 1612.3.1 and+612:4 of the code areis amended and 1612.4.1,
+64242;
1612-431612-4-4-and1612-4-5 areis added to the code to read as follows:

1612.3.1. Alternate flood hazard provisions. Absent the adoption of a flood hazard map and
supporting data, flood hazard areas as determined by the state under its administration of the Part
31, floodplain regulatory authority of the natural resources and environmental protection act,
1994 PA 451, MCL 324.101 to 324.90106, shall become the basis for regulation of floodplain
development within the community and section 1612 shall apply to buildings and structures
within those areas.

1612.4.1. Minimum requirements for buildings and structures. All of the following are in
addition to the requirements of ASCE 24:

(1) Buildings and structures in flood hazard areas subject to high velocity wave action
(zone V) shall be in compliance with the requirements of ASCE 24 for such flood hazard areas.

(2) The lowest floors of structure category Il buildings and structures shall be at or above the
elevation specified in ASCE 24 or 1 foot (305 mm) above the design flood elevation, whichever
is higher.

(3) The lowest floors of structure category III and I'V buildings and structures in flood hazard
areas not subject to high velocity wave action (zone A) shall be at or above the elevation
specified in ASCE 24 or 1 foot (305 mm) above the 500-year flood elevation, whichever is
higher. For the purpose of this requirement, the 500-year flood elevation is the elevation of
flooding having a 0.2% chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given year.

(4) Dry floodproofing for structure category Il buildings and structures shall extend to or above
the elevation specified in ASCE 24 or 1 foot (305 mm) above the design flood elevation,
whichever is higher.

(5) Dry floodproofing for structure category III and IV buildings and structures shall extend to
or above the elevation specified in ASCE 24 or 1 foot (305 mm) above the 500- year flood
elevation, whichever is higher. For the purpose of this requirement, the 500-year flood elevation
is the elevation of flooding having a 0.2% chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given
year.

(6) The interior floor or finished ground level of under-floor spaces and crawlspaces shall
comply with section 1805.1.2.1 of this code.

R 408.30452 Flood hazard areas.
Rule 452. Seetion 34032 of the codeis-amended-and-section Section1612.3.3 is added to read as
follows:

43



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

1612.3.3. Alternate flood hazard area determinations. Absent the adoption of a flood hazard
map and supporting data, flood hazard areas as determined by the state under its administration
of the part 31, floodplain regulatory authority of the natural resources and environmental
protection act, 1994 PA 451, MCL 324.101 to 324.90106, shall become the basis for regulation
of flood hazard area development and the flood load provisions of this code shall apply to
buildings and structures within those areas.

R 408. 30459 Elevators.
Rule 459. Sections 18074 1009.4 and 1607.9.1 of the code are amended to read as follows:
100741009.4. Elevators. To be considered part of an accessible means of egress, an elevator
shall be in compliance with the emergency operation and signaling device requirements of the
Michigan elevator code, R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.
1607.9.1. Elevators. Elevator loads shall be increased by 100% for impact and the structural
supports shall be designed within the limits of deflection prescribed by the Michigan elevator
code, R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.

R 408.30475 Existing-straeturesRescinded.

44



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30497 Signs.
Appendix H101.1.1 is added to the code and HH1-1+-of thecode-is-amended to read as follows:
HI101.1.1. Local ordinances. A governmental subdivision that has sign regulations governing
the placement, location, size, height, or setback from public right of ways shall govern such
items.

45



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Construction Code — Part 9A — Mechanical Code (ORR# 2015-025 LR)
Construction Code — Part 7 — Plumbing Code (ORR# 2015-026 LR)
Construction Code — Part 4 — Building Code (ORR# 2015-032 LR)

Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings (ORR# 2015-036 LR)

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, will hold a
public hearing on Tuesday, March 15, 2016, at 9:00 a.m. in Ottawa Building, Upper Level,
Conference Room 3, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48933. Please come early and bring
your driver’s license, as you will need to check in with the security desk and be escorted to the
conference room. The Part 9A Mechanical, Part 7 Plumbing, Part 4 Building and Michigan
Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules are proposed to be effective 120 days after
filing with the Secretary of State.

The public hearing is being held to receive public comments on the proposed amendments to the
administrative rules noted above. Testimony will be taken for each rule set in the order the rules
are listed above. Individuals who are not present during testimony for a particular rule set will
be provided an opportunity to testify after final testimony on the Michigan Rehabilitation Code
for Existing Building Rules.

The proposed revisions to Part 9A Mechanical Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Mechanical Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under the authority of
Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504 and Executive Reorganization order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-20 and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 7 Plumbing Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Plumbing Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA
230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4,
MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 4 Building Code rules adopt the 2015 edition of the International
Building Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for use in
Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230,
MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4, MCL
445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building rules adopt

the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code with amendments, deletions, and
additions deemed necessary for use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the

46



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization
Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030. The proposed
rules will be published in the February 15, 2016, Michigan Register. Copies of the proposed
amendments to the Michigan Part 9A Mechanical, Michigan Part 7 Plumbing, Michigan Part 4,
and the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules may be obtained for a fee of
$3.00 each by submitting a check or money order made payable to the State of Michigan, to the
Bureau at the address below. You may download a free copy of the proposed amendments by
visiting the Bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc. The amendments are located under
“What’s New” on the front page of the website.

Oral or written comments may be presented in person at the hearing on March 15, 2016, or
submitted in writing by mail, email, or facsimile no later than 5:00 p.m., March 15, 2016, to the
address stated below. If your presentation at the public hearing is in written form, please provide
a copy to the Rules Specialist, at the conclusion of your testimony at the hearing.

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Office of Management & Administrative Services
P.O. Box 30254
Lansing, MI 48909
Telephone (517) 241-6312
Facsimile (517) 241-9570
matsumotos@michigan.gov

The meeting site and parking are accessible. Individuals attending the meeting are requested to
refrain from using heavily scented personal care products, in order to enhance accessibility for
everyone. People with disabilities requiring additional services (such as materials in alternative
format) in order to participate in the meeting should call Hillary Cushman at (517) 335-2972
(voice) at least 14 days prior to the hearing. LARA is an equal opportunity employer/program.

47



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR’S OFFICE
CONSTRUCTION CODE
Draft October 12, 2015

Filed with the Secretary of State on
These rules take effect 120 days after filing with the Secretary of State

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by
section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1,
2008- and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030)

R 408.30551, R 408.30558, R 408.30559, R 408.30561, R 408.30565a, R 408.30566, R
408.30575, and R 408.30577 of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended and R
408.30563 and R 408.30569 are rescinded to read as follows:

REHABILITATION CODE

R 408.30551 Applicable code.

Rule 551. The international existing building code, 20422015 edition, including appendix A
and resource A, hereinafter referred to as "the code," is adopted by reference, as provided in
MCL 24.232, as the "Michigan rehabilitation code for existing buildings" with the exception of
sections 104.8, 108.2 to 108.6, 114.3, 705.1.1 to 705.2, 806.2, 896-3; and Appendix B and C, and
as otherwise noted in these rules. The international existing building code, 20422015 edition is
available for inspection at the Okemes-effiee-of the Michigan Department of Licensing and
Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, 250+ Weedlake-Cirele, Okemes; Michigan
48864611 W. Ottawa Street, 1% Floor Ottawa Building, Lansing, Michigan 48933. The code
may be purchased erfrom the International Code Council, through the bureau’s website at

www.michigan.gov/bcc,é%%me%am%é*ﬂee%shﬂg&m%@%ﬁ ata
cost as of the time of adoption of these rules of $76-:00$81.00.

R 408.30558 Preliminary meeting.

Rule 558. Section +84-2-+ 104.2.2 of the code is amended as follows:

104-21104.2.2. Preliminary meeting. When requested by the owner or owner’s agent, the
building official shall meet with the owner or the owner’s agent to discuss plans for the proposed
work or change of occupancy before the application for a construction permit in order to
establish the specific applicability of the provisions of this code. The building official shall
notify the appropriate fire official of the meeting.

Exception: Repairs, and alterations level 1.

48



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

R 408.30559 Preliminary review.
Rule 559. Section +04-2:2104.2.3 is added to the code to read as follows:
104-2.2104.2.3. Preliminary review. When a building permit is required by the code, the
owner or owner’s agent may request a review of preliminary construction documents to
determine compliance with this code.

R 408.30561 Accessibility.

Rule 561. Sections 410.1, 410.6, 410.7, 410.8.2 and 410.8.3 of the code are amended as
follows:

410.1. Scope. A building, facility, or element that has a change in use group or occupancy
load or alteration shall comply in accordance with the requirements of the utilization of public
facilities by physically limited, 1966 PA 1, MCL 125.1351 to 125.1356 and the Michigan
building code, R 408.30401 to R 408.30499.

410.6. Alterations. A building, facility, or element that is altered shall comply with the
applicable provisions in chapter 11 of the Michigan building code and ICC/A117.1 listed in
chapter 16, unless technically infeasible. When compliance with this section is technically
infeasible, then the alteration shall provide access to the maximum extent technically feasible.

Exceptions:

(1) The altered element or space is not required to be on an accessible route, unless required by
section 410.7 of the code.

(2) Accessible means of egress required by chapter 10 of the Michigan building code are not
required to be provided in existing buildings and facilities.

(3) Buildings, structures, or improved areas which exist on or before the effective date of these
rules and which are in compliance with the code at the time of the issuance of the certificate of
occupancy unless the alteration specifically modifies an area covered by sections 410.6 to 410.8
of the code.

(4) The alteration to type A individually owned dwelling units within a group R-2 occupancy
shall meet the provisions for a type B dwelling unit and shall comply with the applicable
provisions in chapter 11 of the Michigan building code and ICC/A 117.1 listed in chapter 16.

410.7. Alterations affecting an area containing a primary function. Where an alteration affects
the accessibility to, or contains an area of, primary function, the route to the primary function
area shall be accessible. The accessible route to the primary function area shall include toilet
facilities erand drinking fountains serving the area of primary function.

Exceptions:

(1) This provision does not apply to alterations limited solely to windows, hardware, operating
controls, electrical outlets, and signs.

(2) This provision does not apply to alterations limited solely to mechanical systems, electrical
systems, installation or alteration of fire protection systems, and abatement of hazardous
materials.

(3) This provision does not apply to alterations undertaken for the primary purpose of
increasing the accessibility of an existing building, facility, or element.

(4) This provision does not apply to altered areas limited to type B dwelling and sleeping units.

410.8.2. Elevators. Altered elements of existing elevators shall comply with the Michigan
elevator code, R 408.7001 to R 408.8695. Such elements shall also be altered in elevators
programmed to respond to the same hall call control as the altered elevator.

49



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

410.8.3. Platform lifts. Platform (wheelchair) lifts complying with ICC/A 117.1 listed in
chapter 16, and installed in accordance with the Michigan elevator code, R 408.7001 to R
408.8695 shall be permitted as a component of an accessible route.

R 408.30563 EireflowrequirementsRescinded.

R 408.30565a Smoke alarm reference codes.

Rule 565a. Sections 402.5, 403-6403.10, 804.4.3, and 1104.1 of the code are amended as
follows:

402.5. Smoke alarms in existing portions of a building. Where an addition is made to a
building or structure of a group R or I-1 occupancy, the existing building shall be provided with
smoke alarms in accordance with the Michigan building code.

403-6403.10. Smoke alarms. Individual sleeping units and individual dwelling units in group
R and I-1 occupancies shall be provided with smoke alarms in accordance with the Michigan
building code.

804.4.3. Smoke alarms. Individual sleeping units and individual dwelling units in any work
area in group R and I-1 occupancies shall be provided with smoke alarms in accordance with the
Michigan building code.

Exception: Interconnection of smoke alarms outside of the work area shall not be required.

1104.1. Smoke alarms in existing portions of a building. Where an addition is made to a
building or structure of a group R or I-1 occupancy, the existing building shall be provided with
smoke alarms as required by the Michigan building code or the Michigan residential code as
applicable.

R 408.30566 Smoke alarm locations.
Rule 566. Sections 5644501.3 and 560+4-4501.3.1 are added to the code as follows:
564+-4501.3. Smoke alarm locations in existing buildings constructed before November 6, 1974.
Within each dwelling unit or sleeping unit, a single-station smoke alarm shall be installed in the
following locations:
(1) In each sleeping room or each area directly outside the sleeping room.
(2) On each floor level including the basement level.
For sleeping units with split levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels,
a smoke alarm installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that
the lower level is less than 1 full story below the upper level.
504-4-1501.3.1. Equipment Requirements. The required equipment for smoke alarms consist
of the following:
(1) Installation. Smoke alarm devices shall be listed and installed in accordance with the
provisions of this code, the manufacturers installation requirements, and the provisions of NFPA
72 as listed in chapter 16.
(2) Power Source. The equipment shall be operable by power from 1 of the following primary
sources.

50



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

(a) The building wiring provided that such wiring is served from a commercial source and is
equipped with a battery backup. Wiring shall be permanent and without a disconnecting switch
other than as required for overcurrent protection.

(b) A non-rechargeable battery that is capable of operating the smoke alarm in the normal
condition for a life of 5 years.

(c) A rechargeable battery, with proper charging, able to power the alarm for a life of 5 years
and shall be automatically recharged by an AC circuit of the commercial light and power source.
(d) A household or commercial use alarm system with battery backup listed and approved in
accordance with the household and commercial fire warning equipment provisions of NFPA 72,

as adopted by reference in this rule.

(3) Audible Alarm Notification. The activation of the alarm signal shall produce a sound that
is audible in all occupiable dwelling areas.

(4) Testing and Maintenance. The owner of a dwelling unit, in which required or optional fire
detection or fire protection systems equipment is installed, shall be responsible for the proper
operation, testing, and maintenance of the equipment in accordance with the manufacturer’s
instructions included with the equipment. The occupant of rental dwelling units shall be
responsible for the periodic operational testing and periodic cleaning of the installed equipment
within the rental unit in accordance with the testing instructions provided in the manufacturer’s
instructions for the equipment. If the system fails, breaks, or is out of service, it shall be repaired
and functional within 30 days.

Exception: Smoke alarms and devices installed in buildings constructed before November 6,
1974 where an installation was approved by the appropriate enforcing agency under regulations
in effect at the time of the installation shall be considered to comply with the provisions of the
code.

R 408.30569 MichiganYniformEnergy-CodeReference-CodesRescinded.
> SH6Y—Seetions TS 008 andHH oot the-codeare

Cl v v, ) D) ) C v

R 408.30575 High-rise buildings.

51



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Rule 575. Sections-406-4-602-3; 702.4, and 902.1 of the code are amended and-sections406-2;
4063 -and-702-5-are-added to the code to read as follows:

702.4. Window opening control devices. In group R-2 or R-3 buildings containing dwelling
units, window opening control devices complying with ASTM F2090 shall be installed where an
existing window is replaced and where all the following apply to the replacement window:

1. The window is operable;

2. The window replacement includes replacement of the sash and the frame;

3. In group R-2 or R-3 buildings containing dwelling units, the top of the sill of the window
opening is at a height less than 36 inches (915 mm) above the finished floor, or in one- and two-
family dwellings and townhouses regulated by the international residential code, the top of the
sill of the window opening is at a height less than 24 inches (610 mm) above the finished floor;

52



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

4. The window will permit openings that will allow passage of a 4-inch diameter (102 mm)
sphere when the window is in its largest opened position; and

5. The vertical distance from the top of the sill of the window opening to the finished grade or
other surface below, on the exterior of the building, is greater than 72 inches (1829 mm).

The window opening control device, after operation to release the control device allowing the
window to fully open, shall not reduce the minimum net clear opening area of the window unit to
less than the area required by the international building code.

Exceptions:

1. Operable windows where the top of the sill of the window opening is located more than 75
feet (22.86 m) above the finished grade or other surface below, on the exterior of the room, space
or building, and that are provided with window fall prevention devices that comply with ASTM
F2006.

2. Operable windows with openings that are provided with window fall prevention devices that
comply with ASTM F2090.

0 o o

902.1. High-rise buildings. Any building having 1 or more occupied floors located more than
55 feet (16 764 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall comply with
the requirements of sections 902.1.1 and 902.1.2.

Exception: The provisions of sections 902.1.1 and 902.1.2 shall apply to buildings having
occupied floor levels more than 75 feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access
where the local unit of government has complied with the provisions of section 403.1 of the
Michigan building code, exception 6.

R 408.30577 Applicability.

Rule 577. Sections 806.1 and 906.1 are added to the code and 1401.2 and 1401.2.5 of the code
are amended as follows:

806.1. General. A building, facility, or element that is altered shall comply with section .410.

906.1. General. A building, facility, or element that is altered shall comply with section 410.

1401.2. Applicability. Structures existing before November 6, 1974, in which there is work
involving additions, alterations, or changes of occupancy shall be made to conform to the
requirements of this chapter or the provisions of chapters 5 to13 of the code. The provisions in
sections 1401.2.1 to 1401.2.5 shall apply to existing occupancies that will continue to be, or are
proposed to be, in groups A, B, E, F, I-2, M, R, and S. This rule shall not apply to buildings
with occupancies in group H or I-1, I-3, or I-4.

1401.2.5. Accessibility requirements. All portions of the buildings proposed for change of
occupancy shall conform to the accessibility provisions of section 410.

53



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
BUREAU OF CONSTRUCTION CODES
NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Construction Code — Part 9A — Mechanical Code (ORR# 2015-025 LR)
Construction Code — Part 7 — Plumbing Code (ORR# 2015-026 LR)
Construction Code — Part 4 — Building Code (ORR# 2015-032 LR)

Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Buildings (ORR# 2015-036 LR)

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, will hold a
public hearing on Tuesday, March 15, 2016, at 9:00 a.m. in Ottawa Building, Upper Level,
Conference Room 3, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48933. Please come early and bring
your driver’s license, as you will need to check in with the security desk and be escorted to the
conference room. The Part 9A Mechanical, Part 7 Plumbing, Part 4 Building and Michigan
Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules are proposed to be effective 120 days after
filing with the Secretary of State.

The public hearing is being held to receive public comments on the proposed amendments to the
administrative rules noted above. Testimony will be taken for each rule set in the order the rules
are listed above. Individuals who are not present during testimony for a particular rule set will
be provided an opportunity to testify after final testimony on the Michigan Rehabilitation Code
for Existing Building Rules.

The proposed revisions to Part 9A Mechanical Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Mechanical Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under the authority of
Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504 and Executive Reorganization order Nos. 2003-1,
2008-20 and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 7 Plumbing Code rules will adopt the 2015 edition of the
International Plumbing Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for
use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA
230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4,
MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to Part 4 Building Code rules adopt the 2015 edition of the International
Building Code with amendments, deletions, and additions deemed necessary for use in
Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230,
MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4 and 2011-4, MCL
445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030.

The proposed revisions to the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building rules adopt

the 2015 edition of the International Existing Building Code with amendments, deletions, and
additions deemed necessary for use in Michigan. The hearing is being conducted by the

54



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Department under Section 4 of 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and Executive Reorganization
Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025 and 445.2030. The proposed
rules will be published in the February 15, 2016, Michigan Register. Copies of the proposed
amendments to the Michigan Part 9A Mechanical, Michigan Part 7 Plumbing, Michigan Part 4,
and the Michigan Rehabilitation Code for Existing Building Rules may be obtained for a fee of
$3.00 each by submitting a check or money order made payable to the State of Michigan, to the
Bureau at the address below. You may download a free copy of the proposed amendments by
visiting the Bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc. The amendments are located under
“What’s New” on the front page of the website.

Oral or written comments may be presented in person at the hearing on March 15, 2016, or
submitted in writing by mail, email, or facsimile no later than 5:00 p.m., March 15, 2016, to the
address stated below. If your presentation at the public hearing is in written form, please provide
a copy to the Rules Specialist, at the conclusion of your testimony at the hearing.

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Office of Management & Administrative Services
P.O. Box 30254
Lansing, MI 48909
Telephone (517) 241-6312
Facsimile (517) 241-9570
matsumotos@michigan.gov

The meeting site and parking are accessible. Individuals attending the meeting are requested to
refrain from using heavily scented personal care products, in order to enhance accessibility for
everyone. People with disabilities requiring additional services (such as materials in alternative
format) in order to participate in the meeting should call Hillary Cushman at (517) 335-2972
(voice) at least 14 days prior to the hearing. LARA is an equal opportunity employer/program.

55



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

(2016 SESSION)

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once
each month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

(i) Other official information considered necessary or appropriate by the Office of Regulatory
Reform.”

The following table cites administrative rules promulgated during the year 2000, and indicates
the effect of these rules on the Michigan Administrative Code (1979 ed.).

56



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

MICHIGAN ADMINISTRATIVE CODE TABLE

(2015 RULE FILINGS)
2016 MR
R Number Action Issue
325.1 * 2
325.2 * 2
325.3 * 2
3254 * 2

(* Amendment to Rule, A Added Rule, N New Rule, R Rescinded Rule)

57



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

CUMULATIVE
INDEX

A
ARGICULTURE AND RURAL DEVELOPMENT, DEPARTMENT OF
Regulation No.619 Fruit Tree Scionwood, Understock and Nursery Stock (2016-1%)
Regulation No.633 Restricted Use Pesticides (2016-1%)

Regulation No 900 Hearing Procedures (2015-3)
Michigan Commercial Feed Law (2015-13)

Bodies of Dead Animals (2015-21)
Regulation No. 715 Seed Law Implementation (2015-21)

E
EXECUTIVE OFFICE
Executive Reorganization
No. 1 (2016-1)
No. 2 (2016-2)
H

HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES, DEPARTMENT OF
Transportation and Disposition of Dead Bodies (2016-2)

L
LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS, DEPARTMENT OF
Corrections
Part 12. Welding and Cutting (2016-1)
Part 65. Mills and Calendars for Rubber and Plastics (2016-1)

58



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

Part 4. Building Code (2016-2%)
Part 7. Plumbing Code (2016-2%)
Part 9a. Mechanical Code (2016-2%)
Rehabilitation Code (2016-2%)

59



2016 MR 2 — February 15, 2016

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES
ENROLLED SENATE AND HOUSE BILLS
SIGNED INTO LAW OR VETOED
(2015 SESSION)

Mich. Const. Art. 1V, 833 provides: “Every bill passed by the legislature shall be presented to
the governor before it becomes law, and the governor shall have 14 days measured in hours and
minutes from the time of presentation in which to consider it. If he approves, he shall within that
time sign and file it with the secretary of state and it shall become law . . . If he does not
approve, and the legislature has within that time finally adjourned the session at which the bill
was passed, it shall not become law. If he disapproves . . . he shall return it within such 14-day
period with his objections, to the house in which it originated.”

Mich. Const. Art. 1V, 827, further provides: “No act shall take effect until the expiration of 90
days from the end of the session at which it was passed, but the legislature may give immediate
effect to acts by a two-thirds vote of the members elected to and serving in each house.”

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once
each month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

(b) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills
signed into law by the governor during the calendar year and the corresponding public act
numbers.

(c) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills
vetoed by the governor during the calendar year.”

60



2016 Michigan
Public Acts Table

Legislative Service Bureau

Legal Division, Statutory Compiling and Law Publications Unit
124 W. Allegan, Lansing, MI 48909

February 9, 2016
Through PA 8 of 2016

ENROLLED

PA
No. HB

SB

lLE.*
Yes/No

Governor
Approved

Filed
Date

Effective Date

SUBJECT

1 4983

Yes

1/26

1/26

4/25/16

Natural resources; fishing; entrance into state-
operated public boating access sites and certain state
parks on free fishing weekends; allow free of charge.
(Rep. B. Rendon)

2 4604

Yes

1/26

1/26

2/25/16

Natural resources; soil and erosion; soil erosion and
sedimentation permit process; provide exemption for
certain agricultural practices.

(Rep. B. Roberts)

3 5220

Yes

1/29

1/29

1/29/16

Appropriations; supplemental; distribution of certain
appropriated revenue from the state general fund to
department of health and human services; provide for.
(Rep. P. Phelps)

4 4459

Yes

212

2/2

2/2/16

Traffic control; driver license; emergency contact
information encoded in driver license; allow.
(Rep. P. Lucido)

5 4460

Yes

2/2

22

2/2/16

State; identification cards; emergency contact
information on state identification card; provide for.
(Rep. P. Lucido)

6 4535

Yes

22

212

5/2/16

Weapons; licensing; requirement to obtain a license
to purchase, carry, possess, use, or transport a pistol;
exempt law enforcement officers.

(Rep. L. Theis)

0232

Yes

212

212

2/2/16

Use tax; definitions; definition of auto dealer; modify.
(Sen. D. Robertson)

0233

Yes

212

212

2/2/16

Sales tax; definitions; definition of auto dealer; modify.
(Sen. D. Robertson)

* - |.E. means Legislature voted to give the Act immediate effect.

** . Act takes effect on the 91st day after sine die adjournment of the Legislature.

*+* . See Act for applicable effective date.

+ - Line item veto.
++ - Pocket veto.
# - Tie bar.

© 2015 by Legislative Council, State of Michigan. All rights reserved

Page 1




