BuyMichigan:

Respond to a bid / Submit a Quote Screen Walk

Email notification received based on matching NIGP Commodity codes in vendor profile

From: MIeProcurement@buy4michigan.com

To:

o

Subject: Bid Motification - Bid # 0313149813E0000423, GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Sent:

Fri 8/16/2013 11:(

Bids.

A formal bid notification has been sent to you by Department of Education.

Bid Header

Buyer Name: Chad Bassett

Buyer Phone: (517)373-3823

Buver Email: bassettc/@michigan. gov
Bid Number: 0313149813B0000423

(.

/he information from the request is below: \

Requesting Department: Department of Education

Description: GSRP Training and Technical Assistance
Opening Date/Time: 08/27/2013 03:00:00 PM
Available Date/Time 08/16/2013 10:53:00 AM _/

Thank you for vour participation.

Use this link to log on to Buy4Michigan:

Follow link and log in

https:/www.buy4michigan com/bsologin.sdo

Bu 4V||ch|gaﬁi

Welcome to Buy4Michigan.com; the State of Michigan’s online eProcurement solution.

The system login funcitionality is working again with Internet Explore. Thank you for
wour patience. CM 8/1/2013

To view online tutorials. quick reference guides. and general information about doing
business with the State please access: http//www_ michigan.gowmicontractconnect

Register

Register here to begin using BuydMichigan_

Wendors, please read this disclaimer prior to registering.
Complete Registration

Complete registration here to begin using Buy4Michigan.
VWendors, please read this disclaimer prior to completing registration_
Open Bids

Browse open bid opportunities._

Active Contracts

Browse active Contracts/Blankets.

Contract & Bid Search

Search for Bids and active Contracts/Blankets.

Login 10:  |mitchellc4

Password: |(eesesssse

Forgot your password?

To respond online, vou need vour company's user name and login ID. Go to the Department of Education site at https./www.buv4michigan com bsologin sdo. Enter vour login and password
information to sign into the system. Once logged in, open formal bids are listed in the Open Bids section of the home page. All formal bids can be accessed by clicking on Bids, then Open



BuyMichigan:

Go to Seller tab (upper right)
Select Bids tab from home page dashboard

BuMichigan:

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August M3 5:33:46PMEDT D@ & ¥

Home | PDS"l Bids v | Contracts _ Christine Mitchell

Seller ini:

Home - Welcome Back Christine Mitchell

Vendor Communication(0) | Bids(248) ) PO(0) Quotes(o)

No News Available

Copyright © 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - Al Rights Reserved

Look under Open Bids Title bar for referenced bid

Bids - Open

Show Bids for Categnry‘ All v‘ @

1-25 of 62
1231
Bid # Organization Alternate Id Buyer Description Purchase | oy opening Date BHAQ& Quotes. HE“"
3071150413B80000450 | Department of Technology, Mgmt. & 761/13322.SAR Melis=a Former Velsicol Chemical Plant Superfund Site Open Market 10403/2013 Vi Online Quote Not
Budget, Design & Construction Sambiagio 02:00:00 PM Allowed
059415011380000449 | Department of Transportation, Purchasing Maria 1/4" Limestone Chips Open Market 0&/22/2013 View | Create New
and Central Warehouse: Finkbeiner 12:00:00 PM
031314981380000447 Department of Education 313R3200271 Chad Bassett | Michigan E-Library Marketing Plan Open WMarket 08/29/2013 View | Create New
03:00:00 PM
031314981380000423 313R3200245 Chad Bassett | GSRP Training and Technical Assistance Open Market og2rzoma View | Create New
Department of Education
03:00:00 PM
031314981380000422 313R3200242 Chad Bassett | GSRP Contractor fo Application Review Open Market oge2rzma View | Create New
Department of Education
03:00:00 PM
031314981380000421 313R3200241 Chad Bassett | GSRP Contractor for Monitoring Tool Open Market o0g2viz03 View | Create New
Department of Education
03:00:00 PM
307115041380000420 | Department of Technology, Mgmt. & 511/13325.AGY Anne Watros | Camp Grayling - Construct Range Fencing Open Market 09/04/2013 Vi Online Quote Mot List
Budget, Design & Construction 02:00:00 PH Allowed
047214561360000416 Department of Corrections Laura Fathers who Care Reading Program - Department of Open Market 08232013 View | Online Quote Mot List
P Campbell Corrections 03:00:00 PM Allowed
1-25 of 82
12314

Copyright ® 2013 Periscope Holings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved

Acknowledge Receipt & View Solicitation

BuyMichigan:

Seller Seller Administrator

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August20,20135:38:44 PMEDT O @& X

lAcknowledge Receipt and View Solicitation
Bid #
Bid Description GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Click Yes to acknowledge the download of the bid. When you acknowledge a bid, you may receive any future correspondence regarding this document. If you do not want to
acknowledge click No, and the bid will be displayed. Do you want to continue?

s —

Copyright . Inc. - All Rights Reserved




BuyMichigan:

Review all solicitation information attachments, Q&A, etc.
When ready Create Quote

BuyMichigan:

Seller Seller

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Servica | About August 20, 20135:40:55 PMEDT O @ & X

Bid Number: 0313149212B0000423 Description: GERP Training and Technical Assistance Bid Opening Date: 08/27/2013 03:00:00 PM

Purchaser:  Chad Bassett Organization: Department of Education
Department: 1498 - Office of Financial Management/Procurement Services Location: 0313 - Office of Financial Management/Procurement Services

Fiscal Year: 13 Type Code:

Alternate Id: 312R3200245 Required Date: Available Date : 08/16/2013 10:53:00 AW
Info Contact: Chad D. Bassett Bid Type: OPEN Informal Bid Flag: Ho

Purchase Open Markst

Method:

Pre Bid Conference:

Bulletin Desc:
Ship-to Office of Financial Management/Procurement Services Bill-to Address:  Office of Financial Management/Procurement Services
Address: 608 W. Allegan St B08W. Allegan St
Lansing, MI148933 Lansing, M148933
us us
Email: donotreply@michigan gov Email: donotreply@michigan.gov

Fhone: (000)000-0000(&]

Phone: (000)000-0000{G
RFP-CB-313R3200245 .pdf

Item Information

Item #1: (962 - 34) GSRPTraining and Technical Assistance

NIGP Code: 962 - 34

Qty Unit Cost uomM Total Discount Amt. Tax Rate Tax Amount Total Cost
10 EA - Each
Manufacturer: Brand: Mode!
Make: Packaging:
This product was manufactured within the United States and the cost of domestic components exceeds 50% of all components. : No
Brand Requirement:

Item #2: (962 - 34) GSRPTraining and Technical Assistance

NIGP Code: 962 - 34

Qty Unit Cost uom Total Dizcount Amt. Tax Rate Tax Amount Total Cost

This ftem iz narrative

Item #3: (918 - 38) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

NIGP Code: 918 - 38

Qty Unit Cost uom Total Discount Amt. Tax Rate Tax Amount Total Cost
10 EA - Each
Manufacturer: Brand: Mode!
Make: Packaging:
This product was manufactured within the United States and the cost of domestic components exceeds 50% of all components. : No
Brand Requirement:

Print Page Create Quote

Copyright @ 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved.



BuyMichigan:

Bid Q&A

BuyMichi

Seller Seller Administrator

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 5:4258 PMEDT O @ & ¥

Open Market Bid 0313149813B0000423

There are no questions and answers for this bid

Copyright ® 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved

Create Quote, complete General Tab, Save & Continue

BuyMichigan:

MIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 5:47:50 PMEDT O @ & %

Seller Seller Administrator

EZZE) tems GQuestions Subcontractors MNotes Terms & Condiions Attachments Summary  Back to Bid

Quote #: Bid #: 031314981380000423
Organization: Department of Education

Status: In progress Description™ | GSRP Training and Technic:
- Foety
Delivery Days: _ Percent: %

Is "No Bid™ O Aternate Bid: ]

Shipping Terms: v | Freight Terms:

Terms:
it
(MWDDAYYY) 08/30/2013 =

Info Contact: C. Mitchell

Comments: This response is a test for training.

Please answer "yes" here if all tems you are submitting a quote on are manufactured within the United States and the cost of
domestic components exceeds S0% of all components. If you answer “No”, please click each ltem Number on the tems tab and |Yes
indicate individually whether each tem meets these critiera, ™ :

User Last

< pocated
Save & Continue

Copyright © 2013 Periseope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved

Date Last Updated:




BuyMichigan:

Note Validation Errors and Warnings; errors must be resolved before the quote can be

submitted.
Move on to Iltems tab

BuMichiga

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About

EETR soter pami

August 20, 2013 54320 PMEDT O @ &
Christine Mitchell

Home POsY | Bidsv | Contracts Quotes ¥

fluote Validation Errors

# Terms & Conditions is not acknowledged

uote Validation Warnings

= Your quote has not been submitted

Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC

@ Questions Subcontractors MNotes Terms & Condiions Attachments Summary  Back to Bid
CQuote # 00000778 Bid # 0313149813B80000423

Organization: Department of Education

Status In progress Description™ | GSRP Training and Technicz
- — - —
s "No Bid™: Atternate Bid:

0 |

| Freignt Terms: | 7

Shipping Terms:

Sip Vi Terms: L ¥ T
Promised Dte: 02/30/2013 =

(MDD YY)y
Info Contact: C. Mitchell
Comments: This response is a test for training.

Please answer "yes" here if al items you are submitting a quote on are manufactured within the United States and the cost of

domestic components exceeds S0% of all components. If you answer “No”, please click each ltem Number on the ftems tak and |Yes
indicate individually whether each item mests these critiera. ™ :
X : User Last -
Date Last Updated: 08/20/2013 054817 PM Updated: Christine Mitchell

Save & Continue
L =

Copyright ® 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved.




BuyMichigan:

Items tab

Complete unit cost fields, Discount if applicable, Freight if applicable, etc. for each item.
Respond to any item questions. Once again note warnings and errors. Save & Continue.

BuyMichigan:

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 55217 PMEDT O @ € ®

Seller Seller

Home ‘ POs ¥ ‘ Bids ‘ Contracts | Quotes ¥ | Christine Mitchell

eral ltem Information Validation Errors
=« Terms & Conditions is not acknowledged

neral ltem Information Validation Warnipgs
= Your quote has not been submitted
Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC

General ROt S Questions Subcontractors MNotes Terms & Ci i Back to Bid
General [ULICES

Sort by Column: | Print ~| O sortpe =)

ltem # Print C Q::::m ) Description e
‘Quantity | uom | Unit Cost N Discount % | Tax Rate | Freight “ Extended Amount ‘ No Bid ‘ No Charge
1 10 Mo GSRP Training and Technical Agsistance
oo e [ [ | |0 »»= | &8 [ ®

Alternate Description

3 3.0 No 'GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

o o w][ o] 8 [[w] »» [ @ [ o

AlEmRteRT l:l

@ Discount only quotes indicate discount amount off of list catalog price. —
Save & Continue
S S o

Copyright © 2013 Periscope Holdings, Ine. - Al Rights Reserved.

Quote Response Total | $1.00

Questions Tab
Respond to any questions, note those that are required, and otherwise. You cannot submit
your response if you don’t answer required header level questions.

BuyMichigan:

Seller Seller

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 201355516 PMEDT DO @ & &
Christine Mitchell

iote Validation Errors
= Terms & Conditions is not acknowledged

Y

uGTe Vahidation Warnings
= Your guote has not been submitied.

Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC

General ltems [eETTES ’ bcontractors Notes Terms & Conditions Aftachments Summary Back to Bid

There are no questions.

Copyright ® 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - Al Rights Reserved.



BuyMichigan:

Address Subcontractors if required

Notes Tab
Enter Notes if internal messages are needed. Save & Continue

BuyMichigan:

MIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 5:57:24 PMEDT D @ @ X
Christine Mitchell

Seller Seller Administrator

Home | POs> | Bids~ | Contracts | Quotes> |

fluote Validation Errors

uote Validation Warnings j
+ ‘Your quote has not been submited,

Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC

General Items Questions Simﬂ“rl:klr & Conditions Attachments Summary Back to Bid

ﬂ The quote notes tab is for vendor users to enter useful information about the quote. Only authorized users who have access to this profile can view the information added to this tab. This information is not viewable by the agency.

Delete
O Mote Date User Hote

.y
Are you having a good day? )

Copyright ® 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved

Terms & Conditions tab
Complete required fields, Save & Continue

BuyMichigan: o

NIGP Code Browsa | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 6:00:30 PMEDT D@ & %

Home | POs ¥ ‘ Bids ¥ | Contracts ‘ Quotes v | Christine Mitchell

(Juote Validation Errors

« Terms & Conditions is not acknowledged

* Your quote has not been submitted

{Quole Validation Warnings )

Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC

General Hems Questions Subcontractors MNotes(1 Back to Bid

The ring list i all the for the bid which may include terms i
File Name Description File Size
4 RFP.CB. 311303200245 .palf (RFP-CB-313R3200245 ot RFP-CB-313R3200245 79,885 bytes

@ you accept the terms & conditions of the bid?
O ves @ veswthexceptions O No
f you do not fully accept the terms & conditions, please note the below

Would like to negotiate several clauses (Service level
agreements, liguidated damages, etc.). See Proposal
response, Article 2 notes for proposed language for these
sections.

Save & Continue

Copyright @ 2013 Perisct



BuyMichigan:

Note Quote is still not submitted even after hitting Save & Continue here; although the
validation error regarding terms and conditions is no longer there. Move on to Attachments
tab.

Attachments tab

Upload attachments, Save & Continue to add additional attachments, Save & Exit if finished.
Note attachments can be labeled as Confidential, although all docs are subject to Mli
Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), so if there is not an applicable exemption, the doc(s) will
be subject to FOIA.

BuyMichigan:

MIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 6:03:59 PMEDT D @ & ¥

Home | PDs"l Bids"l Contracts | Quotes ¥ | Christine Mitchell

Add File

€ Name is the display name for the file that will appear where attachment repository files are displayed. f can be different from the name on disk and can contain alphanumeric characters, spaces, and special characters up to a maximum
length of 200.

@ Warking an tem "Confidential” wil ensure the document is only seen by relevant personnel and will not be displayed publicly.

G_a_m* |RFP Response | )

Description: | Test submission anly, not real quote.
File*: [caPics\Cherrypiez.ipg | (Browse... >
Confidental.

= e e e

Copyright ® 20113 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved

Save & Exit

BuyMichigan:

[ scier IS

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Sarvice | About August 20, 20136:07:23PMEDT O @ d ¥
Home ‘ POs v | Bids v | Contracts | Quotes ¥ ‘ Christine Mitchell
ote Validation Warnings
® Your quote has not been submitted
o _A
Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC
General Items Questions Subcontractors MNotes(1) Terms & Conditions (JE==lEhiETE)) p mary Back to Bid
ﬂ Marking an item "Confidential” will ensure the document is only seen by relevant personnel and will not be displayed publicty.
Hame Description Confidential Attached By Attached Date Delete
RFP Response Test submission only, not real quote. Chrigtine Mitchell 08202013 dl

Copyright ® 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved.




] .I
BuyMichigan:
Continue to Summary Tab

Review quote, then Submit Quote

BuyMichigan:

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About

ERS8  seller Administrator
August 20, 2013 6:09:00 PMEDT SO @ & %

ds v | Contracts

Overall Validation Warnings

= Your quote has not been submitted.

Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC

General Items Questions Subcontractors Notes(1)

Terms & Cx Back to Bid

Header Information

Quote # 00000779 Bid #: 031314981380000423 Status: In progress
Organization: Department of Education
Description: GSRP Training and Technical Delivery Days: 10 Discount Percent: oo
Assistance

Bid Flag: Alternate Bid: Ho Shipping Terms:
Freight Terms: Ship Via Terms: Payment Term:
Promised Date 0813012013 Info Contact: . ichel (auote Total 20 )
Comment: This response is a test for training.
Date Last Updated: 08/20/2013 06:01:31 P User last Updated: Christine Mitchell

'endor accepts the terms & diti with ptions: Would like to negotiate several clauses (Service level ag iqui d d: ges, etc.). See Proposal response, Article 2 \ 1
notes for proposed language for these sections.

Please answer "yes” here
if all items you are

itting a quote on are
d within the
United States and the
cost of domestic

P ds 50%
of all components. If you
"No", please click
each ltem Number on the
Items tab and indicate
individually whether
each item meets these

(Notes: Are you having a good day? )

Print Sequence #1.0: (962 - 34) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Quantity uoM f Unit Cost \ ( Discount % Tax Rate £ Freight Amnunl\ No Bid No Charge

3
10 EA \ 51.00 / \ 0.0% } 0.0% l $0.00 51.00 J No No

This product was manufactured =i -
within the United States and the
cost of domestic components
exceeds 50% of all components.:

No

Print Sequence #3.0: (918 - 38) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Quantity uon Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge

10 EA 51.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 §1.00 No No

This product was manufactured
within the United States and the
cost of domestic components
exceeds 50% of all components.:

No

!

Copyright © 2013 Periscope Holdings, Inc. - All Rights Reserved




BuyMichigan:

Popup box will appear

st of domestic
impeonents exceeds 50%
all components. If you
1swer "No", please click
ich Item Number on the
:ms tab and indicate
dividually whether

ich item meets these
itiera.:

Message from webpage {E‘

stes: Are you having a good day?

\ ? ) Are you sure you want to submit this quote?

tachments: REP Response

m Information

'rint Sequence # 1.0 :

(962 - 34) GSRP Training and Technical A

JI‘ismnt:e /J

Quantity uomM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge
1.0 EA $1.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 31.00 No No
This product was manufactured

within the United States and the
cost of domestic components
exceeds 50% of all comoonents.

Hit OK and your quote has been submitted.

You will receive an email confirming your submission

From: MIeProcurement@buy4michigan.com
To:
Cc
Subject: Quote 00000779 has been submitted

Sent: Tue 8/20/20135 6:13 PM

@ email confirmation is to confirm to the Vendor that their quote has been submitted. JThank You, Department of Technology. Management & Budget. Procurement

Use this link to log on to Buv4Michigan- https-/www buv4michigan com/bso/login sdo

Hé

Iz =




BuyMichigan:

You now have the option to Withdraw your Quote.

BuyMichigan: e

NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 2013 6:44:47PMEDT O @ & ¥

Quotes ¥
Quote 00000779 - Procurement Empowerment LLC
General ltems Questions Subcontractors Motes() Terms & Conditi 1) Back to Bid

Header Information

Quote # 00000779 Bid #: 0313149613B0000423 Status: Submitted

Organization:

Description: GSRP Training and Technical Delivery Days: 10 Discount Percent: 0.0
Assistance

Bid Flag: Alternate Bid: Ho Shipping Terms:

Freight Terms: Ship Via Terms: Payment Term:

Promised Date 08/30/2013 Info Contact: C. Mitchel Quote Total s2.00

Comment: This response is a test for training.

Date Last Updated: 08/20/2013 08:11:59 PM User last Updated: Christine Mitchell

Vendor accepts the terms & diti with p : Would like to negotiate several clauses (Service level ag liquidated d ges, etc.). See Proposal response, Article 2

notes for proposed language for these sections.

Please answer "yes" here
if all items you are
submitting a quote on are
manufactured within the
United States and the
cost of domestic
components exceeds 50%
of all components. If you
answer "No", please click
each ltem Number on the
Items tab and indicate
individually whether
each item meets these
critiera.:

Notes: Avre you having a good day?

Attachments: RFP Response

Item Information

Print Sequence #1.0: (962 - 34) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Quantity uomM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge

1.0 EA 51.00 0.0% 0.0% £0.00 51.00 No No

This product was manufactured
within the United States and the
cost of domestic components

exceeds 50% of all components.

No

Print Sequence #3.0: (918 - 38) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Quantity UoM Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge

10 EA 51.00 0.0% 0.0% 50.00 51.00 No No

This product was manufactured
within the United States and the
cost of domestic components

exceeds 50% of all components.

No

L

Copyright & 2013 Periscope Holdin'

B s - o —

A popup box will appear

COSI OT aomesuc
components exceeds 50%
of all components. If you
answer "No", please click
each ltem Number on the
Items tab and indicate
individually whether
each item meets these
critiera.:

Message from webpage ‘Xl

Notes: Are you having a good day?

2 ) ave you sure you want to withdraw this quote?

(=)

Print Sequence #1.0: (962 - 34) GSRP Training and Ti L e /

Attachments: REP Response

Item Information

Quantity uom Unit Cost Discount % | Tax Rate ‘ Freight | Extended Amount | Mo Bid Mo Charge
I . T _ T - T — T T [ T [ T ~ T . 1



BuyMichigan:

Click OK to withdraw quote

BuvMiichiga |

EE  seller Administrator
NIGP Code Browse | My Account | Customer Service | About August 20, 201,

General Items Questions Subcontractors MNotes(1) Terms & Conditions Attachments(1) [EFIIIEl  Back to Big

Header Information

Quote #: 00000779 Bid #: 031314981380000423 Status: Withdrawn
Organization: Department of Education
Description: GSRP Training and Technical Delivery Days: 10 Discount Percent: oo
Assistance
Bid Flag: Alternate Bid: Ho Shipping Terms:
Freight Terms: Ship Via Terms: Payment Term:
Promised Date 08/30/2013 Info Contact: C. Mitchell Quote Total $2.00
Comment: This response is a test for training.
Date Last Updated: 08/20/2013 06:16:21 PM User last Updated: Christine Mitchell
Vendor accepts the terms & conditions with exceptions: Would like to negotiate several clauses (Service level ag liquidated d etc.). See Proposal response, Article 2 P

notes for proposed language for these sections.

Please answer "yes” here
if all items you are
submitting a quote on are
manufactured within the
United States and the
cost of domestic
components exceeds 50%
of all components. If you
answer "No", please click
each ltem Number on the
Items tab and indicate
individually whether
each item meets these
critiera.:

Notes: Are you having a good day?

Attachments: REP Response

Item Information

Print Sequence #1.0: (962 - 34) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

CQuantity uom Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge

10 EA $1.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 51.00 Ne No

This product was manufactured
within the United States and the
cost of domestic components
exceeds 50% of all components.:

No

Print Sequence #3.0: (918 - 38) GSRP Training and Technical Assistance

Quantity uom Unit Cost Discount % Tax Rate Freight Extended Amount No Bid No Charge

1.0 EA ¥1.00 0.0% 0.0% $0.00 51.00 No No

This product was manufactured
within the United States and the
cost of domestic components
exceeds 50% of all components.:

Copyright ® 2013 Perizcope Holdings, i red

No

You will receive an email that your quote has been withdrawn

From: MIcProcurement @buyAmichigan.com Sent: Tue8/20/2013617PM o
To: =
e ‘i
Subject: Quote 00000779 has been withdrawn R

This email confirmation is to confirm to the Vendor that their quote has been wi!hdrawBThan.k You, Department of Technology, Management & Budget, Procurement @|

Use this link to log on to Buy4Michigan: https:/'www buy4michigan com/bso/login sdo

Note the Validation Warning — Your quote has been withdrawn. From here you can Reopen
and begin again if desired, or leave the quote withdrawn.



