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Low Bid Real Estate Metro Region Sander, Paul 106624B/77111

One real estate appraisal review for Parcel 
8176, located at 1720 Hancock Street, Port 
Huron, Michigan 48060, St. Clair County 
(Holiday Inn Express).

10/27/2009 11/12/2009

Terzo & Bologna
M.L. Jacobs & Associates
Colliers International
Oetzel-Hartman Group
Cooper Nesbitt Appraisal, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$4,500
declined
declined
$6,500
no bid

5 11/17/09

Low Bid Real Estate Real Estate Division Ramirez, Kelly 108248B/19032

Two before and after appraisals on improved 
residential/agricultural properties and one total 
take appraisal on an improved residential 
property.  The parcels are required for the I-
96/Latson Road interchange project in Genoa 
Township, Livingston County.

10/23/2009 11/10/2009

Todd & Associates, Inc.
Thomas F. Cronin
Steele Appraisal Service
A-1 Appraisal
County to County Appraisal Company

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$385
$850

$3,500
no bid
no bid

5 11/17/09

Low Bid Real Estate Metro Region Sander, Paul 106624B/77111
One real estate appraisal (total take) for Parcel 
6041, located at 2402 Pine Grove Avenue, Port 
Huron, Michigan 48060, St. Clair County.

11/2/2009 11/17/2009

Cooper Nesbitt Appraisal, Inc.
Value Trends, Inc.
Wieme, Rende and Associates
Affinity Valuation Group
R.S. Thomas & Associates

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$3,950
$9,200
$9,400
$4,900

declined

5 11/20/09

Low Bid Real Estate Metro Region Sander, Paul 106624B/77111
Fixture appraisal for Parcel 6041 located at 2402 
Pine Grove Avenue, Port Huron, Michigan 
48060, St. Clair County.

11/2/2009 11/17/2009

Richard G. Terpstra Appraiser
Harvey Deson Appraiser
Delta Consulting Services
S.M. Dix & Associates
ACRO Appraisal Solutions

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$2,150
no bid
$2,500
$3,560
$5,000

5 11/20/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Newberry TSC Paramski, Pete 105846,105847,

102226/Various

As-needed construction engineering and 
inspection services for the North and Superior 
Region design/build project.  This was sent to 
the four on-demand firms only.

11/6/2009 11/12/2009 Wilcox Professional Services, LLC 98/110
85

30/35
25

45/50
40

18/20
17

N/A 5/5
3

N/A 2

Design 
Engineer 
Approval

11/24/09

Low Bid Real Estate Southwest Region Hoopingarner, Kem 49719B/11112 Before and after appraisal on US-31. 11/4/2009 11/20/2009

Bratcher & Associates
Maturen & Associates
Kal-Creek Appraisers
Farmers National Company
Oetzel-Hartman Group

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$2,650
$3,100
$2,750
$3,500
$6,000

5 11/24/09

QBS Design Macomb TSC Forbes, Colin 89090/50112 Evaluating the capacity and condition of six 
drains that cross I-94. N/A N/A Alfred Benesch & Company N/A (Under $25,000) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 11/25/09

Central Selections Review Team
Selections Approved by the

between November 13, 2009 and November 30, 2009
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QBS Construction 
Engineering Oakland TSC Cooper, Dennis 86653A/63043

The project includes superstructure replacement 
and widening of the Opdyke Bridge (S01 of 
63043) over M-59 (ARRA).

8/14/2009 9/8/2009 Fishbeck, Thompson, Carr & Huber, Inc.
111/120

108
91

33/35
34
25

45/50
42
37

18/20
17
18

10/10
10
7

5/5
5
4

N/A 3 RE Approval 
10/30/09

Best Source Design Kalamazoo TSC O'Neill, Michelle 107575C/03041 Road design services on M-222. N/A N/A Soil and Materials Engineers, Inc. N/A (Best Source) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 1 11/9/09

Low Bid Real Estate Southwest Region Ricard, David 46296B/78012 Total take appraisals for five improved 
residential properties. 10/21/2009 11/4/2009

Maturen & Associates, Inc.
Steven J. Petrucci
Oetzel-Hartman Group
Kal-Creek Appraisers, LLC
Bratcher & Associates

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$6,700
$13,500
$7,500
$6,875
$9,250

5 11/6/09

Best Value ITS Grand Region Peplinski, Suzette 104207A/41900
Provision of an audio/video system at the West 
Michigan Traffic Management Center (WMTMC), 
Grand Rapids.

10/6/2009 11/3/2009 Audio Visual Innovations, Inc.

93/105
82
79
77

Contracting 
Firm Exp & Ref.

18/20
16
15
16

Assigned Staff 
Qual.

28/30
23
21
19

Tech. 
Approach & 
Work Plan

22/25
22
19
12 N/A N/A

Bid Price

25/30
21
24
30

$417,267.45
$503,127.56 
$434,862.50
$346,168.00

4 11/10/09

Best Value Other Design Division Lynwood, Lynn N/A/N/A

Develop and install a demonstration solar hot 
water heater project at two rest area facilities for 
the purpose of demonstrating the feasibility and 
benefit of solar technologies in heating water in 
rest areas.

10/8/2009 10/29/2009 Mechanical Energy Systems 70/100 45/50 10/25 10/20 N/A 5/5 N/A 1 11/13/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Taylor, Louis Various/Various As-needed geotechnical engineering services. 9/23/2009 10/19/2009

Wilcox Professional Services, LLC
Soil and Materials Engineers, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Inc.

104/120
99
98
93
92
91
86
82
77
76
75

34/35
31
30
29
33
32
26
29
27
28
27

46/50
46
45
41
40
40
38
31
32
28
28

19/20
17
18
18
16
14
17
17
15
15
15

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
3
5
5
5
3
5
5

N/A 11 11/13/09

QBS Design Southwest Region Azam, Munawar 90361/14041

Mill and two course overlay with seven foot 
paved shoulders, guardrail and isolated drainage 
improvements as determined by existing 
conditions and road treatment.

9/22/2009 10/20/2009 Spalding DeDecker Associates, Inc.

105/120
102
99
97
88
87
86
86
85
83

29/35
27
23
25
18
16
17
17
18
17

43/50
43
43
41
41
41
41
37
37
37

18/20
17
18
18
17
17
16
17
19
17

10/10
10
10
8
7
8
7

10
6
7

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 10 11/13/09

Central Selections Review Team
Selections Approved by the

between October 30, 2009 and November 13, 2009
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QBS Design Kalamazoo TSC Sytsma, Jonathan 90028C/03023,03024 Pavement reconstruction of M-89. 10/8/2009 10/22/2009 Alfred Benesch & Company

95/120
89
89
81
81
74
72
70
70

28/35
20
24
24
28
20
20
20
20

45/50
47
43
34
30
32
30
28
28

17/20
17
17
18
18
17
17
17
17

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 9 11/13/09

QBS Design Grand Rapids TSC Minkus, Jason 90100C/70023

Design services for all necessary work for the 
construction of indirect turn lanes and the 
removal of the through movement at intersection 
of 92nd Avenue and the I-196 Business Loop, 
as well as drainage, permanent signing and 
pavement markings.

8/31/2009 10/26/2009 RW Armstrong & Associates, Inc. N/A (Tier I) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 4 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering Southwest Region Bills, Gregory 89939C/08031 Video taping services on M-37, and M-79 to M-

43. 10/19/2009 11/9/2009

Materials Testing Consultants
Advanced Underground Inspection
Down Under Municipal Services
Doetsch Industrial Services, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$36,097.04
$41,437.80
$52,830.00
$53,240.00

4 11/13/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Jackson TSC Bigelow, Jeff Various/Various As-needed inspection and testing. 9/15/2009 10/13/2009 Great Lakes Engineering Group

114/120
111
108
107
102
97

35/35
33
32
29
30
30

46/50
48
46
48
41
40

18/20
17
15
17
18
17

10/10
8

10
8
8
5

5/5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 6 11/13/09

QBS Design Taylor TSC Yung, Gorette 107189/82061

Streetscape enhancement on US-12 (Michigan 
Avenue) at Inkster Road as well as ADA 
sidewalk ramps, concrete bus stop pads and 
design survey.

10/14/2009 11/4/2009
Giffels-Webster Engineers, Inc.
The Mannik & Smith Group, Inc.
Wade Trim Associates, Inc.

N/A (Tier I) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 10 11/13/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Detroit TSC Judnic, Victor Various/Various

Cold-milling, HMA resurfacing, and bridge 
rehabilitation for various projects in the Metro 
Region (ARRA).

9/28/2009 10/26/2009 BBF Engineering Services, PC

107/120
106
102
86
81
58

31/35
30
27
28
25
15

48/50
45
45
30
30
25

17/20
17
17
16
16
9

6/10
9
8
7
6
5

5/5
5
5
5
4
4

N/A 6 11/13/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Davison TSC Lopez, Armando 44785A/25132

Design/build construction services (full 
construction engineering) project administration, 
inspection, testing, verification, surveying, QA, 
etc.  (ARRA).

9/12/2009 10/12/2009 Fishbeck, Thompson, Carr & Huber, Inc.
112/120

111
102

33/35
34
30

48/50
45
42

18/20
18
18

8/10
9
8

5/5
5
5

N/A 3 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - Bay Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
The Mannik & Smith Group, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
TTL Associates, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Ltd.
Professional Service Industries
DLZ Michigan, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$1,829.80
$2,175.00
$2,605.00
$3,355.00
$4,374.00
$5,520.00
$5,522.00
$8.788.24

8 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - Grand Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
NTH Consultants, Ltd.
Villa Environmental Consultants, Inc.
TTL Associates, Inc.
Professional Service Industries
DLZ Michigan, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$1,747.10
$2,355.00
$3,144.00
$4,668.80
$5,150.00
$5,337.00
$6,072.00
$8.831.62

8 11/13/09
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Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - Metro Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
The Mannik & Smith Group, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
TTL Associates, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Ltd.
Professional Service Industries
DLZ Michigan, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$1,614.90
$2,005.00
$2,605.00
$3,144.00
$3,520.00
$4,456.00
$4,772.00
$8.586.18

8 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - North Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
Professional Service Industries
TTL Associates, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Ltd.
DLZ Michigan, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$2,282.15
$2,705.00
$4,091.00
$5,772.00
$5,780.00
$6,616.80

$11.159.68

7 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - Southwest 

Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
Villa Environmental Consultants, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Ltd.
TTL Associates, Inc.
Professional Service Industries
DLZ Michigan, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$1,835.75
$2,455.00
$3,355.00
$3,815.00
$4,988.00
$5,337.00
$6,072.00
$8.831.62

8 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - Superior 

Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
Professional Service Industries
TTL Associates, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Ltd.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$2,694.45
$2,905.00
$4,684.00
$6,472.00
$7,575.00

$10,030.40

6 11/13/09

Low Bid Construction 
Engineering

Construction & 
Technology Division Woodruff, Jim Various/Various Asbestos investigation services - University 

Region. 10/19/2009 11/6/2009

Testing Engineers & Consultants, Inc.
The Mannik & Smith Group, Inc.
Materials Testing Consultants, Inc.
ASTI Environmental
TTL Associates, Inc.
NTH Consultants, Ltd.
Villa Environmental Consultants, Inc.
Professional Service Industries
DLZ Michigan, Inc.

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$1,697.20
$2,005.00
$2,605.00
$3,144.00
$3,982.00
$4,874.00
$5,150.00
$5.522.00
$8,068.51

9 11/13/09
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QBS Design Taylor TSC Yung, Gorette 106194/82291,82292 Roadway rehabilitation for bike path. 9/22/2009 10/6/2009 Wilbur Smith Associates, Inc.

103/120
102
98
97

32/35
30
27
29

42/50
42
42
39

17/20
17
17
17

7/10
8
7
7

5/5
5
5
5

N/A 5 10/22/09

QBS Design Design Division Cadena, Rudy Various/Various Design assistance to Local Agency Progarms for 
various projects statewide - Urban Program. 8/10/2009 8/27/2009 Rowe Professional Services Company

AECOM USA of Michigan, Inc.

102/110
98
96
95
92
87
87
83
82
82
81
81
73

33/35
33
32
26
28
28
27
27
28
30
32
28
22

47/50
45
43
47
40
37
38
35
35
30
28
32
28

17/20
15
16
17
19
17
17
16
14
17
16
16
18

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 13 RE Approval
10/19/09

QBS Design Design Division Cadena, Rudy Various/Various Design assistance to Local Agency Programs for 
various projects statewide - Rural Program. 8/10/2009 8/27/2009 Fleis & VandenBrink Engineering, Inc.

RS Engineering, LLC

101/110
100
99
95
91
87
87
83
82
81
80
79
73

35/35
28
32
33
28
28
27
27
30
28
28
31
22

45/50
50
45
42
39
37
38
35
30
32
33
27
28

16/20
17
17
15
19
17
17
16
17
16
14
16
18

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 13 RE Approval 
10/19/09

Low Bid Real Estate Real Estate Division Goeman, Scott 101622/47065

Two before and after appraisals on improved 
residential/agricultural properties and one total 
take appraisal on an improved residential 
property.  The parcels are required for the I-
96/Latson Road interchange project in Genoa 
Township, Livingston County.

10/1/2009 10/15/2009

Heinowski Appraisal & Consulting, LLC
Value Trends
Wieme, Rende & Associates
Genzink Appraisal Group
M.L. Jacobs & Associates

N/A (Low Bid) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

$6,800
$22,300
$9,500

$31,000
$10,000

5 10/19/09

QBS Design Design Division Guerrazzi, Sam 107191,107231/17034
Design services for bridge widening, overlay, 
railing replacement, substructure repairs, non-
motorized path and approach work.

9/16/2009 10/7/2009 Wilcox Professional Services, LLC

98/110
96
93
93
91
91

34/35
32
30
30
30
30

42/50
42
42
42
40
40

17/20
17
16
16
16
16

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 6 10/30/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Jackson TSC Zweng, Hal

87160,102741,103021,
105947,84892/

58151,58152,58171

Full construction engineering on I-75 and I-275, 
city of Monroe, Monroe County. 9/14/2009 10/12/2009 Fishbeck, Thompson, Carr & Huber, Inc.

110/120
102
97

31/35
30
28

48/50
44
40

18/20
18
18

9/10
7
6

4/5
3
5

N/A 3 10/30/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Jackson TSC Bigelow, Jeff 105785/38103 As-needed design/build construction services, 

inspection and testing (ARRA). 9/14/2009 10/12/2009 HNTB Michigan, Inc. 114/120
107

35/35
30

48/50
47

18/20
18

8/10
7

5/5
5 N/A 2 10/30/09

Central Selections Review Team
Selections Approved by the

between October 16, 2009 and October 30, 2009
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QBS Design Macomb TSC Minton, Steven 45735C/50031

Mill and HMA resurface curb and gutter 
replacement, sidewalk construction, ADA ramp 
installation, traffic signal replacement, access 
management, pedestrian bridge removal, and 
drainage improvements.

9/9/2009 10/5/2009 Wade Trim Associates, Inc.

101/120
99
96
96
96
95
93
90
88

34/35
32
30
28
28
30
32
28
26

45/50
45
45
45
45
43
40
40
40

17/20
17
16
18
18
17
16
17
17

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 9 10/30/09

QBS Traffic & Safety Jackson TSC Droste, Justin 105893C/38111
For generation of signal modernization and 
staging plan and contract documents, to be 
incorporated with Bridge Project 105893.

N/A N/A Mansell Associates, Inc. N/A (Under $25,000) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 10/27/09

QBS Traffic & Safety Jackson TSC Droste, Justin 83396C/38111
For generation of signal staging plans and 
contract documents, to be incorporated with 
bridge job 83396.

N/A N/A Mansell Associates, Inc. N/A (Under $25,000) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 3 10/27/09
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QBS Construction 
Engineering Taylor TSC Erben, William 104068/82022

Pumphouse rehabilitation, replacement of 
existing mixed flow pump motors and control 
equipment at the I-94 interchange with Schaefer 
Road, city of Dearborn.

9/15/2009 9/24/2009 Hubbell, Roth & Clark, Inc. 95/110
81

30/35
25

45/50
35

16/20
16 N/A 4/5

5 N/A 2 RE Approval
10/1/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Macomb TSC Everett, Denoris 45733/50051

Full construction engineering services for road 
construction on southbound M-3 from Sunnyview 
Street to Cass Avenue in the city of Mount 
Clemens.

7/30/2009 8/27/2009 Tyme Engineering

110/120
109
100
97
88
86
84
84

35/35
35
30
25
25
25
25
25

45/50
45
40
40
40
35
35
35

18/20
17
17
18
16
17
18
16

9/10
8
10
10
5
5
5
5

3/5
4
3
4
2
4
1
3

N/A 8 RE Approval
10/1/09

QBS Design Metro Region Sweeney, Mark 106969,106674/
82191

Interchange reconstruction on I-75 at the Dix 
Toledo Highway interchange, within Brownstown 
Township, Wayne County.

8/17/2009 9/14/2009 Alfred Benesch & Company

112/120
111
110
109
106
104
103
99
99

32/35
34
34
32
30
30
30
28
30

49/50
46
46
46
46
43
43
40
40

17/20
17
18
17
17
17
16
18
16

9/10
9
7
9
8
9
9
8
8

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 10 10/16/09

QBS Design Design Division Guerrazzi, Sam 106859/13073

Design services for two bridge deck 
replacements, widening, painting, beam repairs, 
pin and hanger replacement, and approach 
work.

8/31/2009 9/21/2009 Orchard, Hiltz & McCliment, Inc.

95/120
93
92
91
91
91
89
88

30/35
30
28
30
28
28
28
26

42/50
42
42
40
42
42
40
40

18/20
16
17
16
16
16
16
17

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
5
5
5

N/A 8 10/16/09

QBS Design Detroit River 
International Crossing Alghurabi, Mohammed 82194/802330 Detroit River International Crossing - Scope 2 - 

Aesthetic Design Guide. 8/6/2009 8/27/2009 Hamilton Anderson Associates, Inc. 120/140
116

32/35
30

42/50
43

17/20
18

7/10
6

5/5
4

17/20
15 2 10/16/09

QBS Construction 
Engineering Macomb TSC Everett, Denoris 107296/50015

Full construction engineering services for road 
construction on M-53 from 32 Mile to 34 Mile in 
the village of Romeo.

8/18/2009 9/8/2009
Rowe Professional Services Company
Hubbell, Roth & Clark, Inc.
Orchard, Hiltz & McCliment, Inc.

N/A (Tier I) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A 8 10/16/09

Best Value Other
Office of High Speed 

Rail & Innovative 
Project Advancement

Chapman, Brenda N/A/N/A Feasibility study of traffic demand on Michigan's 
limited access highway system. 8/28/2009 9/17/2009 Wilbur Smith Associates, Inc.

97/120
96
91
65
58
52

30/35
32
27
15
15
12

19/20
15
18
10
16
10

18/20
15
17
10
10
10

Price

19/30
22
20
30
17
18

2/5
4
1
0
0
2

9/10
8
8

N/A
N/A
N/A

$541,289
$462,926
$498,402
$342,617
$603,285
$564,355

6 10/16/09

Best Value Other
Office of High Speed 

Rail & Innovative 
Project Advancement

Chapman, Brenda N/A/N/A

Refresh and update or review and evaluate the 
current draft study conducted on the traffic, 
demand, and revenue potential for the DRIC, 
located between Windsor, Ontario, and Detroit, 
Wayne County.

10/8/2009 10/14/2009 Wilbur Smith Associates, Inc. 119/125
28

34/35
10

19/20
5

24/25
10

Price

40/40
0

2/5
3 N/A

$256,963
unable to determine 2 10/16/09

Central Selections Review Team
Selections Approved by the

between October 2, 2009 and October 16, 2009



Type of 
Selection Service Type

Overseeing Region, 
TSC, or Central Office 

Area
Project Manager Job Number/

Control Section Brief Description of Project RFP Posted 
Date

RFP Due 
Date

Vendor Selected
(Top Band Listed w/ Selected Vendor

in Red for Tier I Selections)

Total Score for 
QBS for All 

Submitting Vendors

Understanding 
of Service

Qualifications 
of Team

Past 
Performance QA/QC Location Presentation/Tec

hnical Proposal

Bid Amounts for Low 
Bid/Best Source 

Selections

Number of 
Vendors per 

Selection

CSRT Review 
Date

QBS Construction 
Engineering Jackson TSC Bigelow, Jeff N/A/N/A As-needed construction staking for Jackson 

TSC. 8/31/2009 9/21/2009 Surveying Solutions, Inc.

104/110
100
97
95
94
94
93
92
89

35/35
31
30
27
29
25
28
25
23

46/50
46
46
46
43
47
43
45
45

18/20
18
16
17
17
18
17
17
17

N/A

5/5
5
5
5
5
4
5
5
4

N/A 9 10/16/09
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