



STATE OF MICHIGAN  
OIL AND GAS LEASE ONLINE AUCTION  
SUMMARY

Tuesday, October 25, 2022

**Finance and Operations Division  
Minerals Management Section**

State of Michigan  
Oil and Gas Lease Auction  
October 25, 2022

Bidder Number	Lessee	Total Acres	Total Bonus + Total Rental
101	Jordan Development Company, L.L.C. 1503 Garfield Rd North Traverse City, MI 49686	2,762.11	\$33,204.22
102	Fortified Properties, LLC 10 E. Bridge Street, Suite 200 Rockford, MI 49341	240.60	\$4,835.00
103	Gallatin Energy, Inc. P.O. Box 1122 Gaylord, MI 49734	114.04	\$2,290.40
104	Savoy Energy, L.P. P.O. Box 1560 Traverse City, MI 49685	672.00	\$8,064.00
105	Sturgeon Point Development Company 333 West Grandview Parkway Suite 400 Traverse City, MI 49684	805.87	\$9,691.74
	Totals:	4,594.62	\$58,085.36

## Mineral Auction Stipulations

Stipulation ID	Stipulation Name	Description
15	Limited Surface Disturbance-OG FEE	To limit surface disturbance, any wells to be drilled on the leased premises shall be drilled from a single surface area that is acceptable to and approved by the Lessor. The Lessee shall submit a proposed development plan for the leased premises including a proposed surface area, access routes and pipeline corridors, with due regard to surface features, the relative location of other operations in the area, and applicable regulatory requirements. The Lessee may not drill any well on the leased premises without first obtaining an approval from the Lessor. Approval shall not be unreasonably withheld. If Lessor reasonably determines that production on adjacent land creates the probability of drainage of oil and/or gas from State mineral land, additional surface locations may be considered.
20	Use Existing Well Pad	All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, it is further understood that existing well pads shall be used for drilling unless otherwise authorized by the Department of Natural Resources' Land Manager.
49	Best Management Practices	Best Management Practices along wetlands, waterways, or steep slopes as per Sustainable Soil and Water Practices on Forest Land IC 4011 (Rev. 06/01/2018 and as amended) and approved in writing by the Local Management Supervisor.
69	Limited Surface Disturbance-OG MIN ONLY	To limit surface disturbance, any wells to be drilled on the leased premises shall be drilled from a single surface area. Upon the request of the Department's Land Administering Division (LAD), the Lessee shall submit a proposed development plan to the LAD for the leased premises including a proposed surface area, access routes and pipeline corridors, with due regard to surface features, the relative location of other operations in the area, and applicable regulatory requirements. If Lessor reasonably determines that production on adjacent land creates the probability of drainage of oil and/or gas from State mineral land, additional surface locations may be considered.
70	Best Management Practices-OG MIN ONLY	Best Management Practices along wetlands, waterways, or steep slopes as per Sustainable Soil and Water Practices on Forest Land IC 4011 (Rev. 06/01/2018 and as amended) and approved in writing by the Surface Owner and the Local Management Supervisor.
78	GS Lease 3332	The Lessee herein agrees that all drilling operations conducted by it upon the premises shall be done in a good and workmanlike manner and in accordance with good oil and gas field practice, and the Lessee herein agrees to case and seal off each gas, brine or fresh water stratum down to and including the Marshall formation to prevent effectively the migration of gas, brine, or fresh water to other strata, and to prevent insofar as practicable, any loss of gas encountered by its drilling operations in any stratum down to and including the Marshall formation, such casing and sealing off shall be effected and tested in such manner and by such methods and means as may be prescribed or approved by the Supervisor of Wells of the State of Michigan, or his authorized representative. When necessary to seal off permanently any gas, brine, or fresh water, the amount of material to be used shall be specified or approved by said Supervisor of Wells, or his authorized representative. The Lessee herein agrees to give Consumers Power Company, its agents or assigns, at least twenty-four (24) hours' notice before drilling through either the Michigan Stray or Marshall formations to enable Consumers Power Company to have its agents present at the time such well is drilled through the said Michigan Stray and Marshall formations.

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-1</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>N-60171</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	SW1/4 NE1/4	4	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>2</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>119</b>	<b>3</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,190.00</b>	<b>60172</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
49	NE1/4 NW1/4	4	39.07	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
49	NW1/4 NW1/4	4	39.05	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
49	SE1/4 NW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	4	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-3</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>N-60173</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	SE1/4 SE1/4	4	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-4</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>3</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,200.00</b>	<b>N-60174</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NW1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SE1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>5</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>119</b>	<b>3</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,190.00</b>	<b>60175</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
49	NE1/4 NE1/4	5	38.72	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
49	SE1/4 NE1/4	5	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
49	SW1/4 NE1/4	5	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-6</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>156</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,560.00</b>	<b>N-60176</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 NW1/4	5	37.76	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 NW1/4	5	37.28	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SE1/4 NW1/4	5	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 NW1/4	5	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-7</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60177</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 of the SE1/4	5	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the SE1/4	5	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-8</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>160</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>N-60178</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 of the SW1/4	5	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the SW1/4	5	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the SW1/4	5	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	5	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-9</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>155</b>	<b>6</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,550.00</b>	<b>N-60179</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	E 330 feet of NE1/4 of the NE1/4	6	10.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	0.00%
None	E 330 feet of SE1/4 of the NE1/4	6	10.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	0.00%
None	NE1/4 of the NE1/4 except E 330 feet thereof	6	27.16	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the NE1/4	6	37.49	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the NE1/4, except E 330 feet thereof	6	30.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the NE1/4	6	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-10</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>153</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,530.00</b>	<b>N-60180</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 of the NW1/4	6	37.82	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the NW1/4	6	36.16	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the NW1/4	6	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the NW1/4	6	38.12	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-11</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>160</b>	<b>6</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>N-60181</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	E 330 feet of NE1/4 of the SE1/4	6	10.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	0.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering <b>N-11</b>	Arenac County T19N R03E	Bid Acres 160	Parcel Count 6	Bidder Number 101	Per Acre Bid \$10.00	Total Bid \$1,600.00	Lease Number N-60181
-------------------------	----------------------------	------------------	-------------------	----------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	E 330 ft of SE1/4 of the SE1/4	6	10.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	0.00%
None	NE1/4 of the SE1/4, except E 330 feet thereof	6	30.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the SE1/4	6	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the SE1/4, exc. E 330 ft thereof Subject to existing easements.	6	30.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the SE1/4	6	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering <b>N-12</b>	Arenac County T19N R03E	Bid Acres 157	Parcel Count 4	Bidder Number 101	Per Acre Bid \$10.00	Total Bid \$1,570.00	Lease Number N-60182
-------------------------	----------------------------	------------------	-------------------	----------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 of the SW1/4	6	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the SW1/4	6	38.32	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the SW1/4	6	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the SW1/4	6	38.52	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering <b>N-13</b>	Arenac County T19N R03E	Bid Acres 40	Parcel Count 1	Bidder Number 101	Per Acre Bid \$10.00	Total Bid \$400.00	Lease Number N-60183
-------------------------	----------------------------	-----------------	-------------------	----------------------	-------------------------	-----------------------	-------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NW1/4 of the NE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	7	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering <b>N-14</b>	Arenac County T19N R03E	Bid Acres 158	Parcel Count 4	Bidder Number 101	Per Acre Bid \$10.00	Total Bid \$1,580.00	Lease Number N-60184
-------------------------	----------------------------	------------------	-------------------	----------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 of the NW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	7	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the NW1/4	7	38.61	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the NW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	7	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the NW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	7	38.55	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering <b>15</b>	Arenac County T19N R03E	Bid Acres 157	Parcel Count 4	Bidder Number 101	Per Acre Bid \$10.00	Total Bid \$1,570.00	Lease Number 60185
-----------------------	----------------------------	------------------	-------------------	----------------------	-------------------------	-------------------------	-----------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
49	NE1/4 of the SW1/4	7	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
49	NW1/4 of the SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	7	38.49	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
49	SE1/4 of the SW1/4	7	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
49	SW1/4 of the SW1/4	7	38.43	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>16</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>60186</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
49	SE1/4 of the NE1/4	8	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-17</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>3</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,200.00</b>	<b>N-60187</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 of the NE1/4	8	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the NE1/4	8	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the NE1/4	8	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-18</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>160</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>N-60188</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 of the NW1/4	9	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 of the NW1/4	9	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the NW1/4	9	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 of the NW1/4	9	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-19</b>	<b>T19N R03E</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60189</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NW1/4 of the SW1/4	9	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SE1/4 of the SW1/4	9	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>20</b>	<b>T20N R03E</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>60190</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
15, 49	NE1/4 NE1/4	31	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
15, 49	NW1/4 NE1/4	31	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-21</b>	<b>T20N R03E</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60191</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	SE1/4 NE1/4	31	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 NE1/4	31	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

## Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-22</b>	<b>T20N R03E</b>	<b>156</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,560.00</b>	<b>N-60192</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 NW1/4	31	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 NW1/4	31	37.52	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 NW1/4	31	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 NW1/4	31	37.52	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>23</b>	<b>T20N R03E</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,200.00</b>	<b>60193</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
15, 49	NE1/4 SE1/4	31	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
69, 70	Part of SE1/4 SE1/4 beg at SE sec cor of sd sec, th N 01d06'30" W alg E sec. In 1358.58 ft, S 12d53'40" W 1321.37 ft, S 00d48'20" E 74.77 ft to S sec. In N 89d10'20" E alg S sec In 320.10 ft to pob.	31	4.99	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	0.00%
15, 49	SE1/4 SE1/4 exc. beg at SE sec cor of sd sec th N 01d06'30" W alg E sec. In 1358.58 ft, S 12d53'40" W 1321.37 ft, S 00d48'20" E 74.77 ft to S sec. In, N 89d10'20" E alg S sec. In 320.10 ft to pob.	31	35.01	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
15, 49	SW1/4 SE1/4	31	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>24</b>	<b>T20N R03E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>60194</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
49	SE1/4 SW1/4	31	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Arenac County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-25</b>	<b>T20N R03E</b>	<b>78</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>101</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$780.00</b>	<b>N-60195</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SW1/4	31	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 SW1/4	31	37.52	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%



# Mineral Lease Auction Results

## Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Clare County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-26</b>	<b>T20N R06W</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>102</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60196</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NW1/4 NW1/4	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 NW1/4	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Clare County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-27</b>	<b>T20N R06W</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>102</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60197</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NW1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Clare County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-28</b>	<b>T20N R06W</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>102</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>N-60198</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
78	NE1/4 NE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Clare County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-29</b>	<b>T20N R06W</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>102</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>N-60199</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
78	Govt Lot 1 Subject to existing easements.	26	0.24	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
78	Govt Lot 3 Subject to existing easements.	26	0.36	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Clare County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>30</b>	<b>T20N R06W</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>102</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>60200</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
20, 49, 78	SE1/4 NW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	27	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

## Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>31</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>103</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>60201</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
49	SE1/4 NW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-32</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>103</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$400.00</b>	<b>N-60202</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 NW1/4	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>33</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>None</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
15, 49	SE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-34</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>3</b>	<b>None</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 SE1/4	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 SE1/4	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>35</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>None</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
49	NE1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-36</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>40</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>None</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>No Bid</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	SE1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	13	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Gladwin County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-37</b>	<b>T17N R01E</b>	<b>35</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>103</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$350.00</b>	<b>N-60203</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	Lot 3 (SW NE)	14	34.04	Mineral 100.00% Surface 0.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

## Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Kalamazoo County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-38</b>	<b>T04S R09W</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>104</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60204</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 NE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	SE1/4 NE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Kalamazoo County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-39</b>	<b>T04S R09W</b>	<b>92</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>104</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$920.00</b>	<b>N-60205</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SE1/4	23	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	That part of S1/2 SE1/4 lying W of Bear Creek	23	52.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Kalamazoo County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-40</b>	<b>T04S R09W</b>	<b>20</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>104</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$200.00</b>	<b>N-60206</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	W 1/4 N1/2 NW1/4	24	20.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Kalamazoo County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-41</b>	<b>T04S R09W</b>	<b>160</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>104</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>N-60207</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	NW1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	SE1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	SW1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Kalamazoo County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-42</b>	<b>T04S R09W</b>	<b>160</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>104</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>N-60208</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SE1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	NW1/4 SE1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	SE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	SW1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering	Kalamazoo County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-43</b>	<b>T04S R09W</b>	<b>160</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>104</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>N-60209</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SW1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	NW1/4 SW1/4	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering <b>N-43</b>	Kalamazoo County <b>T04S R09W</b>	Bid Acres <b>160</b>	Parcel Count <b>4</b>	Bidder Number <b>104</b>	Per Acre Bid <b>\$10.00</b>	Total Bid <b>\$1,600.00</b>	Lease Number <b>N-60209</b>
Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity			
None	SE1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%		
				Surface	100.00%		
None	SW1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	26	40.00	Mineral	100.00%		
				Surface	100.00%		

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering	Oakland County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-44</b>	<b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>12</b>	<b>1</b>	<b>105</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$120.00</b>	<b>N-60210</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	S 111/2A SW1/4 NE1/4	1	11.50	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Oakland County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-45</b>	<b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>105</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60211</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 SE1/4	1	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	1	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Oakland County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-46</b>	<b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>80</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>105</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60212</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	1	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	1	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Oakland County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-47</b>	<b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>64</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>105</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$640.00</b>	<b>N-60213</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	SE1/4 NE1/4 ex N1/2 of ten acre parcel described as N1/2 of that part of E 359.8 ft lying S of White Lake Road as set forth in deed recorded in Liber 668 of deeds, page 347, Oakland Co., records, also exc that part lyg Nly of White Lake Road	2	35.53	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	SW1/4 NE1/4 exc that part lyg Nly of White Lake Road	2	27.62	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Oakland County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-48</b>	<b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>100</b>	<b>4</b>	<b>105</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$800.00</b>	<b>N-60214</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	East 1/2 of the East 1/2 of the Northeast 1/4 of the Southeast 1/4 Subject to existing easements.	2	20.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 SE1/4	2	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	West Half of East Half of Northeast Quarter of Southeast Quarter Subject to existing easements.	2	20.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	West Half of East Half of Southeast Quarter of Southeast Quarter Subject to existing easements.	2	20.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

Offering	Oakland County	Bid Acres	Parcel Count	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
<b>N-49</b>	<b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>120</b>	<b>3</b>	<b>105</b>	<b>\$10.00</b>	<b>\$1,200.00</b>	<b>N-60215</b>

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity
None	NE1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	2	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%
None	NW1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	2	40.00	Mineral 100.00% Surface 100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

## Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

Offering <b>N-49</b>	Oakland County <b>T03N R08E</b>	Bid Acres <b>120</b>	Parcel Count <b>3</b>	Bidder Number <b>105</b>	Per Acre Bid <b>\$10.00</b>	Total Bid <b>\$1,200.00</b>	Lease Number <b>N-60215</b>
-------------------------	------------------------------------	-------------------------	--------------------------	-----------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	SW1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	2	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering <b>N-50</b>	Oakland County <b>T03N R08E</b>	Bid Acres <b>132</b>	Parcel Count <b>7</b>	Bidder Number <b>105</b>	Per Acre Bid <b>\$10.00</b>	Total Bid <b>\$1,320.00</b>	Lease Number <b>N-60216</b>
-------------------------	------------------------------------	-------------------------	--------------------------	-----------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	3	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	Part of SE 1/4 desc as beg at a pt dis N 00D 20M 20S E 1,250.66 ft and S 89D 51M 50S E 689.78 ft. & S 340.0 ft. from S 1/4 corner, th S 89D 51M 50S E 640.0 ft, th S 340.62 ft, th N 89D 51M 50S W 640.0 ft., th N 340.62 ft. to POB.	3	5.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	Part of SW 1/4 of SE 1/4 com in c/l of rd 1357.35 feet S of E&W 1/4 line, S 170 feet, W 320 feet, N 170 feet, E to beg	3	1.25	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	Part of W1/2 of SE1/4, described as follows: Beg. at the center of Sec. 3, th S 0d 20'20" W 1357.55 ft, th S 89d 51'50" E 1329.78 ft to the center of Teggerdine road; th due N along the N and S 1/8 line 1182.35 ft to SE cor. of school property; th along S line of said school property N 89d 28'20" W 198.65 ft to SW cor. thereof; th along W line of said school property N 0d 26'40" W 173.84 ft to E and W 1/4 line; th N 89d 51' 50" W along the E and W 1/4 Sec. line 1121.78 ft. to the beginning. Subject to existing easements.	3	40.42	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	3	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	T03N, R08E, Sec. 03, Pt of the W 1/2 of the SE 1/4 of Sec. 3 beg at a point located N 00D 20M 20S E 1250.66 ft and S 89D 51M 50S E 689.78 ft from the S 1/4 cor Sec. 3, T3N, R8E; th S 89D 51M 50S E 320.00 ft; th S 170.00 ft; th S 89D 51M 50SE 320.00 ft to the c/l of Teggerdine Rd; th S 170.00 ft alg sd c/l; th N 89D 51M50S W 640.00 ft; th N 340.00 ft to pob Sec. 3, T3N, R8E.	3	3.75	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	T3N, R8E, Section 3, Part of West 1/2 of SE 1/4; Beg at pt dist S 89°51'50" E 1121.78 feet from cen of Sec; Th S 89°51'50" E 199.98 feet, Th S 175.18 feet; Th N 89°28'20" W 198.65 feet; Th N 00°26'40" W 173.84 feet to beginning. Containing 0.80 acres, more or less.	3	0.80	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

Offering <b>N-51</b>	Oakland County <b>T03N R08E</b>	Bid Acres <b>160</b>	Parcel Count <b>5</b>	Bidder Number <b>105</b>	Per Acre Bid <b>\$10.00</b>	Total Bid <b>\$1,600.00</b>	Lease Number <b>N-60217</b>
-------------------------	------------------------------------	-------------------------	--------------------------	-----------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------	--------------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	3	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	NW1/4 SW1/4 Subject to existing easements.	3	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SE1/4 SW1/4	3	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%
None	SW1/4 SW1/4 EXCEPT That part of the SW ¼ of Section 3, commencing at the W ¼ corner, th. N 87° 49' 27" E along the East and West ¼ line (between the W ¼ corner and the E ¼ corner) a distance of 681.57 ft., th. S 02° 10' 33" E a distance of 1,657.89 ft. to the point of beginning of the following described parcel of land: th. N 83° 20' 16" E a distance of 290.31 ft.; th. S 12° 37' 37" E a distance of 329.51 ft.; th. S 19° 58' 17" W a distance of 84.55 ft.; th. S 75° 46' 36" W a distance	3	36.78	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

# Mineral Lease Auction Results

## Oil and Gas Lease Auction Tuesday October 25, 2022

<b>Offering</b> <b>N-51</b>	<b>Oakland County</b> <b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>Bid Acres</b> <b>160</b>	<b>Parcel Count</b> <b>5</b>	<b>Bidder Number</b> <b>105</b>	<b>Per Acre Bid</b> <b>\$10.00</b>	<b>Total Bid</b> <b>\$1,600.00</b>	<b>Lease Number</b> <b>N-60217</b>
--------------------------------	-------------------------------------------	--------------------------------	---------------------------------	------------------------------------	---------------------------------------	---------------------------------------	---------------------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	of 244.74 ft.; th. N 32° 58' 07" W a distance of 271.20 ft.; th. N 14° 55' 58" E a distance of 206.92 ft. to the point of beginning. That part of the SW ¼ of Section 3, commencing at the W ¼ corner, th. N 87° 49' 27" E along the East and West ¼ line (between the W ¼ corner and the E ¼ corner) a distance of 681.57 ft., th. S 02° 10' 33" E a distance of 1,657.89 ft. to the point of beginning of the following described parcel of land: th. N 83° 20' 16" E a distance of 290.31 ft.; th. S 12° 37' 37" E a distance of 329.51 ft.; th. S 19° 58' 17" W a distance of 84.55 ft.; th. S 75° 46' 36" W a distance of 244.74 ft.; th. N 32° 58' 07" W a distance of 271.20 ft.; th. N 14° 55' 58" E a distance of 206.92 ft. to the point of beginning. Subject to existing easements.	3	3.22	Mineral	100.00%
				Surface	100.00%

<b>Offering</b> <b>N-52</b>	<b>Oakland County</b> <b>T03N R08E</b>	<b>Bid Acres</b> <b>80</b>	<b>Parcel Count</b> <b>2</b>	<b>Bidder Number</b> <b>105</b>	<b>Per Acre Bid</b> <b>\$10.00</b>	<b>Total Bid</b> <b>\$800.00</b>	<b>Lease Number</b> <b>N-60218</b>
--------------------------------	-------------------------------------------	-------------------------------	---------------------------------	------------------------------------	---------------------------------------	-------------------------------------	---------------------------------------

Stipulations	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	
None	NE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	4	40.00	Mineral	100.00%
None	SE1/4 SE1/4	4	40.00	Surface	100.00%

**MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES MISSION STATEMENT**

"The Michigan Department of Natural Resources is committed to the conservation, protection, management, use and enjoyment of the State's natural and cultural resources for current and future generations."

**NATURAL RESOURCES COMMISSION STATEMENT**

The Natural Resources Commission, as the governing body for the Michigan Department of Natural Resources, provides a strategic framework for the DNR to effectively manage your resources. The NRC holds monthly, public meetings throughout Michigan, working closely with its constituencies in establishing and improving natural resources management policy.

The Michigan Department of Natural Resources provides equal opportunities for employment and access to Michigan's natural resources. Both State and Federal laws prohibit discrimination on the basis of race, color, national origin, religion, disability, age, sex, height, weight or marital status under the U.S. Civil Rights Acts of 1964 as amended, 1976 MI PA 453, 1976 MI PA 220, Title V of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 as amended, and the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act, as amended.

If you believe you have been discriminated against in any program, activity, or facility, or if you desire additional information, please write: Human Resources, Michigan Department of Natural Resources, PO Box 30028, Lansing MI 48909-7528, or Michigan Department of Civil Rights, Cadillac Place, 3054 West Grand Blvd, Suite 3-600, Detroit, MI 48202, or Division of Federal Assistance, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, 4401 North Fairfax Drive, Mail Stop MBSP-4020, Arlington, VA 22203

For information or assistance on this publication, contact Kimberly Venne, Finance and Operations Division, Minerals Management Section, Michigan Department of Natural Resources, PO Box 30452, Lansing MI 48909.

This publication is available in alternative formats upon request.

---