

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
07-Feb-12		Senior Project Manager for the Statewide Automated Child Welfare Information System (SACWIS)	22nd Century Technologies Inc.	Bid	071B1300244	\$350,000.00	\$1,012,576.64	Dollar Authorization	
21-Feb-12		Global Positioning System Lease and Maintenance	3M Electronic Monitoring, Inc.	Bid	071B2200036	\$3,750,000.00	\$10,134,280.79	Option and Dollar Authorization	6
03-Apr-12		Contact Center Support	Accenture LLP	Bid	071B2200168	\$22,000,000.00	\$22,000,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
	24-Sep-12	Oracle Upgrade ReSTART PM	ACRO Service Corp	Bid	071B2200246	\$120,746.24	\$0.00	Dollar Authorization	
	25-Sep-12	Sr Programmer/Analyst - MGS - TEDS Project	ACRO Service Corp	Bid	071B2200246	\$168,640.00	\$0.00	Dollar Authorization	
	28-Sep-12	MDOS CDLIS Mod. ReStart Programmer Analyst	ACRO Service Corp	Bid	071B2200246	\$63,635.00	\$0.00	Dollar Authorization	
21-Aug-12		Aging Information System	ACRO Service Corp.	Bid	071B9200084	\$544,961.00	\$2,534,715.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
01-Nov-11		Intelligrants Software Maintenance and Support	Agate Software	Bid	071B1300072	\$271,522.50	\$6,205,022.50	Dollar Authorization	
	23-Apr-12	AGATE 2012	Agate Software	Bid	071B1300072	\$1,796,000.00	\$8,001,022.50	Dollar Authorization	0
	25-Jun-12	Agile Access Control Contract	Agile Access Control	Bid	071B9200170	\$81,622.00	\$484,225.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
20-Dec-11		Alcohol Monitoring System	Alcohol Monitoring System	Bid	071B9200162	\$430,000.00	\$3,600,000.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	2
06-Mar-12		Alcohol Monitoring System and Maintenance	Alcohol Monitoring Systems, Inc.	Bid	071B2200120	\$860,000.00	\$860,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
20-Mar-12		Telecommunications, Wireless, and LINK MI Contracts	Alltel Corporation	Bid	071B8200192	\$500,000.00	\$2,000,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
06-Dec-11		Additional funds for the contract for MI Disease Surveillance System	Altarum Institute	Bid	071B1300364	\$275,000.00	\$1,191,203.00	Dollar Authorization	

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
24-Jul-12		Add funds and exercise option year for Senior Programmer Analyst support of Michigan Online Educator Certification System (MOECS)	Amberian	Bid	071B1300337	\$160,704.00	\$321,408.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
19-Jun-12		Senior Software Engineer - MEDC Workforce Development Agency enhancements to IT Systems	Amberian Corporation	Bid	071B0200247	\$164,672.00	\$494,016.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
19-Jun-12		One-year option to AASHTO Transportation Systems	American Association of State Highway and Transportation	Bid	071B0200182	\$1,989,225.00	\$4,403,675.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
03-Apr-12		Facilitated Sessions for Business Requirements	Analysts International	Bid	071B8200236	\$1,000,000.00	\$4,420,000.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
29-Jun-12		Senior Application/Software Engineer support for Criminal History Records System	Analysts International	Bid	071B1300251	\$152,272.00	\$304,544.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
17-Jan-12		MCVNN VINE Software Maintenance; Modification Requested for IT Purchase	Appriss, Inc.	Bid	071B1300025	\$600,000.00	\$3,658,080.00	Dollar Authorization	
17-Apr-12		Add funds and exercise the final option year for Technology Consultant for Citrix Center of Excellence (CCoE)	Arrow Strategies	Bid	071B0200180	\$218,240.00	\$654,720.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
06-Dec-11		Commercial Broadband, Cable TV and Basic Internet Services - Telecommunications	AT&T	Bid	071B2200205	\$250,000.00	\$250,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
20-Mar-12		Telecommunications, Wireless, and LINK MI Contracts	AT&T Global Services	Bid	071B3001358	\$125,000,000.00	\$363,530,541.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
20-Mar-12		Telecommunications, Wireless, and LINK MI Contracts	AT&T Mobility	Bid	071B8200194	\$4,000,000.00	\$5,400,000.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
13-Sep-12		Extension of software license & maintenance for B&L Suite	B&L Associates Inc.	Bid	071B0200038	\$570,925.00	\$1,416,556.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	24

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
03-Apr-12		Bentley Software Products Maintenance Services	Bentley Systems, Inc.	Bid	071B2200290	\$4,343,915.00	\$4,343,915.00	Follow-On Contract	
	21-Dec-11	Online Auction Service	BidCorp	Bid	071B9200083	\$60,000.00	\$270,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
06-Mar-12		Development and Maintenance of the Qualified Voter File and Help America Vote Act	Borsare Consulting Group, LLC	Bid	071B1300369	\$208,480.00	\$626,440.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	26-Jan-12	Support for Qualified Voter File (QVF)	Borsare Consulting Group, LLC	Bid	071B1300369	\$81,000.00	\$417,960.00	Dollar Authorization	
15-Nov-11		Grant Management Software and Services	CA, Inc.	Bid	071B2200090	\$769,135.00	\$769,135.00	Follow-On Contract	
21-Aug-12		Central Reservation System	Camis USA Inc.	Bid	071B2200297	\$11,062,186.00	\$11,062,186.00	Follow-On Contract	
	05-Oct-11	Teammate support	CCH Incorporated	Bid	071B8200090	\$73,900.00	\$73,900.00	Follow-On Contract	
20-Mar-12		Telecommunications, Wireless, and LINK MI Contracts	Cellco Partnership	Bid	071B8200195	\$5,000,000.00	\$8,500,000.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
06-Dec-11		Commercial Broadband, Cable TV and Basic Internet Services - Telecommunications	Charter Communications Holding Company, LLC	Bid	071B2200066	\$2,875,000.00	\$2,875,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
06-Dec-11		Commercial Broadband, Cable TV and Basic Internet Services - Telecommunications	Comcast Business Communications, LLC	Bid	071B2200126	\$2,875,000.00	\$2,875,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
29-Jun-12	22-Jun-12	Complete Corp. - Kristie Olenthof, Ext, 1st Option	Complete Corp.	Bid	071B1300282	\$76,384.00	\$152,768.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	1 year
	24-Feb-12	2012 Helpdesk Analyst - Postma, Option1	Complete Corp.	Bid	071B1300191	\$79,360.00	\$158,720.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
03-Apr-12		USA Herds Enhancements and Maintenance	Computer Aid, Inc.	Bid	071B2200136	\$286,292.00	\$286,292.00	Follow-On Contract	
27-Sep-12		Next Generation Law Enforcement Information Network Project	Computer Projects of Illinois	Bid	071B3200068	\$1,106,196.52	\$1,106,196.52	Follow-On Contract	

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
15-Nov-11		BAA Secure Site	Compuware Corporation	Bid	071B2200039	\$2,883,415.00	\$2,883,415.00	Follow-On Contract	
29-Jun-12		Senior Programmer Analyst support of the Enterprise Licensing System (ELS)	Compuware Corporation	Bid	071B2200016	\$168,640.00	\$337,280.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
07-Aug-12		Additional funds for the BAA Secure Site Re-Write Project	Compuware Corporation	Bid	071B2200039	\$418,291.18	\$3,301,706.18	Dollar Authorization	
07-Aug-12		Case Management Tracking and Investigation Solution	Customer Expressions Corp.	Bid		\$1,096,000.00	\$1,096,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
18-Oct-11		Programmer Analyst for Federal Statewide Automated Child Welfare Information System (SACWIS)	Data-Core	Bid	071B0200053	\$103,664.00	\$310,992.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	12-Sep-12	Exercise option year 1 from 10/1/12-9/30/13	Data-Core Systems, Inc.	Bid	071B2200002	\$109,120.00	\$109,120.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
07-Aug-12		Additional funding for Option Years One and Two of the Ursa Infosuite contract for Software Maintenance and Support	Decision Support, LLC	Bid	071B0200035	\$159,039.89	\$347,673.69	Option and Dollar Authorization	24
	28-Sep-12	One Stop 1 out of 2 Programmer Analyst	Digital Technology Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B2200033	\$109,120.00	\$218,240.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
01-Nov-11		Contract Management Contraxx Software, Maintenance and Support	Ecteon Inc.	Bid	071B2200046	\$750,000.00	\$750,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
13-Sep-12		Maintenance for National Drug Data File Software	Edifecs, Inc.	Bid	071B1300128	\$193,514.97	\$1,648,227.93	Dollar Authorization	
	14-May-12	CORES? RMS Online Basic Badging Module	EM Systems	Bid	084P2200010	\$83,752.88	\$83,752.88	Dollar Authorization	
15-May-12		Storage Infrastructure Solutions	EMC Corporation	Bid	071B8200079	\$10,400,000.00	\$36,614,646.00	Dollar Authorization	
	29-Feb-12	AOD Home Ownership – DTMB / MSHDA	Emphasys Computer Solutions	Bid	071B2200100	\$1,559,267.00	\$1,559,267.00	Follow-On Contract	
03-Apr-12		Critical Incident Management System	Esi Acquisition Inc.	Bid	071B2200173	\$1,176,790.00	\$1,176,790.00	Follow-On Contract	

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
18-Oct-11		Case Management Systems	Evans Caseload, Inc.	Bid	071B0200162	\$314,050.00	\$1,806,431.25	Dollar Authorization	
13-Sep-12		Additional Users of Evans Caseload Management System	Evans CaseLoad, Inc.	Bid	071B0200162	\$362,548.00	\$2,168,979.25	Dollar Authorization	
27-Sep-12		Information Technology Research and Advisory Services	Gartner, Inc.	Bid	071B1300098	\$333,120.00	\$448,590.00	Dollar Authorization	
	17-Jan-12	Restart Senior Systems Analyst for TEA-TEDS Powerb	GDI Infotech	Bid	071B2200104	\$138,880.00	\$138,880.00	Dollar Authorization	
27-Sep-12		Bureau of Juvenile Justice Tracking System	Global Vision Technologies, Inc.	Bid	071B9200015	\$1,144,000.00	\$6,131,500.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
21-Aug-12		Quality Control Services for the Statewide Automated Child Welfare Information System (SACWIS)	Gnosis Technologies	Bid	071B0200353	\$683,190.40	\$2,049,568.40	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
13-Sep-12		First Option Year and Add Funds for Program Manager support of BAA	Gnosis Technologies	Bid	071B1300378	\$186,496.00	\$372,992.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
15-May-12		Option Year and Add funds to Senior Project Manager support of the States Enterprise License System MyLicense (MLO)	Gnosis Technologies, Inc.	Bid	071B0200224	\$202,368.00	\$613,056.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
24-Jul-12		Add funds and exercise option year of Project Manager support of MEGS+, Special Education, and Professional Preparation Services (OPPS)	Gnosis Technologies, Inc.	Bid	071B0200280	\$186,496.00	\$559,488.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
20-Mar-12		Electronic Recruitment System Modification	Governmentjobs.com, Inc.	Bid	071B8200298	\$285,000.00	\$950,300.00	Dollar Authorization	
17-Apr-12		Senior Programmer Analyst support for Office of Commercial Services, Corporation Division's current entity database system and Re-Write Project	Grafius Consulting	Bid	071B0200049	\$152,768.00	\$458,304.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
27-Sep-12		First Option year and add funds for Senior Project Manager to assist DTMB-ORS with application development system	Halo Group	Bid	071B2200045	\$218,240.00	\$436,480.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
07-Aug-12		Integrated Tax Project Control Office	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Bid	071B7200344	\$500,000.00	\$5,489,440.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	6
	20-Aug-12	FileNet Technical Services DMS Capture Implementation	HTC Global	Bid	071B2200068	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
05-Jun-12		Staff Augmentation and System Documentation	HTC Global Services, Inc.	Bid	071B9200218	\$3,574,218.00	\$14,099,538.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	15-Jun-12	PCR 074 and Replacement of Servers for Hosting	IBM	Bid	071B9200124	\$620,183.00	\$0.00	Dollar Authorization	
13-Sep-12		Human Resources Management Network Disaster Recovery	IBM Corporation	Bid	071B7200232	\$132,030.00	\$1,534,674.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	6
27-Sep-12		IBM Software Licensing and Maintenance	IBM Corporation	Bid	071B1300071	\$1,800,000.00	\$17,316,450.00	Dollar Authorization	
27-Sep-12		Mainframe Operations Contract	IBM Corporation	Bid	071B6000116	\$10,000,000.00	\$149,990,777.35	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
27-Sep-12		Second Option year and add funds for Systems Analyst Senior support of MDOT's MPINS PowerBuilder applications	Iknowvate Technologies	Bid	071B1300062	\$138,880.00	\$412,672.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	12-Mar-12	Emergency Medical Services MEMSIS	Imagetrend, Inc.	Bid	071B8200101	\$85,840.00	\$676,680.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	13-Jun-12	Field Manager Local Support RFP	Info Tech, Inc.	Bid	071B2200210	\$214,393.98	\$214,393.80	Follow-On Contract	
15-Nov-11		Maintenance for UIA InfoPrint Printers	InfoPrint Solutions, LLC	Bid	071B8200042	\$80,000.00	\$892,649.86	Extension and Dollar Authorization	5
	03-Apr-12	MSP Dashboard-Phase 2	Information Builders	Bid	071B1300137	\$640,000.00	\$640,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
	16-Jul-12	RFP for DW support	Information Builders	Bid	071B1300137	\$274,000.00	\$1,482,000.00	Dollar Authorization	

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
13-Sep-12		First Option Year and Add Funds for Senior Programmer Analyst support with Administrative Services IT Portfolio	Information Gateways, Inc.	Bid	071B1300384	\$168,640.00	\$337,280.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
19-Jun-12		Senior Programmer Analyst - Michigan Profile for Healthy Your (S3)	(No Suggestions)	Bid	071B1300286	\$168,640.00	\$337,280.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
15-Nov-11		To continue BI Query Software Licensing and Support as part of the Data Warehouse Implementation & Services	Integrus, Inc.	Bid	071B1300109	\$455,008.85	\$19,073,579.85	Dollar Authorization	
15-Nov-11		To Continue Licensing and Support of J-SURS as part of the Data Warehouse Implementation & Services Contract	Integrus, Inc.	Bid	071B1300109	\$1,351,521.00	\$18,618,571.00	Dollar Authorization	
	23-Jul-12	PO release for DW support	Integrus/Optum Government Solutions, Inc.	Bid	071B1300138	\$2,204,000.00	\$16,195,088.00	Dollar Authorization	
19-Jun-12		Programmer Analyst support for Michigan Profile for Healthy Your (S3)	Intelligent Solutions	Bid	071B1300284	\$109,120.00	\$218,420.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
27-Sep-12		Oracle Migration Project	Intergraph Corporation	Bid	071B2200240	\$511,500.00	\$678,506.58	Dollar Authorization	
	04-Oct-11	Exercise option year two 8/23/11-11/16/12	JaWood	Bid	071B1300374	\$91,264.00	\$145,084.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
13-Sep-12		Option Year and Add Funds for Programmer Analyst support of the Bridge Management System	Keystрата	Bid	071B1300368	\$164,672.00	\$329,344.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
20-Dec-11		Senior Project Manager - MDE's Bureau of Assessment and Accountability services	Konzman Consulting, LLC	Bid	071B1300091	\$178,560.00	\$357,120.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
13-Sep-12		Data Center Technical Advisory Services	KPMG	Bid	071B1300220	\$650,000.00	\$999,513.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	24

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
13-Sep-12		Option Year and Add funds for Senior Database Administrator support of SUITE Methodology	Kutir Corporation	Bid	071B2200072	\$158,720.00	\$317,440.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
15-Nov-11		MICESES Print and Mail Services	Lason Systems	Bid	071B7200101	\$500,000.00	\$13,871,390.63	Dollar Authorization	
19-Jun-12		Network Analyst	Lazer Technologies	Bid	071B0200260	\$126,976.00	\$380,928.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
19-Jun-12		Security Analyst	Lazer Technologies	Bid	071B0200264	\$144,336.00	\$433,504.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
24-Jul-12		Add funds and exercise final option year for Senior Project Manager support of the Independent Verification and Validation Services	Lazer Technologies	Bid	071B1300032	\$217,248.00	\$653,728.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
18-Oct-11		Telemanagement System	Matsch Financial Systems	Bid	071B6000400	\$342,634.00	\$3,561,108.68	Dollar Authorization	
06-Mar-12		MOST Telecom Billing System Maintenance, Enhancement & Support	Matsch Financial Systems	Bid	071B2200137	\$1,729,605.00	\$1,729,605.00	Follow-On Contract	
13-Sep-12		Option year and add funds for Senior Programmer Analyst support and knowledge transfer to state resources	Mejenta	Bid	071B1300332	\$148,800.00	\$306,600.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
13-Sep-12		Option Year and Add funds for Senior Programmer Analyst support of key new generation projects	Mejenta	Bid	071B1300373	\$168,640.00	\$325,376.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	03-Apr-12	DD-79 Integration	Memex	Bid	071B9200243	\$135,962.00	\$3,947,066.00	Dollar Authorization	
	22-Dec-11	Michigan Cyber Security Initiative	MEMEX INC	Bid	071B9200243	\$95,000.00	\$3,947,066.00	Dollar Authorization	
	26-Jul-12	PO release for DW support	MiPro Consulting	Bid	071B1300140	\$250,000.00	\$999,160.00	Dollar Authorization	
	30-Jul-12	Modis Inc 1-year option and add money	Modis Incorporated	Bid	071B0200037	\$80,897.72	\$323,590.88	Option and Dollar Authorization	12

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
15-Nov-11		Michigan Public Safety Communications System (MPSCS) Radio and Wireless Related Communications Equipment	Motorola Solutions, Inc.	Bid	071B2200101	\$82,845,751.00	\$82,845,751.00	Follow-On Contract	
06-Dec-11		AFIS - Automated Fingerprint Identification System - Maintenance and Support	NEC Corporation of America	Bid	071B2200089	\$16,000,000.00	\$16,000,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
27-Sep-12		Electronic Medical Records System for Corrections	NextGen HealthCare Information Systems	Bid	071B8200130	\$234,550.85	\$4,223,670.85	Dollar Authorization	
27-Sep-12		NICE Call Recording Software Maintenance Support and Enhancements	NICE Systems	Bid	071B3200034	\$492,160.00	\$492,160.00	Follow-On Contract	
13-Sep-12		MCOLES Information and Tracking Network (MITN)	Northrop Grumman Systems Corporation	Bid	071B3200012	\$2,487,511.50	\$2,487,511.50	Follow-On Contract	
27-Sep-12		ESKORT Compliance Solution	Optum Government Solutions, Inc.	Bid	071B1300034	\$1,000,000.00	\$3,866,824.00	Dollar Authorization	
	07-Aug-12	CSSTP BI ETL Developer	Optum Government Solutions, Inc.	Bid	071B1300138	\$130,000.00	\$14,121,088.00	Dollar Authorization	
05-Jun-12		First option year and add funds for a Project Manager for continued support of MDE Michigan Profile for Healthy Youth (MIPHY)	PEER Solutions Group, Inc.	Bid	071B1300227	\$188,480.00	\$376,960.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
29-Jun-12		NBS LIMS Maintenance, Support, and Enhancements	PerkinElmer Health Sciences, Inc.	Bid	071B2200254	\$1,221,557.13	\$1,221,557.13	Follow-On Contract	

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
03-Apr-12		New Hire Reporting Services	Policy Studies Inc.	Bid	071B2200225	\$1,420,000.00	\$1,420,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
17-Jan-12		Support Services for the New Hires Reporting System	Policy Studies, Inc.	Bid	071B7200117	\$175,000.00	\$2,714,329.00	Extension and Dollar Authorization	3
13-Sep-12		Option Year and Add Funds for Web Developer support of MDOT Office of Communications tasks	PTD Technology	Bid	071B2200073	\$128,960.00	\$257,920.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	16-May-12	Adding resource to contract	Pyramid Solutions	Bid	071B2200070	\$71,514.00	\$177,514.00	Dollar Authorization	
	19-Jun-12	Adding resource to contract	Pyramid Solutions	Bid	071B2200070	\$62,742.00	\$239,986.00	Dollar Authorization	
	19-Jun-12	Adding resource to contract	Pyramid Solutions	Bid	071B2200070	\$62,742.00	\$239,986.00	Dollar Authorization	
	12-Sep-12	RFP for electronic document management	Pyramid Solutions	Bid	071B2200070	\$294,000.00	\$533,986.00	Dollar Authorization	
13-Sep-12		Option Year and Add Funds for Enterprise Architect support of system conversion and migration projects	Red Cedar Solutions Group	Bid	071B1300365	\$227,664.00	\$455,328.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
24-Apr-12		REMI Transight Software Maintenance	Regional Economic Models, Inc.	Bid	071B2200135	\$275,000.00	\$275,000.00	Follow-On Contract	
05-Jun-12		Maintenance for the LARA (Unemployment Insurance Agency) Mainframe Printers	Ricoh Americas Corporation	Bid	071B2200241	\$499,545.71	\$499,545.71	Follow-On Contract	
01-Nov-11		Additional funds for the Annual SAP Software Licenses and Maintenance	SAP Public Services, Inc.	Bid	071B1300170	\$2,500,000.00	\$13,615,967.50	Dollar Authorization	
03-Apr-12		Add funds and exercise first option year of Senior Project Manager for MDOS Business Application Modernization (BAM) Project	Senior Technology Partners, Inc.	Bid	071B1300228	\$218,240.00	\$436,480.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
13-Sep-12		Commercial Driver Licenses (CDL)/ Automated Testing Systems (ATS)	Solutions Thru Software Inc.	Bid	071B7200347	\$151,470.00	\$4,321,478.20	Extension and Dollar Authorization	6
15-Nov-11		MICSES Print and Mail	SourceHOV	Bid	071B2200063	\$11,695,025.00	\$11,695,025.00	Follow-On Contract	
20-Mar-12		Telecommunications, Wireless, and LINK MI Contracts	Sprint Solutions Inc.	Bid	071B8200193	\$3,000,000.00	\$7,200,000.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
15-Nov-11		Additional funding for additional Software Maintenance on Sybase Software Products	Sybase, Inc.	Bid	071B1300107	\$794,957.15	\$4,575,346.30	Dollar Authorization	
19-Jun-12		Enterprise Licensing System	System Automation Corp.	Bid	071B1300022	\$1,751,342.50	\$4,571,635.64	Dollar Authorization	
29-Jun-12	03-Aug-12	Vital Records ReSTART	Systems Technology Group	Bid	071B1300381	\$109,120.00	\$218,240.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
24-Jul-12		Michigan Online Educator Certification System	Systems Technology Group	Bid	071B9200198	\$119,700.00	\$2,741,072.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	4.84
	22-Dec-11	MOECS maintenance extension	Systems Technology Group (STG)	Bid	071B9200198	\$119,700.00	\$2,621,372.00	Dollar Authorization	
	05-Jan-12	MOECS maintenance extension	Systems Technology Group (STG)	Bid	071B9200198	\$119,700.00	\$2,621,372.00	Dollar Authorization	
29-Jun-12		Senior Project Manager support of implementing a disaster recovery system	Systems Technology Group, Inc.	Bid	071B1300310	\$218,240.00	\$434,496.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
27-Sep-12		Second Option year and add funds for Senior Programmer Analyst for OSS and MDOT continued software maintenance and operations support	Systems Technology Group, Inc.	Bid	071B1300357	\$154,752.00	\$309,504.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
19-Jun-12		Two-Way Radios and Accessories	T & W Electronics, Inc.	Bid	071B0200127	\$950,000.00	\$1,950,000.00	Dollar Authorization	
	15-May-12	Four (4) Senior Programmers/Analysts	Technology Resource Services	Bid	071b2200204	\$148,800.00	\$148,800.00	Dollar Authorization	

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
20-Mar-12		Add funds and exercise option year of Senior Programmer for MDOT's Local Agency Project Management System (LAPMS) or Local Agency Reimbursement System (LARS)	Technology Resource Services, Inc.	Bid	071B1300225	\$168,640.00	\$337,280.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
03-Apr-12		Add funds and exercise option year for Senior Database Administrator for Qualified Voter System (QVF) and Inventory System	Technology Resource Services, Inc.	Bid	071B1300213	\$158,720.00	\$317,440.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
03-Apr-12		Add funds and exercise option year for Senior Programmer for Local Agency Project, Management System (LAPMS) and Local Agency Reimbursement System (LARS)	Technology Resource Services, Inc.	Bid	071B1300225	\$168,640.00	\$337,280.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
18-Oct-11		Senior Programmer Analyst for State Information Data Exchange System (SIDES)	The Wellman Group	Bid	071B1300086	\$160,704.00	\$321,408.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
19-Jun-12		Security Analyst	Thin Systems, Inc.	Bid	071B0200263	\$158,720.00	\$476,160.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
29-Jun-12	03-Aug-12	Vital Records ReSTART	Unified business Technologies Inc.	Bid	071B1300359	\$109,120.00	\$218,240.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
	27-Apr-12	Unisys Contract CHG/PO release from bank of hours	Unisys	Bid	071B1300247	\$1,500,000.00	\$47,303,560.00	Dollar Authorization	
24-Jul-12		Unisys and Mainframe Environment Support	Unisys Corporation	Bid	071B2200257	\$23,009,884.41	\$23,009,884.41	Follow-On Contract	
	26-Jul-12	Project Coordinator - Teresa Grey, 2012 1st Option	V2 Soft	Bid	071B1300324	\$128,960.00	\$257,324.80	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
07-Aug-12		Exercise first option year and add funds to continue services of a Telecom Project Coordinator	V2Soft, Inc.	Bid	071B1300324	\$128,960.00	\$257,324.80	Option and Dollar Authorization	12

## Michigan Department of Technology, Management and Budget - Report of Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2012

As Required by Section 830 of PA 200 of 2012

Ad Board Date	Completed Date	Contract Name	Vendor Name	Bid/No Bid	Contract Number	Amendment Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Type	Option or Extension Period (in months)
05-Jun-12		Exercise first year option and add funds for continuation for Senior Applications/Software Engineer Services with support of Bureau of Accounting and Financial Management (BAFM) software application called Local Accounting System Replacement (LASR)	VisanTech Solutions LC	Bid	071B1300289	\$166,656.00	\$333,312.00	Option and Dollar Authorization	12
01-Nov-11		Michigan Waste Data System (WDS) Rebuild Project Modification requested for IT purchase	Windsor Solutions, Inc.	Bid	071B9200161	\$325,000.00	\$1,743,400.00	Dollar Authorization	