Michigan Department of Information Technology
Contract Options and Amendments Issued in FY 2009

AD Board Contract New Total or Contract Option or
Date Contract Name Vendor Name ITB # Bid/No Bid [Number Amendment Amount |Amount Type ExtensionPeriod Note
Elect Wastewater Discharge Reporting
10/7/2008|- DEQ Enfotech & Consulting, Inc 761R1001548 [No Bid 071B1001740 $228,648.00 $5,609,975.80|Dollar Authorization N/A Pre-MDIT contract
10/7/2008|Novell State-Wide Contract Novell, Inc 084R4001934 [No Bid 071B4200346 $1,400,000.00 $11,509,166.00|Dollar Authorization N/A Proprietary products
IT Support for LTC Application -
10/7/2008|DIT/DCH Electronic Data Systems 084R4002501 (Bid 071B5200041 $1,858,236.00 $8,446,380.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
10/7/2008|Restart - DELEG, UIA Tax Area Wellman Group 07117200284 |Bid 071B8200013 $172,640.00 $345,280.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Unisys Mainframe Hardware/Software
11/5/2008|MIPC Unisys Corporation 07115001494 (Bid 071B5000692 $309,024.96 $97,074,759.79|Dollar Authorization N/A
11/18/2008|MMCC RFP - DIT Electronic Data Systems 07114001003 (Bid 071B4200147 $23,000,000.00 $271,531,396.24|Dollar Authorization N/A
LCMS Lab and Case Management
11/18/2008|System - DIT/MSP The Computer Solution Company  |084R5201188 |Bid 071B5200312 $62,325.00 $761,753.07|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
11/18/2008|Restart Program Manager DLEG Business Solutions 21 07117200059 [Bid 071B7200105 $187,200.00 $561,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
11/18/2008|MMIS PCO Kunz Leigh & Associates 07116200037 (Bid 071B8200082 $2,000,000.00 $4,197,696.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
12/2/2008]IT Research & Advisory Services - DIT [Gartner Group 07115200386 |[Bid 071B6200126 $188,100.00 $917,100.00|Dollar Authorization N/A
(A) Automated Offenders Risk
12/2/2008|Assessment Northpoint Institute for Public Managq07116200049 |[Bid 071B6200148 $347,300.00 $1,042,300.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Medicaid Management Info Systems
12/2/2008|{(MMIS) Client Network Services 07115200190 (Bid 071B6200168 $17,111,259.00 $84,454,909.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
RE:Start DHS MSP - Cobol Model
12/2/2008|Payment Sys TekSystems 07116200388 (Bid 071B6200418 $220,000.00 $667,040.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
12/2/2008|Restart MDE OEAA Konzman Consulting 07118200017 (Bid 071B8200046 $208,000.00 $436,800.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
12/2/2008|Restart DLEG OFIS Business Analyst |Dewpoint 07118200095 [Bid 071B8200157 $151,840.00 $229,940.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
12/16/2008|Restart UIA IVR Development Support |Centurion 07117200307 [Bid 071B8200034 $265,200.00 $530,400.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Restart HRMN Technology
1/20/2009|Consultants ARM Consulting 07117200062 (Bid 071B7200109 $478,400.00 $1,435,200.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
1/20/2009|Restart HRMN SR Project Manager ARM Consulting 07117200063 |[Bid 071B7200110 $220,000.00 $660,000.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Restart DIT/MSP SOR Tech
1/20/2009|Consultant Keane, Incorporated 07118200050 (Bid 071B8200092 $187,200.00 $374,400.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
1/20/2009|Re:Start DIT-DSO Saber Software 07117200055 (Bid 071B8200278 $239,200.00 $427,920.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Restart MDE/MEDS SR Programmer
2/10/2009|Analyst Amberian 07118200037 (Bid 071B8200087 $176,800.00 $353,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
2/17/2009|IT Research & Advisory Services - DIT |Gartner Group 07115200386 |[Bid 071B6200126 $233,000.00 $1,150,100.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
MDIT/MMDOC Global Positioning
3/3/2009|System DIT/MDOT ProTech Monitoring 07116200106 (Bid 071B6200309 $4,400,457.00 $7,400,456.00{ Three-month-nine-day option & Dollar Authorizg3 Months, 9 Days Agency Owned
3/3/2009|Restart DLEG License 2000 Technology Resource Services 07117200109 (Bid 071B7200183 $152,800.00 $305,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Re:Start Senior Programmer/Analysts
3/3/2009|DIT/ Lazer Technologies 07118200171 (Bid 071B8200172 $176,800.00 $304,300.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Unisys Mainframe Hardware/Software
3/17/2009|MIPC Unisys Corporation 07115001494 (Bid 071B5000692 $2,041,454.00 $99,116,213.79|Dollar Authorization N/A
3/17/2009|Restart MDOT OST App Support DataCore 07116200413 |[Bid 071B7200051 $288,240.00 $1,160,400.00(Eight-month Option & Dollar Authorization 8 Months
3/17/2009|Re:start MDOT MFOS Re-Engineering |DataCore 07117200141 [Bid 071B7200208 $427,500.00 $1,226,250.00({Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
3/17/2009|Re:Start DMB ORS OpTech 07117200144 |Bid 071B7200212 $176,800.00 $530,400.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
3/17/2009|Restart MDOC OMNI Enhancements |Prairie Quest Consulting 07118200085 |[Bid 071B8200128 $176,800.00 $353,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
3/17/2009|MAIN Technology Services - DMB IBM Corporation 93-AR0044 Bid 071B4000144 $1,554,804.00 $227,453,431.00{Nine Month Extension & Dollar Authorization |9 Months
4/7/2009|(A) MDE School Meals Training Michigan Public Health Institute 07116200067 (Bid 071B6200170 $60,500.00 $280,500.00|Eleven-month Option & Dollar Authorization 11 Months
Compuware Enterprise Agreement -
4/7/2009|DIT Compuware Corporation 084R6200182 [No Bid 071B6200219 $551,209.95 $5,563,525.95|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year Proprietary products
Restart DIT Telecom Strategic Plan
4/7/2009|PM Dewpoint 07117200075 (Bid 071B7200129 $208,000.00 $624,000.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
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4/7/2009|Restart MDOS QVF Support Ken Borsare 07117200293 [Bid 071B8200016 $176,800.00 $442,000.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
4/7/2009|Restart DCH DCH Medicaid Reporting |Symbiosis 07118200070 [Bid 071B8200117 $57,200.00 $171,600.00|Six Month Option & Dollar Authorization 6 Months
4/7/2009|Re:Start DCH Medicaid Reporting Ramsoft 07118200070 [Bid 071B8200118 $57,200.00 $171,600.00{Six Month Option & Dollar Authorization 6 Months
4/7/2009|Re:Start DCH Medicaid Reporting E-Com 07118200070 [Bid 071B8200119 $57,200.00 $171,600.00|Six Month Option & Dollar Authorization 6 Months
4/7/2009|Restart MSP NCHIP/CHR Ramsoft 07118200097 [Bid 071B8200152 $145,600.00 $291,200.00(|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
4/7/2009|Software Consultants - DIT/MDE Mindteck Bid 071B9200140 $282,880.00 $472,528.00(|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
4/21/2009|Restart DLEG BCS/CORPS Mejenta Systems 07118200054 |Bid 071B8200104 $156,000.00 $312,000.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
4/21/2009|Restart MSP MICR Reports Ramsoft 07118200123 |[Bid 071B8200167 $145,600.00 $291,200.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Bridges Development &
5/5/2009|Implementation DIT/DHS Deloitte Consulting 07115200315 (Bid 071B6200149 $4,123,312.00 $99,609,450.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
5/5/2009|(A) Michigan Integrated Tax System Deloitte Consulting 07117200239 [Bid 071B8200018 $9,485,000.00 $24,635,000.00|Dollar Authorization N/A
Restart DLEG/Workers Compensation
5/5/2009|Agency Analysts International 07118200065 |Bid 071B8200105 $114,400.00 $228,800.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
5/19/2009|Restart OES SIEM TekSystems 07119200025 |Bid 071B9200070 $70,080.00 $120,080.00|Five Month Option & Dollar Authorization 5 Months
DLEG - BCC- Boiler hand held
6/16/2009|changes Accela 084R5200312 [No Bid 071B5200293 $36,498.00 $630,425.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year Proprietary products
6/16/2009|(A) MDIT/MDCH/MDSS Project Altarum 07116200211 |Bid 071B6200382 $269,695.00 $1,726,195.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
6/16/2009|WIC Information System Three Sigma Software 07116200272 (Bid 071B7200133 $1,301,200.00 $8,809,272.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
6/16/2009|Restart MDOT Fieldnet Support Uday Corporation 07117200154 |Bid 071B7200217 $164,320.00 $492,960.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
6/16/2009|Restart UIA SR Programmer Analyst |Analysts International 07117200175 |[Bid 071B7200243 $164,320.00 $492,860.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Restart DIT/DLEG SR Software
6/16/2009|Engineer Amberian 07117200178 (Bid 071B7200244 $176,800.00 $530,400.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
6/16/2009|Lottery Net Conversion Unified Business 07117200277 (Bid 071B7200339 $86,328.00 $343,728.00|Five Month Option & Dollar Authorization 5 Months
6/16/2009|Restart Telecom Security Analyst (1) |OpTech 07118200089 [Bid 071B8200133 $174,720.00 $322,361.00({Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
6/16/2009|Restart Telecom Network Admin (2) Milleniumsoft 07118200088 |Bid 071B8200134 $135,200.00 $233,701.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
6/16/2009|Re:Start DIT/Telecom Network Admin |TekSystems 07118200088 |[Bid 071B8200135 $135,200.00 $233,701.00(|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
6/16/2009|Restart Filenet Support Dept Treasury |Ramsoft 07118200103 [Bid 071B8200162 $187,200.00 $374,400.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
RE: Start DIT/DEQ Project
6/16/2009|Management Business Solutions 21 07118200151 (Bid 071B8200182 $210,080.00 $420,160.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Re-Start Resource for Project
6/16/2009|Management Gnosis Technologies 07118200151 (Bid 071B8200198 $187,200.00 $374,400.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
(A) Mich Air Emissions Reporting
6/16/2009|System Enfotech & Consulting, Inc 07118200188 (Bid 071B8200295 $116,560.00 $1,155,340.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
6/16/2009|Re:Start DIT/MDOT Serena Expert NetXert 07119200066 |[Bid 071B9200185 $73,040.00 $99,600.00|Five Month- 24 day Option & Dollar Authorizatig5 Months, 24 Days
7/21/2009|IRP Processing Agreement - DOS R.L. Polk 231R1000102 |Bid 071B2001161 $196,000.00 $1,783,910.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|Restart MDOT Web Services Sackett 07116200403 |[Bid 071B7200201 $143,500.00 $430,540.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|(A) Wellhead Protection System Lazer Technologies 07118200144 |[Bid 071B7200215 $110,976.00 $377,216.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|Restart Treasury SF & Bond Finance |Business Solutions 21 07118200112 [Bid 071B8200159 $176,800.00 $353,600.00|Dollar Authorization N/A
7/21/2009|Re:Start DIT Telecommunications V2Soft 07118200139 [Bid 071B8200180 $137,340.00 $251,874.00(|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 year
7/21/2009|Re:Start DIT Telecommunications Ramsoft 07118200139 [Bid 071B8200181 $114,400.00 $214,390.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|Restart DIT Enterprise Architect Blueoak Database 07118200153 |[Bid 071B8200203 $269,215.00 $508,415.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|Re:Start DIT Filenet Resource DataCore 07118200158 |Bid 071B8200219 $239,200.00 $478,400.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|Restart Dept Agri Animal Industry Div |Computer Aid 07118200230 [Bid 071B8200230 $114,800.00 $359,900.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
7/21/2009|Restart MDOS BAM Phase Ill Proj Mgr|Lazer Technologies 07118200253 |[Bid 071B8200243 $220,800.00 $441,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
(A) Hosting/Infras Serv and CMS
7/21/2009|Solution IBM Corporation 07118200091 (Bid 071B9200124 $15,616,253.00 $32,614,217.00|Dollar Authorization N/A
7/21/2009|Restart Telecom Network Admin TekSystems 07118200139 [Bid 071B8200179 $137,340.00 $255,510.00(|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
8/4/2009|Re:Start DIT/Treasury MITAS Project |HTC Global 07117200135 [Bid 071B7200200 $349,440.00 $1,048,320.00{Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
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8/4/2009|(A) E Procurement System Contract |Compuware Corporation 07116200249 [Bid 071B7200346 $59,500.00 $2,066,962.00|Dollar Authorization N/A
Restart UIA Tax Project SR
8/4/2009|Prog/Analyst The Wellmam Group 07117200284 (Bid 071B8200013 $172,640.00 $517,920.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
8/4/2009|MMIS PCO Kunz Leigh & Associates 07116200037 (Bid 071B8200082 $3,117,600.00 $7,315,296.00|Dollar Authorization N/A
8/4/2009|Restart LAN & VOIP Sr Proj Mgr V2Soft 07118200184 [Bid 071B8200209 $143,520.00 $287,040.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
8/4/2009|Restart DLEG SR Business Analyst Dewpoint 07118200175 [Bid 071B8200224 $156,000.00 $312,000.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
8/4/2009|Restart Treasury Secondary Collection |Millenium Software 07118200207 [Bid 071B8200237 $156,000.00 $312,000.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
8/4/2009|Restart Treasury Secondary Collection [Lazer Technologies 07118200208 [Bid 071B8200238 $145,600.00 $291,200.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
8/4/2009|Restart Treasury Secondary Collection |Vanco Technologies 07118200206 |Bid 071B8200239 $176,800.00 $353,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
(A) MIOC - Criminal & Analytical
8/4/2009|Solution Dewpoint 07118200122 |Bid 071B8200270 $271,350.00 $2,637,944.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
Restart DLEG/UIA Mainframe
8/4/2009|Programmers Compuware Corporation 07118200331 (Bid 071B9200036 $603,200.00 $1,206,400.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 year
Oracle Software and Support -
8/18/2009Statewide Oracle USA No Bid 071B7200116 $6,100,000.00 $32,851,066.62|Dollar Authorization N/A Proprietary products
IT Support for LTC Application -
9/14/2009|DIT/DCH Electronic Data Systems 084R4002501 (Bid 071B5200041 $619,412.00 $9,065,792.00{Three month Option & Dollar Authorization 3 Months
9/14/2009|Mainframe Operations - MESA IBM Corporation Bid 071B6000116 $7,368,174.00 $129,990,777.35|Dollar Authorization N/A
MDIT/MMDOC Global Positioning
9/14/2009|System DIT/MDOT ProTech Monitoring 07116200106 (Bid 071B6200309 $6,200,000.00 $13,600,457.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
9/14/2009|MDOT Field Manager Compuware Corporation 07117200278 (Bid 071B7200325 $166,400.00 $499,200.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
(A) Electronic Medical Records for
9/14/2009|MDOC NextGen Healthcare 07118200043 |Bid 071B8200130 $251,896.00 $3,347,970.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
9/14/2009|Re:Start DIT Telecommunications Ramsoft 07118200139 [Bid 071B8200181 $141,700.00 $241,690.00(|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Restart DHS LASR Proj APPSW ENG
9/14/2009|SR Visantech Solutions 07118200227 (Bid 071B8200240 $194,480.00 $388,960.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
9/14/2009|Restart MDIT/MDOT TIMS FoxPro Peer Solutions 07118200220 |Bid 071B8200272 $145,600.00 $390,900.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
9/14/2009|(A) DEQ Waste Data System Windsor Solutions 07119200039 |Bid 071B9200161 $250,000.00 $1,418,400.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
9/14/2009|Item Bank System Dept. of Education |Systems Technology Group 07119200026 |Bid 07189200201 $394,360.00 $2,642,360.00(Six Month Option & Dollar Authorization 6 Months
9/30/2009|IT Research & Advisory Services - DIT |Gartner Group 07115200386 |[Bid 071B6200126 $148,200.00 $1,298,300.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
(A) MSP MCOLES Network
9/30/2009|Maintenance Northrop Grumman Information Tech{07116200380 |Bid 071B7200134 $300,000.00 $1,200,000.00(Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
9/30/2009|Restart DIT Strategic Consultant Questa Technology 07118200157 [Bid 071B8200216 $228,800.00 $457,600.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year
Restart MDE OEAA (2) SR Prog
9/30/2009|Analysts Saber Software 07118200248 |Bid 071B8200282 $353,600.00 $707,200.00(Dollar Authorization N/A
9/30/2009|(A) DHS CDC IVR Project RFI Centurion 07119200027 |[Bid 071B9200088 $55,810.00 $110,810.00|Option Year & Dollar Authorization 1 Year




