

FY16 DTMB Sec. 830 Boilerplate Report

Contract Num	Eff Date of CN	DESCRIPTION	Type	Option or Extension Period-Mths	CN Dollar Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Ad Board Date	Bid/ No Bid	Vendor_name	Links To Contracts
071B4300147	03-May-16	CHANGEPOINT CANADA	Dollar Increase		\$140,800.00	\$1,401,678.00			Changepoint Canada	View Contract
071B1300137	22-Feb-16	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Dollar Increase		\$2,500,000.00	\$9,848,816.00	22-Feb-16		INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	View Contract
071B1300143	29-Feb-16	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Dollar Increase		\$500,000.00	\$1,795,220.00	29-Feb-16		TEKSYSTEMS INC	View Contract
071B3200103	01-Mar-16	DELOITTE HUB	Increase	12	\$10,160,227.80	\$33,592,454.80	01-Mar-16		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B8200236	22-Dec-15	BUREAU OF STRATEGIC POLICY FOR MDIT	Dollar Increase		\$296,750.00	\$8,987,366.57			ANALYSTS INTERNATIONAL	View Contract
071B9200084	01-Dec-15	AGING INFORMATION SYSTEM	Dollar Increase	12	\$446,080.00	\$4,067,085.00			AGRO SERVICE CORP	View Contract
071B1300256	11-Feb-16	MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT OF DHS BRIDGES	Dollar Increase	12	\$16,963,321.00	\$121,204,012.00			DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B1300128	01-Oct-15	SOFTWARE MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT	Terms, Pricing or Extension and	12	\$369,780.73	\$2,030,214.31	16-Jun-15		Edifecs, Inc.	View Contract
071B8200079	19-Dec-15	STORAGE INFRASTRUCTURE SOLUTIONS	Dollar Increase	12	\$8,000,000.00	\$55,174,216.00			EDIFECIS INC CORPORATION	View Contract
071B1300034	01-Oct-15	TREASURY ESKORT MAINTENANCE & SUPPORT	Terms, Pricing or Change in Product,	12	\$758,050.00	\$5,124,874.00	04-Aug-15		GOVERNMENT	View Contract
071B1300025	01-Oct-15	VINE SOFTWARE MAINT.	Terms, Pricing or Option and Dollar	12	\$637,712.96	\$4,295,792.96	01-Sep-15		APPRISS INC	View Contract
071B1300094	01-Oct-15	UNCLAIMED PROPERTY SOFTWARE	Increase	12	\$119,935.00	\$680,524.00			ASSOCIATES INC	View Contract
071B0200024	01-Oct-15	DCH MEDICAID COST SETTLEMENT	Option and Dollar Increase	24	\$3,604,063.04	\$16,252,275.52	10-Sep-15		ENTERPRISE SERVICES, LLC	View Contract
071B4300019	01-Nov-15	SENIOR PROJECT MGMT SRVCS FOR MDE	Dollar Increase	12	\$548,440.00	\$1,299,348.00	10-Sep-15		Technologies	View Contract
071B1300064	01-Oct-15	RFP FOR DDS CASE TRK SYS 5YR CONTRACT	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$333,327.00	\$1,113,327.00	30-Sep-15		Microfact Global, Inc.	View Contract
071B3200096	01-Oct-15	CORRECTIONAL OFFENDER MANAGEMENT AND PROFILING FOR ALTERNATIVE SOLUTIONS	Increase	12	\$700,000.00	\$2,998,355.00	10-Sep-15		Northpointe, Inc.	View Contract
071B9200191	10-Apr-16	MIPRINT OFFICE DOCUMENT OUTPUT MANAGEMENT SERVICES	Dollar Increase	8	\$1,600,000.00	\$11,600,000.00			RICOH USA INC	View Contract
071B4300138	13-Oct-15	ERP IMPLEMENTATION SERVICES AGREEMENT	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$6,134,584.00	\$46,905,322.00	13-Oct-15		CGI Technologies and Solutions Inc	View Contract
071B4300137	13-Oct-15	ERP HOSTING, MANAGED SERVICES, SOFTWARE LICENSE AND MAINTENANCE AGREEMENT	Dollar Increase		\$2,865,416.00	\$59,622,078.00	13-Oct-15		CGI Technologies and Solutions Inc	View Contract
071B0200042	21-Oct-15	DIT/DHS CSES BRIDGES PCO	Increase	12	\$17,419,969.00	\$76,411,969.00	13-Oct-15		Services, LLC	View Contract
071B2200246	27-Oct-15	VENDOR MANAGED SERVICES	Option and Dollar Increase	6	\$15,000,000.00	\$98,012,290.80	27-Oct-15		AGRO SERVICE CORP	View Contract
071B3200059	27-Oct-15	PRE-QUALIFIED IT SERVICES CONTRACT PROGRAMMER	Dollar Increase		\$2,400,000.00	\$19,015,385.00	27-Oct-15		Advocate Solutions, LLC	View Contract
071B1300138	29-Oct-15	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Terms, Pricing or Change in Product,	48	\$52,996,608.00	\$124,475,662.00			GOVERNMENT	View Contract
071B8200018	06-Nov-15	MBT/MIITAS	Terms, Pricing or Change in Product,		\$443,062.00	\$77,448,071.99	18-Aug-15		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B3200041	17-Nov-15	LAWSON SOFTWARE MAINTENANCE & SUPPORT	Terms, Pricing or Option and Dollar	35	\$5,498,091.84	\$8,378,164.06	17-Nov-15		INFOR (US), INC	View Contract
071B3200064	17-Nov-15	MOBILE DEVICE MANAGEMENT (MDM) SOLUTION	Increase	12	\$450,000.00	\$1,673,040.00	17-Nov-15		IBM Corporation	View Contract
071B1300256	01-Oct-15	MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT OF DHS BRIDGES	Terms, Pricing or Option and Dollar		\$4,189,920.00	\$125,393,932.00	20-Oct-15		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B0200187	15-Dec-15	AAMVA	Increase	12	\$500,000.00	\$3,911,866.36	15-Dec-15		AMERICAN ASSOCIATION OF MOTOR	View Contract
071B6200311	15-Dec-15	WEB-BASED DATABASE SYSTEM TO TRACK DEFERRED PRESENTMENT TRANSACTIONS	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or Change in Product,	36	\$3,600,000.00	\$15,700,000.00	15-Dec-15		VERITEC SOLUTIONS, LLC	View Contract
071B4300014	23-Nov-15	HOSTED COMPUTERIZED MAINTENANCE MANAGEMENT SOLUTION	Terms, Pricing or		\$60,000.00	\$807,760.00			ENTERPRISES, LLC	View Contract
071B2200137	11-Dec-15	TELECOM BILLING SYSTEM MAIN & SUPPORT	Dollar Increase		\$263,200.00	\$3,016,435.00	18-Aug-15		FINANCIAL	View Contract
071B3200100	22-Dec-15	MAGI ELIGIBILITY DETERMINATION SERVICE	Dollar Increase		\$120,000.00	\$22,899,166.59	22-Dec-15		CGI Technologies and Solutions Inc	View Contract
071B3200115	07-Dec-15	SAP SOFTWARE LICENSES	Option and Dollar Increase	24	\$2,446,774.00	\$4,953,406.00			INTERNATIONAL SECURITY SERVICES, INC	View Contract
071B5500025	15-Dec-15	ENTERPRISE INTERNET SERVICE PROVIDER	Dollar Increase		\$314,770.00	\$1,485,887.50	15-Dec-15		INTERNET NETWORK INC	View Contract
071B4300058	15-Dec-15	AUTOMATED SECURITY MAINTENANCE	Dollar Increase		\$198,934.00	\$1,372,279.00	15-Dec-15		HONEYWELL INTERNATIONAL	View Contract
071B2200100	01-Jan-16	AOD HOME OWNERSHIP-DTMB / MSHDA	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$458,955.63	\$2,209,629.50			EMPHASTS COMPUTER	View Contract
071B3200096	26-Jan-16	CORRECTIONAL OFFENDER MANAGEMENT AND PROFILING FOR ALTERNATIVE SOLUTIONS	Dollar Increase		\$159,180.00	\$3,084,015.00	26-Jan-16		Northpointe, Inc.	View Contract

FY16 DTMB Sec. 830 Boilerplate Report

Contract Num	Eff Date of CN	DESCRIPTION	Type	Option or Extension Period-Mths	CN Dollar Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Ad Board Date	Bid/ No Bid	Vendor_name	Links To Contracts
071B1300033	26-Jan-16	HRMN STAFF AUGMENTATION	Dollar Increase		\$288,000.00	\$6,589,780.00	26-Jan-16		CONSULTING	View Contract
071B2200052	26-Jan-16	NARCOTIC DISPENSING SYSTEM	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or		\$452,652.00	\$649,428.00	18-Aug-15		SOLUTIONS, LLC	View Contract
071B3200070	26-Jan-16	IMAGERY 2013 CSSTP	Dollar Increase		\$403,679.45	\$4,715,320.59	26-Feb-16		MAP COMPANY, SECURITY	View Contract
071B2200258	26-Jan-16	RFP SECURITY AWARENESS	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$114,400.00	\$509,980.00	26-Jan-16		MENTOR, INC	View Contract
071B3200103	31-Jan-16	DELOITTE HUB	Dollar Increase		\$91,855.00	\$23,432,227.00	31-Jan-16		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B2200137	10-Feb-16	TELECOM BILLING SYSTEM MAIN & SUPPORT	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$758,093.00	\$3,774,528.00	10-Feb-16		FINANCIAL	View Contract
071B4300078	10-Feb-16	ENTERPRISE RISK ASSESSMENT	Dollar Increase		\$1,286,160.00	\$4,357,910.00	09-Feb-16		ACCENTURE	View Contract
071B6600011	11-Dec-15	TRANSPARENCY WEBSITE FOR STATE BUDGET OFFICE (SBO)	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or		\$60,000.00	\$110,000.00			Socrata, Inc.	View Contract
071B2200068	08-Feb-16	431 391 ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT MGT	Dollar Increase		\$600,000.00	\$3,784,541.00	08-Feb-16		SERVICES INC	View Contract
071B1300140	22-Feb-16	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Dollar Increase		\$1,300,000.00	\$6,046,648.00			MIPRO Consulting	View Contract
071B2200246	19-Feb-16	VENDOR MANAGED SERVICES	Dollar Increase		\$12,000,000.00	\$110,012,290.80	31-May-16		CORP	View Contract
071B1300256	29-Feb-16	MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT OF DHS BRIDGES	Dollar Increase		\$11,558,400.00	\$136,952,332.00	20-Oct-15		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B9200243	02-Mar-16	MICHIGAN CRIMINAL INTELLIGENCE SYSTEM	Extension and Dollar Increase	6.5	\$246,666.46	\$4,285,349.46			Memex, Inc.	View Contract
071B2200300	28-Mar-16	DIGITAL COMM MGT	Dollar Increase		\$65,157.90	\$1,584,857.90			FedResults, Inc.	View Contract
071B1300138	28-Mar-16	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Dollar Increase		\$9,717,204.00	\$134,192,866.00			GOVERNMENT	View Contract
071B3200052	01-Mar-16	ELECTRONIC MEDICAL BUSINESS RECORD SYSTEM	Dollar Increase		\$542,588.48	\$19,611,231.48	01-Mar-16		TECHNOLOGIES,	View Contract
071B4300066	05-Apr-16	STATEWIDE VIDEO MGT SYSTEM	Dollar Increase		\$1,652,281.00	\$4,001,317.00			MOTOROLA INC	View Contract
071B9200230	19-Apr-16	MDIT/MDLEG MRS E-LEARN SYSTEM	Extension and Dollar Increase	60	\$871,497.00	\$1,893,159.00	19-Apr-16		MICHIGAN STATE UNIVERSITY	View Contract
071B5500113	25-Apr-16	CASE MGMT SYSTEM FOR MI LIQUOR CONTROL	Dollar Increase		\$377,010.00	\$4,455,508.00			DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B9200171	29-Apr-16	MICHIGAN STATE HOUSING DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY ELITE SYSTEM	Option and Dollar Increase	24	\$1,248,200.07	\$5,499,233.66			COMPUTER	View Contract
071B2200068	08-Feb-16	431 391 ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT MGT	Dollar Increase		\$1,000,000.00	\$4,784,541.00			MICHIGAN STATE UNIVERSITY	View Contract
071B5500113	25-Apr-16	CASE MGMT SYSTEM FOR MI LIQUOR CONTROL	Dollar Increase		\$279,290.00	\$4,710,788.00			SERVICES INC	View Contract
071B2200241	07-Jun-16	UIA INFOPRINT MAINFRAME PRINTER MAINT.	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or	12	\$165,339.42	\$830,224.55	17-May-16		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B3200101	17-May-16	DTMB DISASTER RECOVERY SERVICES	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$214,015.80	\$856,063.20	17-May-16		RICOH USA INC	View Contract
071B4300022	12-May-16	ENTERPRISE SUPPORT SERVICES MIRS RPS ARS	Dollar Increase		\$54,500.00	\$5,033,933.37			Services, LLC	View Contract
071B3200100	17-May-16	MAGI ELIGIBILITY DETERMINATION SERVICE	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$6,473,532.00	\$29,372,698.59	17-May-16		ASSOCIATES INC	View Contract
071B3200088	20-May-16	MAINT MODERNIZATION CONSULTANT	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or		\$2,839,920.00	\$9,696,640.00			and Solutions Inc	View Contract
071B2200052	07-Jun-16	NARCOTIC DISPENSING SYSTEM	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or		\$116,840.00	\$766,268.00	07-Jun-16		INTERNATIONAL CONSULTING	View Contract
071B0200182	07-Jun-16	AASHTO TRANSPORTATION SYSTEM	Extension and Dollar Increase	60	\$10,000,000.00	\$17,764,675.00	07-Jun-16		SOLUTIONS, LLC	View Contract
071B2200168	10-Jun-16	CONTACT CENTER SUPPORT	Option and Dollar Increase	24	\$7,048,355.11	\$27,779,730.51	07-Jun-16		AMERICAN ASSOC OF STATE	View Contract
071B1300185	07-Jun-16	CEPAS TREASURY	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or	24	\$1,600,000.00	\$4,628,348.00	07-Jun-16		ACCENTURE	View Contract
071B8200018	21-Jun-16	MBT/MIITAS	Dollar Increase		\$5,060,267.00	\$82,508,338.99			FIRST Data Government	View Contract
071B5500110	21-Jun-16	EIM IMPLEMENTATION SRVCS FOR DTMB CSS ST	Option and Dollar Increase		\$1,000,000.00	\$3,000,000.00	21-Jun-16		DELOITTE CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B9200040	24-Jun-16	MDOT STATEWIDE ADVANCED TRAFFIC MANAGEMENT SYSTEM	Dollar Increase	12	\$96,800.00	\$4,076,721.37			PRICEWATERHOUSE COOPERS, LLP	View Contract
071B4300022	07-Jul-16	ENTERPRISE SUPPORT SERVICES MIRS RPS ARS	Dollar Increase		\$65,800.00	\$5,102,193.37			DELLAV CORPORATION	View Contract
071B3200059	11-Jul-16	PRE-QUALIFIED IT SERVICES CONTRACT PROGRAMMER	Dollar Increase		\$1,500,000.00	\$23,515,385.00			ASSOCIATES INC	View Contract
071B5500023	12-Jul-16	ECRASH AND ECITATION FOR MSP	Option and Dollar Increase	24	\$852,657.00	\$1,326,639.76	12-Jul-16		Advocate	View Contract
071B4300022	12-Jul-16	ENTERPRISE SUPPORT SERVICES MIRS RPS ARS	Dollar Increase		\$103,800.00	\$5,205,993.37			Solutions, LLC	View Contract

FY16 DTMB Sec. 830 Boilerplate Report

Contract Num	Eff Date of CN	DESCRIPTION	Type	Option or Extension Period-Mths	CN Dollar Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Ad Board Date	Bid/ No Bid	Vendor_name	Links To Contracts
071B2200070	22-Jul-16	431 391 ELECTRONIC DOCUMENT MGT	Dollar Increase		\$700,000.00	\$4,478,697.00			SOLUTIONS INC	View Contract
071B3200034	21-Jul-16	NICE MAINT. AND SOFTWARE	Dollar Increase		\$87,766.55	\$794,642.64			NICE SYSTEMS, INC	View Contract
071B2200290	22-Jun-16	BENTLY ENTERPRISE LICENSING & SELECT AGREEMENT SOFTWARE, SOFTWARE UPDATE, TECHNICAL SUPPORT & LIMITED SUPPORT SERVICES	Dollar Increase		\$93,400.00	\$4,437,315.00			BENTLEY SYSTEMS INCORPORATED	View Contract
071B5500025	27-Jul-16	ENTERPRISE INTERNET SERVICE PROVIDER	Dollar Increase		\$80,000.00	\$1,575,887.50			WENT NETWORK INC	View Contract
071B4300022	29-Jul-16	ENTERPRISE SUPPORT SERVICES MIRS RPS ARS	Dollar Increase		\$78,040.00	\$5,284,033.37			KONZ LEIGH & ASSOCIATES INC	View Contract
071B1300247	07-Jun-16	SACWIS PROJECT	Dollar Increase		\$127,206.51	\$87,614,052.51	07-Jun-16		CORPORATION	View Contract
071B0200097	01-Aug-16	MSP MAINT. CONTRACT	Dollar Increase	36	\$1,893,901.67	\$4,487,971.32	26-Jul-16		DATAWORKS PLUS, LLC	View Contract
071B4300014	01-Aug-16	HOSTED COMPUTERIZED MAINTENANCE MANAGEMENT SOLUTION	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$247,111.60	\$1,054,871.60	30-Oct-17		ENTERPRISES, LLC	View Contract
071B2200297	10-Aug-16	CENTRAL RESERVATION SYSTEM FOR DNR	Dollar Increase		\$610,000.00	\$11,213,497.08			CAMIS USA INC.	View Contract
071B1300034	16-Aug-16	TREASURY ESKORT MAINTENANCE & SUPPORT	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$1,093,092.00	\$6,217,966.00			GOVERNMENT	View Contract
071B1300157	16-Aug-16	MDNR RETAIL SALES SYSTEM	Dollar Increase		\$153,486.00	\$37,397,901.00	16-Aug-16		Services, LLC	View Contract
071B1300256	26-Jul-16	MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT OF DHS BRIDGES	Dollar Increase		\$2,916,000.00	\$139,868,332.00			DETROIT CONSULTING LLP	View Contract
071B4300145	16-Aug-16	MDOC ELEC. MONITORING PROGRAM	Dollar Increase		\$2,900,145.00	\$10,905,605.00			MONITORING, INC	View Contract
071B3200093	30-Aug-16	MIWATERS RFP	Dollar Increase		\$703,092.00	\$5,587,427.00	30-Aug-16		SOLUTIONS INC	View Contract
071B1300107	13-Sep-16	MULTIAGENCY SYBASE MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$595,233.00	\$5,258,827.82			SYBASE INC	View Contract
071B4300022	30-Aug-16	ENTERPRISE SUPPORT SERVICES MIRS RPS ARS	Dollar Increase		\$403,000.00	\$5,687,033.37			ASSOCIATES INC	View Contract
071B9200170	10-Sep-16	MOTOR POOL MANAGEMENT SYSTEM	Dollar Increase	12	\$97,186.35	\$807,866.53	30-Aug-16		Control, Inc.	View Contract
071B4300138	13-Sep-16	ERP IMPLEMENTATION SERVICES AGREEMENT	Dollar Increase		\$526,750.00	\$47,432,072.00			and Solutions Inc	View Contract
071B2200225	21-Jun-16	RFP MANDATED NEW HIRE REPORTING SERVICES	Dollar Increase		\$224,600.00	\$1,815,000.00	21-Jun-16		INC	View Contract
071B2200300	13-Sep-16	DIGITAL COMM MGT	Dollar Increase	12	\$381,675.12	\$1,966,533.02	13-Sep-16		FedResults, Inc.	View Contract
071B1300386	06-Sep-16	Q2 INVESTMENT ACCOUNTING & PORTFOLIO MGT	Dollar Increase		\$111,500.00	\$2,324,626.94	18-Aug-16		INFORMATION	View Contract
071B3200057	12-Sep-16	PRE-QUALIFIED IT SERVICES CONTRACT	Dollar Increase		\$3,000,000.00	\$52,561,316.00			DEWPOINT, INC.	View Contract
071B1300140	13-Sep-16	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Dollar Increase		\$1,000,000.00	\$7,046,648.00			MIPRO Consulting	View Contract
071B0200349	14-Sep-16	MDE CNAP TECHNICAL SUPPORT	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or	12	\$343,192.32	\$2,222,040.32	13-Sep-16		Mindteck, Inc.	View Contract
071B9200308	30-Aug-16	MDIT INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY TRAINING SERVICES STATEWIDE	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or	12	\$495,000.00	\$3,496,800.00	30-Aug-16		PROFESSIONAL TECHNICAL	View Contract
071B1300098	14-Sep-16	INFORMATION TECH RESEARCH & ADVISORY SERVICES	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or		\$500,000.00	\$2,755,490.00			GARTNER GROUP INC	View Contract
071B1300069	30-Sep-16	COMPUWARE VANTAGE PRODUCT AND SERVICE	Change in Product, Terms, Pricing or	36	\$4,505,093.37	\$13,916,093.37	30-Aug-16		COMPUWARE CORPORATION	View Contract
071B1300025	21-Jun-16	VINE SOFTWARE MAINT.	Increase	12	\$907,712.96	\$5,203,505.92	21-Jun-16		APPRISS INC	View Contract
071B1300157	13-Sep-16	MDNR RETAIL SALES SYSTEM	Dollar Increase		\$133,194.00	\$37,531,095.00			Services, LLC	View Contract
071B8200298	08-Sep-16	E-RECRUITING	Dollar Increase		\$83,000.00	\$2,708,300.00			entjobs.com, Inc.	View Contract
071B6600012	19-Aug-16	VULNERABILITY ASSESSMENT SERVICES	Dollar Increase		\$62,377.62	\$2,562,377.62			Cyber Defense Technologies, LCC	View Contract
071B1300071	31-Aug-16	SOFTWARE MAINT.	Dollar Increase	24	\$35,000,000.00	\$90,007,365.03			CORPORATION	View Contract
071B1300072	27-Sep-16	INTELLIGRANTS MAINTENANCE	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$84,443.00	\$10,710,875.50	29-Sep-16		ASATE SOFTWARE INC	View Contract
071B1300137	20-Sep-16	DTMB DATA WAREHOUSE BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE (BI)	Dollar Increase		\$2,900,000.00	\$12,748,816.00			INFORMATION BUILDERS INC	View Contract
071B1300080	13-Sep-16	UNIVERSAL ADDRESSING SOFTWARE	Dollar Increase		\$731,020.00	\$2,378,768.00	29-Sep-16		SOFTWARE	View Contract
071B2200290	29-Sep-16	BENTLY ENTERPRISE LICENSING & SELECT AGREEMENT SOFTWARE, SOFTWARE UPDATE, TECHNICAL SUPPORT & LIMITED SUPPORT SERVICES	Option and Dollar Increase	12	\$969,238.10	\$5,418,553.10			BENTLEY SYSTEMS INCORPORATED	View Contract
071B5500023	29-Sep-16	ECRASH AND ECITATION FOR MSP	Dollar Increase		\$4,416,000.00	\$5,742,639.76			EQUIFAX SERVICES INC	View Contract
071B2200240	29-Sep-16	DIT/CGI MGF ORACLE MIGRATION PROJECT	Dollar Increase	12	\$100,000.00	\$1,954,310.58	29-Sep-16		INTERGRAPH CORPORATION	View Contract

FY16 DTMB Sec. 830 Boilerplate Report

Contract Num	Eff Date of CN	DESCRIPTION	Type	Option or Extension Period-Mths	CN Dollar Amount	New Total or Contract Amount	Ad Board Date	Bid/ No Bid	Vendor_name	Links To Contracts
071B1300108	30-Jun-16	DCH WEBEBC SUPPORT AND ENHANCEMENT	Increase	12	\$149,975.00	\$1,253,335.00			GENESIS SYSTEMS INC	View Contract
071B4300147	29-Sep-16	CHANGEPOINT CANADA	Increase		\$5,172,069.60	\$6,573,747.60	29-Sep-16		Changepoint Canada	View Contract
071B1300128	29-Sep-16	SOFTWARE MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT	Increase	12	\$369,780.73	\$2,399,995.04	29-Sep-16		Edifecs, Inc.	View Contract
071B3200030	16-Aug-16	CTE HOSTING, MAINTENANCE AND SUPPORT	Increase	12	\$57,528.00	\$236,512.00			OCCUPATIONAL RESEARCH AND	View Contract
071B9200243	30-Aug-16	MICHIGAN CRIMINAL INTELLIGENCE SYSTEM	Dollar Increase		\$54,600.00	\$4,713,956.45			Memex, Inc.	View Contract
071B6600020	08-Feb-16	VENDOR MANAGED SERVICES (VMS) FOR INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY STAFF AUGMENTATION; STATEWIDE	New Contract		\$0.00	\$164,840,000.00		Bid	COMPUTER AID, INCORPORATED	View MiDeal Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600014	27-Oct-15	TWO WAY RADIO WIRELESS	New Contract		\$0.00	\$2,000,000.00		Bid	REMI COMMUNICATION	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600012	17-Nov-15	VULNERABILITY ASSESSMENT SERVICES	New Contract		\$0.00	\$2,500,000.00		Bid	Cyber Defense Technologies, LCC	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600022	26-Jan-16	LIVE SCAN	New Contract		\$0.00	\$1,982,994.00		Bid	ID Networks, Inc.	Contract View MiDeal
071B6600034	11-Jan-16	AERIAL IMAGING SERVICES TO INCLUDE: ORTHO-IMAGERY AND OPTIONAL OBLIGUE SERVICES - DTMB CSS	New Contract		\$0.00	\$1,899,375.00		Bid	Axis GeoSpatial LLC	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600036	10-Feb-16	AERIAL IMAGING SERVICES	New Contract		\$0.00	\$4,689,190.00		Bid	Company, Inc.	Contract view vmiDeal
071B9200192	07-Apr-16	MMCC	New Contract		\$0.00	\$440,000,000.00		Bid	HP Enterprise Services, LLC	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600068	05-Apr-16	TRAFFIC DATA MANAGEMENT SYSTEM	New Contract		\$0.00	\$1,080,642.00		Bid	Midwestern Software Solutions,	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600075	15-Apr-16	PREVAILING WAGE AND LABOR COMPLIANCE SAAS SOLUTION	New Contract		\$0.00	\$154,440.00		Bid	LCPtracker, Inc.	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600085	07-Jun-16	PAGER ACQUISITION AND SERVICE	New Contract		\$0.00	\$249,995.00		Bid	Unication USA Inc.	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600112	15-Jul-16	MMCC	New Contract		\$0.00	\$40,000,000.00		Bid	Insight Public Sector, Inc.	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600113	15-Jul-16	MMCC	New Contract		\$0.00	\$40,000,000.00		Bid	3m international Corp.	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600110	01-Aug-16	MMCC	New Contract		\$0.00	\$80,000,000.00		Bid	CDW Government Inc.	Contract view vmiDeal
071B6600111	15-Jul-16	MICHIGAN MASTER COMPUTING PROGRAM	New Contract		\$0.00	\$80,000,000.00		Bid	Dell Marketing L.P.	Contract
071B6600129	30-Aug-16	LAND OWNERSHIP TRACKING SYSTEM - DNR	New Contract		\$0.00	\$5,799,793.00		Bid	Kurtz, Leight & Associates, Inc.	View Contract