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REPORT AUTHORITY 
 

This report is required by Article XIII, section 515, of 2017 PA 107, the Omnibus 
Appropriations Act for Fiscal Year 2018, which reads:   
 
Sec. 515. (1) The department shall assess and collect fees in the licensing and 
regulation of child care organizations, as described in 1973 PA 116, MCL 722.111 to 
722.128, and adult foster care facilities, as described in the adult foster care facility 
licensing act, 1979 PA 218, MCL 400.701 to 400.737. 

 
(2) The department shall report the total amount of fees assessed and collected under 
subsection (1) during the preceding fiscal year to the fiscal agencies no later than 
December 1 and shall provide information requested by the fiscal agencies as they 
consider necessary to shift authorization equivalent to that amount from the general 
fund/general purpose to a state restricted fund within the department’s budget for fiscal 
year 2018-2019. 
 

DEPARTMENT OVERVIEW 
 

LARA is composed of agencies and commissions that promote business growth and job 
creation through streamlined, simple, fair, and efficient regulation, while at the same 
time protect the health and safety of Michigan's citizens. 
 

The Bureau of Community and Health Systems (BCHS) serves to protect and ensure 
safe, effective, efficient and accessible community and health care services delivered by 
state licensed and federally certified providers in Michigan.  It is responsible for state 
licensing of facilities, agencies and programs under all of the following public acts: 
 

• Public Health Code, Act 368 of 1978. 

• Mental Health Code, Act 258 of 1974.  

• Adult Foster Care Facility Licensing Act, Act 218 of 1979. 

• Child Care Organizations Act, Act 116 of 1973. 
 
The bureau is also the state agency responsible for conducting certification activities on 
behalf of the Centers for Medicare and Medicaid Services (CMS).  In general, the 
majority of state licensing activities involve the issuance and renewal of licenses to 
qualified facilities, agencies, and programs; conducting initial, routine and revisit 
inspections to determine compliance with state and federal requirements; and 
investigating complaints against state licensed and federally certified providers. 
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REPORTING REQUIREMENTS 
 

During fiscal year 2018, total fees assessed and collected for the licensing and 
regulation of child care organizations and adult foster care facilities were $688,082.38. 
 
 

License Type Fees Collected 

Child Care Centers $266,750.00  

Family and Group Child Care Homes $218,821.20  

Children’s Camps $ 55,975.00 

Child Care Organizations      $541,546.20     

 

Adult Foster Care Facilities $144,536.18  

 

Total $686,082.38 

 
 


