STATE OF MICHIGAN 47
PROCUREMENT' >

Michigan.gov/MiProcurement

Recommendation of Award

Notice of Intent to Award Number: 250000000167

The Department of Technology, Management, & Budget's Procurement office has completed the
evaluation of RFP # 240000002925, Agricultural, Grounds, Turf, Earth Moving, and Roadside, Maintenance
Equipment, and has recommended a multiple award to Clark Equipment, John Deer Retail Sales, Morrison
Industrial, Sunbelt Rentals, and United Rentals pending State Administrative Board approval, if applicable.
More information on the State Administrative Board can be found at: State Administrative Board.

Bidders who were not recommended for the award are encouraged to schedule a debriefing session with
the Solicitation Manager. The debriefing session will provide the bidder with the State’s rationale on why
the bidder was not recommended for the award. The Solicitation Manager may be contacted as follows:

Yvon Dufour, Solicitation Manager
dufoury@michigan.gov
(517) 249-0455

Background Information:

This Request for Proposal (RFP) was to solicit responses for selection of a Contractor(s) to provide
Agricultural, Grounds, Turf, Earth Moving, and Roadside, Maintenance Equipment. The term of this
contract is five (4) years, with up to five (5), one (1) year renewal options.

Bidders:
The RFP was posted on www.michigan.qgov/SIGMAVSS on 8/23/2024 for forty-one (41) days. The
following bidders submitted proposals by the published due date of 10/3/2024.

Bidder Address, City, State, Zip Code SDVOB* GDBE**
Clark Equipment 250 E. Beaton Drive, West Fargo, ND 58078 No No
John Deer Retail Sales | 1300 River Drive, Moline, IL 61265 No No
Morrison Industrial 1825 Monroe Ave. NW, Grand Rapids, Ml 49505 No No
Sunbelt Rentals 1799 Innovation Point, Fort Mill, SC 29715 No No
United Rentals 100 First Stamford Pl #700, Stamford, CT 06902 No No

*SDVOB: Service-Disabled Veteran Owned Business
*GDBE: Geographically Disadvantaged Business Enterprise

07/26/16


http://www.michigan.gov/micontractconnect/0,4541,7-225-48756---,00.html
http://www.michigan.gov/SIGMAVSS

Evaluation Synopsis

|. Evaluation

A Responsible Vendor is a vendor that demonstrates it has the ability to successfully perform the duties
identified by the solicitation. A Responsive proposal is one that is submitted in accordance with the
solicitation instructions and meets all mandatory requirements identified in the solicitation.

7. MANDATORY MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS. To avoid disqualification, the bidder must provide
documentation to support the following:
e Manufacturer Authorized Distributor

e All “catalog” pricing must be published and available at all times via website access, and/or
electronic/printed price pages.

Only proposals meeting the mandatory minimum requirements will be considered for evaluation.
8. EVALUATION PROCESS. The State will evaluate each proposal based on the following factors:

Technical Evaluation Criteria Weight

1 Warranties/Service Levels/Delivery/Training - Schedule A — Statement | 20
" | of Work, A. EQUIPMENT FOR PURCHASE, Sections 2.1 — 2.5 (Equipment
for Rental and Parts, Maintenance & Repair service shall be evaluated
separately)

AND/OR

Rental Capabilities - Schedule A — Statement of Work, B. EQUIPMENT
FOR RENTAL, Sections 3.1 — 3.4. (Equipment for Purchase and Parts,
Maintenance & Repair service shall be evaluated separately)

AND/OR

Parts, and Maintenance and repair service capabilities - Schedule A —
Statement of Work, C. PARTS and MAINTENANCE & REPAIR, Sections
4.1 — 4.3. (Equipment for Purchase and Rental shall be evaluated
separately)

2. | General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL | 15
REQUIREMENTS, all sections.

3. | Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, 15
sections 1 -4 and 6 — 13.

4. | Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing 50
service to the entire State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5.
(The Contractor(s) with the most resources in all areas shall attain the
highest score).

Total 100

Proposals receiving a score of 80 or more technical evaluation points will have pricing evaluated and
considered for award.

The State may utilize all bidder information, without regard to a proposal’s technical score, to determine
fair market value for goods or services sought. The State is not obligated to accept the lowest price
proposal. If applicable, the State’s evaluation will include consideration of a bidder’s qualified disabled
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veterans/service-disabled veteran owned business(QDV/SDVOB) status under MCL 18.1261(8).
Additional information on the SDVOB preference is available at: Michigan.gov/SDVOB.

The State strongly encourages strict adherence to the Contract Terms. The State reserves the right to
deem a bid non-responsive for failure to accept the Contract Terms. Nevertheless, the bidder may
submit proposed changes to the Contract Terms in track changes (i.e., visible edits) with an explanation
of the bidder’s need for each proposed change. Failure to include track changes with an explanation of
the bidder’s need for the proposed change constitutes the bidder’s acceptance of the Contract Terms.
General statements, such as that the bidder reserves the right to negotiate the terms and conditions,
may be considered non-responsive. Failure to respond timely to requests for proposed changes to
Contract Terms during ongoing negotiations may be cause for disqualification.

The State may but is not required to conduct an on-site visit to tour and inspect the bidder’s facilities;
require an oral presentation of the bidder's proposal; conduct interviews, research, reference checks,
and background checks; and request additional price concessions at any point during the evaluation
process.

II. Evaluation Method

Responses to this solicitation were reviewed by Solicitation Manager in collaboration with Subject Matter
Expert, which consisted of the following individuals:

Voting Advisory

Yvon Dufour, Category Specialist, DTMB Central
Procurement,

Erin Reincke, Fleet Procurement Specialist, MDOT —
Transportation Systems Management and Operations

[1l. Evaluation Results

Step 1 - Mandatory Minimums

Bidder Meets Deficiency
Clark Equipment (Clark) YES NA
John Deer Retail Sales (JDRS) YES NA
Morrison Industrial (Morrison) YES NA
Sunbelt Rentals (Sunbelt) YES NA
United Rentals (United) YES NA
Step 2 — Technical Evaluation

A. Clark

The Evaluation Team determined that Clark, based on a score of 98/100, did meet the requirements
of this RFP for “PURCHASE”. This determination was accomplished by evaluating their responses
to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Warranties/Service Levels/Delivery/Training - Schedule A — Statement of Work, A.
EQUIPMENT FOR PURCHASE, Sections 2.1 — 2.5. SCORE_20/20

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.


http://www.legislature.mi.gov/(S(12rtpbjmznw1mn4opquus2gz))/mileg.aspx?page=getObject&objectName=mcl-18-1261
https://www.michigan.gov/SDVOB

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL REQUIREMENTS,
all sections. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6 —
13. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the entire
State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE_48/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
Total Score: 98/100

The Evaluation Team determined that Clark, based on a score of 98/100, did meet the requirements
of this RFP for “PARTS, AND MAINTENANCE & REPAIR”. This determination was accomplished
by evaluating their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Parts, and Maintenance and repair service capabilities - Schedule A — Statement of Work,
C. PARTS and MAINTENANCE & REPAIR, Sections 4.1 — 4.3. SCORE_20/20
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL REQUIREMENTS,
all sections. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6 —
13. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the entire
State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE_48/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
Total Score: 98/100

B. JDRS

The Evaluation Team determined that JDRS, based on a score of 98/100, did meet the
requirements of this RFP for “PURCHASE”. This determination was accomplished by evaluating
their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Warranties/Service Levels/Delivery/Training - Schedule A — Statement of Work, A.
EQUIPMENT FOR PURCHASE, Sections 2.1 — 2.5. SCORE_20/20

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS, all sections. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6
—13. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.




4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the
entire State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE _48/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
Total Score: 98/100

C. Morrison
The Evaluation Team determined that Morrison, based on a score of 95/100, did meet the

requirements of this RFP for “PURCHASE”. This determination was accomplished by evaluating

their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Warranties/Service Levels/Delivery/Training - Schedule A — Statement of Work, A.

EQUIPMENT FOR PURCHASE, Sections 2.1 — 2.5. SCORE_20/20
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS, all sections._ SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6 —
13. SCORE 15/15
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the entire
State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE _45/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

Total Score: 95/100

The Evaluation Team determined that Morrison, based on a score of 95/100, did meet the
requirements of this RFP for “RENTAL”. This determination was accomplished by evaluating their

responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Rental Capabilities - Schedule A — Statement of Work, B. EQUIPMENT FOR RENTAL,

Sections 3.1 — 3.4. SCORE_20/20
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS, all sections._ SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6
—13. SCORE 15/15
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the
entire State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE _45/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

Total Score: 95/100



The Evaluation Team determined that Morrison, based on a score of 95/100, did meet the
requirements of this RFP for “PARTS, AND MAINTENANCE & REPAIR”. This determination was
accomplished by evaluating their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Parts, and Maintenance and repair service capabilities - Schedule A — Statement of
Work, C. PARTS and MAINTENANCE & REPAIR, Sections 4.1 — 4.3. SCORE_20/20
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS, all sections. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6
—13. SCORE 15/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the
entire State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE _45/50
The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
Total Score: 95/100

D. Sunbelt

The Evaluation Team determined that Sunbelt, based on a score of 89/100, did not meet the
requirements of this RFP for “PURCHASE”. This determination was accomplished by evaluating
their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Warranties/Service Levels/Delivery/Training - Schedule A — Statement of Work, A.
EQUIPMENT FOR PURCHASE, Sections 2.1 — 2.5. SCORE_20/20

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS, all sections._ SCORE 13/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were mostly satisfactory, but
the following deficiencies were noted:

a) Bidder did not provide a response to questions in section 5.3 and 9.2.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6 —
13. SCORE 8/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were mostly satisfactory, but
the following deficiencies were noted:

a) Bidder has several exceptions to Terms.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the entire
State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE_48/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
Total Score: 89/100



E. United
The Evaluation Team determined that United, based on a score of 85/100, did meet the
requirements of this RFP for “PURCHASE”. This determination was accomplished by evaluating
their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.
1. Warranties/Service Levels/Delivery/Training - Schedule A — Statement of Work, A.
EQUIPMENT FOR PURCHASE, Sections 2.1 — 2.5. SCORE_20/20

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.

2. General Requirements - Schedule A — Statement of Work, D. GENERAL
REQUIREMENTS, all sections._ SCORE 7/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were mostly satisfactory, but
the following deficiencies were noted:

a) Bidder did not provide an Org Chart for section 7.4.

b) Bidder did not provide a phone number or days of the week for sections 7.5 and 7.6.
c) Bidder does not describe how they comply with section 9.2.

d) Bidder does not comply with Liquidated Damages in section 13.

3. Company information/Experience — Vendor Questions Worksheet, sections 1 - 4 and 6
—13. SCORE 10/15

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were mostly satisfactory, but
the following deficiencies were noted:

a) Bidder listed sections 6, 7, & 8 as “Proprietary”. However, they did not disclose
proprietary information by signing the first page the Confidential Treatment Form.

4. Evidence of a Superior level of “Resources/Capacity” providing service to the
entire State — Vendor Questions Worksheet, section 5. SCORE _48/50

The Evaluation Team determined that overall, the responses were satisfactory.
Total Score: 85/100

IV. Technical Evaluation Summary

Evaluation Including Schedule A, Section A. Equipment for Purchase

1. Warranties 4. Evidence of a
- Service > General .3. Comp‘any Superior level of
BIDDER Levels - T information - | “Resources - Capacity”
: Requirements ) o .
Delivery - Experience | providing service to the
Training entire State TOTAL
WEIGHT 20 15 15 50 100
Clark 20 15 15 48 98
JDRS 20 15 15 48 98
Morrison 20 15 15 45 95
Sunbelt 20 13 8 48 89
United 20 7 10 48 85




Evaluation Including Schedule A, Section B. Equipment for Rental

4. Evidence of a
3. Compan Superior level of
BIDDER L. Re_”.“?" 2. G_eneral informa?iony- “Resoﬁrces - Capacity”
Capabilities | Requirements ExDeri i 6 10 the
perience | providing service
entire State TOTALS
WEIGHT 20 15 15 50 100
Clark NB NB NB NB NB
JDRS NB NB NB NB NB
Morrison 20 15 15 45 95
Sunbelt 20 13 8 48 89
United 20 7 10 48 85
Evaluation Including Schedule A, Section C. Parts, Maintenance & Repair
1. Parts, and 4. Evidence of a
Maintenan_ce 5> General _3. Comp_any Superior level of_
BIDDER and repair : information - | “Resources - Capacity”
service Requirements Experience | providing service to the
capabilities entire State TOTALS
WEIGHT 20 15 15 50 100
Clark 20 15 15 48 98
JDRS NB NB NB NB NB
Morrison 20 15 15 45 95
Sunbelt NB NB NB NB NB
United NB NB NB NB NB

VI. Pricing Summary

Pricing was evaluated for the bidders who passed technical. The following is a summary of their price

proposals:
UNIT PRICING
PURCHASE
*CALCULATED BID 2ND ROUND

BIDDER Spec # ITEM AMOUNT PRICING AWARD
Clark Spec #4 Bobcat T86 $95,639.00 $95,639.00
Clark Spec #4 Bobcat T770 $77,202.00 $77,202.00 YES
JDRS Spec #4 333 P-Tier Compact Track Loader $87,537.08 $87,537.08
JDRS Spec #5 320G $47,878.08 $47,878.08 YES
Clark Spec #7 Doosan G30E-7 6000lbs $30,780.00 $30,780.00 YES
Morrison Spec #7 Bobcat G30N-7 $37,736.38 $34,447.00
Clark Spec #15 UV34 Gas Utility Vehicle $17,679.00 $17,679.00 YES
Clark Spec #20 Doosan D35S-9 ODB  8000lbs $53,174.00 $53,174.00 YES
Morrison Spec #20 Bobcat D35S-9 $62,995.38 $56,367.00 YES

*All items above for PURCHASE shall be evaluated based on a single purchase at each prosperity region (13 single purchases). If delivery pricing is

per mile, the delivery cost shall be calculated from the nearest dealer location to the estimated central location of each region. Mileage is calculated one

way. a) (Purchase price x 13) + (Delivery cost at all 13 prosperity regions) or b) (Purchase price x 13) + (Mileage rate x mileage from nearest dealer to each

estimated central prosperity region).
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RENTAL

k%

BIDDER Spec #1 ITEM CA;T\;J(;’:JLETD BID ZNP';IRC?I;’G'\'D AWARD
United Spec #1 FELLING FT-10 DT or equivalent $3,316.92 $3,332.00 YES
United Spec #2 straight plow for truck $1,299.28 $1,326.00 YES
United Spec #3 John Deere 310L or equivalent $1,932.48 $1,932.48 YES
SUNBELT | Spec#3 John Deere 310 or Equivalent $1,945.38 $1,945.38

United Spec #4 TAKEUCHI TL12R2-CR or equivalent $2,040.38 $2,040.38 YES
SUNBELT | Spec#4 Gehl VT320 $2,442.08 $2,442.08

United Spec #5 John Deere 316GR or equivalent $1,643.23 $1,643.23 YES
SUNBELT | Spec#5 Bob Cat S510 $1,895.08 $1,895.08

United Spec #7 Heli CPYD30-KU1HG3 or equivalent $1,597.78 $1,579.00

Morrison | Spec #7 Bobcat G30N-7 $945.43 $945.43 YES
SUNBELT | Spec#7 Mitsubishi FG30N $1,878.38 $1,878.38

United Spec #8 HUSQVARNA FS 7000D $1,709.18 $1,709.18 YES
United Spec #9 Ledwell LW31 PHT2-DT/EB or equivalent $1,449.08 $1,449.08 YES
United Spec #11 LINCOLN LE400 or equivalent $1,308.23 $1,303.00 YES
SUNBELT | Spec#11 Miller Big Blue 400 Pro $1,878.38 $1,878.38

United Spec #12 Boss VBS15150C or equivalent $1,413.48 $1,413.00 YES
SUNBELT | Spec#13 Exmark LZX993EBV606X1 $1,677.98 $1,677.98

United Spec #13 JOHN DEERE Z930M or equivalent $1,439.93 $1,439.93 YES
SUNBELT | Spec #15 Kawasaki 4010 or equivalent $1,529.98 $1,529.98

United Spec #15 Polaris Pro XC Mid Size or equivalent $1,402.53 $1,423.00 YES
SUNBELT | Spec #16 John Deere 444L $2,132.58 $2,132.58 YES
United Spec #16 JOHN DEERE 444 or equivalent $2,336.53 $2,283.00

SUNBELT | Spec #17 John Deere 624K $2,428.48 $2,428.48 YES
United Spec #17 Case 621 or equivalent $2,743.28 $2,677.00

SUNBELT | Spec #18 John Deere 700LLGP $2,930.98 $2,930.98

United Spec #18 John Deere 550 or equivalent $2,295.23 $2,905.00 YES
United Spec #19 GENERAC MLT6SMDS or equivalent $1,431.03 $1,400.00 YES
SUNBELT | Spec #19 Genie RL4 $1,474.23 $1,474.23

United Spec #20 Heli CPCD40-CU9G3 or equivalent $1,696.08 $1,684.00

Morrison | Spec #20 Bobcat D35S-9 $1,127.88 $1,127.88 YES
SUNBELT | Spec #20 JCB 940 $2,138.33 $2,138.33

**All items above for RENTAL shall be evaluated on a combination of a single daily, weekly, and a monthly rental in each prosperity region.

Delivery and pickup shall be calculated for each single rental (13 x 3 = 39 single purchases). If delivery/pickup pricing is per mile, the delivery/pickup cost
shall be calculated from the nearest dealer location to the estimated central location of each region. Mileage is calculated one way for each pickup and
delivery. a) (Daily rental price x 13) + (Delivery and pickup cost at all 13 prosperity regions) + (Weekly rental price x 13) + (Delivery and pickup cost at all 13
prosperity regions) + (Monthly rental price x 13) + (Delivery and pickup cost at all 13 prosperity regions) or b) (Daily rental price x 13) + (Delivery and
pickup mileage rate x mileage to and from nearest dealer to each estimated central prosperity region) + (Weekly rental price x 13) + (Delivery and pickup
mileage rate x mileage to and from nearest dealer to each estimated central prosperity region) + (Monthly rental price x 13) + (Delivery and pickup

mileage rate x mileage to and from nearest dealer to each estimated central prosperity region).

PARTS, MAINTENANCE & REPAIR

BIDDER % OFF PARTS LABOR HOURLY RATE AWARD NOTES
Clark 0% $169.00 YES
JDRS No Bid No Bid NO
Morrison 10% $136.00 YES
SUNBELT No Bid No Bid NO
United No Bid No Bid NO




VII. Negotiations: Bidders with a passing technical score were asked to submit second round pricing. The
following savings were met:

Morrison Industrial submitted new pricing for two spec items. The discount resulted in 10.6% (potential
savings of $19,835.00).

United Rentals submitted new pricing for ten monthly rental spec items. The discount for monthly rentals
resulted in 25.3% (potential savings of $5,608.00).

No other pricing was submitted.
VIIl. Award Recommendation:

Award recommendation is made to the responsive and responsible Bidder who offers the best value to the
State of Michigan. Best value is based on the proposal meeting the minimum point threshold and offering
the best combination of the factors stated in the Proposal Instructions Evaluation Process section, and
price.

Clark, JDRS, Morrison, Sunbelt, and United provide the best value to the State. Best value factors for
Award Recommendation include:

1. Provides sales, warranty, rental, parts, and maintenance & repair services.
2. Provides their services to the entire State of Michigan.

3. Provides a broad scope of equipment.

4. Provides best price in selective specifications.

The Buyer recommends that Clark, JDRS, Morrison, Sunbelt, and United, are awarded a contract for
Agricultural, Grounds, Turf, Earth Moving, and Roadside, Maintenance Equipment.

Funding for this contract shall be as follows:

*** Clark Award amount: $2,000,000.00

*** JDRS Award amount: $4,000,000.00

*** Morrison Award amount: $2,000,000.00
*** Sunbelt Award amount: $1,000,000.00
*** United Award amount: $1,000,000.00

***Award amounts are based on State of Michigan Agencies current spend on similar contracts. Does
not include MiDEAL members which includes local units of government, school districts, universities,
community colleges, and nonprofit hospitals.
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