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AWARD RECOMMENDATION

Notice of Intent to Award Number: 250000000912
Notice of Intent to Award Date: 8/12/2025

The Department of Technology, Management & Budget’s Procurement office has
completed the evaluation of Request for Proposal No. 250000002515 for On-Site Oral and
Urine Drug Test Kits for the Michigan Department of Corrections (MDOC) and has
recommended an award to Peckham Vocational Industries, Inc. in the amount of
$2,088,510.75, pending State Administrative Board approval, if applicable. More
information on the State Administrative Board can be found at: State Administrative Board.

Bidders who were not recommended for the award are encouraged to schedule a
debriefing session with the Solicitation Manager. The debriefing session will provide the
bidder with the State’s rationale on why the bidder was not recommended for the award.

The Solicitation Manager may be contacted as follows:

Nichole Harrell, Solicitation Manager
Harrelln@michigan.gov
517-449-9245

Public copies of all bidder proposals can be found here: DTMB - Bid Proposals
(michigan.gov)

Background Information:

This Request for Proposal (RFP) was to solicit responses for the selection of a Contractor
to provide On-Site Oral and Urine Drug Test Kits for the MDOC. The term of this contract is
three (3), with up to seven (7) one-year renewal options.

This solicitation is designated as a Community Rehabilitation Organization (CRO) set
aside. Bids from non-CRO bidders will only be considered if no responsive CRO bids
are received, or if the CRO bids are not determined to be within fair market value.

Bidders:

The RFP was posted on SIGMA VSS on Tuesday, May 27, 2025, for 53 days. The following
bidders submitted proposals by the published due date of Friday, July 18, 2025.

Bidder Address, City, State, Zip Code SDVOB* | GDBE** CRO***

Technical Resource Management, | 5604 Fortune Circle South Dr.,

LLC dba Cordant Health Solutions | Suite N, Indianapolis, IN 46241 No No No
Engaged Healthcare Solutions,
LLg g 200 W. MLK Blvd., Ste. 1000 No No No

Chattanooga, TN 37402
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Peckham Vocational Industries, 3510 Capital City Blvd.,

Inc. Lansing, M| 48906 No No Yes

*SDVOB: Service-Disabled Veteran Owned Business
**GDBE: Geographically Disadvantaged Business Enterprise
***CRO: Community Rehabilitation Organization

Version 2024-2 Page 2 of 13




STATE OF MICHIGAN <L

PROCUREMENT! >

Michigan.gov/MiProcurement

EVALUATION SYNOPSIS

I. Evaluation Process

A Responsible Vendor is avendor that demonstrates it has the ability to successfully
perform the duties identified by the solicitation. A Responsive proposalis one that is
submitted in accordance with the solicitation instructions and meets all mandatory
requirements identified in the solicitation.

Proposal Instructions: Evaluation Process

The State will evaluate each proposal based on the following factors:

Technical Criteria Name Weight

Project Scope 40
e Schedule A, Statement of Work, Sections 1 and 9

Service Requirements 30
e Schedule A, Statement of Work, Sections 2,4-8, 10 and 11

Staffing 15
e Schedule A, Statement of Work, Section 3

Company Background 15
e Vendor Questions Worksheet

Total Weight 100

Proposals receiving 80 or more technical evaluation points will have pricing evaluated and
considered for award.

The full evaluation process is stated in the RFP Proposal Instructions.
Il. Evaluation Method

Responses to this solicitation were reviewed by a Joint Evaluation Committee (JEC), which
consisted of the following individuals:

Voting Advisory

Bernard G. Scott, Administrative Assistant Lakiesha Williams, Contract Monitor
MDOC Correctional Facilities Administration | MDOC Budget & Operations Division

Andrew Fotenakes, Contract Monitor Joseph Pirochta, Lieutenant
MDOC Budget & Operations Division MDOC SME

Don Matson, State Assistant Administrator Christopher Hopcraft, Buyer
MDOC Field Operations MDOC
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Advisory

Nichole Harrell, Category Specialist
DTMB Central Procurement

I1l. Evaluation Results
A. Cordant Health Solutions

The Evaluation Team determined that Cordant Health Solutions, based on a score of 97,
did meet the requirements of this RFP. This determination was accomplished by
evaluating their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.

1. Schedule A -Statement of Work, Sections 1 and 9 Score 38/40

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses were mostly
satisfactory, but the following deficiencies were noted:

a. Page 5, Section 1.2. Specifications: Saliva Point of Collections (POC)
Screening Devices, C, Bidder failed to accept the requirement(s) as
presented.

b. Page 7, Section 1.3. Specifications: Urine Point of Collections (POC)
Screening Devices, A.1.(h), Bidder failed to accept the requirement(s) as
presented.

2. Schedule A - Statement of Work, Sections 2,4 -8, 10 and 11 Score 29/30

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses were mostly
satisfactory, but the following deficiencies were noted:

a. Page 29, Section 4.1. Price Term, Bidder failed to accept the requirement(s)
as presented.

3. Schedule A - Statement of Work, Section 3 Score 15/15

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses provided were
satisfactory. No deficiencies were noted for this section.

4. Vendor Questions Worksheet Score 15/15

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses provided were
satisfactory. No deficiencies were noted for this section.

Total Score: 97/100
B. Engaged Healthcare Solutions

The Evaluation Team determined that Engaged Healthcare Solutions, based on a
score of 76, did not meet the requirements of this RFP. This determination was
accomplished by evaluating their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.

1. Schedule A - Statement of Work, Sections 1 and 9 Score 33/40
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a. Pg. 4, Section 1.2. Specifications: Saliva Point of Collections (POC)
Screening Devices, C, Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder
Response box.

b. Pg. 6, Section 1.3. Specifications: Urine Point of Collections (POC) Screening
Devices, A.1.(h), Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder Response box.

c. Pg. 6, Section 1.3. Specifications: Urine Point of Collections (POC) Screening
Devices, A.3.(a - j), Bidder failed to agree to the requirement(s) as presented.

d. Pg.7, Section 1.3. Specifications: Urine Point of Collections (POC) Screening
Devices, A, Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder Response box.

e. Pg.7, Section 1.4. Warranties, Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder
Response box.

f. Pg. 8, Section 1.6. Quality Assurance Program, Bidder failed to provide a
response in Bidder Response box.

g. Pg. 8, Section 1.7. Incentives, Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder
Response box.

2. Schedule A-Statement of Work, Sections 2,4 -8, 10 and 11 Score 18/30

a. Pg. 9, Section 2.1. A. Initial Training, Bidder failed to provide a response in
Bidder Response box.

b. Pg. 10, Section 2.2. Reporting, A. Usage Report, Bidder failed to provide a
response in Bidder Response box.

c. Pg. 10, Section 2.2. Reporting, A. Usage Report, Bidder failed to provide
sample reports as attachments to the RFP.

d. Pg. 10, Section 2.3. Meetings, B. Contract Meeting, Bidder failed to agree to
the requirement(s) as presented.

e. Pg. 22, Section 5.2. Online Ordering Capabilities, Bidder failed to provide a
response in Bidder Response boxes.

f. Pg.22, Section 5.3. Order Verification, Bidder failed to provide a response in
Bidder Response box.

g. Pg. 22, Section 6.1. Delivery Process, B, Bidder failed to provide a response
in Bidder Response box.

h. Pg. 23, Section 6.1. Delivery Process, C - I., Bidder failed to provide a

response in Bidder Response box.

Pg. 23, Section 6.2. Packaging and Palletizing, Bidder failed to provide a
response in Bidder Response box.

Pg. 25, Section 10.3. Mercury Content, Bidder failed to agree to the
requirement(s) as presented.
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k. Pg. 26, Section 10.4. Brominated Flame Retardants, Bidder failed to agree to
the requirement(s) as presented.
3. Schedule A - Statement of Work, Section 3 Score 10/15

a. Pg. 11, Section 3.1. Contractor Representative, Bidder failed to provide a
response in Bidder Response box.

b. Pg. 13, Section 3.2. Key Personnel, B, Bidder failed to provide detailed,
chronological resumes for all proposed Key Personnel.

c. Pg. 13, Section 3.4. Organizational Chart, Bidder failed to provide an overall
organizational chart as an attachment to the RFP.

d. Pg. 13, Section 3.5. Customer Service Telephone Number, Bidder failed to
provide a response in Bidder Response box.

e. Pg. 16, Section 3.8. Security, Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder
Response box.

4. Vendor Questions Worksheet Score 15/15

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses provided were
satisfactory. No deficiencies were noted for this section.

Total Score: 76/100
C. Peckham Vocational Industries, Inc.

The Evaluation Team determined that Cordant Health Solutions, based on a score of 96,
did meet the requirements of this RFP. This determination was accomplished by evaluating
their responses to the Technical Evaluation Criteria.

1. Schedule A -Statement of Work, Sections 1 and 9 Score 37/40

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses were mostly
satisfactory, but the following deficiencies were noted:

a. Pg. 7, Section 1.2. Specifications: Saliva Point of Collection (POC) Screening
Devices, C, Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder Response box.

b. Pg.10, Section 1.3. Specifications: Urine Point of Collection (POC) Screening
Devices, A.1.(h), Bidder failed to provide a response in Bidder Response box.

c. Pg. 15, Section 1.5. Recall Requirements and Procedures, Bidder failed to
accept the requirement(s) as presented.

2. Schedule A - Statement of Work, Sections 2,4 -8, 10 and 11 Score 30/30

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses provided were
satisfactory. No deficiencies were noted for this section.
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3. Schedule A - Statement of Work, Section 3

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses were mostly
satisfactory, but the following deficiencies were noted:

a. Pg. 24, Section 3.6. Work Hours and Call Center Location, Bidder failed to
provide a response in Bidder Response box.

4. Vendor Questions Worksheet Score 15/15

The evaluation team determined that overall, the responses provided were
satisfactory. No deficiencies were noted for this section.

Total Score: 96/100

IV. Technical Evaluation Summary

Technical Criteria Name Cordant Engaged Peckham
Healthcare
Project Scope
e Schedule A, Statement of Work, -2 -7 -3

Sections1and 9

Service Requirements

e Schedule A, Statement of Work, -1 -12 0
Sections 2,4-8,10and 11

Staffing
e Schedule A, Statement of Work, 0 -5 -1
Section 3
Company Background 0 0 0
o Vendor Questions Worksheet
Total Technical Evaluation Deductions -3 -24 -4
Technical Evaluation Score 97 76 96
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V. Pricing Summary

Pricing was evaluated for the bidders who passed the technical evaluation. The following is
a summary of their price proposals:

Note, Bidders were asked to list each drug they could provide a single panel drug test Dip
Stick for along with proposed base pricing. Single Panel tests proposed by each bidder may
differ and a “No Bid” response indicates the bidder did not list drug as a potential option
with their initial bid.

A response of “N/A” indicates the Bidder provided a response of Not Applicable for that
testing device.

Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT  PECKHAM  ; age (Single Kit)

URINE POINT OF COLLECTION (POC) DEVICES
SINGLE PANEL DEVICE
1 | Amphetamine No Bid $0.43
2 | Benzodiazepine No Bid $0.43
3 | Buprenorphine $0.38 No Bid
4 | Cotinine $0.36 No Bid
5 | Ethyl glucuronide (ETG) $1.11 $0.24
6 | Fentanyl $1.11 $0.77
7 | Gabapentin $2.74 No Bid
8 K2 $0.60 No Bid 400
9 K3 No Bid $0.20
10 | Kratom $3.37 $0.38
11 | Morphine $0.43 No Bid
12 | Methadone $0.43 $0.43
13 | Methamphetamine $0.38 No Bid
14 | Opiates $0.38 No Bid
15 | THC No Bid $0.43 50
16 | Tramadol No Bid $0.77
17 | Xylazine $3.01 $0.24
3 PANEL DEVICE
12 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $1.06
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Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT PECKHAM Usage (Single Kit)
13 | In-Cup N/A $1.78
4 PANEL DEVICE
14 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $1.20
15 | In-Cup N/A $2.05
5 PANEL DEVICE
16 | Dip Stick w/Cup $1.55 $1.28
17 | In-Cup $2.00 $2.22
6 PANEL DEVICE
18 | Dip Stick w/Cup $1.85 $1.48
19 | In-Cup N/A $2.42 8,850
7 PANEL DEVICE
20 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $1.70
21 | In-Cup N/A $2.63 18,700
21 | 8 PanelIn-Cup* $2.59 N/A 18,700
12 PANEL DEVICE
22 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $2.79
23 | In-Cup N/A $3.78
13 PANEL DEVICE
24 | Dip Stick w/Cup* N/A $2.95 15,900
24 | 16 PanelIn-Cup* $3.36 N/A 15,900
25 | In-Cup $3.21 $3.91
LIDS
26 | Dip Stick w/Cup $0.36 No Cost 100

SALIVA POINT OF COLLECTION (POC) SCREENING DEVICES

27 | Saliva Alcohol Test $1.11 $1.06
28 | 3 Panel N/A $4.50
29 | 4 Panel N/A $4.77
30 | 5Panel N/A $5.05
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Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT PECKHAM |\ e (Single Kit)
31 | 6Panel N/A $5.25
32 | 7 Panel N/A $5.57 104,225
32 | 14 Panel* $4.76 N/A 104,225
33 | 8 Panel N/A $6.10
34 | 9Panel N/A $6.63
35 | 10 Panel N/A $7.15
36 | 11 Panel N/A $7.68
37 | 12 Panel N/A $8.21
Annual Spend | $614,580.50 $695,998.25
3-Year Base Term | $1,843,741.50 | $2,087,994.75

*Cordant Health Solutions proposed alternative to the screening device requested in RFP.

VI. Negotiations

Second-round pricing clarifications and offers were requested from both bidders. This
included the addition of eight (8) new drugs for single panel urine testing.

As aresult, Cordant Health Solutions did not provide a response. Peckham Vocational
Industries reduced their overall bid by 0.3% and submitted pricing for all devices. This
equates to a Cost Savings for MDOC of an estimated $1,887.50 annually and $5,662.50
over the 3-year base term.

The following is a summary of Peckham Vocational second-round pricing proposal:
Note, adjusted pricing is highlighted in red.

Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT PECKHAM . .
Usage (Single Kit)

URINE POINT OF COLLECTION (POC) DEVICES
SINGLE PANEL DEVICE
1 | Amphetamine No Bid $0.43
2 | Barbiturates No Bid $0.43
3 | Benzodiazepine $0.38 $0.43
4 | Buprenorphine $0.38 $0.43
5 | Cocaine No Bid $0.43
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Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT PECKHAM |\ e (Single Kit)
Cotinine $0.36 No Bid
6 EDDP No Bid $0.43
7 | Ethyl glucuronide (ETG) $1.11 $0.24
8 | Fentanyl $1.11 $0.77
9 | Gabapentin $2.74 $0.93
10 | K2 $0.60 $0.43 400
11 | K8 $0.43 $0.20
12 | Ketamine No Bid $0.77
13 | Kratom $3.37 $0.38
14 | Methamphetamine $0.38 $0.43
15 | MDMA No Bid $0.43
16 | Methadone $0.43 $0.43
17 | Opiates $0.43 $0.43
18 | Oxycodone $0.38 $0.43
19 | Phencyclidine No Bid $0.43
20 | Propoxyphene No Bid $0.43
21 | TCA No Bid $0.43
22 | THC No Bid $0.43 50
23 | Tramadol No Bid $0.77
24 | Xylazine $3.01 $0.47
3 PANEL DEVICE
25 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $1.02
26 | In-Cup N/A $1.72
4 PANEL DEVICE
27 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $1.12
28 | In-Cup N/A $1.93
5 PANEL DEVICE
29 | Dip Stick w/Cup $1.55 $1.23
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Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT PECKHAM Usage (Single Kit)
30 | In-Cup $2.00 $2.14
6 PANEL DEVICE
31 | Dip Stick w/Cup $1.85 $1.44
32 | In-Cup N/A $2.35 8,850
7 PANEL DEVICE
33 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $1.65
34 | In-Cup N/A $2.57 18,700
34 | 8 Panel In-Cup* $2.59 N/A 18,700
12 PANEL DEVICE
35 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $2.71
36 | In-Cup N/A $3.68
13 PANEL DEVICE
37 | Dip Stick w/Cup N/A $2.93 15,900
37 | 16 Panel In-Cup* $3.36 N/A 15,900
38 | In-Cup $3.21 $3.89
LIDS
39 | Dip Stick w/Cup $0.36 No Cost 100
SALIVA POINT OF COLLECTION (POC) SCREENING DEVICES
40 | Saliva Alcohol Test $1.11 $1.06
41 | 3Panel N/A $4.50
42 | 4 Panel N/A $4.77
43 | 5Panel N/A $5.05
44 | 6 Panel N/A $5.25
45 | 7 Panel N/A $5.57 104,225
45 | 14 Panel* $4.76 N/A 104,225
46 | 8 Panel N/A $6.10
47 | 9 Panel N/A $6.63
48 | 10 Panel N/A $7.15
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Estimated Annual

DELIVERABLES CORDANT PECKHAM Usage (Single Kit)
49 | 11 Panel N/A $7.68
50 | 12 Panel N/A $8.21
Annual Spend | $614,580.50 $696,170.25

3-Year Base Term

$1,843,741.50

$2,088,510.75

*Cordant Health Solutions proposed alternative to the screening device requested in RFP.

Vil. Award Recommendation

Award recommendation is made to the responsive and responsible Bidder who offers the
best value to the State of Michigan. Best value is based on the proposal meeting the
minimum point threshold and offering the best combination of the factors stated in the
Proposal Instructions Evaluation Process section, and price.

Peckham Vocational Industries, Inc., a Community Rehabilitation Organization, provided
the best value to the State. Best value factors for Award Recommendation include a robust
product portfolio, experience, and price.

As part of the best value determination, overall economic impact to the State of Michigan
was considered and is not a determinative factor in making this award.

Award Recommendation is made to Peckham Vocational Industries, Inc. in the amount of
$2,088,510.75.
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