Michigan
Reglster

2222222222222222222222222222222222




GRAPHIC IMAGES IN THE

MICHIGAN REGISTER

COVER DRAWING

Michigan State Capitol:
This image, with flags flying to indicate that both chambers of the legislature are in session, may have originated
as an etching based on a drawing or a photograph. The artist is unknown. The drawing predates the placement of

the statue of Austin T. Blair on the capitol grounds in 1898.

(Michigan State Archives)

PAGE GRAPHICS

Capitol Dome:
The architectural rendering of the Michigan State Capitol’s dome is the work of Elijah E. Myers, the building’s
renowned architect. Myers inked the rendering on linen in late 1871 or early 1872. Myers’ fine draftsmanship,
the hallmark of his work, is clearly evident.
Because of their size, few architectural renderings of the 19" century have survived. Michigan is fortunate that
many of Myers’ designs for the Capitol were found in the building’s attic in the 1950’s. As part of the state’s
1987 sesquicentennial celebration, they were conserved and deposited in the Michigan State Archives.

(Michigan State Archives)

East Elevation of the Michigan State Capitol:
When Myers’ drawings were discovered in the 1950’s, this view of the Capitol — the one most familiar to
Michigan citizens — was missing. During the building’s recent restoration (1989-1992), this drawing was
commissioned to recreate the architect’s original rendering of the east (front) elevation.

(Michigan Capitol Committee)



Michigan
Register

Published pursuant to § 24.208 of
The Michigan Compiled Laws

Issue No. 4— 2024
(This issue, published March 15, 2024, contains
documents filed from February 1, 2023 to March 1, 2024)

Compiled and Published by the
Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules




© 2024 by Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules, State of Michigan
All rights reserved.
Printed in the United States of America

Michigan Register (ISSN 0892-3124). Published twice per month, with a cumulative index, by the Michigan
Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules, pursuant to §24.208 of the Michigan Compiled Laws. Subscription
$400.00 per year, postpaid to points in the U.S. First class postage paid at Lansing, Michigan. Direct all mail
concerning subscriptions to Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules, Ottawa Building — Second
Floor, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, MI 48909.

Katie Wienczewski, Administrative Rules Division Director, Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and
Rules; Deidre O’Berry, Administrative Rules Specialist for Operations and Publications.



Gretchen Whitmer, Governor

Garlin Gilchrist, Lieutenant Governor



PREFACE

PUBLICATION AND CONTENTS OF THE MICHIGAN REGISTER
The Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules publishes the Michigan Register.

While several statutory provisions address the publication and contents of the Michigan Register, two are of
particular importance.

24.208 Michigan register; publication; cumulative index; contents; public subscription; fee; synopsis of
proposed rule or guideline; transmitting copies to office of regulatory reform.

Sec. 8.

(1) The office of regulatory reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once each month. The Michigan
register shall contain all of the following:

(a) Executive orders and executive reorganization orders.

(b) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills signed into law
by the governor during the calendar year and the corresponding public act numbers.

(c) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills vetoed by the
governor during the calendar year.

(d) Proposed administrative rules.

(e) Notices of public hearings on proposed administrative rules.

(f) Administrative rules filed with the secretary of state.

(9) Emergency rules filed with the secretary of state.

(h) Notice of proposed and adopted agency guidelines.

(i) Other official information considered necessary or appropriate by the office of regulatory reform.
(1) Attorney general opinions.

(k) All of the items listed in section 7(m) after final approval by the certificate of need commission under section
22215 of the public health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.22215.

(2) The office of regulatory reform shall publish a cumulative index for the Michigan register.

(3) The Michigan register shall be available for public subscription at a fee reasonably calculated to cover
publication and distribution costs.

(4) If publication of an agency's proposed rule or guideline or an item described in subsection (1)(k) would be
unreasonably expensive or lengthy, the office of regulatory reform may publish a brief synopsis of the proposed
rule or guideline or item described in subsection (1)(k), including information on how to obtain a complete copy
of the proposed rule or guideline or item described in subsection (1)(k) from the agency at no cost.

(5) An agency shall electronically transmit a copy of the proposed rules and notice of public hearing to the office
of regulatory reform for publication in the Michigan register.



4.1203 Michigan register fund; creation; administration; expenditures; disposition of money received from
sale of Michigan register and amounts paid by state agencies; use of fund; price of Michigan register;
availability of text on internet; copyright or other proprietary interest; fee prohibited; definition.

Sec. 203.

(1) The Michigan register fund is created in the state treasury and shall be administered by the office of regulatory
reform. The fund shall be expended only as provided in this section.

(2) The money received from the sale of the Michigan register, along with those amounts paid by state agencies
pursuant to section 57 of the administrative procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.257, shall be
deposited with the state treasurer and credited to the Michigan register fund.

(3) The Michigan register fund shall be used to pay the costs of preparing, printing, and distributing the Michigan
register.

(4) The department of management and budget shall sell copies of the Michigan register at a price determined by
the office of regulatory reform not to exceed the cost of preparation, printing, and distribution.

(5) Notwithstanding section 204, beginning January 1, 2001, the office of regulatory reform shall make the text of
the Michigan register available to the public on the internet.

(6) The information described in subsection (5) that is maintained by the office of regulatory reform shall be made
available in the shortest feasible time after the information is available. The information described in subsection
(5) that is not maintained by the office of regulatory reform shall be made available in the shortest feasible time
after it is made available to the office of regulatory reform.

(7) Subsection (5) does not alter or relinquish any copyright or other proprietary interest or entitlement of this
state relating to any of the information made available under subsection (5).

(8) The office of regulatory reform shall not charge a fee for providing the Michigan register on the internet as
provided in subsection (5).

(9) As used in this section, “Michigan register” means that term as defined in section 5 of the administrative
procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.205.

CITATION TO THE MICHIGAN REGISTER
The Michigan Register is cited by year and issue number. For example, 2024 MR 1 refers to the year of issue
(2024) and the issue number (1).

CLOSING DATES AND PUBLICATION SCHEDULE
The deadlines for submitting documents to the Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules for
publication in the Michigan Register are the first and fifteenth days of each calendar month, unless the submission
day falls on a Saturday, Sunday, or legal holiday, in which event the deadline is extended to include the next day
which is not a Saturday, Sunday, or legal holiday. Documents filed or received after 5:00 p.m. on the closing date
of a filing period will appear in the succeeding issue of the Michigan Register.

The Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules is not responsible for the editing and proofreading of
documents submitted for publication.

Documents submitted for publication should be delivered or mailed in an electronic format to the following
address: MICHIGAN REGISTER, Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules, Ottawa Building —
Second Floor, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, M1 48933.



RELATIONSHIP TO THE MICHIGAN ADMINISTRATIVE CODE
The Michigan Administrative Code (1979 edition), which contains all permanent administrative rules in effect as
of December 1979, was, during the period 1980-83, updated each calendar quarter with the publication of a
paperback supplement. An annual supplement contained those permanent rules, which had appeared in the 4
quarterly supplements covering that year.

Quarterly supplements to the Code were discontinued in January 1984, and replaced by the monthly publication
of permanent rules and emergency rules in the Michigan Register. Annual supplements have included the full text
of those permanent rules that appear in the twelve monthly issues of the Register during a given calendar year.
Emergency rules published in an issue of the Register are noted in the annual supplement to the Code.

SUBSCRIPTIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
The Michigan Register, a publication of the State of Michigan, is available for public subscription at a cost of
$400.00 per year. Submit subscription requests to: Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules,
Ottawa Building —Second Floor, 611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, M1 48933. Checks Payable: State of Michigan.
Any questions should be directed to the Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules (517) 335-2484.

INTERNET ACCESS
The Michigan Register can be viewed free of charge on the website of the Michigan Office of Administrative
Hearings and Rules — Administrative Rules Division: www.michigan.gov/ard.

Issue 2000-3 and all subsequent editions of the Michigan Register can be viewed on the Michigan Office of
Administrative Hearings and Rules website. The electronic version of the Register can be navigated using the
blue highlighted links found in the Contents section. Clicking on a highlighted title will take the reader to related
text, clicking on a highlighted header above the text will return the reader to the Contents section.

Executive Director,
Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules



2024 PUBLICATION SCHEDULE

Closing Date for

Issue Filing or Submission Publication
No. Of Documents (5 p.m.) Date

1 January 1 February 1

2 January 15 February 15

3 February 1 March 1

4 February 15 March 15

5 March 1 April 1

6 March 15 April 15

7 April 1 May 1

8 April 15 May 15

9 May 1 June 1
10 May 15 June 15
11 June 1 July 1
12 June 15 July 15
13 July 1 August 1
14 July 15 August 15
15 August 1 September 1
16 August 15 September 15
17 September 1 October 1
18 September 15 October 15
19 October 1 November 1
20 October 15 November 15
21 November 1 December 1
22 November 15 December 15
23 December 1 January 1
24 December 15 January 15




CONTENTS

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES FILED
WITH SECRETARY OF STATE

Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Professional Licensing (2023-29)
Genetic Counseling - General RUIES...........cc.ooiiiieieiiece e 2-9

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES,
NOTICES OF PUBLIC HEARINGS

Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Bureau of Construction Codes (2022-16)
Construction Codes - Part 5. Residential Code...........ccooviiiiiiiiiieiieeee e 11-92
PUDBIIC HEAING NOTICE .....veiviecieeie ettt sre e enes 93-93

Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Bureau of Construction Codes (2022-57)
Construction Code - Part 4. Building Code .........ccoiiiiiiiiiieece e 94-120
PUDBIIC HEAING NOTICE .....viivii ettt ra et nra e enes 121-121

Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Bureau of Construction Codes (2022-58)
ReNabilItation COUE .....cveiiieiiee e e re e sae e 122-131
PUDBIIC HEAING NOTICE .....ve ettt nre e e enes 132-132

Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Bureau of Professional Licensing (2023-33)
AcUpUNCLUre - GENEral RUIES.........ooiiii e 133-135
PUDBIIC HEAINNG NOTICE ... ittt 136-136

Licensing and Regulatory Affairs

Bureau of Professional Licensing (2023-35)
Chiropractic — GeNeral RUIES............ccviieieee et 137-143
PUDBIIC HEAING NOTICE .....eeieieiieti et 144-144

Insurance and Financial Services

Financial Institutions (2023-44)
DDt MANAGEIMENT .......eeiieie ettt e et e s e ae e esreesteeneesreesseeneenneas 145-146
PUDBIIC HEAING NOTICE .....eeieieiieti et 147-147



CUMULATIVE INDEX

CUMUIALIVE INAEX (2024) ..ottt sta et e esba e e sraenteeneesneenneaneennens 148-148

BILLS SIGNED INTO LAW OR VETOED

Appendix Table 1 (2024 Session) (Legislative Service Bureau Pages (1-2)........ccoecevververiennenne 149-149



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES
FILED WITH THE SECRETARY OF STATE

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once each
month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

() Administrative rules filed with the secretary of state.”



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR’S OFFICE
GENETIC COUNSELING - GENERAL RULES
Filed with the secretary of state on February 16, 2024

These rules become effective immediately after filing with the secretary of state unless adopted under
section 33, 44, or 45a(9) of the administrative procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.233,
24.244, or 24.245a. Rules adopted under these sections become effective 7 days after filing with the
secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by sections
16145, 16148, 16174, 16201, 16204, 16287, 17091, 17092, and 17096 of the public health code, 1978
PA 368, MCL 333.16145, 333.16148, 333.16174, 333.16201, 333.16204, 333.16287, 333.17091,
333.17092, and 333.17096, and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 1991-9, 1996-2, 2003-1, and
2011-4, MCL 338.3501, 445.2001, 445.2011, and 445.2030)

R 338.2455, R 338.2457, R 338.2461, R 338.2462, R 338.2463, R 338.2465, R 338.2471, R 338.2473,
and R 338.2481 of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended, as follows:

PART 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS

R 338.2455 Telehealth.

Rule 155. (1) A licensee shall obtain consent for treatment before providing a telehealth service under
section 16284 of the code, MCL 333.16284.

(2) A licensee shall maintain proof of consent for telehealth treatment in the patient’s up-to-date
medical record and satisfy section 16213 of the code, MCL 333.16213.

(3) A licensee providing a telehealth service may prescribe a drug if the licensee is a prescriber acting
within the scope of the licensee’s practice and in compliance with section 16285 of the code, MCL
333.16285, and if the licensee does both of the following:

(a) Refers the patient to a provider that is geographically accessible to the patient, if medically
necessary.

(b) Makes the licensee available to provide follow-up care services to the patient, or to refer the patient
to another provider, for follow-up care.

(4) A licensee providing any telehealth service shall do both of the following:

(@) Act within the scope of the licensee’s practice.
(b) Exercise the same standard of care applicable to a traditional, in-person health care service.

R 338.2457 Training standards for identifying victims of human trafficking;
requirements.



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 157. (1) Under section 16148 of the code, MCL 333.16148, an individual seeking licensure or
who is licensed shall have completed training in identifying victims of human trafficking that satisfies
all the following standards:

(@) Training content must cover all the following:

(i) Understanding the types and venues of human trafficking in the United States.

(i1) 1dentifying victims of human trafficking in health care settings.

(iii) ldentifying the warning signs of human trafficking in health care settings for adults and minors.

(iv) Providing resources for reporting the suspected victims of human trafficking.

(b) Acceptable providers or methods of training include any of the following:

(i) Training offered by a nationally recognized or state-recognized health-related organization.

(i) Training offered by, or in conjunction with, a state or federal agency.

(iii) Training obtained in an educational program that has been approved under these rules for initial
licensure or registration, or by a college or university.

(iv) Reading an article related to the identification of victims of human trafficking that satisfies the
requirements of subdivision (a) of this subrule and is published in a peer-reviewed journal, health care
journal, or professional or scientific journal.

(c) Acceptable modalities of training include any of the following:

(i) Teleconference or webinar.

(if) Online presentation.

(iii) Live presentation.

(iv) Printed or electronic media.

(2) The department may select and audit a sample of individuals and request documentation of proof of
completion of training. If audited by the department, an individual shall provide an acceptable proof of
completion of training, including either of the following:

(@) Proof of completion certificate issued by the training provider that includes the date, provider
name, name of training, and individual’s name.

(b) A self-certification statement by the individual. The certification statement must include the
individual’s name and either of the following:

(i) For training completed under subrule (1)(b)(i) to (iii) of this rule, the date, training provider name,
and name of training.

(ii) For training completed under subrule (1)(b)(iv) of this rule, the title of the article, author,
publication name of the peer-review journal, health care journal, or professional or scientific journal,
and the date, volume, and issue of publication, as applicable.

(3) Under section 16148 of the code, MCL 333.16148, the requirements specified in subrule (1) of this
rule apply for license renewals beginning with the 2025 renewal cycle and for initial licenses beginning
April 15, 2026.

PART 2. LICENSURE

R 338.2461 Application for license; qualifications.

Rule 161. (1) An applicant for a genetic counselor license shall satisfy the requirements of the code
and the rules promulgated under the code, as well as both of the following requirements:

(@) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying current certification in good standing from
the ABGC or the ABMGG.



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(2) An applicant for a temporary-licensed genetic counselor license shall satisfy the requirements of the
code and the rules promulgated under the code, as well as all the following requirements:

(a) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying active candidate status from the ABGC or
the ABMGG.

(c) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying that the applicant will be supervised by a
qualified supervisor in this state.

R 338.2462 Application for license by endorsement; qualifications.

Rule 162. (1) An applicant for a genetic counselor license by endorsement shall satisfy the
requirements of the code and the rules promulgated under the code, as well as all the following
requirements:

(a) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying a current and full genetic counselor license
in another state or in a province of Canada.

(c) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying current certification in good standing from
the ABGC or the ABMGG.

(2) An applicant who is or has been licensed, registered, or certified in a health profession or specialty
by another state, the United States military, the federal government, or another country shall disclose
that fact on the application form. The applicant shall satisfy the requirements of section 16174(2) of the
code, MCL 333.16174, including verification from the issuing entity showing that disciplinary
proceedings are not pending against the applicant and sanctions are not in force when applying. If
licensure is granted and it is determined that sanctions have been imposed, the disciplinary
subcommittee may impose appropriate sanctions under section 16174(5) of the code, MCL 333.16174.

R 338.2463 Application for relicensure; qualifications.

Rule 163. (1) An applicant may be relicensed within 3 years after the expiration date of the license
under section 16201(3) of the code, MCL 333.16201, if the applicant satisfies the requirements of the
code and the rules promulgated under the code, as well as all the following requirements:

(a) Provides the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provides proof, as directed by the department, verifying 1 of the following, as applicable:

(i) If applying for relicensure as a genetic counselor, current certification in good standing from the
ABGC or the ABMGG.

(ii) 1f applying for relicensure as a temporary-licensed genetic counselor, active candidate status from
the ABGC or the ABMGG.

(c) Establishes good moral character as that term is defined in, and determined under, 1974 PA 381,
MCL 338.41 to 338.47.

(d) If applying for relicensure as a temporary-licensed genetic counselor, provides proof, as directed
by the department, verifying that the applicant will be supervised by a qualified supervisor in this state.

(2) An applicant may be relicensed more than 3 years after the expiration date of the license under
section 16201(4) of the code, MCL 333.16201, if the applicant satisfies the requirements of the code and
the rules promulgated under the code, as well as all the following requirements:

(a) Provides the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.
(b) Provides proof, as directed by the department, verifying 1 of the following, as applicable:
(i) If applying for relicensure as a genetic counselor, current certification in good standing from the
ABGC or the ABMGG.
(ii) 1f applying for relicensure as a temporary-licensed genetic counselor, active candidate status from
the ABGC or the ABMGG.



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(c) Establishes good moral character as that term is defined in, and determined under, 1974 PA 381,
MCL 338.41 to 338.47.

(d) Provides fingerprints as required under section 16174(3) of the code, MCL 333.16174.

(e) If applying for relicensure as a temporary-licensed genetic counselor, provides proof, as directed
by the department, verifying that the applicant will be supervised by a qualified supervisor in this state.

(3) An applicant who is or has been licensed, registered, or certified in a health profession or specialty
by another state, the United States military, the federal government, or another country shall disclose
that fact on the application form. The applicant shall satisfy the requirements of section 16174(2) of the
code, MCL 333.16174, including verification from the issuing entity showing that disciplinary
proceedings are not pending against the applicant and sanctions are not in force when applying. If
licensure is granted and it is determined that sanctions have been imposed, the disciplinary
subcommittee may impose appropriate sanctions under section 16174(5) of the code, MCL 333.16174.

R 338.2465 Application for renewal of license; qualifications.
Rule 165. (1) An applicant for renewal of a genetic counselor license shall satisfy the requirements of
the code and the rules promulgated under the code, as well as all the following requirements:

(@) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying current certification in good standing from
the ABGC or the ABMGG.

(c) Satisfy the requirements under R 338.2471, as applicable.

(2) An applicant for renewal of a temporary-licensed genetic counselor license shall satisfy the
requirements of the code and the rules promulgated under the code, as well as all the following
requirements:

(a) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying active candidate status from the ABGC or
the ABMGG.

(c) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying that the licensee will be supervised by a
qualified supervisor in this state.

(3) A temporary-licensed genetic counselor license may be renewed 4 times.

PART 3. CONTINUING EDUCATION

R 338.2471 License renewals.

Rule 171. (1) This part applies to an application for renewal of a genetic counselor license under R
338.2465 and sections 16201 and 17091 of the code, MCL 333.16201 and 333.17091.

(2) An applicant for license renewal who has been licensed in the 3-year period immediately preceding
the application for renewal shall accumulate a minimum of 75 contact hours of continuing education in
activities approved under R 338.2473 during the 3 years immediately preceding the application for
renewal.

(3) Submission of an application for renewal constitutes the applicant’s certification of compliance
with the requirements of this rule. The licensee shall retain documentation of satisfying the
requirements of this rule for 4 years after the date of applying for license renewal. Failure to satisfy this
rule is a violation of section 16221(h) of the code, MCL 333.16221.

(4) The department may select and audit a sample of licensees who have renewed their license and
request proof of compliance with subrule (2) of this rule. If audited, a licensee shall provide
documentation as specified in R 338.2473.



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(5) An applicant shall submit a request for a waiver of continuing education requirements to the
department for the board’s consideration not less than 30 days before the last regularly scheduled board
meeting before the expiration date of the license.

R 338.2473 Acceptable continuing education; requirements; limitations.

Rule 173. (1) The 75 contact hours of continuing education required under R 338.2471 must satisfy
the following requirements, as applicable:

(a) Credit for a continuing education program or activity that is identical or substantially equivalent to
a program or activity for which the licensee has already earned credit during the renewal period cannot
be granted.

(b) A minimum of 1 contact hour of continuing education must be earned in medical ethics.

(c) A minimum of 1 contact hour of continuing education must be earned in pain and symptom
management under section 16204 of the code, MCL 333.16204. Continuing education contact hours in
pain and symptom management may include, but are not limited to, any of the following areas:

(i) Public health burden of pain.

(i) Ethics and health policy related to pain.

(iii) Michigan pain and controlled substance laws.

(iv) Pain definitions.

(v) Basic sciences related to pain including pharmacology.

(vi) Clinical sciences related to pain.

(vii) Specific pain conditions.

(viii) Clinical physician communication related to pain.

(ix) Management of pain, including evaluation and treatment and non-pharmacological and
pharmacological management.

(x) Ensuring quality pain care.

(xi) Michigan programs and resources relevant to pain.

(d) Completion of implicit bias training under R 338.7004 during the 3 years immediately preceding
the application for renewal may be used toward satisfaction of the requirements of R 338.2471(2) and
this subrule.

(2) The following activities are acceptable continuing education:

Activity and Proof of Completion Number of Continuing
Education Contact Hours
Granted/Allowed for the
Activity

(a) | Attendance at or participation in a continuing The number of continuing
education program or activity related to the practice | education contact hours

of genetic counseling that includes, but is not limited | credit for a specific

to, live in-person programs, interactive or monitored | program or activity is the
teleconference, audio-conference, or web-based number of contact hours
programs, online programs, and journal articles with | approved by the sponsor or
a self-study component or other self-study programs | the approving organization

approved or offered by any of the following for the specific program.
organizations:

- Accreditation Council for Continuing Medical A minimum of 45 hours of
Education (ACCME) including non-ACCME continuing education credit
accredited providers engaging in joint providership must be earned in this

with ACCME accredited providers. activity in each renewal

- American College of Medical Genetics and period.




2024 MR 4 — March 15,

2024

Genomics.

- American College of Obstetricians and
Gynecologists.

- American Medical Association.

- American Nurses Credentialing Center’s
Commission on Accreditation.

- American Osteopathic Association.

- American Society for Reproductive Medicine.
- Michigan Association of Genetic Counselors.
- Michigan Osteopathic Association.

- Michigan State Medical Society.

- National Society of Genetic Counselors.

- Society for Maternal Fetal Medicine.

If audited, the licensee shall provide a copy of the
letter or certificate of completion showing the
licensee’s name, number of continuing education
contact hours earned, sponsor name or the name of
the organization that approved the program or
activity for continuing education credit, and the date
on which the program was held or the activity
completed.

A maximum of 75 contact
hours of continuing
education credit may be
earned for this activity in
each renewal period.

(b) | Serving as a clinical supervisor for a student at a site | Five contact hours of
used by an Accreditation Council for Genetic continuing education credit
Counseling (ACGC) accredited program. is granted for a minimum

of 25 hours of direct
To receive credit, the clinical supervision must not be | clinical supervision.
the licensee’s primary employment function.

A maximum of 30 contact
If audited, the licensee shall provide the student’s hours of continuing
initials, training program, dates supervision began education credit may be
and ended, and number of supervision hours earned for this activity in
provided per week. each renewal period.

(c) | Publication of an article or chapter in a peer- Ten contact hours of

reviewed journal or book related to practice-based
competency.

If audited, the licensee shall provide a copy of the
publication that identifies the licensee as the author.

continuing education credit
Is granted for serving as
the first, second, or senior
author.

Five contact hours of
continuing education credit
Is granted for serving as
any other author who is not
first, second, or senior
author.

A maximum of 10 contact
hours of continuing




2024 MR 4 — March 15,

2024

education credit may be
earned per article or
chapter.

A maximum of 30 contact
hours of continuing
education credit may be
earned for this activity in
each renewal period.

(d) | Service in a leadership position role as a board Five contact hours of
member, chair, or leader of a genetics-related continuing education credit
organization. is granted for 25 hours of
service for each

If audited, the licensee shall provide the organization | organization.

name, contact information, dates of service, dated

agenda, and meeting minutes documenting not less A maximum of 30 contact

than 25 hours of service. hours of continuing
education credit may be
earned for this activity in
each renewal period.

(e) | Serving as an instructor for a graduate-level course in | Five contact hours of
an area related to genetics competency. continuing education credit

is granted for a minimum
To receive credit, the instructorship must not be the | of 5 hours of teaching.
licensee’s primary employment function.

A maximum of 10 contact
If audited, the licensee shall provide document titles, | hours of continuing
course description, faculty list of each course, dates | education credit may be
of all courses, scheduled instructional hours, and a earned for each course.
letter from the program director verifying the
licensee’s role. A maximum of 30 contact

hours of continuing

education credit may be

earned for this activity in

each renewal period.

() | Serving as a peer-reviewer of a manuscript by Two contact hours of

invitation for a scientific journal.

If audited, a licensee shall provide copies of
documentation inviting the license to complete the
review and thanking them for completing the review.

continuing education credit
is granted for each
manuscript reviewed.

A maximum of 30 contact
hours of continuing
education credit may be
earned for this activity in
each renewal period.

PART 4. STANDARDS OF PRACTICE




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 338.2481 Certification; active candidate status; requirement.

Rule 171. (1) A genetic counselor licensee shall maintain certification with the ABGC or the
ABMGG.

(2) A temporary-licensed genetic counselor shall report to the department a change in qualified
supervisor not later than 30 days after the change occurs.

(3) A temporary-licensed genetic counselor license automatically expires on issuance of a genetic
counselor license or on loss of active candidate status with the ABGC or the ABMGG. A temporary-
licensed genetic counselor shall report to the department a change in active candidate status not later
than 30 days after the change occurs.



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES,
NOTICES OF PUBLIC HEARINGS

MCL 24.242(3) states in part:

*“... the agency shall submit a copy of the notice of public hearing to the Office of Regulatory Reform for
publication in the Michigan register. An agency's notice shall be published in the Michigan register
before the public hearing and the agency shall file a copy of the notice of public hearing with the Office
of Regulatory Reform.”

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once each
month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

(d) Proposed administrative rules.

(e) Notices of public hearings on proposed administrative rules.”

10



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS

DIRECTOR'S OFFICE

CONSTRUCTION CODE

Filed with the secretary of state on

These rules become effective 120 days after filing with the secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by section 4
of the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and
Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025, and
445.2030)

R 408.30500, R 408.30501b, R 408.30505, R 408.30513, R 408.30515, R 408.30516, R 408.30518, R
408.30519, R 408.30521a, R 408.30524, R 408.30529, R 408.30530, R 408.30532, R 408.30533, R
408.30533a, R 408.30533b, R 408.30534, R 408.30535, R 408.30536, R 408.30541a, R 408.30544, and
R 408.30544b of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended, R 408.30533c is added, and R
408.30501a, R 408.30506, R 408.30507, R 408.30509, R 408.30510, R 408.30510a, R 408.30521, R
408.30522a, R 408.30522b, R 408.30523, R 408.30523a, R 408.30525a, R 408.30528, R 408.30528a, R
408.30536a, R 408.30537, R 408.30537a, R 408.30537b, R 408.30537c, R 408.30537d, R 408.30538, R
408.30539a, R 408.30540, R 408.30542, R 408.305444a, R 408.30545, R 408.30545a, R 408.30547b, R
408.30547c, R 408.30547d, R 408.30547¢, R 408.30547f, and R 408.305479 are rescinded, as follows:

PART 5. RESIDENTIAL CODE

R 408.30500 Applicable code.

Rule 500. The provisions of the international residential code, 2045 2021 edition, including
appendices A-AA, B AB, € AC, B AD, E AE, F AF, G AG, J AJ, K AK, N AN, © AO, R AP, R AR,
and S AS except for Sections R104.2, R104.3, R104.5, R104.7, R104.8, R104.8.1, R105.3, R105.3.1,
R105.3.2, R105.6, R105.9, R108.3, R108.4, R108.5, R108.6, R109.1, R112.2, R112.3, R112.4, R113.1
to R113.3, R113.4, R114.1 and R114.2, R313.1.1 to R313.2.1, R602.11, R602.12, N1102.3.2, tables
R507.2.3, N1101.12.3(3) and figure—R507212); R507.2.3(1), R507.2.3(2), and R507.2.4, sections
M1411.8, G2411.1.1.1 to G2411.1.1.5, G2439.7.2, P2503.9, P2709.2.3, P2904.1.1 to P2904.8.2,
P2905.1, P2905.2, figure P2904.2.4.2, table P2904.2.2, tables P2904.6.2(1) to P2904.6.2(9), P3009.1 to
P3009.11.1, E3902.15E3902.16E3902.17.E3401.2 to E4304.5 and AJ102.4, the IBC-2015-2021,
IECC-2015-2021, IMC-2015-2021, IPC-2015-2021, NFPA 70-20614-2023 listed in chapter 44 govern the

11



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

construction, alteration, relocation, demolition, use, and occupancy of buildings and structures, and, with
the exceptions noted, the international residential code is adopted by reference in these rules. All
references to the International Building Code, International Residential Code, International Energy
Conservation Code, National Electrical Code, International Existing Building Code, International
Mechanical Code, and International Plumbing Code mean the Michigan Building Code, Michigan
Residential Code, Michigan Energy Code, Michigan Electrical Code, Michigan Rehabilitation Code for
Existing Buildings, Michigan Mechanical Code, and Michigan Plumbing Code, respectively. The code
is available for inspection and purchase at the Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau
of Construction Codes, 611 West: Ottawa Street St:, 1% First Floor Ottawa Building, Lansing, Michigan
48933. The code may be purchased from the International Code Council, through the bureau’s website
at www.michigan.gov/bcc, at a cost as of the time of adoption of these rules of $118.00 $140.00 for
each code book.

R 408.30501b Intent.

Rule 501b. Sections R101.3 ard-101-4 of the code are is amended to read as follows:

R101.3. Intent. The purpose of this code is to establish minimum requirements to safeguard the public
safety, health, and general welfare through affordability, structural strength, means of egress facilities,
stability, sanitation, light and ventilation, energy conservation, and safety to life and property from fire
and other hazards attributed to the built environment, and to provide safety to fire fighters and
emergency responders during emergency operations. The Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction
code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1501 to MEE 125.1531, takes precedence over all provisions of this
code.

R 408.30505 Work exempt from permit.

Rule 505. Section R105.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:

R105.2. Work exempt from permit. Exemption from the permit requirements of the code shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of

12



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

the code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits are not required for any of the
following:

(a) Building permits shall not be required for any of the following:

(i) One-story detached. accessory structures, if the floor area does not exceed 200
square feet, {18.58 m>meters squared).

(i) A fence that is not more than 7 feet, {2,134 mm millimeters}, high.

(iii) A retaining wall that is not more than 4 feet, {1,219 mm millimeters), in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

(iv) A water tank supported directly upon grade if the capacity is not more than
5,000 gallons €18,927 L liters) and the ratio of height to diameter or width is not greater than 2 to 1.

(v) A sidewalk and driveway not more than 30 inches, {762 mm millimeters), above adjacent grade
and not over any basement or story below and not part of an accessible route.

(vi) Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops, and similar finish
work.

(vii) A prefabricated swimming pool that is less than 24 inches, {610 s, millimeters); deep, and not
greater than 5,000 gallons, {18, 925 L liters), and is installed entirely above ground.

(viii) Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached 1- or 2-family
dwellings.

(ix) Window awnings in group R-3 and U occupancies, supported by an exterior
wall that do not project more than 54 inches, {1,372 mm millimeters), from the exterior wall and do not
require additional support, as applicable in Ssection 101.2 and group U occupancies.

(x) Decks, porches, patios, landings, or similar structures not exceeding 200 square feet, {18.58 m?
meters squared}, in area, that are not more than 30 inches, {762 mm millimeters), above grade at any
point as prescribed by Ssection R312.1.1, are not attached to a dwelling or its accessory structures, are
not within 36 inches, {914 mm millimeters), of a dwelling or its accessory structures, and do not serve

(be) Mechanical permits shall not be required for any of the following:
(i) A portable heating or gas appliance that has inputs of less than 30,000 BFJ-sBritish thermal units,
BTUs, per hour.

(ii) Portable ventilation appliances and equipment.

(iii) A portable cooling unit.

(iv) Steam, hot water, or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment or appliances
regulated by this code.

(V) Repla ot-a approval-of-eguip or-an—apphs
- Except for a heat exchanger, replacement of any
manufacturer installed part on a listed and labeled appliance or listed and labeled equipment, if
the replacement does not alter the approval of the appliance or equipment or make the appliance
or equipment unsafe.
(vi) A portable evaporative cooler.

13



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(vii) Self-contained refrigeration systems that contain 10 pounds, (4.5 kg kilograms), or less of
refrigerant, or that are actuated by motors of 1 horsepower, {0.75kW kilowatt), or less.

(viii) Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

(ix) An oil burner that does not require connection to a flue, such as an oil stove and a heater equipped
with a wick.

ee}(x) When changlng or relocatlng a gas meter or regulator a permlt IS not required when installing
gas piping which shall be limited to 10 feet, {3,005 mm millimeters}, in length and not more than 6
fittings.

©4b(xi) When installing geothermal vertical closed loops under the supervision of a mechanical
contractor licensed in HVAC as long as the company meets both the following:

(A) Has obtained a certificate of registration as a well drilling contractor pursuant to part 127 of the
public health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.12701 to 333.12771.

(B) Has installed the geothermal vertical closed loops in accordance with the department of
enwronment Great Lakes and energys best practlces regardlng geothermal heat pump closed Ioops

(cd) Plumbing permits shall not be required for either of the following:

(i) The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste, or vent pipe. If any concealed trap, drainpipe,
water, soil, waste, or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the
same with new material, then the work is considered as new work and a permit shall be obtained and
inspection made as provided in the code.

(ii) The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves, or fixtures, and the removal and
reinstallation of water closets, if the repairs do not involve or require the replacement or rearrangement
of valves, pipes, or fixtures.

R 408 30506 Sebm+ttal—deeement& Rescmded

14



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

15



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408 30510a Fweelasaﬂeaﬂen—Rescmded

R 408.30513 Definitions.

Rule 513. The definitions of attic and sunroom addition in Ssection R202 of the code are amended to
read as follows:
R202. Definitions.
(a) “Attic, uninhabitable with limited storage” means uninhabitable attics with limited storage where the
minimum clear height between joists and rafters is 42 inches, {1,063 mm-millimeters}, or greater or
where there are not 2 or more adjacent trusses with web configurations capable of accommodating an
assumed rectangle 42 inches, {1,063 mm millimeters), high by 24 inches, {610 mm millimeters), in
width, or greater, within the plane of the trusses.
(b) “Attic, uninhabitable without storage” means uninhabitable attics without storage where the
maximum clear height between joists and rafters is less than 42 inches, {1,063 mm millimeters), or
where there are not 2 or more adjacent trusses with web configurations capable of accommodating an
assumed rectangle 42 inches, {1,063 mm millimeters), high by 24 inches, {610 mm millimeters), in

width, or greater Wlthln the plane of the trusses B&H&ng—%peeteﬁneans—the—m@wdu&l—whe—m

16



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(c) “Building ©official” means the person who is appointed and employed by a governmental
subdivision, who is charged with the administration and enforcement of the state codes speeified—n-R
40830499, and who is registered in compliance with 2016 PA 407, MCL 339.5101 to 339.6133.

(d) “Registered design professional” means an individual who is licensed under the occupational code,
1980 PA 299, MCL 339. 101 to 339. %9%92677

(e) =+ isH '
299—MG|£>39—]:91—EG%39—29}9"Sunr00m addltlon" means a new structure Wlth glazmg |n excess of
40% of the gross area of the structure's exterior walls and roof added to an existing dwelling.

R 408.30515 Ground snow loads.
Rule 515. Figure R301.2(5) and Ftable R301.2(1) of the code are amended and Ftable R301.2(5) is
added to the code to read as follows:

17



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

18



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

19



Table R301.2(5)P

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Michigan Ground Snow Loads by Jurisdiction

County

Jorisdich

ALCONA

ALGER

AH
AH

ALLEGAN

‘&#%E%’g

8|8

20




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

&

8 K88

8|&

B 5R(E|8

21




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

S

22




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

8

8

23




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

kS

&8

&\8|&

& 88

24




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

| EMMET | 70 | AH

E

GENESEE 30 Al-exeept:
25 SHY-OFBAVISON

CHY-OFFENTON
SHY-OFGRAND-BLANGC
CHY-OFLINDEN
VHEAGE-OF-GAINES
VHLEAGE-OFGOODRICH
FOWNSHIP-OF
ARGENTINE
TFOWNSHIR-OF-ATLAS
FOWNSHIP-OFBAVASON
TFOWNSHIP-OFFENTON
TFOWNSHIP—OF—GRAND
BLANC
FOWNSHIP-OF-MUNDY

GEADWAN 40 AH

GOGEBIC 60 AH

GRAND-TRAVERSE | 60 Al

GRAHOT 35 AH

HILLSBALE 20 AH-except:

25 CHY-OFLFCHFIELD

FOWNSHIP-OF
HFCHFIELD
FOWNSHIP-OF-SCIRIO
All-exeept:
FOWNSHIP-OF-ADAMS
FOWNSHIP-OFCHASSELL
TFOWNSHIP-OF DUNCAN
FOWNSHIPOFELM-RIMER
TFOWNSHIPOFLAIRD
TFOWNSHIP-OFPORTAGE

25



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

8|&R|&

J

26




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

8| &

&8

8|&|8

27




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

8|&

& 8|8

e3pp=

28




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

0 AH
MACKINAC 60 All-exeept:
70 FOWNSHIP-OF-NEWTON
FOWNSHIP-OFRPORTAGE
MACOMB 25 Al
MANISTEE 60 AH
MARQUETTE 0 AH-except:
60 TFOWNSHIP-OFEWANG
TFOWNSHIPOFWELLS
FOWNSHIP-OFRERUBLIC
60 AH
MECOSTA 40 Al
MENOMINEE 60 AH
MIDLAND 35 All-exeept:
40 CHY-OFCOLEMAN
WVHEAGE OFSANFORD
FOWNSHIP-OF
EDENVALLE
TFOWNSHIP-OF- GENEVA
TFOWNSHIR-OFHOPE
FOWNSHIP-OFMHLLS
TFOWNSHIP-OFWARREN
MISSAUKEE 50 AH-except:
60 TFOWNSHIP-OF BLOOMFIELD
FOWNSHIP-OF
CALDWELL
TOWNSHIP OF PIONEER
MONROE 20 AH
MONTCALM 35 All-exeept:

29




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

& 8|8

30




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

& B|&K

| Al-except

31




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

8|8

8|8

8|8

32




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

&8

& 5|8B|&

33




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

&8

& 8|8

34




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

& B|&

&8

8|8

35




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

8|

& 8| &8

County

Ground Snow

Jurisdictions

Alcona

All

Alger

All

Allegan

All except:

36




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

35 city of Allegan
city of Otsego
city of Plainwell
city of Wayland
village of Hopkins
village of Martin
township of Allegan
township of Dorr
township of Gun Plain
township of Hopkins
township of Leighton
township of Martin
township of Monterey
township of Otsego
township of Salem
township of Trowbridge
township of Watson

township of Wayland

Alpena 50 All
Antrim 60 All except:
70 township of Banks

township of Central Lake
township of Echo
township of Jordan
township of Warner

Arenac 40 All
Baraga 70 All
Barry 35 All except:
30 village of Nashville

township of Assyria
township of Barry
township of Johnstown
township of Maple Grove

Bay 35 All except:

40 city of Pinconning
township of Fraser
township of Garfield
township of Gibson
township of Mt. Forest
township of Pinconning

Benzie 60 All
Berrien 50 All
Branch 25 All except:

37




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

20 township of Algansee
township of California
township of Gilead
township of Kinderhook
township of Ovid

Calhoun 25 All except:
30 city of Battle Creek
city of Marshall
city of Springfield

village of Athens
township of Athens
township of Battle Creek
township of Bedford
township of Convis
township of Emmet
township of Lee
township of Leroy
township of Marengo
township of Marshall
township of Newton
township of Pennfield

Cass 30 All except:

50 city of Dowagiac
village of Cassopolis

village of Edwardsburg
township of Howard
township of La Grange
township of Milton
township of Pokagon
township of Silver Creek
township of Wayne

Charlevoix 70 All

Cheboygan 70 All except:

38




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

60 city of Cheboygan
village of Afton
village of Wolverine
township of Aloha
township of Benton
township of Ellis
township of Grant
township of Koehler
township of Nunda
township of Walker
township of Waverly
township of Wilmot

50 township of Forest
Chippewa 70 All except:
60 village of DeTour

township of DeTour
township of Raber

Clare 40 All except:
50 township of Summerfield
township of Winterfield
Clinton 30 All except:
35 city of St. Johns

village of Fowler
village of Maple Rapids
village of Westphalia
township of Bengal
township of Dallas
township of Essex
township of Greenbush
township of Lebanon
township of Westphalia

Crawford 50 All
Delta 60 All except:
70 township of Garden

township of Masonville
township of Nahma

Dickinson 60 All
Eaton 30 All except:
35 village of Mulliken

village of Sunfield
township of Sunfield

Emmet 70 All

Genesee 30 All except:

39




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

25

city of Davison

city of Fenton

city of Grand Blanc
city of Linden

village of Gaines
village of Goodrich
township of Argentine
township of Atlas
township of Davison
township of Fenton
township of Grand Blanc
township of Mundy

Gladwin

40

All

Gogebic

60

All

Grand Traverse

60

All

Gratiot

35

All

Hillsdale

20

All except:

25

city of Litchfield
township of Litchfield
township of Scipio

Houghton

80

All except:

70

township of Adams
township of Chassell
township of Duncan
township of EIm River
township of Laird
township of Portage

90

village of Calumet
village of Copper City
village of Lake Linden
village of Laurium
township of Calumet
township of Schoolcraft

Huron

35

All

Ingham

25

All except:

30

city of East Lansing

city of Lansing

city of Mason

township of Alaiedon
township of Aurelius
township of Delhi
township of Lansing
township of Meridian
township of Williamston

lonia

35

All

40




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

losco 40 All
Iron 60 All
Isabella 40 All except:
35 village of Shepherd

township of Chippewa
township of Coe

township of Fremont
township of Lincoln
township of Union

Jackson 25 All except:

20 village of Brooklyn
township of Columbia
township of Norvell

Kalamazoo 30 All except:

35 city of Parchment
township of Alamo
township of Cooper
township of Oshtemo

Kalkaska 60 All
Kent 35 All except:
40 city of Cedar Springs

village of Casnovia
village of Kent City
village of Sand Lake
village of Sparta
township of Nelson
township of Solon
township of Sparta
township of Tyrone

Keweenaw 90 All except:

100 township of Eagle Harbor
township of Grant
township of Houghton

Lake 60 All except:

50 township of Chase
township of Cherry Valley
township of Ellsworth
township of Pinora
township of Pleasant Plains
township of Yates

Lapeer 25 All except:

41




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

30 village of Clifford
village of Columbiaville
village of North Branch
village of Otter Lake
township of Burlington
township of Burnside
township of Deerfield
township of Marathon
township of North Branch
township of Oregon
township of Rich

Leelanau 60 All
Lenawee 20 All
Livingston 25 All
Luce 70 All
Mackinac 60 All except:

70 township of Newton

township of Portage
Macomb 25 All
Manistee 60 All
Marqguette 70 All except:

60 township of Ewing
township of Wells
township of Republic

Mason 60 All
Mecosta 40 All
Menominee 60 All
Midland 35 All except:

40 city of Coleman
village of Sanford
township of Edenville
township of Geneva
township of Hope
township of Mills
township of Warren

Missaukee 50 All except:

60 township of Bloomfield
township of Caldwell
township of Pioneer

Monroe 20 All
Montcalm 35 All except:

42




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

40 village of Howard City
village of Lakeview
village of Pierson
township of Cato
township of Maple Valley
township of Pierson
township of Reynolds
township of Winfield

Montmorency 50 All
Muskegon 40 All except:
50 township of Holton

township of Blue Lake

60 city of Montague

city of Muskegon

city of Muskegon Heights
city of North Muskegon
city of Norton Shores
city of Roosevelt Park
city of Whitehall
township of Dalton
township of Fruitland
township of Fruitport
township of Laketon
township of Montague
township of Muskegon
township of Sullivan
township of Whitehall
township of White River
village of Fruitport
village of Lakewood Club

Newaygo 40 All except:

50 village of Hesperia
township of Barton
township of Beaver
township of Denver
township of Home
township of Lilley
township of Merrill
township of Troy

Oakland 25 All

Oceana 60 All except:

43




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

50 village of Hesperia
village of Walkersville
township of Colfax
township of Crystal
township of Elbridge
township of Ferry
township of Greenwood
township of Leavitt
township of Newfield
township of Otto

Ogemaw 40 All except:

50 city of Rose City
township of Cummings
township of Foster
township of Goodar
township of Hill
township of Klacking
township of Ogemaw
township of Rose

Ontonagon 70 All except:

60 township of Haight
township of Interior
township of McMillan

Osceola 50 All except:

40 city of Evart

village of Hersey
township of Evart
township of Hersey
township of Orient
township of Osceola
township of Sylvan

Oscoda 50 All
Otsego 50 All except:
60 village of EImira

village of Vanderbilt
township of Corwith
township of Elmira
township of Hayes
township of Livingston

Ottawa 50 All except:

35 township of Georgetown
township of Jamestown
township of Tallmadge

township of Zeeland

44




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

40 city of Coopersville
township of Allendale
township of Blendon
township of Chester
township of Polkton
township of Wright

Presque Isle 50 All except:

60 township of Bearinger
Roscommon 50 All except:

40 township of Nester
Saginaw 35 All except:

30 city of Frankenmuth

village of Birch Run
village of Chesaning
village of Oakley
township of Albee
township of Birch Run
township of Brady
township of Bridgeport
township of Chapin
township of Chesaning
township of Frankenmuth
township of Maple Grove
township of St. Charles

township of Taymouth

Sanilac 30 All except:

25 village of Melvin
township of Fremont
township of Worth

35 village of Minden City

township of Austin

township of Greenleaf
township of Minden

Schoolcraft 70 All
Shiawassee 30 All except:
25 village of Byron
township of Burns
St. Clair 25 All
St. Joseph 30 All except:

45




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

25 city of Sturgis

village of Burr Oak
village of Colon

village of White Pigeon
township of Burr Oak
township of colon
township of Fawn River
township of Sherman
township of Sturgis
township of White Pigeon

Tuscola 30 All except:

35 village of Caro

village of Cass City
village of Fairgrove
village of Gagetown
village of Reese
village of Unionville
township of Akron
township of Almer
township of Columbia
township of Elkland
township of EImwood
township of Fairgrove
township of Gilford
township of Wisner

Van Buren 50 All except:
30 township of Porter
35 city of Gobles

village of Decatur
village of Lawton
village of Mattawan
village of Paw Paw
township of Almena
township of Antwerp
township of Bloomingdale
township of Decatur
township of Paw Paw
township of Pine Grove
township of Waverly

Washtenaw 25 All except:

46




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

20

city of Ann Arbor

city of Saline

city of Ypsilanti

village of Manchester
township of Augusta
township of Bridgewater
township of Lodi
township of Manchester
township of Pittsfield
township of Saline
township of Superior
township of York
township of Ypsilanti

Wayne

20

All except:

25

city of Northville

Wexford

60

All except:

50

township of Clam Lake

47




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30516 Design criteria.
Rule 516. Table R301.2(1) of the code is amended and figures R301.2(7) and R301.2(8) are added to the code to read as follows:

TABLE R 301.2(1)

CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERIA

Show Speed® | Design Design | Underlayment | Hazards® Freezing Annual
Foud Frosthine : e :

Weathering? depth® Termite®

Table See Figure See footnote
R30122(5) Note g R403:3(2 J
ICE
BARRIER
SEISMIC FLOOD AIR
WIND DESIGN DESIGN  SUBJECT TO DAMAGE FROM = UNDERLAY o ArRDs FREEZING MEANANNUAL
MENT . TEMPI
CATEGORY REQUIRED INDEX
Ground
Snow

48



Load

Table
R301.2(4)

Speed? . Special
Topographic .
(mph) K wind
Effects region'
107 No No
Elevation
Latitude

For SI: 1 pound per square foot =0.0479 kllopascals 1 mlle per hour = 0.447 meter /second

Windborne
debris
zonem

No

Altitude
correction
Factor®

Daily range

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

. Frost
Wegt?erl Line Termitec
9 depth®b
R301.2.2.1 Severe 427 g'gglugri Yes

MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA

Coincident Indoor winter design Indoor winter design
wet bulb dry-bulb temperature dry bulb temperature
Indoor
Summer Indoor Summer .
design design relative Lnrd?nggjgmezgaﬁgg
relative humidity y P
Humidity

See Figure
Footnote? R403.3.(2)

Outdoor winter design
dry-bulb temperature

Outdoor summer design
dry-bulb temperature

See Footnote!

Heating
temperature
difference

Cooling
temperature
difference

%M%@M—%%—%%MM@WWhere weatherlng reqmres a hlgher

strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural requirements of this code, the frost line depth

strength required for weathering shall govern. The weathering column shall be filled in with the weathering index,

"negligible,” ""moderate," or

ASTM C652.

49

""severe" for concrete as determined from figure R301.2(1). The grade of masonry units shall be
determined from ASTM C34, ASTM C55, ASTM C62, ASTM C73, ASTM C90, ASTM C129, ASTM C145, ASTM C216, or



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(b) . ode- Where the frost line depth requires deeper
footings than |nd|cated in f|gure R403 1(1) the frost line depth strength required for weathering shall govern. The jurisdiction
shall fill |n the frost I|ne depth column with the m|n|mum depth of foot|ng below finish grade

(©)

oflocal-damage- The Jurlsdlctlon shaII f||| in th|s part of the table to |nd|cate the need for protectlon dependlng on whether
there has been a hlstory of Iocal subterranean termlte damage

(d)

i i Hi is e-With ton-F .Thejurlsdlctlon
shall f|II in th|s part of the table Wlth the Wlnd speed from the baS|c Wlnd speed map, f|gure R301 2(2). W|nd exposure category
shall be determlned on a site- speCIflc baS|s in accordance with sectlon R301.2.1.4.

(e) Thew : v
408.30796- The jurlsdlctlon shaII fill in th|s sectlon of the table to establlsh the de5|gn crlterla usmg table 10A from ACCA
Manual J or established criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

(F}-Design-category-determined-from-section-R301-2-2-1-of the-code: The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the
seismic deslgn category determlned from section R30l 2.2.1.

(9) wing: The Jurlsdlctlon shall fill in this part of the table
with the date of the Jurlsdlctlon S entry into the Natlonal Flood Insurance Program, which is the date of adoption of the first
code or ordinance for management of flood hazard areas, and the title and date of the currently effective Flood Insurance
Study or other rood hazard study

(ih) 3
management—ef—ﬂeed—hazard—areas)-ln accordance W|th sections R905 1. 2 R905 4. 3 1, R905 5. 3 1, R905 6.3.1, R905 7 3 1 and
R905.8.3.1, where there has been a history of local damage from the effects of ice dammlng the Jurlsdlctlon shall fill in this
part of the table with "YES.” OtherW|se the jurlsdlctlon shaII fill in this part of the table with "NO."

W|th+n—theseareas The jurlsdlctlon shaII f|II in this part of the table Wlth the 100 -year return perlod air freezmg |ndex BF-
days from figure R403.3(2) or from the 100- year 99 percent, value on the National Climatic Data Center data table entitled,
"Air Freezmg Index USA Method (Base 32 F)

50



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

|||r|sd|etlen shall :|E||| in thrs—part—et—the—talele—wrth—NQ—“ Z The jurISdICtIOI’l shaII f|II in thls part of the tabIe Wlth the mean annual

temperature from the National Climatic Data Center data table entitled, ""Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°degrees
Fahrenhelt) "

degrees—Fahrenhert)l In accordance Wlth sectlon R301 2 1 5, Where there is Iocal hlstorlcal data documentlng structural damage

to buildings due to topographic wind speed-up effects, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with ""YES.""
OtherW|se the Jurlsdlctlon shaII |nd|cate "NO™ in thls part of the tabIe

AAALREdE-ROa3-] st htm In accordance with flgure

R301 2(2) Where there is Iocal hlstorlcal data documentlng unusual Wlnd condltlons the Jurlsdlctlon shall fill In this part of

the table with ""YES™" and identify any specific requirements. Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO™ in this part of
the table.

(m) In accordance with section R301.2.1.2, the jurisdiction shall indicate the wind-borne debris wind zone or zones.
Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate ""NO™ in this part of the table.

(n) The jurisdiction shall fill in these sections of the table to establish the design criteria using table la or Ib from ACCA
Manual .1 or established criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

(0) The jurisdiction shall fill in this section of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in figures R301.2(3) and R301.2(4).

51


http://www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html
http://www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html
http://www.ncdc.noaa.gov/fpsf.html

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30518 Means of egress.

Rule 518. Sections R311.6.4 and R311.2.1 are added to the code and R311.2 of the code is amended to
read as follows:

R311.6.4 Modular ramps. Modular ramp systems approved pursuant to the act are not required to
comply with the requirements of section R403.1.4 of the code.

R311.2. Door type and size. The required exit door shall be a side-hinged door not less than 3 feet,
{914 mm-millimeters), in width and 6 feet, 8 inches, {2,032 mm-millimeters), in height. Other exterior
hinged or sliding doors shall not be less than 24 inches (6,096 mm millimeters) in width and 6 feet, 6
inches, {1,981 mm-millimeters), in height.

R311.2.1. Interior doors. Interior doors shall be not less than 24 inches, {6,096 mm millimeters), in
width and 6 feet, 6 inches, {1,524 mm-millimeters}, in height.

Exception: Doors to areas less than 10 square feet of floor area.

R 408.30519 Treads and risers.

Rule 519. Sections R311.7.4-5.1 and R 311.7.4-5.2 of the code are amended to read as follows:

R311.7.5.1. Riser height. The maximum riser height shall be 8-1/4 inches, {210 mm-millimeters). The
riser shall be measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The greatest riser height
within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch, {9.5 mm-millimeters).

R311.7.5.2. Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches, {229 mm-millimeters). The
tread depth shall be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost projection of
adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread's leading edge. The greatest tread depth within any flight
of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch, {9.5 mm millimeters). Winder treads shall
have a minimum tread depth of 10 inches, {254 mm-millimeters), measured as above at a point 12
inches, €305 mm millimeters), from the side where the treads are narrower. Winder treads shall have a
minimum tread depth of 6 inches, {152 mm-millimeters}, at any point. Within any flight of stairs, the
greatest winder tread depth at the 12-inch, (305 mm—millimeters), walk line shall not exceed the
smallest by more than 3/8 inch, {9.5 mm-millimeters).

R 408.30521 Elevation-reguirements—Rescinded.

R 408.30521a Rooftop mounted photovoltaic panel systems.

52



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 521a. Sections R9097.1, R9097.2, and R9097.3 of the code are added to read as follows:

R9097.1. General. The installation of photovoltaic panel systems that are mounted on or above the
roof covering shall comply with the provisions of this code, Ssection R324, and NFPA 70.

R9097.2. Structural requirements. Rooftop mounted photovoltaic panel systems shall be designed to
structurally support the system and withstand gravity loads in accordance with chapter 3. The roof upon
which these systems are installed shall be designed and constructed to support the loads imposed by
such systems in accordance with chapter 8.

R9097.3. Installation. Rooftop mounted photovoltaic systems shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions. Roof penetrations shall be flashed and sealed in accordance with this
chapter.

53



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Berrien Al counties | Alger Baraga Gogebic
Branch not listed Charlevoix Dickinson Houghton
Gass Chebeygan Hon Ontonagon
Kalamazoo Chippewa Keweenaw
Macomb Crawford Marquette
Ottawa——St Delta-Emmet
Clai—St losecoKalkaska
Joseph Lake Luce
Mackinac
Meneminee
Missaukee
Meontmeoreney
Ogermaw
Oseceola
Otsego
Roscommon
Sehooleraft
Wexford
R 408.30523 feists: Rescinded.
FIGURER5072.1(1)
- E STAGGER FASTENERS
Nz / IN 2 ROWS
. o q\- il @——‘:_- M [ g:g: ;mai FOR2X 8  “DISTANCE SHALLFE PERMITTED TO
?__°© o _°r REDLCEDTO T OF LAC SoREwS
M T \_ BAND JOISTS, ReTeR
5" MAX. LEDGER LAG SCREW OR BOLT 3/4" MIN,
R408.30523a Flashing. Rescinded.
», o a NN RO /l

54



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

oNTEES LI AT LIRS _—
AT T HiIN G -—

) Il
EFERIeR-SH

EXISTING STUD WALL————»I l k
i

EXISTING 2x BAND JOIST X —

OR ENGINEERED RIM BOARD \
|

| 2/ MIN. ‘/ . ‘«\‘/g,// DECK JOIST
T 1-5/8" MIN. AY
Pal

T W

57 MAX. LAG SCREWS OR BOLTS
2" MIN.

A

R 408.30524 Michigan GHIFOFfH &erdy dode-

Rule 524. ~Butldimgs shall be designed angm gonstructed in accordance with the Michigan uniform
energy code part 10 rules, R 408:3406459 toriR-408:3 0997 kars

.

JOIST HANGER

R 408.30525aéimpl+ﬁed—w&l4—b_raeingu. Rescinded.

R 408.30528a SSST-Rescinded.

55



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30529 Lining required.

Rule 529. Section P2709.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:

P2709.2. Lining required. The adjoining walls and floor framing enclosing on-site built-up shower
receptors shall be lined with 1 of the following:

1. Sheet lead.

2. Sheet copper.

3. Plastic liner material that complies with ASTM D 4068 or ASTM D 4551.

4. Sheet-applied load-bearing, bonded waterproof membranes that comply with ANSI A118.10.

The lining material shall extend not less than 3 inches, {76 mm-millimeters), beyond or around the
rough jambs and not less than 3 inches, {76 mm-millimeters}, above finished thresholds. Sheet-applied
load bearing, bonded waterproof membranes shall be applied in accordance with the manufacturer’s
instructions.

R 408.30530 Requirements for discharge pipe.

Rule 530. Section P2803 4.6.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

P2803 4.6.1. Requirements for discharge pipe. Relief valves shall not discharge so as to be a hazard, a
potential cause of damage, or a nuisance.
A relief valve discharge pipe shall be provided for each individual relief valve and shall meet all of the
following:

(@) Shall terminate atmospherically not more than 4 inches, {102 mm millimeters), from the floor with
an unthreaded end.

(b) Shall not be interconnected.

(c) Valves shall not be connected in the relief valve discharge pipe.

(d) Shall be rigid pipe approved for water distribution, with a minimum temperature rating of 210
degrees Fahrenheit.

(e) Shall have the same nominal inside diameter as the relief valve outlet and shall drain by gravity
flow.

(F) Shall discharge to the floor, or to the pan serving the water heater or storage tank, or to a waste
receptor.

The outlet of a pressure, temperature, or other relief valve shall not be directly connected to the
drainage system.

R 408.30532 Roof extension.

56



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 532. Section P3103.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

P3103.1. Roof extension. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall terminate at least 1 foot,
€305 mm millimeters), above the roof, except that if a roof is to be used for any purpose other than
weather protection, then the vent extension shall be run not less than 7 feet, {2,134 mm millimeters),
above the roof.

R 408.30533 Frost closure.

Rule 533. Section P3103.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:

P3103.2. Frost closure. To prevent frost closure, every vent extension through a roof shall be not less
than 3 inches, {76 mm millimeters), in diameter. Any increase in the size of the vent shall be made
inside the building with a minimum of 1 foot, {305 mm millimetersy}, below the roof or inside the wall.

R 408.30533a Rough plumbing.

Rule 533a. Section P2503.5.1 of the code is amended and P2503.8, P2503.8.1 and P2503.8.2 are
added to read as follows:

P2503.5.1. Rough plumbing. DWV systems shall be tested on completion of the rough piping
installation by water or air with no evidence of leakage. Either test shall be applied to the drainage
system in its entirety or in sections after rough piping has been installed, as follows:

1. Water test. Each section shall be filled with water to a point not less than 10 feet, {3, 048 mm
millimeter}, above the highest fitting connection in that section, or to the highest point in the completed
system. Water shall be held in the section under test for a period of 15 minutes. The system shall prove
leak free by visual inspection.

2. Air test. The portion under test shall be maintained at a gauge pressure of 5 pounds per square inch
(psi), €34 kRa kilopascals), or 10 inches, {254 mm millimeters), of mercury column, {34 kRa
kilopascals). This pressure shall be held without introduction of additional air for a period of 15
minutes.

P2503.8 Inspection and testing of backflow prevention devices. Inspection and testing of
backflow prevention devices shall comply with sections P2503.8.1 and P2503.8.2.

P2503.8.1 Inspections. Inspections shall be made of backflow prevention assemblies to
determine whether they are operable.

P2503.8.2 Testing. Reduced pressure principle, double check, double check detector, and
pressure vacuum breaker backflow preventer assemblies shall be tested at the time of
installation and immediately after repairs or relocation.

R 408.30533b Sewer depth.

Rule 533b. Section P2603.5.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

P2603.5.1. Sewer depth. A building sewer that connects to a private disposal system shall be a
minimum of 8 inches, {203 mm millimeters), to the top of the pipe below finished grade at the point of
septic tank connection. Building sewers shall be installed a minimum of 42 inches, {1,067 mm
millimeters}, below grade.

Exception: When permitted by the code official.

R 408.30533c Pipe fittings.
Rule 533c. Section P2906.6 is added to the code to read as follows:

57



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Pipe Fittings
MATERIAL STANDARD
Acrylonitrile butadiene styrene (ABS) plastic ASTM D2468
Cast-iron ASME B16.4

ASSE 1061; ASTM D2846; ASTM F437; ASTM F438; ASTM

Chlorinat lyvinyl chloride (CPVC) plasti
orinated polyvinyl chloride ( ) plastic F439; CSA B137.6

ASSE 1061; ASME B16.15; ASME B16.18; ASME B16.22;

Copper or copper alloy ASME B16.26; ASME B16.51

Cross-linked polyethylene/aluminum/high-density

ASTM F1986
polyethylene (PEX-AL-HDPE)

ASSE 1061; ASTM F877; ASTM F1807; ASTM F1960; ASTM

Fittings for cross-linked polyethylene (PEX) plastic tubing F2080; ASTM F2098; ASTM F2159; ASTM F2434; ASTM
F2735; CSA B137.5

Gray iron and ductile iron AWWA C110/A21.10; AWWA C153/A21.53

Galvanized steel pipe ASTM A53

Malleable iron ASME B16.3

Insert fittings for

Polyethylene/aluminum/polyethylene (PE-AL-PE) and cross- ASTM F1974; ASTM F1281; ASTM F1282; CSA B137.9; CSA

linked polyethylene/aluminum/cross-linked polyethylene (PEX- B137.10

AL-PEX)

Polyethylene (PE) plastic ASTM D2609; CSA B137.1

Fittings for polyethylene of raised temperature (PE-RT) plastic tubing ASTM F1807; ASTM F2098; ASTM F2159; ASTM F2735;
ASTM F2769

Polypropylene (PP) plastic pipe or tubing ASTM F2389; CSA B137.11

Polyvinyl chloride (PVC) plastic ASTM D2464; ASTM D2466; ASTM D2467; CSA B137.2; CSA
B137.3

Stainless steel (Type 304/304L) pipe ASTM A312; ASTM A778

Stainless steel (Type 316/316L) pipe ASTM A312; ASTM A778

Steel ASME B16.9; ASME B16.11; ASME B16.28

R 408.30534 Venting.

Rule 534. Section P3105.1 is amended and section 3105.4 and figure P3105.4 are added to the code
and figure N3 in appendix N of the code is amended to read as follows:

P3105.1. Distance of trap from vent. Each fixture trap shall have a protecting vent located so that the
slope and the developed length in the fixture drain from the trap weir to the vent fitting are within the
requirements in table P3105.1 of the code.

P3105.4. Vertical leg for waste fixture drains. A vertical leg, {see figure P3105.4)}, is permitted within
a fixture drain of a waste fixture in accordance with the following criteria:

(1) Minimum trap diameter shall be in accordance with table P3201.7 of the code.

(2) The diameter of section A shall be equal to the diameter of the trap.

(3) The length of section A shall not be less than 8 inches, {2,032 mm-millimeters), and in accordance
with table P3105.1 of the code.

(4) The diameter of section B shall be 1 pipe size larger than the diameter of Ssection A.

(5) The length of section B shall not be more than 36 inches, {9,144 mm-millimeters).

(6) The diameter of section C shall be 1 pipe size larger than the diameter of section B.

(7) The total length of section A and section C shall not exceed the distance allowed in table P3105.1
of the code.

(8) Bends shall be the diameter of the largest connected section.

58




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

BEND DIAMETER
= SAME AS SECHIONE

13
- }5
BEND DISMETER - -\
SAME AS SECTION & o=
]—7 [

FIGURE P3105.4
VERTICAL LEG FIXTURE DRAIN SCHEMATIC

i
]
[
B
|
il

=1

Figure N3. Typical horizontal wet venting.

n T
-~
I~
AN
1-;N’/J= b \\\
| \J H
; V/{: b v,
T |B ‘ v W
g R l i
wid o T
™ SA )ﬁ\ Vil /<\J
" \( | 1IN
Doan 3N G L\
: \ T i
- 2lisIN L
. .
A e TN
/- ./
3h
[
3ik /1

Bt Linen = 3540

Note: The lower lavatory connected to the horizontal part of the wet vent illustrates a portion of Sectian P3105.4 Vertical
leg for wasks fixture drains.
FIGURE N3
TYPICAL HORIZONTAL WET VENTING

R 408.30535 Connection.

Rule 535. Section P3111.2.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:

P3111.2.2. Connection. The combination waste and vent systems shall be provided with a dry vent
connected to a point within the system or the system shall connect to a horizontal drain that is vented in

59



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

accordance with one of the methods specified in this chapter. Combination waste and vent systems
connecting to building drains receiving only the discharge from a stack or stacks shall be provided with
a dry vent. The vent connecting the combination waste and vent pipe shall extend vertically not less
than 6 inches, {152 mm millimeters), above the flood level rim of the highest fixture being vented
before offsetting horizontally.

R 408.30536 Electrical; general; electrical conductors; connections and electrical grounding.
Rule 536. Sectlons E3401 1—%491—2—%491%—%105—4—1—%9@&8—1—&9@!—%9@&8—2 of the code are is
added-to

amended 3
read as follows:

E3401.1. Apphieability Scope. This chapter governs the electrical components, equipment and
systems used in buildings and structures covered by this code. Electrical components, equipment
and systems shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the provisions of the Michigan

electrlcal code, R 408.30801 to R 408. 30873. Ih&p#ews—rensef—eh&pte#s&—te%ef—th&eede—sh&”

60



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

61



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

62



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

63



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

B

:
:

g
3

i

F

USE!

Ab

(bbbl

(mp2pdpN|

I

I

I3]0

dbdb3b b6 4b-db b 3b 44

Bl B>

I [>| >

BB

> P>

B>

I

BBl BIPIBRBPP PP %

BPIPB PP EEP PP PE AE

21 (B35 BB 35s> E

LB B] BB BB B

Bl BB BB BB BB

64




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

E
A - A A A = A | =
Ak - Ak Al Al = A=

k
A - A A A = Al A
- - A - |A] = A =
i
- A A =] A - -
A A A =] A - | A
- A A =] A - | A
4.5b¢ 10/ 3 45° | 4| 3¢ | 25 | =
5
126+ 36 36 |19 (1| 36 | 1 | -
2
By
+




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

66



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

67



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30538 Ceombustible-inswlation—Rescinded.

68



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30541a Duct tinstallation.

Rule 541a. Section M1502.4.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:

M1502.4.2. Duct tinstallation. Dryer exhaust ducts shall be supported at 4 foot, {1,219 mm
millimeters), intervals and secured in place. The insert end of the duct shall extend into the adjoining
duct or fitting in the direction of airflow. Ducts shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners that
protrude into the inside of the duct.

R 408.30544 Light, ventilation, and heating.

69



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 544. Section R303.5.2 of the code is amended to read as follows:
R303.5.2. Exhaust openings. Outside exhaust openings shall be located as not to create a nuisance.
Exhaust openings shall not be directed onto walkways. Exhaust openings shall not terminate within 3
feet, 914.4 millimeters, of a ventilated section in a soffit.

R 408.30544b Exterior walls.

Rule 544b. Section R302.5.1 of the code is amended and table R302.1(1) is added to read as follows:

R302.5.1. Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used for sleeping
purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and residence shall be equipped
with solid wood doors not less than 1-3/8 inches, {35 mm—millimeters), in thickness, solid or
honeycomb-core steel doors not less than 1-3/8 inches, {35 mm millimeters), thick, or 20-minute fire-

rated doors.

TABLE R302.1(1)
EXTERIOR WALLS

EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT

MINIMUM FIRE-

MINIMUM FIRE

RESISTANCE RATING SEPARATION
DISTANCE
Walls Fire-resistance rated 1 hour-tested in accordance
with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 < 5 feet
with exposure from both sides
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 5 feet
Not allowed? NA < 2 feet
Projections Fire-resistance rated 1 hour on the underside > 2 feet to < 5 feet
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 5 feet
Opening in walls Not allowed N/A < 3 feet
25% maximum of wall 0 hours 3 feet
area
Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet
Penetrations All Comply with Ssection R302.4 <5 feet
None required 5 feet

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm-millimeters.

70




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

N/A = Not applicable
a. except as allowed as per Ssection R302.1 exceptions 3 and 4

R 408.30545 Masenry-veneerwal-covering-Rescinded.
Rule 545. ~R703.8.2.1,and-R703.8.2.

71



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

WATER-RESISTVE BARRIER

WALLBOARD -
B

=)

INSUL ATION
BETAEEN

aTups -

MAGONRY VENEER

— FLASHING

sTEEL LNTES

—weePHoLE

N - SEALANT

. -
rieure R 703.8 - continued
MASONRY VENEER WALL DETAILD
FOR SI. | INGH # 254 =
3 SEE SECTIONS R1C31S5 R193 1.6 AND R10Z 6.
b SEEC SESTIONS RIOD.2 AND RTOS 1.4
G SEE SSCTKENS RTD3.7.4 2 AND RIO3.T43
d SEE SECTION RIG2T3

T MIK, CLEARANGE GF
374114 (1 mm )

T VEREER TTE

SN

; = —— NATER-RESISTIVE BARRIER

~—— MASONRY MENCER

1IN, AR SPACE OR ¢
1IN, MORTARED SPace’ —.

risurg R 703.8 - continuted
MABONRY VENEER WALL DETAILS
FOR 51 | INGH & 254 mm
3 SEE SECTIONS U035 RIGDI 6 ANG RIGS 8
U BEE ZECTIONG RICE 2 AND F103.74
s SECTIONS R1O3.7.4.2 AND RIG37.43
¢ 3E2 SECTION R703 T3

72



WALLEQARD

SHEATHING ——

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

YENZER TIEh

[N, AR SFACE OR

| IN MORTARED SPACE ©

FLASHING

ANCHOR BOLT -~

GROUTED FUL

FOR 81 1 INCH = 254 mm

BHEATHING

L

Fisuee R 703.8

MASONRY VENEER WALL DETAILS
(CENTINUED)

WNATER-RESISTIVE BARRIER

MASONRY VENEER

FLASHING
WEEFHOLE
STEEL ANGLE NOT
T T 10 5100
BASE FLASHING
FASTENERS

I

SLFFORT BY ROOF CONSTRUCTION
Fioure R 703.8.2.2

= TRIPLE RAFTER:

ATTACHERD TG STUDS

EXTERIOR MASONRY VENEER SUPPORT BY ROOF CONSTRUCTION

73



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

WATER-RESISTIVE BARRIER

SHEATHING — -

IS
o \\14 ——— MASONRY VENEER

B T
STUD ——— N

N \\ Tt WENEER TIE
S

FLASHING

STEEL ANGLE
ATTASHESD TO STUD
WITH FASTENERS .

COUNTERITL ASHING

e - BASE FLASHING

FASTENERS —

— ROOF SHEATHING

T RO TRmMING

SUPFORT BY STEEL ANGLE

Fioure R 703.8.2.1
EXTERIOR MASONRY VENEER SUFFORT BY STCEL ANGLES

R 408.30545a Masenry-heater-clearance—-Rescinded.

74



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

75



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

— 2FT MIN

(®) BonD BEAM %  — F BRICK I BLOCK
SE— -
d [
T — CLEARANCE —
EFFECTIVE
@RUE HE,'\> 10FT MIN 1 AR .Q [l
V] = ==
BOND BEAM . L] 11| FLASHING 8IN
s
P o P /® ANReE WIDTH OF FIREPLACE
OPENING
i
v ; PLAN VIEW
FLUE LINING \_q
== _ ?é»— BOND BREAK
L] BOND BEAM
(® esono eean . A 2
» (8) AncHORAGE ZFTMN e sy
e /
T 1T CLEARANCE —
1 10FT MIN @ K i
RENEORGNG TES U 1 FULL MASONAY 4 d
\"\ WALL oy — Gr) VE_H TICAL
A - ~_  FLASHING
By %
ANCHOR STRAP
WAL £ss VENEER TIE rd
THH
® HARGLE i \{ 4 CLEARANCE DETAIL WITH A B
MOAT, WOOD
sk 1 \ MATERI AL
ain MmN | FF =3 ANCHORAGE 21/ IN. 1 1
“'-<| BOLTS EACH STRAP &+ —
SMOHE — FLUE LNER
@ CHAMBER L \ d | 4
Y r
o L % . 2\ . & =
>| DISTANCE 21 ‘\ \ %
VERTICAL INMIN. papge\8IN
® REINFORCING S—ate— WITH h’/‘\ i) - HORIZONTAL
\< MORTAR i REINFORCING TIES
81N MIN. . "
| I® MEASURE HEIGHT AL 5 |- ‘AN AN
ﬁLE'EE%;;“”-\. | [NETG) T O BIANDNNG 4 .~ 4IN. THICK MASONRY UNITS
d | [ TOP OF FOOTING ;
HEARTH 20 IN. || ExTension  SEETLACE 4 VERTICAL REINFORCING
MIN. FIREBRICK —( I © HEIGHT | 20 IN. LAF IF SPUCED TO
By i LINTEL FOOTING DOWELS
— @ Tess T v HEARTH | R
@ Thickness . 3 EXTENSION FIREBOX WALL
1A = L THICKNESS
Tl soPmB ™
HEARTH SLAS 1
ASH DUMP OPTIONAL REINFORCEMENT | 181M. MIN v FREE STANDING
CLEAN OUT GRADE AW NN FIREPLACE
- 77 V
N7 7773 NN e b P TET VT JZANN
(DFooTNG wioTH —] [+— FOOTING WiDTH (T) E;L%?L

HEARTH 20 IN. MIN

d BARS IN CONCRETE
: FOOTING

BRICK FIREBOX AND CHIMNEY — BRICK FIREBOCX AND BLOCK CHIMNEY —
SECTIONAL SIDE VIEW ON WOOD FLOOR SECTIONAL SIDE VIEW ON CONCRETE SLAB

76



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

77



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

78



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Fable-N1101-10
Climate Zones by County
Zohes
5A 6A +
Allegan Aleona Baraga
Barry Adger Chippewa
Bay Alpena Gogebic
Berrien Antrim Houghton
Branch Arenac fron
Calhoun Benzie Keweenaw

79



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

80



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

81



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

82



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

83



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

84



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

85




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

86




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Emittance = 0.90 As proposed

87




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

88



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

89



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

90



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

91



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Table N1106.4(R406-4)
. i I
Climate-Zone
1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8

%%iﬂq&ﬂﬂﬂﬂ%ﬁﬂg

92



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Administrative Rules for Construction Codes- Part 5. Residential Code
Rule Set 2022-16 LR

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
Thursday, March 21, 2024
09:00 AM

Michigan Library & Historical Center. First Floor Forum
Michigan Historical Center, 702 W Kalamazoo St, Lansing, M1 48915

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs will hold a public hearing to receive
public comments on proposed changes to the Construction Codes- Part 5. Residential Code rule
set.

The proposed rules provide the latest standards to protect the health and promote the safety and welfare
of the State of Michigan residents by regulating residential installation and inspection within the state.

By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by section 4
of the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and
Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL445.2011, 445.2025, and
445.2030

The proposed rules will take effect 120 days after filing with the Secretary of State. The proposed rules
are published on the State of Michigan's website at www.michigan.gov/ARD and in the 3/15/2024 issue
of the Michigan Register. Copies of these proposed rules may also be obtained by mail or electronic
mail at the following email address: Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov.

Comments on these proposed rules may be made at the hearing, by mail, or by electronic mail at the
following addresses until 3/21/2024 at 05:00PM.

Attn: Tony Williamson, Bureau of Construction Codes
P.O. Box 30254, Lansing, MI 48909

Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov

The public hearing will be conducted in compliance with the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act. If
the hearing is held at a physical location, the building will be accessible with handicap parking
available. Anyone needing assistance to take part in the hearing due to disability may call 517-243-
9100 to make arrangements.

93


http://www.michigan.gov/ARD
mailto:Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov
mailto:Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR’S OFFICE
CONSTRUCTION CODE
Filed with the secretary of state on
These rules take effect 120 days after filing with the secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by section 4
of the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and
Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025, and
445.2030)

R 408.30401, R 408.30402, R 408.30409, R 408.30412, R 408.30414, R 408.30415a, R 408.30418, R
408.30419, R 408.30427, R 408.30448d, R 408.30458, R 408.30459, and R 408.30499 of the Michigan
Administrative Code are amended, R 408.30406 and R 408.30406a are added, and R 408.30401a, R
408.30403, R 408.30404, R 408.30408, R 408.30410, R 408.30411, R 408.30428, R 408.30430, R
408.30441, R 408.30442, and R 408.30443 are rescinded, as follows:

PART 4. BUILDING CODE

R 408.30401 Applicable code.

Rule 401. The provisions of the international building code, 2045 2021 edition, including appendices
F, G, and H, except for sections 104.2, 104.3, 104.8, 104.8.1, 104.10, 105.3, 105.3.1, 105.3.2, 105.6,
109.2 to 109.6,-43%:%, 111.2, 111.3,113.2, 113.3, 113.4, 114.1, 114.2, 114.3, 114.4, 115.1 to 115.4,
903.2.8.4, 2902 to 2902.6, Table 2902.1, section 3005.5, the definition of “agricultural building” in
section 202, the definition of "recreational vehicle" in Appendix G, and IECC-2015 2021, IEBC-2015
2021, IMC-2015 2021, IPC-2615 2021, IPSDC-2015 2021, and NFPA 70-2014 2023, listed in chapter
35, govern the construction, alteration, relocation, demolition, use, and occupancy of buildings and
structures, and, with exceptions noted, the international building code is adopted by reference in these
rules. All references to the International Building Code, International Residential Code, International
Energy Conservation Code, National Electrical Code, International Existing Building Code,
International Mechanical Code, and International Plumbing Code mean the Michigan Building Code,
Michigan Residential Code, Michigan Energy Code, Michigan Electrical Code, Michigan Rehabilitation
Code for Existing Buildings, Michigan Mechanical Code, and Michigan Plumbing Code, respectively.
The code is available for inspection; and purchase at the Michigan Department of Licensing and
Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, 611 West . Ottawa Street St;, 2% First Floor
Ottawa Building Lansing, M} Michigan 48933. The code may be purchased from the International
Code Council, through the bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc, at a cost as of the time of
adoption of these amendatory rules of $128-60 $144.00.

R 408.30401a Adultfostercare-facilities-and-childeare-organizations— Rescinded.

94


http://www.michigan.gov/bcc

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30402 Fitle General.

Rule 402. Seetien Sections 101.1 and 101.3 of the code is-are amended to read as follows:

101.1. Title. These rules shall be known as the Michigan building code, hereinrafter and referred to as
"the code."”

101.3. Intent. The purpose of the code and the act is to establish the minimum requirements to
provide a reasonable level of safety, public health, and general welfare through structural
strength, means of egress facilities, stability, sanitation, adequate light and ventilation, energy
conservation, and safety to life and property from fire and other hazards attributed to the built
environment and to provide a reasonable level of safety to firefighters and emergency responders
during emergency operations. The act takes precedence over all provisions of the code.

R 408.30403 Residential-group-R-3-Rescinded.

95



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30404 Duties-and-powers-ofbuilding-official Rescinded.
R ection104-9 of the ais amended-to read 3

R 408.30406 Building Official Right of Entry.

Rule 406. Section 104.6 of the code is added to read as follows:

104.6. Right of entry. If a structure or premises is unoccupied, the building official shall first
make a reasonable effort to locate the owner or other person having charge or control of the
structure or premises and request entry. If a building or premises are occupied, the building
official shall present credentials to the occupant and request entry. If entry is refused, the
building official shall have recourse to the remedies provided by law to secure entry. When a
building official has first obtained a proper inspection warrant or other remedy provided by law
to secure entry, the owner, owner’s authorized agent or occupant, or person having charge, care,
or control of the building or premises shall not fail or neglect, after a proper request is made as
provided in this rule, to allow the building official prompt entry into the building or premises to
inspect or examine the building or premises under this code.

R 408.30406a Required.

Rule 406a. Section 105.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

105.1. Required. Owners or their authorized agents shall obtain the required permit from the
building official before undertaking any construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, relocation,
demolition, change of occupancy, erection, installation, enlargement, alteration, repair, removal,

96



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

conversion, or replacement of electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing, or solar panel systems
regulated by the code.

R 408.30408 Fees Rescinded.
» actinn NO a

R 408.30409 Permit.
Rule 409. Sections10511_and105-1.2 Section 105.2 of the code are is amended to read as follows:
0 nayal-permit—ln-place mdividual bermi cach alterationto-an alres anproved

105.2. Work exempts from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of the code shall not be
deemed to grant authorization for ary work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of
the code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for any-of the
following:

(@) Building permits shall not be required for any-of the following:

(i) One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses and similar
uses, provided-if the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet, {11 square meters m?).

(if) A fence that is not more than 7 feet, {2-meters-134-millimeters mm}, high.

(iii) Oil derricks.

(iv) A retaining wall that is not more than 4 feet,-1,219 millimeters, mm) in height measured from
the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding class I, II,
or II-A liquids.

(v) A water tank supported directly on grade if the capacity is not greater than 5,000 gallons, 18,925
liters, {48-925-1L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width is not greater than 2 to 1.

(vi) A sidewalk and driveway not more than 30 inches, 762 millimeters, {#62-mm} above adjacent
grade and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

(vii) Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, countertops eeunterteps, and similar finish work.

(viii) Temporary motion picture, television, and theater stage sets and scenery.

(ix) Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a group R-3 occupancy, as applicable in section
101.2, that are less than 24 inches, 610 millimeters, {610-mm) deep, are not greater than 5,000 gallons,
18,925 liters, {48-925-1}, and are installed entirely above ground.

(x) Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not including service
systems.

(xi) Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached 1- and 2-family dwellings.

97



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(xii) Window awnings in group R-3 and U occupancies, supported by an exterior wall that do not
project more than 54 inches, 1,372 millimeters, (-372-mm)-from the exterior wall and do not require
additional support, as applicable in section 101.2 and group U occupancies.

(xiii) Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters, and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches,

1,753 millimeters, (3#53-mm)-in height.

(b) Electrical permits shall not be required, as in accordance with the-Michigan-electrical-coderR
408.30801 to R 408.30880, for any-ef the following:

(i) Repairs and maintenance: Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the
connection of approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed receptacles.

(if) Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of the code do not apply to electrical
equipment used for radio and television transmissions, but they do apply to equipment and wiring for
power supply and to the installation of towers and antennas.

(ili) Temporary testing systems: A permit is not required for the installation of any temporary system
required for the testing or servicing of electrical equipment or apparatus.

(c) Mechanical permits shall not be required for any of the following:

(i) A portable gas heating appliance that has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s per hour.

(ii) Portable ventilation appliances and equipment.

(iif) Portable cooling unit.

(iv) Steam, hot water, or chilled water piping within ary heating or cooling equipment or appliances
regulated by this-the code.

(v) Replacement of an ary minor part that does not alter the approval of equipment or an appliance or
make such equipment or appliance unsafe.

(vi) A portable evaporative cooler.

(vii) Self-contained refrigeration systems that contain 10 pounds, 4.5 kilograms, {4-5-kg) or less of
refrigerant, or that are actuated by motors of 1 horsepower, 0.75 Kilowatts, {0-75-kW) or less.

(viii) Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

(ix) An oil burner that does not require connection to a flue, such as an oil stove and a heater equipped
with a wick.

(xX) A portable gas burner that has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s per hour.

(xi) When changing or relocating a gas meter or regulator, a permit is not required when installing gas
piping which-shal-be limited to 10 feet, 3,005 millimeters, {3-085-mm)-in length and not more then
than 6 fittings.

(xii) When installing geothermal vertical closed loops under the supervision of a mechanical
contractor licensed in HVAC, as long as the company meets both the following:

(A) Has obtained a certificate of registration as a well drilling contractor purstant-te-under part 127
of the public health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.12701 to 333.12771.

(B) Has installed the geothermal vertical closed loops in accordance with the department of
environmental-guality environment, Great Lakes, and energy’s best practices regarding geothermal
heat pump closed loops. Exemption from the permit requirements of this grant authorization for work to
be done in violation of the provisions of this the code or other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

(d) Plumbing permits shall not be required for either of the following:

(i) The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste, or vent pipe. However, if any concealed trap,
drainpipe, water, soil, waste, or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and
replace the drain or pipe with new material, then the work is considered new work and a permit shall be
obtained and inspection made as provided in the code.

98



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(if) The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves, or fixtures, and the removal
and reinstallation of water closets, if the repairs do not involve or require the replacement or
rearrangement of valves, pipes, or fixtures.

R 408 30410 #lelanens Rescmded

R 408.30412 Certificate of use and occupancy.
Rule 412. Sectlons 1—1—1—1—&%1—111 2 and 111.2.1 of the code are amended to read as follows

99



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

A change of occupancy shall not be made in any building unless that building complies with the
requirements of the International Building Code for the use or occupancy. Changes of occupancy
in a building or portion thereof shall be such that the existing building is not less compliant with
the provisions of the code than the existing building or structure was before the change. Subject to
the approval of the code official, changes of occupancy shall be permitted without complying with
all the requirements of the code for the new occupancy, provided that the new occupancy is less
hazardous, based on life and fire risk, than the existing occupancy.

111.2.1 Change in the character of use.

0000- Compliance shall be only as necessary to meet the specific provisions and is not intended to
require the entire building be brought into compliance.

R 408.30414 Beard-ofappeals Barrierfree-appealsboard. Barrier free design board
Rule 414. Seetions Section 113 1 and—l—l%% of the code is amended to read as follows

113.1. Means of appeal

Exception—Requests for barrier free design exception shall be in accordance with 1966 PA 1, MCL
$25:1352 125.1351 to 125.1356.

R 408.30415a Definitions.
Rule 415a. The definitions of act; agricuttural-or—agriculturalpurposes,—and—seurce—peint-attic,

uninhabitable with limited storage; cold weather months and attlc unlnhabltable W|th0ut storage

are added, and the definitions of 3
occupiable space and registered design professmnal and—struetere in sectlon 202 of the code are
amended to read as follows:

202. Definitions.

(a) “Act” means the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL

125. 1501 to 125 1531 anMenewna&Haeéﬂtb—Dﬁ%esseﬁ—H&le&ngteetateeenetrueﬂeneed&aet

(b) “Attic, uninhabitable with limited storage” means an uninhabitable attic atties with limited storage
are-these-where the minimum clear height between joists and rafters is 42 inches or greater; 42 inches
high by 24 inches in width, or greater, within the plane of the trusses; or where there are not twe 2 or
more adjacent trusses with web configurations capable of accommodating an assumed rectangle.

(c) “Attic, uninhabitable without storage” means an uninhabitable attic atties without storage are-these
where the maximum clear height between joists and rafters is less than 42 inches; or where there are not
2 or more adjacent trusses with web configurations capable of accommodating an assumed rectangle 42
inches high by 24 inches in width or greater, within the plane of the trusses.

100



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(d) “Cold weather months” means November 1 through April 1 in Michigan Uniform Energy
Code climate zone 5A and from October 15 through May 1 in Michigan Uniform Energy Code
climate zones 6A and 7.

(e) “Occupiable space” means a room or enclosed space designed for regular or non-regular
human occupancy in which individuals congregate for activities, amusement, educational or
similar purposes, or in which occupants are engaged at labor, and which is equipped with means
of egress, heat, light, and ventilation facilities meeting the requirements of the code. Occupiable
space does not include those spaces that are intended primarily for other purposes such as storage
rooms and equipment rooms.

(F) "Registered design professional” means an individual who is licensed under the occupational code,

R 408.30418 Maximum-fleer-area-aHowaneces-per-oceupant-Occupiable space heating systems.
Rule 418. Fable-1004-1-21004-5 1203.1 of the code is amended to read as follows:

1203.1. Equipment and systems. Interior spaces intended for human occupancy shall be provided
with heating facilities capable of maintaining a minimum interior room temperature of 68 degrees

101



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Fahrenheit at a point 3 feet above the floor and 2 feet from exterior walls at the required design
temperature. The installation of portable space heaters shall not be used to comply with this
section.

Exceptions:

(a) Interior spaces where the primary purpose is not associated with human contact.

(b) Group F, H, S, or U occupancies.

(c) Interior, seasonal spaces unoccupied during cold weather months, including restrooms,
shower buildings, day-use restrooms, concession stands, press boxes, ticket booths, and locker
rooms.

MAXIMUM-FLOOR-AREA-ALLOWANCES PER OCCUPANT
FUNCHON-OF SPACE FLOOR AREAIN-SOFTPER
1T N LAA R 4] T TN . .
Aaricultural hildlding 399_%55
I_\sll\.lu UTuUAT UUIIUIIIH
Coneourse 100-gress
Exhibit Gallery and Museum 30 nets
Coneentrated{chatrs-only-netfixed)-Standing 7hets
Space: : 5 nets
Unconcentrated-(tables-and-chairs) 15-nets
- g - ] |
additional-areas
Business areas 100-gress
Rerthan fied .
Day-eare 35-nets
Dormitories 50 gross
Educational
Classroom area 20-nets
Shops and other vocational room areas 50 nets
Lockerrooms 15-gress
Exerciserooms 50-gress
Industrial areas 100 gross

102



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

tional
Inpatient treatment areas 240-gross
Qutpetient—aFeas 100-gross
Sleeping-areas 120-gross
Readrmg—reems 50-nets
Stack-area 100-gross
T buildi and .
Locker rooms 50 gross
Mercantile 60-gross
Parking-garages 200-gross
Restdential 200-gross
KatingFirke_swimm i

Rink-andpeol 50-gress
Decks 15-gress
Stages-and-platforms 15nets
Acecessory-storage-areas,-mechanical

eguipment room 300-gross
Warehouses 500 gross
-For Sk-1 square foot=0.0929-m?

R 408.30419 Toilet room requirements.

Rule 419. Sections 1210.1; is amended and sections 1210.4,1210.5, and 1210.6 are added to the code
to read as follows:

1210.1. Required fixtures. The number and type of plumbing fixtures provided in ary an occupancy
shall comply with the Michigan plumbing code.

1210.4. Toilet room location. Toilet rooms shall not open directly into a room used ferthe-preparation
of to prepare food for service to the public.

1210.5. Baby changing stations. A building or structure that-has-with baby changing stations in the
women's restrooms shall have baby changing stations in the men's restrooms.

1210.6. D+Feet|enal—54gnage D|rect|onal S|gnage |nd|cat|ng the route to the public facilities. shal

o ode- Signage shall be located

ina corrldor or alsle at the entrance to the facilities for customers and visitors indicating the route
to the public facilities.

R 408.30427 Barrier free design for buildings, structures, and improved areas.

103



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 427. Sections-1101:2 1102.1 and-1109-8 of the code are-is amended and section 1103.2.15 is
added to the code to read as follows:

1101.2: 1102.1. Design. Buildings and facilities shall be designed and constructed to be accessible in
accordance with 1966 PA 1, MCL 125.1351 to 125.1356, this the code, and ICC/ANSI A 117.1, except
sections 611 and 707.

1103.2.15. Military, fire service, and police facilities. Housing, bathing, toilet, training, and storage
areas intended for use and occupancy exclusively by military, fire service, police, or security personnel
required to be physically agile are not required to be accessible.

104



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30442 Automatic-sprinklersystems. Rescinded.

105



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30443 Masenry. Rescinded.

106



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30448d Ground snow loads.
Rule 448d. Figure 1608.2 of the code is amended and Table 1608.3 is added to read as follows:
FIGURE 1608.2
Ground Snow Loads

107



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

108



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Table 1608.3
Michigan Ground Snow Loads by Jurisdiction

COUNTY GROUND | JURISDICTIONS
SNOW
LOAD

Alcona 50 All

Alger 70 All

Allegan 50 All except:

35 city of Allegan

city of Otsego

city of Plainwell

city of Wayland
village of Hopkins
village of Martin
township of Allegan
township of Dorr
township of Gun Plain
township of Hopkins
township of Leighton
township of Martin
township of Monterey
township of Otsego
township of Salem
township of Trowbridge
township of Watson
township of Wayland

Alpena 50 All

Antrim 60 All except:

70 township of Banks
township of Central Lake
township of Echo
township of Jordan
township of Warner

Arenac 40 All

Baraga 70 All

Barry 35 All except:

30 village of Nashville
township of Assyria
township of Barry
township of Johnstown
township of Maple Grove

Bay 35 All except:

109




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

40 city of Pinconning
township of Fraser
township of Garfield
township of Gibson
township of Mt. Forest
township of Pinconning

Benzie 60 All
Berrien 50 All
Branch 25 All except:
20 township of Algansee

township of California
township of Gilead
township of Kinderhook
township of Ovid

Calhoun 25 All except:
30 city of Battle Creek
city of Marshall
city of Springfield

village of Athens
township of Athens
township of Battle Creek
township of Bedford
township of Convis
township of Emmet
township of Lee
township of Leroy
township of Marengo
township of Marshall
township of newton
township of Pennfield

Cass 30 All except:

50 city of Dowagiac

village of Cassopolis
village of Edwardsburg
township of Howard
township of La Grange
township of Milton
township of Pokagon
township of Silver Creek
township of Wayne

Charlevoix 70 All

Cheboygan 70 All except:

110




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

60 city of Cheboygan
village of Afton
village of Wolverine
township of Aloha
township of Benton
township of Ellis
township of Grant
township of Koehler
township of Nunda
township of Walker
township of Waverly
township of Wilmot

Chippewa 70 All except:

60 village of DeTour
township of DeTour
township of Raber

Clare 40 All except:
50 township of Summerfield
township of Winterfield
Clinton 30 All except:
35 city of St. Johns

village of Fowler
village of Maple Rapids
village of Westphalia
township of Bengal
township of Dallas
township of Essex
township of Greenbush
township of Lebanon
township of Westphalia

Crawford 50 All
60 All except:
Delta 60 All except:
70 township of Garden

township of Masonville
township of Nahma

Dickinson 60 All
Eaton 30 All except:
35 village of Mulliken

village of Sunfield
township of Sunfield

Emmet 70 All

Genesee 30 All except:

111




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

25

city of Davison

city of Fenton

city of Grand Blanc
city of Linden

village of Gaines
village of Goodrich
township of Argentine
township of Atlas
township of Davison
township of Fenton
township of Grand Blanc
township of Mundy

Gladwin

40

All

Gogebic

60

All

Grand Traverse

60

All

Gratiot

35

All

Hillsdale

20

All except:

25

city of Litchfield
township of Litchfield
township of Scipio

Houghton

80

All except:

70

township of Adams
township of Chassell
township of Duncan
township of EIm River
township of Laird
township of Portage

90

village of Calumet
village of Copper City
village of Lake Linden
village of Laurium
township of Calumet
township of Schoolcraft

Huron

35

All

Ingham

25

All except:

30

city of East Lansing

city of Lansing

city of Mason

township of Alaiedon
township of Aurelius
township of Delhi
township of Lansing
township of Meridian
township of Williamston

112




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

lonia

35

All

losco

40

All

lron

60

All

Isabella

40

All except:

35

village of Shepherd
township of Chippewa
township of Coe
township of Fremont
township of Lincoln
township of Union

Jackson

25

All except:

20

village of Brooklyn
township of Columbia
township of Norvell

Kalamazoo

30

All except:

35

city of Parchment
township of Alamo
township of Cooper
township of Oshtemo

Kalkaska

60

All

Kent

35

All except:

40

city of Cedar Springs
village of Casnovia
village of Kent City
village of Sand Lake
village of Sparta
township of Nelson
township of Solon
township of Sparta
township of Tyrone

Keweenaw

90

All except:

100

township of Eagle Harbor
township of Grant
township of Houghton

Lake

60

All except:

50

township of Chase
township of Cherry Valley
township of Ellsworth
township of Pinora
township of Pleasant Plains
township of Yates

Lapeer

25

All except:

113




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

30 village of Clifford
village of Columbiaville
village of North Branch
village of Otter Lake
township of Burlington
township of Burnside
township of Deerfield
township of Marathon
township of North Branch
township of Oregon
township of Rich

Leelanau 60 All
Lenawee 20 All
Livingston 25 All
Luce 70 All
Mackinac 60 All except:
70 township of Newton
township of Portage
Macomb 25 All
Manistee 60 All
Marquette 70 All except:
60 township of Ewing

township of Wells
township of Republic

Mason 60 All
Mecosta 40 All
Menominee 60 All
Midland 35 All except:
40 city of Coleman

village of Sanford
township of Edenville
township of Geneva
township of Hope
township of Mills
township of Warren

Missaukee 50 All except:

60 township of Bloomfield
township of Caldwell
township of Pioneer

Monroe 20 All

Montcalm 35 All except:

114




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

40 village of Howard City
village of Lakeview
village of Pierson
township of Cato
township of Maple Valley
township of Pierson
township of Reynolds
township of Winfield

Montmorency 50 All
Muskegon 40 All except:
50 township of Holton
township of Blue Lake
60 city of Montague

city of Muskegon

city of Muskegon Heights
city of North Muskegon
city of Norton Shores
city of Roosevelt Park
city of Whitehall
township of Dalton
township of Fruitland
township of Fruitport
township of Laketon
township of Montague
township of Muskegon
township of Sullivan
township of Whitehall
township of White River
village of Fruitport
village of Lakewood Club

Newaygo 40 All except:

50 village of Hesperia
township of Barton
township of Beaver
township of Denver
township of Home
township of Lilley
township of Merrill
township of Troy

Oakland 25 All

Oceana 60 All except:

115




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

50 village of Hesperia
village of Walkersville
township of Colfax
township of Crystal
township of Elbridge
township of Ferry
township of Greenwood
township of Leavitt
township of Newfield
township of Otto

Ogemaw 40 All except:

50 city of Rose City
township of Cummings
township of Foster
township of Goodar
township of Hill
township of Klacking
township of Ogemaw
township of Rose

Ontonagon 70 All except:

60 township of Haight
township of Interior
township of McMillan

Osceola 50 All except:

40 city of Evart

village of Hersey
township of Evart
township of Hersey
township of Orient
township of Osceola
township of Sylvan

Oscoda 50 All
Otsego 50 All except:
60 village of EImira

village of Vanderbilt
township of Corwith
township of EImira
township of Hayes
township of Livingston

Ottawa 50 All except:

35 township of Georgetown
township of Jamestown
township of Tallmadge
township of Zeeland

116




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

40 city of Coopersville
township of Allendale
township of Blendon
township of Chester
township of Polton
township of Wright

Presque isle 50 All except:
60 township of Bearinger
Roscommon 50 All except:
40 township of Nester
Saginaw 35 All except:
30 city of Frankenmuth

village of Birch Run
village of Chesaning
village of Oakley
township of Albee
township of Birch Run
township of Brady
township of Bridgeport
township of Chapin
township of Chesaning
township of Frankenmuth
township of Maple Grove
township of St. Charles
township of Taymouth

Sanilac 30 All except:

25 village of Melvin
township of Fremont
township of Worth

35 village of Minden City
township of Austin
township of Greenleaf
township of Minden

Schoolcraft 70 All
Shiawassee 30 All except:
25 village of Byron
township of Burns
St. Clair 25 All
St. Joseph 30 All except:

117




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

25 city of Sturgis

village of Burr Oak
village of Colon

village of White Pigeon
township of Burr Oak
township of Colon
township of Fawn River
township of Sherman
township of Sturgis
township of White Pigeon

Tuscola 30 All except:

35 village of Caro

village of Cass City
village of Fairgrove
village of Gagetown
village of Reese
village of Unionville
township of Akron
township of Almer
township of Columbia
township of Elkland
township of EImwood
township of Fairgrove
township of Gilford
township of Wisner

Van Buren 50 All except:
30 township of Porter
35 city of Gobles

village of Decatur
village of Lawton
village of Mattawan
village of Paw Paw
township of Almena
township of Antwerp
township of Bloomingdale
township of Decatur
township of Paw Paw
township of Pine Grove
township of Waverly

Washtenaw 25 All except:

118




2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

20 city of Ann Arbor

city of Saline

city of Ypsilanti

village of Manchester
township of Augusta
township of Bridgewater
township of Lodi
township of Manchester
township of Pittsfield
township of Saline
township of Superior
township of York
township of Ypsilanti

Wayne 20 All except:
25 city of Northville
Wexford 60 All except:
50 township of Clam Lake

R 408.30458 Elevators and conveying systems.

Rule 458. Sections 3001.1, 3061-2,-3061-4, 3001.5, 3002.5, 36626, 3003.1, and 3003.2; of the code
are amended, and sections 3001-2.1,-3661-2.2 3003.1.5 and 3004.5 are added to the code to read as
follows:

3001.1. Scope. The design, construction, installation, alteration, and repair of elevators and conveying
systems and their equipment shall conform with the requirements of the Michigan elevator laws and
rules, including 1967 PA 227, MCL 408.801 to 408.824; 1976 PA 333, MCL 338.2151 to 338.2160;
and R 408.7001 to R 408.8695; and this chapter. Installation or construction in flood hazard areas
established in sectlon 1612 3 shall comply Wlth ASCE 24 listed i in chapter 35

30014- 3001.5 Change in use. A change in use of an elevator from freight to passenger, passenger to
freight, or from 1 freight class to another freight class shall comply with the requirements of the
Michigan-elevator-code; R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.

3002.5. Emergency doors. Where an elevator is installed in a single blind hoistway or on the outside
of a building, there shall be installed in the blind portion of the hoistway or blank face of the building, an
emergency door in accordance with the requirements of the-Michigan-elevatorcode; R 408.7001 to R
408. 8695

3003.1. Standby power. In buildings and structures where, standby power is required or furnished to
operate an elevator, the operation shall be in accordance with sections 3003.1.1 to 3003.1.5 of the code.
3003.1.5. Lighting. Where standby power is connected to elevators, the machine room, car top, pit,

and landing lighting shall be connected to the standby power source.

119



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

3003.2 Fire-fighters™ Firefighters” emergency operation Elevators shall be provided with phase |
emergency recall operation and phase Il emergency in-car operation in accordance with the

requirements of the-Michigan-elevatorcode; R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.

3004.5. Construction at bottom of hoistway. Pits extending to the ground shall have noncombustible
floors and be designed as to prevent the entry of greund-water-groundwater into the pit. The pit floor
of any hoistway not extending to the ground shall be of fire-resistive construction, having a fire-
resistance rating at least equal to that required for the hoistway enclosure.

R 408.30459 Elevators.

Rule 459. Sections 1009.4 and 466+9-1 1607.11.1 of the code are amended to read as follows:

1009.4. Elevators. To be considered part of an accessible means of egress, an elevator shall be-ia
comphianee comply with the emergency operation and signaling device requirements of the Michigan
elevatorecede; R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.

160791 1607.11.1. Elevators. Elevator loads shall be increased by 100% for impact and the
structural supports shall be designed within the limits of deflection prescribed by the-Michigan-elevator
code; R 408.7001 to R 408.8695.

R 408.30499 Adoption of standards by reference; referenced codes.

Rule 499. Chapter 35 of the code is amended to add the following referenced codes, which are
available for inspection and purchase from the Michigan Department of Licensing and Regulatory
Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, 2501 \Weodlake-Circle, Okemeos,-Michigan-48864 611 West
Ottawa, Lansing, Michigan 48933, each at a cost as of the time of adoption of these rules of:
Michigan Electrical Code $131.00, Michigan Mechanical Code $87.50, Michigan Plumbing Code
$87.50, Michigan Uniform Energy Code $49.00, Michigan Elevator Code $89.50, and Michigan
Skilled Trades Regulation Rule Part 9 Boiler $0:

(@) Michigan Electrical Code R 408.30801 to R 408.30880 of the Michigan

Administrative Code.

(b) Michigan Mechanical Code R 408.30901 to R 408.30998 of the Michigan
Administrative Code.

(c) Michigan Plumbing Code R 408.30701 to R 408.30796 of the

Michigan Administrative Code.

(d) Michigan Uniform Energy Code R 408.31001 to R 408.31086 of the Michigan
Administrative Code.

(e) Michigan Elevator Code R 408.7001 to R 408.8695 of the

Michigan Administrative Code.
(F) Michigan BeHerCode-Skilled Trades Regulation Rules Part 9 Boiler R 408.4001 R
339.5171 to R-408:5609-408-5507 R 339.5253 of the Michigan Administrative Code.

120



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Administrative Rules for Construction Code- Part 4. Building Code
Rule Set 2022-57 LR

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
Thursday, April 4, 2024
09:00 AM

Michigan Library & Historical Center. First Floor Forum
Michigan Historical Center, 702 W Kalamazoo St, Lansing, M1 48915

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs will hold a public hearing to receive
public comments on proposed changes to the Construction Code- Part 4. Building Code rule
set.

The proposed rules provide the latest standards to protect the health and promote the safety and welfare
of the State of Michigan residents by regulating building installation and inspection within the state.

By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by section 4
of the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and
Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL445.2011, 445.2025, and
445.2030

The proposed rules will take effect 120 days after filing with the Secretary of State. The proposed rules
are published on the State of Michigan's website at www.michigan.gov/ARD and in the 3/15/2024 issue
of the Michigan Register. Copies of these proposed rules may also be obtained by mail or electronic
mail at the following email address: Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov.

Comments on these proposed rules may be made at the hearing, by mail, or by electronic mail at the
following addresses until 4/4/2024 at 05:00PM.

Attn: Tony Williamson, Bureau of Construction Codes
P.O. Box 30254, Lansing, MI 48909

Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov

The public hearing will be conducted in compliance with the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act. If
the hearing is held at a physical location, the building will be accessible with handicap parking
available. Anyone needing assistance to take part in the hearing due to disability may call 517-243-
9100 to make arrangements.

121


http://www.michigan.gov/ARD
mailto:Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov
mailto:Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR’S OFFICE
CONSTRUCTION CODE

Filed with the secretary of state on

These rules become effective 120 days after filing with the secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by section 4
of the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and
Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL 445.2011, 445.2025, and
445.2030)

R 408.30551, R 408.30557, R 408.30558, R 408.30560, R 408.30561, R 408.30564, and R 408.30571 of
the Michigan Administrative Code are amended, and R 408.30556, R 408.30559, R 408.30562, R
408.30565, R 408.30565a, R 408.30566, R 408.30568, R 408.30570, R 408.30572, R 408.30573, R
408.30574, R 408.30575, and R 408.30576 are rescinded, as follows:

REHABILITATION CODE

R 408.30551 Applicable code.

Rule 551. The international eX|st|ng building code, 2045 2021 edition, including appendix A and
resource A, hereinafter referred to in these rules as "the code,” is adopted by reference-as-provided-in
section-32(4)-of the- Administrative Procedures-Act 01969 MCL24-232; as the "Michigan
rehabilitation code for existing buildings™ with the exception of sections 103.1;to 103.3, 104.8, 104.8.1,
104.10, 105.3; to 105.3.2, 108.2 to 108.6, 110.2, 110.3, 112.1; to 112.4, 113.1; to 113.3, 114.1;-334.3; to
114.4,705.1.1 to 705.2, 806.2, and Appendix B and C, and as otherwise noted in these rules. The
international existing building code, 2045 2021 edition is available for inspection at the Michigan
Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Construction Codes, 611 West- Ottawa
Street, 2% First Floor Ottawa Building, Lansing, Michigan 48933. The code may be purchased from the
International Code Council, through the bureau’s website at www.michigan.gov/bcc, at a cost as of the
time of adoption of these rules of $81.00 $77.50.

101.3 Purpose: The purpose of the code and the act is to provide the use of alternative
approaches to achieve compliance with minimum requirements to provide a reasonable level of
safety, health, property protection, and general welfare insofar as they are affected by the repair,
alteration, change of occupancy, addition, and relocation of existing buildings. The act takes
precedence over all provisions of the code.

R 408.30556 Elevators: Rescinded.

122


http://www.michigan.gov/bcc,

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30557 Definitions.

Rule 557. The definitions of act-butding-efficial-and registered design professional in the act are
added to section 202 of the code to read as follows:

202. Definitions.

(@) "Act" means the Stille-DeRossett- Hale single state constructlon code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL

(b) "Registered design professional™ means aﬁ individual who is licensed under the occupational
code, 1980 PA 299, MCL 339.101 to 339.2949 2677.

R 408.30558 Preliminary meeting.

Rule 558. Section 104.2.2 of the code is amended and 104.6 is added to read as follows:

104.2.2. Preliminary meeting. When requested by the owner or owner’s agent, the building official
shall meet with the owner or the owner’s agent to discuss plans for the proposed work or change of
occupancy before the application for a construction permit in order to establish the specific applicability
of the provisions of this the code. The building official shall notify the appropriate fire official of the
meeting.

Exception: Repairs, and alterations level 1.

104.6 Right of entry: If a building or premises are occupied, the code official shall present their
credentials to the occupant and request entry. If a building or premises are unoccupied, the code
official shall first make a reasonable effort to locate either the owner, the owner’s authorized
agent, or another individual having care or control of the building or premises and request entry.
If entry is refused, the code official has recourse to every remedy provided by law to secure entry.
When a code official has first obtained a proper inspection warrant or other remedy provided by
law to secure entry, the owner, the owner’s authorized agent, the occupant, or the individual
having charge, care, or control of the building or premises shall not fail or neglect, after a proper
request is made as provided in this rule, to allow the code official prompt entry into the building
or premises to inspect or examine the building or premises pursuant to the code.

R 408.30559-Pretiminary-review—Rescinded.

123



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30560 Anndalpermit. Permits.
Rule 560. Sections 105.1-4-105-1.2-and-of the code is being added and 105.2 of the code is amended

as follows:
105.1 Required: Owners or their authorized agents shall obtain the required permit from a
building official before undertaking any construction, enlargement, alteration, repair, relocation,
demolition, change of occupancy, erection, installation, enlargement, alteration, repair, removal,
conversion, or replacement of electrical, gas, mechanical, plumbing, or solar panel systems
regulated by the code.
() narm

105.2. Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of the code shall not be
deemed-te grant authorization for any work te-be done in any manner in violation of the code or any
other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for any-ef the following:

(a) Building permits shall not be required for any-efthe following:

(i) One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, playhouses, and similar
uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet, {11.15 square meters m?).

(ii) A fence that is not more than 7 feet, {134 millimeters, mm) high.

(iii) Oil derricks.

(iv) A retaining wall that is not more than 4 feet, {1,219 millimeters, mm} in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding class I, 11, or
I1-A liquids.

(v) A water tank supported directly on grade if the capacity is not greater than 5,000 gallons, {18 925
liters, &) and the ratio of height to diameter or width is not greater than 2 to 1.

(vi) A sidewalk and driveway not more than 30 inches, {762 millimeters, mm) above adjacent grade
and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

(vii) Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, countertops eeunterteps, and similar finish work.

(viii) Temporary motion picture, television, and theater stage sets and scenery.

(ix) Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a group R-3 occupancy, as applicable in section 101.2,
that are less than 24 inches, {610 millimeters, mm)-deep, are not greater than 5,000 gallons, {18,925
liters, &) and are installed entirely above ground.

(x) Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes and not including service
systems.

(xi) Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached 1- and 2-family dwellings.

(xii) Window awnings in group R-3 and U occupancies, supported by an exterior wall that do not
project more than 54 inches, €1,372 millimeters, mm) from the exterior wall and do not require
additional support, as applicable in section 101.2.

(xiit) Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters, and partitions not over 5 feet 9 inches,
€1,753 millimeters, mm) in height.

124



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(b) Electrical permits shall not be required, as ir-accerdance-with pursuant to the Michigan-electrical
eoede; R 408.30801 to R 408.30880, for any-of the following:

(i) Repairs and maintenance: Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the connection
of approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed receptacles.

(if) Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of the code do not apply to electrical
equipment used for radio and television transmissions, but they do apply to equipment and wiring for
power supply and to the installation of towers and antennas.

(iii) Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the installation of any temporary
system required for the testing or servicing of electrical equipment or apparatus.

(c) Mechanical permits shall not be required for any-of the following:

(i) A portable gas heating or gas appliance that has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s per hour.

(ii) Portable ventilation appliances and equipment.

(iii) A Pertable portable cooling unit.

(iv) Steam, hot water, or chilled water piping within ary heating or cooling equipment or appliances
regulated by the code.

(v) Fhereplacement Replacement of any a minor part that does not alter the approval of equipment or
an appliance or make steh the equipment or appliance unsafe.

(vi) A portable evaporative cooler.

(vii) Self-contained refrigeration systems that contain 10 pounds, {4.5 kilograms, kg) or less of
refrigerant, or that are actuated by motors of 1 horsepower, {0.75 kilowatts, kA4 or less.

(viii) Portable fuel cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and are not
interconnected to a power grid.

(ix) An oil burner that does not require connection to a flue, such as an oil stove and a heater equipped
with a wick.

(x) A portable gas burner that has inputs of less than 30,000 Btu’s per hour.

—{xi) (xi) When changing or relocating a gas meter or regulator, a permit is not required when installing
gas piping which shall be limited to 10 feet, (3,005 millimeters, mm) in length and not more ther than
6 fittings.

©)-(xi1) When installing geothermal vertical closed loops under the supervision of a mechanical
contractor licensed in heating, ventilation and air conditioning, {“HVAC” } as long as the company
meets both of the following:

(A) Has obtained a certificate of registration as a well drilling contractor pursuant to part 127 of the
public health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.12701 to 333.12771.

(B) Has installed the geothermal vertical closed loops ir-aceerdanee-with pursuant to the department
of environmental-guality environment, Great Lakes, and energy best practices regarding geothermal
heat pump closed loops.

Exemption from the permit requirements of this the code shall not be deemed to grant authorization
for work te-be-done in violation of the provisions of the this code or other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction.

(d) Plumbing permits shall not be required for either of the following:

(i) The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste, or vent pipe. However, if any concealed trap,
drainpipe, water, soil, waste, or vent pipe becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and
replace the drain or pipe with new material, then the work is considered new work and a permit shall be
obtained and inspection made as provided in the code.

(if) The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves, or fixtures, and the removal
and reinstallation of water closets, if the repairs do not involve or require the replacement or
rearrangement of valves, pipes, or fixtures.

125



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30561 Accessibility.

Rule 561. Sections 410-1,-410.6.410-7-410.8.2anrd-410.8.3 306.1, 306.7, 306.7.7, and 306.7.8 of the
code are amended as follows:

410:1. 306.1. Scope. A building, facility, or element that has a change in use group or occupancy load

or alteratlon shaII comply #n-aceerdanee with the requirements of the-utilization-efpublicfacHities by

1966 PA 1, MCL 125.1351 to 125.1356, and the-Michigan-buHding-code; R
408.30401to R 408 30499a.

410-6- 306.7. Alterations. A building, facility, or element that is altered shall comply with the
applicable provisions in chapter 11 of the Michigan building code and ICC/A117.1 listed in chapter 16,
of the Michigan building code unless technically infeasible. When compliance with this section is
technically infeasible, then the alteration shall provide access to the maximum extent technically
feasible.

Exceptions:

(1) The altered element or space is not required to be on an accessible route, unless required by section
410-7 306.7.2 of the code.

(2) Accessible means of egress required by chapter 10 of the Michigan building code are not required
to be provided in existing buildings and facilities.

(3) Buildings, structures, or improved areas which that exist on or before the effective date of these
rules and which are-in-comphanee comply with the code at the time of the issuance of the certificate of
occupancy unless the alteration specifically modifies an area covered by sections 410-6 306.7 to 306.7.7
of the code.

(4) The alteration to type A individually owned dwelling units within a group R-2 occupancy shall
meet the provisions for a type B dwelling unit and shall comply with the applicable provisions in chapter
11 of the Michigan building code and ICC/A 117.1 listed in chapter 16 of the Michigan building code.

410-7. 306.7.2 Alterations affecting an area containing a primary function. Where an alteration affects
the accessibility to, or contains an area of, primary function, the route to the primary function area shall
be accessible. The accessible route to the primary function area shall include toilet facilities and drinking
fountains serving the area of primary function.

Exceptions:

5 (a) This provision does not apply to alterations limited solely to windows, hardware, operating
controls, electrical outlets, and signs.

—2) (b) This provision does not apply to alterations limited solely to mechanical systems, electrical
systems, installation or alteration of fire protection systems, and abatement of hazardous materials.

£3) (c) This provision does not apply to alterations undertaken for the primary purpose of increasing the
accessibility of an existing building, facility, or element.

4} (d) This provision does not apply to altered areas limited to type B dwelling and sleeping units.

410.8-2. 306.7.7. Elevators. Altered elements of existing elevators shall comply with the Michigan
elevator code, R 408.7001 to R 408.8695. Sueh These elements shall also be altered in elevators
programmed to respond to the same hall call control as the altered elevator.

410.8-3- 306.7.8. Platform lifts. Platform or {wheelchair} lifts complying with ICC/A 117.1 listed in
chapter 16 of the Michigan building code, and installed in accordance with the Michigan elevator code,
R 408.7001 to R 408.8695 shall be permitted allowed as a component of an accessible route.

R 408.30562 Submittal-of documents: Rescinded.

126



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30564 Elevator control.

Rule 564. Section 14061614 1301.6.14 of the code is amended as follows:

1401.6.14. Elevator control. Evaluate the passenger elevator equipment and controls that are available
to the fire department to reach all occupied floors. Elevator recall controls shall be provided
accordance-with pursuant to the Michigan elevator code, R 408.7001 to R 408.8695. Under the
categories and occupancies in table 1401.6.14, determine the appropriate value and enter that value into
table 1401.7 under safety parameter 1401.6.14, elevator control, for fire safety, means of egress, and
general safety. The values shall be zero for a single-story building.

R 408.30565-Payment-of fees—Rescinded.

R 408.30565

R 408.30566-Smoke-alarm-locations—Rescinded.

127



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

128



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 408.30570 Beard-ofappeals—Rescinded.

R 408.30571 Violation penalties.

Rule 571. Section 109.6 is added and Seetien section 113.4 of the code is amended as follows:

109.6 Approval required: Work shall not be done beyond the point indicated in each successive
inspection without first obtaining the approval of the building official. The building official on
notification shall make the requested inspections and shall either indicate the portion of the
construction that is satisfactory as completed, or shall notify the permit holder or agent of the
permit holder where a portion of the construction fails to comply with the code. The notification
shall include specific reference to the code chapter and section numbers in violation in writing.
Any portions that no do not comply shall be corrected and such portion shall not be covered or
concealed until authorized by the building official. Neither the code official or the authority
having jurisdiction are liable for expense entailed in the removal or replacement of material
required to allow inspection.

113.4 Violation penalties.

(1) Itis unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation to violate a provision of this the code or fail to
conform with ary-ef the requirements thereof, or erect, construct, alter, extend, repair, move, remove,
demolish, or occupy any building, structure, or equipment regulated by the this code, or cause work to
be performed or done in conflict with or in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the enforcing agency or a permit or certificate issued under this the code.

129



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(2) A violator shall be assessed a fine in accordance with the act- and may be subject to a review that
could result in licensing action pursuant to the skilled trades regulation act, 2016 PA 407, MCL
339.5101 to 339.6133.

R 408.30572 Stop-werk-erder—Rescinded.

R 408.30573 Change-of-oceupancy-—Rescinded.

R 408.30574 Aceessibiity—Rescinded.

130



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

131



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Construction Codes
Administrative Rules for Rehabilitation Code
Rule Set 2022-58 LR

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
Thursday, April 4, 2024
01:00 PM

Michigan Library & Historical Center. First Floor Forum
Michigan Historical Center, 702 W Kalamazoo St, Lansing, M1 48915

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs will hold a public hearing to receive
public comments on proposed changes to the Rehabilitation Code rule set.

The proposed rules provide the latest standards to protect the health and promote the safety and welfare
of the State of Michigan residents by regulating existing building installation and inspection within the
state.

By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by section 4
of the Stille-DeRossett-Hale single state construction code act, 1972 PA 230, MCL 125.1504, and
Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 2003-1, 2008-4, and 2011-4, MCL445.2011, 445.2025, and
445.2030

The proposed rules will take effect 120 days after filing with the Secretary of State. The proposed rules
are published on the State of Michigan's website at www.michigan.gov/ARD and in the 3/15/2024 issue
of the Michigan Register. Copies of these proposed rules may also be obtained by mail or electronic
mail at the following email address: Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov.

Comments on these proposed rules may be made at the hearing, by mail, or by electronic mail at the
following addresses until 4/4/2024 at 05:00PM.

Attn: Tony Williamson, Bureau of Construction Codes
P.O. Box 30254, Lansing, MI 48909

Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov

The public hearing will be conducted in compliance with the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act. If
the hearing is held at a physical location, the building will be accessible with handicap parking
available. Anyone needing assistance to take part in the hearing due to disability may call 517-243-
9100 to make arrangements.

132


http://www.michigan.gov/ARD
mailto:Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov
mailto:Lara-bcc-rules@michigan.gov

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR’S OFFICE
ACUPUNCTURE - GENERAL RULES
Filed with the secretary of state on

These rules become effective immediately after filing with the secretary of state unless adopted under
section 33, 44, or 45a(9) of the administrative procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.233,
24.244, or 24.245a. Rules adopted under these sections become effective 7 days after filing with the
secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by sections
16141, 16145, 16148, 16174, 16201, 16204, 16205, 16287, 16515, 16517, and 16525 of the public
health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.16141, 333.16145, 333.16148, 333.16174, 333.16201, 333.16204,
333.16205, 333.16287, 333.16515, 333.16517, and 333.16525 and Executive Reorganization Order Nos.
1991-9, 1996-2, 2003-1, and 2011-4, MCL 338.3501, 445.2001, 445.2011, and 445.2030)

R 338.13001, R 338.13004, R 338.13031, and R 338.13033 of the Michigan Administrative Code are
amended, as follows:

PART 1. GENERAL RULES

R 338.13001 Definitions.

Rule 1. (1) As used in these rules:

(a) “Board” means the Michigan board of acupuncture created under section 16521 of the public
health code, MCL 333.16521.

(b) “Code” means the public health code 1978 PA 368, MCL 333.1101 to 333.25211.

(c) “Department” means the department of licensing and regulatory affairs.

(d) “NCCAOM” means the National Certification Commission for Acupuncture and Oriental
Medicine.

(e) “PDA” means a continuing education course or activity approved by the NCCAOM as a
professional development activity.

(2) Terms defined in the code have the same meanings when used in these rules.

R 338.13004 Approval and adoption of examinations; approval and adoption of
standards of competence.
Rule 4. (1) The board approves and adopts the examlnatlons developed scored and requwed for
certification by the N3 3 3 al-\
{NCCAOM).
(2) The board approves and adopts the NCCAOM national standards of competence in acupuncture and
Oriental medicine as set forth in the document titled, “NCCAOM Certification Handbook,” effective
January-1,-2019 June 2023. The document is available for inspection and distribution at the cost of 10

133



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

cents per page from the Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Professional
Licensing at 611 W= West Ottawa St: Street, P.O. Box 30670, Lansing, Michigan 48909 and at no cost
from NCCAOM at https://www.nccaom.org/wp-

content/uploads/pdf/NCCAOM _Certification_Handbook Sept 2023.pdf or National Certification
Commission for Acupuncture and Oriental Medicine, 2025-M-Street- NW,-Suite-800 2001 K Street
NW, 3 Floor North, Washington, DC 20036 20006.

PART 3. LICENSE RENEWAL, LIMITED LICENSE RENEWAL, AND CONTINUING
EDUCATION

R 338.13031 Renewal of acupuncturist license; renewal of limited license;

requirements; limitations; waiver request.

Rule 31. (1) Pursuant to section 16517 of the code, MCL 333.16517, an applicant for renewal of a
license or limited license, who has been licensed for the 2-year period immediately preceding the
expiration date of the license, shall satishy-the-regquirements-o0f R-338-7001t6-R-338.7005-and
accumulate 30 hours of continuing education related to the practice of acupuncture and approved by the
board pursuant to these rules, during the 2 years before the expiration date of the license.

(2) An applicant shall satisfy the implicit bias training standards requirements of R 338.7004.
The licensee may count the hours earned satisfying the requirements of R 338.7004 as part of the
30 hours of continuing education required under subrule (1) of this rule if the hours were earned
by participating in a course or activity approved by the NCCAOM.

2)(3) An applicant for renewal of a license or a limited license shall accumulate at least 5 hours of the
continuing education hours required in subrule (1) of this rule required-hours-of-continuing
edueation in pain and symptom management related to the practice of acupuncture during each license
cycle pursuant to sections 16204(2) and 16517(2) of the code, MCL 333.16204 and 333.16517.

3)}(4) An applicant for renewal of a limited license, in addition to meeting the requirements of subrules
(1) ane2) to (3) of this rule, shall meet all of the following:

(@) Pursuant to section 16517(3) of the code, MCL 333.16517, the applicant shall hold an active
license to engage in another health profession;-as-that-term-is-defined-ir-section-16105-of the-code MCL
333-16105; at the time of his-er-her the applicant’s application, and as a condition of renewal of his-er
her the applicant’s limited license.

(b) The applicant shall accumulate the continuing education credits required in subrules (1) are-{2)to
(3) of this rule in addition to any continuing education credits accumulated for the purpose of renewing
his-er-her the applicant’s other health professional license.

(c) The applicant shall submit a form, provided by the department, that contains the name and
signature of his-er-her the applicant’s supervising physician acknowledging that the physician provided
the supervisory responsibilities described under section 16109(2) of the code, MCL 333.16109, during
the previous license cycle and agreeing to provide those supervisory responsibilities during the next
license cycle.

4)(5) Submission of an application for renewal constitutes the applicant's certification of compliance
with this rule. An applicant shall retain documentation of satisfying the requirements of this rule for a
period of 4 years frem after the date of applying for license renewal. The board may require an
applicant to submit evidence to demonstrate compliance with this rule. Failure to comply with this rule
is a violation of section 16221(h) of the code, MCL 333.16221.

{5)(6) The department must receive a request for a waiver under section 16205 of the code, MCL
333.16205, before the expiration date of the license.

£6)}(7) The continuing education credits earned in 1 license cycle may not be carried forward to the next
license cycle.

134


https://www.nccaom.org/wp-content/uploads/pdf/NCCAOM_Certification_Handbook_Sept_2023.pdf
https://www.nccaom.org/wp-content/uploads/pdf/NCCAOM_Certification_Handbook_Sept_2023.pdf

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

£A(8) Except for the implicit bias training required under R 338.7004 that may be used to
comply with R 338.7004 and a continuing education requirement under subrule (2) of this rule,
the Fhe applicant may not earn continuing education credits for a continuing education program that
is identical to a program the applicant has already earned credit for during that renewal

completing-the-same-activity-twice-within-the-same-license-cycle.

R 338.13033 Acceptable continuing education, requirements.

Rule 33. (1) The board approves for continuing education a course or activity approved by the
NCCAOM as a professional-developmentactivity(PDA). One PDA credit equals 1 hour of continuing
education credit that can be accumulated to satisfy the requirements of R 338.13031.

(2) Pursuant to section 16517(1) of the code, MCL 333.16517, an individual who has met the
continuing education standards of the NCCAOM is considered to have met the continuing education
requirements for license renewal.

(3) If an applicant does not meet the requirements of subrule (2) of this rule, he-er-she the applicant
shall accumulate not less than 30 continuing education credits by participating in a course or activity
approved by the NCCAOM.

135



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Professional Licensing
Administrative Rules for Acupuncture- General Rules
Rule Set 2023-33 LR

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
Tuesday, March 19, 2024
09:00 AM

UL-5
611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, Michigan

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs will hold a public hearing to receive
public comments on proposed changes to the Acupuncture- General Rules rule set.

The proposed rules revise definitions, update the national standards of competence approved and
adopted by the board, and clarify that a licensee who completes an implicit bias training program
required under R 338.7004 may also use that training toward fulfillment of continuing education
requirements if the training has been approved by the National Certification Commission for
Acupuncture and Oriental Medicine.

By authority conferred on the Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs by MCL 333.16141,
333.16145, 333.16148, 333.16174, 333.16201, 333.16204, 333.16205, 333.16287, 333.16515,
333.16517, and 333.16525 and Executive Reorganization Order Nos. 1991-9, 1996-2, 2003-1, and
2011 -4, MCL 338.3501, 445.2001, 445.2011, and 445.2030.

The proposed rules will take effect immediately after filing with the Secretary of State. The proposed
rules are published on the State of Michigan's website at www.michigan.gov/ARD and in the
3/15/2024 issue of the Michigan Register. Copies of these proposed rules may also be obtained by
mail or electronic mail at the following email address: BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov.

Comments on these proposed rules may be made at the hearing, by mail, or by electronic mail at the
following addresses until 3/19/2024 at 05:00PM.

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, Bureau of Professional Licensing-Boards and
Committees Section

P.O. Box 30670, Lansing, MI 48909-8170
BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov

The public hearing will be conducted in compliance with the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act.
If the hearing is held at a physical location, the building will be accessible with handicap parking
available. Anyone needing assistance to take part in the hearing due to disability may call 711- to
make arrangements.

136


http://www.michigan.gov/ARD
mailto:BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov
mailto:BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING AND REGULATORY AFFAIRS
DIRECTOR'S OFFICE
CHIROPRACTIC - GENERAL RULES
Filed with the secretary of state on

These rules become effective immediately after filing with the secretary of state unless adopted under
section 33, 44, or 45a(9) of the administrative procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.233,
24.244, or 24.245a. Rules adopted under these sections become effective 7 days after filing with the
secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of licensing and regulatory affairs by sections
16145, 16148, 16401, 16412, 16423, and 16431 of the public health code, 1978 PA 368, MCL
333.16145, 333.16148, 333.16401, 333.16412, 333.16423, and 333.16431, and Executive
Reorganization Order Nos. 1991-9, 1996-2, 2003-1, and 2011-4, MCL 338.3501, 445.2001, 445.2011,
and 445.2030)

R 338.12021, R 338.12031, R 338.12032, R 338.12034, R 338.12035, R 338.12036, R 338.12037, R
338.12041, and R 338.12042 of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended, and R 338.12016 is
added, as follows:

PART 1. GENERAL PROVISIONS

R 338.12016 Telehealth.

Rule 16. (1) A licensee shall obtain consent from the patient for treatment before
providing a telehealth service under section 16284 of the code, MCL 333.16284.

(2) A licensee shall keep proof of consent for telehealth treatment in the patient’s
up-to-date medical record and satisfy section 16213 of the code, MCL 333.16213.

(3) A licensee providing any telehealth service shall do both of the following:

(a) Act within the scope of the licensee’s practice.

(b) Exercise the same standard of care applicable to a traditional, in-person health
care service.

PART 2. EDUCATION

R 338.12021 Educational program standards; adoption by reference.

Rule 21. (1) The process and requirements for the CCE’s accreditation of chiropractic educational
programs as set forth in the publication titled "CCE Accreditation Standards: Principles, Processes &
Requirements for Accreditation” July 2021, which are available from the council's website at
http://www.cce-usa.org at no cost, are approved and adopted by reference. Copies are available for
inspection and distribution at a cost of 10 cents per page from the Board of Chiropractic, Bureau of

137



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Professional Licensing, Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs, 611 West Ottawa Street, P. O.
Box 30670, Lansing, Michigan 48909.
(2) Any A chiropractic educational program accredited by the CCE is considered approved.

PART 3. LICENSURE

R 338.12031 Training standards for identifying victims of human trafficking;

requirements.

Rule 31. (1) Under section 16148 of the code, MCL 333.16148, an individual seeking licensure or who
is licensed shall eemplete have completed training in identifying victims of human trafficking that
satisfies the following standards:

(a) Training content must cover all the following:

(i) Understanding the types and venues of human trafficking in the United States.

(ii) 1dentifying victims of human trafficking in healthcare settings.

(iii) Identifying the warning signs of human trafficking in healthcare settings for adults and minors.

(iv) Identifying resources for reporting the suspected victims of human trafficking.

(b) Acceptable providers or methods of training include any of the following:

(i) Training offered by a nationally-recognized or state-recognized health-related organization.

(i) Training offered by, or in conjunction with, a state or federal agency.

(iii) Training obtained in an educational program that has been approved for initial licensure or
registration, or by a college or university.

(iv) Reading an article related to the identification of victims of human trafficking that satisfies the
requirements of subdivision (a) of this subrule and is published in a peer-reviewed journal, healthcare
journal, or professional or scientific journal.

(c) Acceptable modalities of training may include any of the following:

(i) Teleconference or online seminar.

(if) Online presentation.

(iii) Live presentation.

(iv) Printed or electronic media.

(2) The department may select and audit an individual and request documentation of proof of
completion of training. If audited by the department, the individual shall provide an acceptable proof of
completion of training, including either of the following:

(a) Proof of completion certificate issued by the training provider that includes the date, provider
name, name of training, and individual’s name.

(b) A self-certification statement by the individual. The certification statement must include the
individual’s name and either of the following:

(i) For training completed under subrule (1)(b)(i) to (iii) of this rule, the date, training provider name,
and name of training.

(ii) For training completed under subrule (1)(b)(iv) of this rule, the title of article, author, publication
name of peer-reviewed journal, healthcare journal, or professional or scientific journal, and the date,
volume, and issue of publication, as applicable.

R 338.12032 Educational limited license; requirements.

138



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 32. An applicant for a nonrenewable educational limited license under section 16412 of the code,
MCL 333.16412, shall satisfy the requirements of the code and the rules promulgated under the code, as
weH-as and all the following requirements:

(a) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying the completion of 2 years of education in a
college of arts and sciences.

(c) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying the completion of 1 of the following
requirements:

(i) Two years of attendance in a program or institution of chiropractic that satisfies the educational
requirements under R 338.12021.

(it) Four semesters of attendance in a program or institution of chiropractic that satisfies the
educational requirements under R 338.12021.

(iii) Six quarter terms of attendance in a program or institution of chiropractic that satisfies the
educational requirements under R 338.12021.

(d) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying that a licensed chiropractor shall supervise
the applicant.

R 338.12034 Licensure by examination; requirements.

Rule 34. An applicant for a chiropractic license by examination shall satisfy the requirements of the
code and the rules promulgated under the code, as-well-as and all the following requirements:

(a) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying graduation from a program or institution of
chiropractic that satisfies the educational requirements under R 338.12021.

(c) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying passing scores on parts I, Il, 11I, and 1V of
the national board examination conducted and scored by the NBCE, under R 338.12033.

R 338.12035 Licensure by endorsement; requirements.

Rule 35. (1) An applicant for a chiropractic license by endorsement shall satisfy the requirements of
the code, and the rules promulgated under the code, as-wel-as and all the following requirements:

(a) Provide the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying a current and full chiropractic license in
another state or in a province of Canada.

(c) If the applicant is licensed as a chiropractor in a province of Canada, provide proof, as directed by
the department, verifying that the applicant completed the educational requirements in Canada or # the
United States for licensure as a chiropractor in Canada or the United States.

(d) Provide proof, as directed by the department, verifying passing scores on either of the following
examinations for a chiropractic license in another state or in a province of Canada to obtain licensure as
a chiropractor in another state or #-a province of Canada:

(i) Parts I, Il, 111, and IV of the national board examination conducted and scored by the NBCE, under
R 338.12033.

(if) Component A — Chiropractic Knowledge, Component B — Clinical Decision Making, and
Component C — Clinical Skills Demonstration of the Canadian Chiropractic Examining Board’s (CCEB)
examinations.

(2) An applicant that who provides proof, as directed by the department, verifying a current and full
chiropractic license in good standing in another state or in a province of Canada for not less than the last
5 years before the date of filing the application for a chiropractic license by endorsement is presumed to
satisfy the requirements of subrule (1)(c) and (d) of this rule.

139



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(3) An applicant that who is or has been licensed, registered, or certified in a health profession or
specialty by another state, the United States military, the federal government, or another country shall
disclose that fact on the application form. The applicant shall satisfy the requirements of section
16174(2) of the code, MCL 333.16174, including verification from the issuing entity showing that
disciplinary proceedings are not pending against the applicant and sanctions are not in force at the time
of application. If licensure is granted and it is determined that sanctions have been imposed, the
disciplinary subcommittee may impose appropriate sanctions under section 16174(5) of the code, MCL
333.16174.

R 338.12036 Relicensure requirements.

Rule 36. (1) An applicant whose chiropractic license has lapsed may be relicensed within 3 years after
the expiration date of the license under section 16201(3) of the code, MCL 333.16201, if the applicant
satisfies the requirements of the code, and the rules promulgated under the code, as-weH-as and all the
following requirements:

(@) Provides the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Establishes good moral character as defined in, and determined under, 1974 PA 381, MCL 338.41
to 338.47.

(c) Provides proof, as directed by the department, verifying the completion of, in the 3-year period
immediately preceding the application for relicensure, 45 hours of continuing education in programs
approved under R 338.12041, that include both the following requirements:

(i) The required continuing education hours listed in R 338.12041(1)(d) to {h)- (Q).

(if) Not more than 15 continuing education hours in distance learning programs.

(2) An applicant whose chiropractic license has lapsed may be relicensed more than 3 years after the
expiration date of the license under section 16201(4) of the code, MCL 333.16201, if the applicant
satisfies the requirements of the code and the rules promulgated under the code, as+weH-as and all the
following requirements:

(a) Provides the required fee and a completed application on a form provided by the department.

(b) Establishes good moral character as defined in, and determined under, 1974 PA 381, MCL 338.41
to 338.47.

(c) Provides fingerprints as required under section 16174(3) of the code, MCL 333.16174.

(d) Provides proof, as directed by the department, verifying either of the following:

(i) The completion of, in the 3-year period immediately preceding the application for relicensure, 45
hours of continuing education in programs approved under R 338.12041 that include all the following
requirements:

(A) Twenty-four live and in-person continuing education hours on chiropractic adjusting techniques.
(B) The required continuing education hours listed in R 338.12041(1)(d) to ¢h)- ().
(C) Not more than 15 continuing education hours in distance learning programs.

(if) The applicant holds or has held a valid and unrestricted license in another state or a province of
Canada in the 3-year period immediately preceding the application for relicensure.

(3) An applicant that who is or has been licensed, registered, or certified in a health profession or
specialty by another state, the United States military, the federal government, or another country shall
disclose that fact on the application form. The applicant shall satisfy the requirements of section
16174(2) of the code, MCL 333.16174, including verification from the issuing entity showing that
disciplinary proceedings are not pending against the applicant and sanctions are not in force at the time
of application. If licensure is granted and it is determined that sanctions have been imposed, the
disciplinary subcommittee may impose appropriate sanctions under section 16174(5) of the code, MCL
333.16174.

140



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

R 338.12037 License renewal; continuing education.

Rule 37. (1) An applicant for renewal shall satisfy the requirements of the code and the rules
promulgated under the code.

(2) An applicant for renewal shall complete 30 hours of continuing education in the 2-year period
immediately preceding the renewal application that satisfy R 338.12041.

(3) Submission of an application for renewal constitutes the applicant's certification of compliance with
the requirements of this rule. The licensee shall keep maintain documentation of satisfying the
requirements of this rule for 4 years after the date of applying for Hicense renewal. Failure to satisfy this
rule is a violation of section 16221(h) of the code, MCL 333.16221.

(4) Fhe-department-shalreceive An applicant shall submit a request for a waiver of continuing
education requirements to the department for the board’s consideration not less than 30 days before the
last regularly scheduled board meeting before the expiration date of the license.

PART 4. CONTINUING EDUCATION

R 338.12041 Acceptable continuing education.

Rule 41. (1) The 30 hours of continuing education required under R 338.12037 must satisfy all the
following requirements:

(@) No more than 12 credit hours of continuing education may be earned during one 24-hour period.

(b) Not less than 15 hours of continuing education must be completed by attending a live, in-person
program.

(c) Credit for a continuing education program or activity that is identical to or substantially identical to
a program or activity for which the licensee has already earned credit during the license cycle must not
be granted.

(d) Under section 16431(2) of the code, MCL 333.16431, at least 1 hour of continuing education must
be in pain and symptom management. Continuing education in pain and symptom management
includes, but is not limited to, courses in any of the following:

(1) Chiropractic manipulative treatment.

(if) Manual therapies.

(iii) Therapeutic exercises for pain management.

(iv) Behavior management.

(v) Psychology of pain.

(vi) Pharmacology.

(vii) Behavior modification.

(viii) Stress management.

(ix) Clinical applications.

(x) Drug interventions as they related to the practice of chiropractic.

(e) At least 1 hour of continuing education must be in sexual boundaries.

(f) At least 1 hour of continuing education must be in ethics.

(9) Not less than 2 hours of continuing education must be in physical measures.

(2) In addition to those programs approved under R 338.12042, the following are considered acceptable
continuing education:

(a) Attendance at or participation in a continuing education program or activity related to the practice
of chiropractic, or any non-clinical subject relevant to the practice of chiropractic education,
administration, management, or science, which includes, but is not limited to, live in-person programs,

141



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

interactive or monitored teleconferences, audio-conferences, web-based programs, online programs, and
review of journal articles or other self-study programs approved or offered by the Michigan Association
of Chiropractors (MAC) according to the following:

(i) If audited, the licensee shall provide a copy of a letter or certificate of completion showing the
licensee’s name, number of continuing education hours earned, the provider’s name or the name of the
organization that approved the program or other activity, and the date the program or activity was
completed.

(i1) The number of continuing education hours for a specific program or activity is the number of
hours approved by the approving organization for the specific program or activity.

(iii) A maximum of 30 hours of continuing education may be earned for this category in each renewal
period.

(b) Successful completion of a course or courses related to the practice of chiropractic, offered by a
chiropractic school approved under R 338.12021, according to the following:

(i) If audited, the licensee shall provide a copy of a letter or certificate of completion showing the
licensee’s name, the number of continuing education hours earned, the school’s name, and the date the
course or courses was completed.

(if) The number of continuing education hours for a specific course or courses is the number of hours
approved by the school for the specific course or courses.

(ii1) A maximum of 30 hours of continuing education may be earned for courses completed in this
category in each renewal period.

(c) Initial presentation by the licensee of a continuing education program related to the practice of
chiropractic to a state, regional, national, or international organization. To receive credit, the
presentation must not be a part of the licensee’s regular job description and must be approved or offered
for continuing education credit by the American Chiropractic Association (ACA), the International
Chiropractors Association (ICA), or an approved program under this rule or R 338.12042. Continuing
education under this subdivision is subject to the following:

(1) If audited, the licensee shall provide a copy of the presentation notice, advertisement, or letter from
the approved program under this rule or R 338.12042, showing the date of the presentation and the
licensee’s name listed as a presenter.

(if) Two hours of continuing education credit are granted for each 50 to 60 minutes of presentation.
No other credit is granted for preparation of a presentation.

(ii1) A maximum of 10 hours of continuing education may be earned in this category in each renewal
period.

(3) Continuing-ed i ms-3 ' i is_ amended
eenade#ed—appreved— Completlon of |mpI|C|t blas training under R 338 7004 during the 2 years
immediately preceding the application for renewal may be used toward satisfaction of the
requirements of R 338.12037(2) and subrule (1) of this rule.

(4) Continuing education programs approved before the effective date of this amended rule are
considered approved.

R 338.12042 Approval of continuing education programs.

Rule 42. (1) A continuing education program provider that is not pre-approved under R 338.12041(2)
shall petition the board for approval of a continuing education program.

(2) The continuing education program provider shall complete an application provided by the
department, file the application and supporting documentation with the department for review not less
than 120 days before the program date, and satisfy the requirements of subrule (3) of this rule.

(3) The application and supporting documentation must include all the following information:

(a) A description of the sponsoring organization.

142



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

(b) Name, title, and address of the program director.

(c) An outline of the course.

(d) A resumé for all speakers or presenters, or both.

(e) A description of the delivery method.

() The dates and location or locations that the course will be delivered.

(9) A description of how attendance is monitored, sample documents, and identification of the
individual monitoring attendance.

(h) A sample certificate or other document that will be issued after completion and a description of
how the participant will be notified.

(i) If appropriate, a request for recognition in a specific topic area required by R 338.12041(1)(d) to
- (9).

(4) Continuing education programs approved before the effective date of this amended rule are
considered approved.

143



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs
Bureau of Professional Licensing
Administrative Rules for Chiropractic — General Rules
Rule Set 2023-35 LR

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
Tuesday, March 19, 2024
09:00 AM

UL-5
611 W. Ottawa Street, Lansing, Michigan

The Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs will hold a public hearing to receive
public comments on proposed changes to the Chiropractic — General Rules rule set.

The proposed rules include clarifying language and typographical revisions, supplying conditions related
to consent, scope of practice, and standard of care for telehealth services, removal of the requirement
that a licensee must complete not less than two hours of continuing education in performing and
ordering tests, and clarification that a licensee who completes implicit bias training under R 338.7004
may also use that training toward fulfillment of continuing education requirements.

By authority conferred on the department in consultation with the board under MCL 333.16145,
333.16148, 333.16204, 333.16287, 333.16401, 333.16412, 333.16423, and 333.16431, and Executive
Reorganization Nos. 1991-9, 1996-2, 2003-1 and 2011-4, MCL 338.3501, 445.2001, 445.2011, and
445.2030.

The proposed rules will take effect immediately after filing with the Secretary of State. The proposed
rules are published on the State of Michigan's website at www.michigan.gov/ARD and in the
3/15/2024 issue of the Michigan Register. Copies of these proposed rules may also be obtained by mail
or electronic mail at the following email address: BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov.

Comments on these proposed rules may be made at the hearing, by mail, or by electronic mail at the
following addresses until 3/19/2024 at 05:00PM.

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs Bureau of Professional Licensing — Boards and
Committees Section P.O. Box 30670 Lansing, MI 48909-8170 Attention: Departmental Specialist

Department of Licensing and Regulatory Affairs Bureau of Professional Licensing — Boards and
Committees Section P.O. Box 30670 Lansing, MI 48909-8170 Attention: Departmental Specialist

BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov

The public hearing will be conducted in compliance with the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act. If
the hearing is held at a physical location, the building will be accessible with handicap parking
available. Anyone needing assistance to take part in the hearing due to disability may call 711- to make
arrangements.

144


http://www.michigan.gov/ARD
mailto:BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov
mailto:BPL-BoardSupport@michigan.gov

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

PROPOSED ADMINISTRATIVE RULES

DEPARTMENT OF INSURANCE AND FINANCIAL SERVICES
DEBT MANAGEMENT
Filed with the secretary of state on

These rules become effective immediately after filing with the secretary of state unless adopted under
section 33, 44, or 45a(9) of the administrative procedures act of 1969, 1969 PA 306, MCL 24.233,
24.244, or 24.245a. Rules adopted under these sections become effective 7 days after filing with the
secretary of state.

(By authority conferred on the director of the department of insurance and financial services by section
22 of the debt management act, 1975 PA 148, MCL 451.432)

R 451.1227, R 451.1237, and R 451.1239 of the Michigan Administrative Code are amended, as
follows:

R 451.1227 Books and records.

Rule 7. The firm shall make and keep current the following books and records relating to its business:

(@) Journals or other records of original entry containing an itemized daily record of all payments and
receipts for, or on behalf of, debtors of the firm, all receipts and disbursements of cash, and all other
debits and credits.

(b) Ledgers or other records reflecting all assets, liabilities, income, expense, and capital accounts.
The books and records included in this subdivision are not current unless the firm updates and
posts to the books and records at least monthly.

(c) Ledger accounts or other records, itemizing separately as to each debtor all receipts from the
debtor, payments to the firm, and disbursements on behalf of the debtor, the creditor's representative
contacted, the response obtained or whether there has been a response within 14 days after the mailing
of the creditor consent form, any revised or special conditions or arrangements conditioning the consent,
and the date at-which the required consents were secured.

(d) A complaint file containing copies of all written complaints made to the firm by debtors.

(e) Personnel files for all employees, listing the employee’s name, current home address, home phone
number, social security number, and a record of all compensation.

R 451.1237 Procedures; review.

Rule 17. (1) Each firm shall prepare and maintain a—manualdetailing—the written policies and
procedures for compliance with the act.

(2) Each firm shall provide eachEaeh certified counselor of the firm shal-be-provided with the
manual written policies and procedures.

R 451.1239 Budget analysis.

145



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

Rule 19. (1) A copy of the budget analysis required under section 12 of the act, MCL 451.422, must
be retained in the debtor's file for a period of 6 years after the last transaction.

(2) The budget analysis must be signed by a certified counselor of the firm who participated in the
preparation of the analysis.

(3) The budget analysis must identify the type and amount of each debtor’s obligation by
providing an adequate general description. Adequate general descriptions include “credit card,”
“unsecured loan,” “vehicle loan,” “mortgage loan,” or other terms similarly identifying the type of
debtor’s obligation. The terms “other,” “miscellaneous,” or “generic” are not adequate general
descriptions.

146



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING

Department of Insurance and Financial Services
Financial Institutions
Administrative Rules for Debt Management
Rule Set 2023-44 IF

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
Wednesday, April 3, 2024
10:00AM

Ottawa Building, Conference Room #6
611 West Ottawa Street, Lansing, Michigan 48933

The Department of Insurance and Financial Services will hold a public hearing to receive
public comments on proposed changes to the Debt Management rule set.

This existing rule set, R 451.1221 to R 451.1246, implements and enforces the Debt Management Act
(“DMA”), MCL 451.411 to 451.437. The proposed rules would add clarity to firms regulated under
the DMA and existing rules by: (1) requiring books and records to be kept current on a monthly basis;
(2) updating references to a firm’s “manual” under R 451.1237; (3) clarifying requirements for the
licensee’s budget analysis of the debtor; and (4) making other clarifying changes to the regulatory
requirements under the DMA.

By authority conferred on the Director of the Department of Insurance and Financial Services by
sections 5(5) and 22 of the Debt Management Act, MCL 451.415(5) and 451.432.

The proposed rules will take effect immediately after filing with the Secretary of State. The proposed
rules are published on the State of Michigan's website at www.michigan.gov/ARD and in the
3/15/2024 issue of the Michigan Register. Copies of these proposed rules may also be obtained by
mail or electronic mail at the following email address: EstradaM1@michigan.gov.

Comments on these proposed rules may be made at the hearing, by mail, or by electronic mail at the
following addresses until 4/3/2024 at 05:00PM.

Michele Estrada, Department of Insurance and Financial Services, Office of Appeals, Legal Research,
and Market Regulation

Department of Insurance and Financial Services, Office of Appeals, Legal Research, and Market
Regulation, P.O. Box 30220 Lansing, MI 48909-7720

EstradaM1@michigan.gov

The public hearing will be conducted in compliance with the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act.
If the hearing is held at a physical location, the building will be accessible with handicap parking
available. Anyone needing assistance to take part in the hearing due to disability may call 517-284-
8735 to make arrangements.

147


http://www.michigan.gov/ARD
mailto:EstradaM1@michigan.gov
mailto:EstradaM1@michigan.gov

2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

CUMULATIVE
INDEX

E
EDUCATION, DEPARTMENT OF
Teachers' Tenure (2024-3)
1
INSURANCE AND FINANCIAL SERVICES, DEPARTMENT OF
Debt Management (2024-4%*)
Surplus Lines Insurance Fees (2024-3%*)
L
LABOR AND ECONOMIC OPPORTUNITY, DEPARTMENT OF
Part 8. Portable Fire Extinguishers (2024-2)
Part 11. Recording and Reporting of Occupational Injuries and IlInesses (2024-3)

LICENSING & REGULATORY AFFAIRS, DEPARTMENT OF
Correction:

Construction Codes - Part 7. Plumbing Code (2024-1)

Construction Code - Part 9A Mechanical Code (2024-1)

Acupuncture - General Rules (2024-4*)

Chiropractic — General Rules (2024-4*)

Construction Code - Part 4. Building Code (2024-4%*)

Construction Codes - Part 5. Residential Code (2024-4*)

Construction Code - Part 10. Michigan Uniform Energy Code (2024-2%)
Construction Code - Part 10a. Michigan Energy Code (2024-2%*)
Genetic Counseling - General Rules (2024-4)

Public Health Code — General Rules (2024-2*)

Rehabilitation Code (2024-4%*)

148



2024 MR 4 — March 15, 2024

ADMINISTRATIVE RULES
ENROLLED SENATE AND HOUSE BILLS
SIGNED INTO LAW OR VETOED
(2024 SESSION)

Mich. Const. Art. 1V, 833 provides: “Every bill passed by the legislature shall be presented to the
governor before it becomes law, and the governor shall have 14 days measured in hours and minutes
from the time of presentation in which to consider it. If he approves, he shall within that time sign and
file it with the secretary of state and it shall become law . . . If he does not approve, and the legislature
has within that time finally adjourned the session at which the bill was passed, it shall not become law.
If he disapproves . . . he shall return it within such 14-day period with his objections, to the house in
which it originated.”

Mich. Const. Art. 1V, 827, further provides: “No act shall take effect until the expiration of 90 days from
the end of the session at which it was passed, but the legislature may give immediate effect to acts by a
two-thirds vote of the members elected to and serving in each house.”

MCL 24.208 states in part:

“Sec. 8. (1) The Office of Regulatory Reform shall publish the Michigan register at least once each
month. The Michigan register shall contain all of the following:

* * *

(b) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills signed
into law by the governor during the calendar year and the corresponding public act numbers.

(c) On a cumulative basis, the numbers and subject matter of the enrolled senate and house bills vetoed
by the governor during the calendar year.”

149



2024 Michigan
Public Acts Table

Legislative Service Bureau
Legal Division, Statutory Compiling and Law Publications Unit
124 W. Allegan, Lansing, MI 48909

February 28, 2024
Compiled through PA 11 of 2024

ENROLLED * ; ;
’5: Y(Ie.sE/.No Eoverno; ISI(tad Eff[t;.cttlve SUBJECT
. HB |sB pprove ate ate

0001 | 4416 Yes 2/21/2024 (2/21/2024 | 2/21/2024 Probate; other, general amendments to the estates
and protected individuals code; provide for.
(Rep. Graham Filler)

0002 | 4417 Yes |2/21/20242/21/2024|5/21/2024 Vehicles; title; transfer of ownership of vehicle to
surviving spouse or heir after owner's death; modify
maximum value and adjust for cost of living.

(Rep. Graham Filler)

0003 | 4418 Yes |2/21/2024(2/21/2024|2/21/2024 Probate; other, uniform transfers to minors act;
modify amount of transfer allowed.
(Rep. Kelly Breen)

0004 | 4419 Yes |2/21/2024(2/21/2024|5/21/2024 Watercraft; other, eligible for issuance of
certificate of title transferring deceased owner's
interest; increase maximum value of, subject to
Consumer Price Index.

(Rep. Kelly Breen)

0005 | 4845 Yes |2/21/2024(2/21/2024|2/21/2024 Highways; memorial, portion of M-125; designate
as the "Captain Joseph M. Liedel Memorial
Highway".

(Rep. William Bruck)

0006 | 4325 No 2/21/2024 (2/21/2024 *x Environmental protection; other, criminal penalties
and civil fines for unlawful dumping of garbage;
provide for.

(Rep. Helena Scott)

0007 | 4824 No 2/27/202412/27/2024 ** # |Administrative procedure; other, cross-reference
to administrative procedures act within the natural
resources and environmental protection act; update.
(Rep. Donavan McKinney)

0008 | 4825 No 2/271202412/27/2024 ** # |Administrative procedure; other, cross-reference
to administrative procedures act within the state
police retirement act of 1986; update.

(Rep. Jenn Hill)

* - 1.E. means Legislature voted to give the Act immediate effect.

** - Act takes effect on the 91st day after sine die adjournment of the Legislature.

*** - See Act for applicable effective date.
+ - Line item veto.

++ - Pocket veto.

# - Tie bar.

© 2024 Legislative Council, State of Michigan. All rights reserved.

Page 1



ENROLLED * i i
5: YI.E/.N Eoverno(r‘ ISI(:d Eff[;ecttlve SUBJECT
. HB | sB|Yes/No|Approve ate ate
0009 | 4826 No 2/27/2024 (2/27/2024 *x Environmental protection; other, environmental
rules review committee; eliminate.
(Rep. Sharon MacDonell)
0010 | 4677 No 2/271202412/27/2024 ** Children; foster carg assessments of education
facilities at child care institutions; require.
(Rep. Stephanie A. Young)
0011 | 4678 No 2/27/2024 (2/27/2024 ** Children; child carg assessments of education
facilities at child care institutions; require.
(Rep. Kimberly Edwards)
* - |.E. means Legislature voted to give the Act immediate effect.

** - Act takes effect on the 91st day after sine die adjournment of the

*** - See Act for applicable effective date.
+ - Line item veto.

++ - Pocket veto.

# - Tie bar.

© 2024 Legislative Council, State of Michigan. All rights reserved.

Legislature.

Page 2



	Michigan
	Register
	Issue No. 4— 2024
	Michigan Office of Administrative Hearings and Rules


	Insert from: "2024-PAT.pdf"
	2024 Michigan  Public Acts Table


